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Volunteer firefighters fight for survival
By FR E D E R IC K  M.

WINSHIP
America's volunteer fire 

figh tinR  s e rv ic e  — a 
problem-plagued holdover 
from Colonial times — will 
be able to survive if 
recruiting can be stepped 
up and training improved.

That's the consensus of 
experts in the field con­
tacted by UPI in a survey 
of the nation's largest and 
most dangerous volunteer 
effort. More injuries occur 
in firefighting than in any 
other occupation. More 
than too fire-related deaths 
of firefighters are reported 
annually.

Of the nation's 28,200 fire 
departments. 22,450 are 
totally volunteer (VFDs) 
and 4,455 are a mix of 
v o lu n tee rs  and paid 
firemen with volunteers 
predominating 5 to 1. Only 
1,295 departments are 
staffed by paid career 
firemen only. Almost all of 
them are located in urban 
centers of 250,000 or more 
population. Even New 
York C ity has a few  
volunteer companies.

VFDs protect half of 
America's population. It's 
plain to see that survival of 
the volunteer firefighting 
system is vital to the 
nation's safety and health.

In addition to fighting 
fires and combatting ar­
son. the nation's 899,250 
volunteers provide the only 
emergency rescue and am­
bu lan ce  s e r v ic e s  in 
thousands of communities, 
where there are often 
twice as many ambulance 
ca lls  as f ire  alarm s. 
Almost 80 percent of the 
Emergency Medical Ser­
vices care in the nation is 
provided by local fire ser­
vices and many volunteers 
have basic paramedic 
skills.

In most school systems 
firemen provide the only 
instruction primary school 
children ever get in fire 
safety and survival

VFDs have increased as 
the annual number of fires 
reported by the National 
Fire Protection associa­
tion has risen from 2.4 
million in 1965 to nearly 3 
million in 1980 for a total 
property loss of $5.7 billion, 
compared to only tl.8  
billion 15 years ago. There 
have been 4,200 new 
volunteer and paid fire 
departments established 
since 1965, on an average of 
200 a year, and the majori­
ty are all-volunteer.

H o w e v e r ,  many  
Americans still picture the 
local firehouse, sometimes 
owned by the company 
itself rather than the com­
munity, as a late Victorian 
macho club, a gathering 
place for poker and pool­
playing blue collar workers 
who'd rather while away 
their leisure hours with the 
boys and the company's 
dalmation mascot than 
with their families.

' ' T h a t ' s  not true 
anymore," said Marion 
Cole, a spokeswoman for 
the National Fire Protec­
tion^ Organ i za t i on  in 
Boston, which provides 
technical and educational 
material to fire companies 
across the nation. "It  used 
to be a much more social 
thing, a fun thing, than it is 
now. Now it's serious 
business with a lot of 
problems to be solved."

The blue collar makeup 
of volunteer companies is 
still the general rule but 
t h er e  a r e  a lot  of  
vo lun teers  f rom  the 
professions and a small but 
growing number of women. 
One of the white collar 
vo lun te ers  in Nor th 
Brunswick, N. J., is Dr. 
Robert G. Kahrmann, dean 
of continuing education at 
New Jersey's Seton Hall 
University.

Rerruil crisis
"Yes, there are a lot of 

problem s," said Kahr­
mann, who has written 
many  a r t i c l e s  f o r  
firefighters' publications 
and is considered an expert 
on VFDs.

"  V o l u n t e e r i s m  in 
firefighting peaked in this 
country in the 19th century 
and has diminished con­
siderably in the past 20 
years. Many towns won't 
admit it, but they're hur­
ting for lack of recruits. 
And there are too many 
vo lu n teers  who work 
during the day, some of 
them in conrfmunlties other 
than where they live, to 
provide adequate response 
to alarms."

E. James Monihan, a 
volunteer for 23 years and 
now p res iden t o f the 
National Volunteer Fire 
Council representing VFDs

ip 22 states, confirms this.
"There's generally a tur­

nover of about one-third 
annually," Monihan said. 
"A  company has to take in 
about six new men to get a 
good one."

One d i f f i c u l t y ,  as 
Monihan sees it, is that the 
$50,000 benefit paid by the 
federal government to 
public service officers for 
death in the line of duty 
must go to f i remen's 
dependents, which means

equipment — even air 
masks — as one of the most 
prevalent shortcomings of 
VFDs, although mutual aid 
arrangements with com­
panies in neighboring com­
munities can partially 
make up for this.
H igh  rise  ch a llen ge  

New high rise buildings 
in areas protected by com­
panies that f o rmer l y  
needed only 65-70 foot 
ladders poses another 
challenge. Even in big

Image of volunteers 
is changing rapidly

the estates of bachelor 
f i r emen get  nothing, 
thereby discouraging 
bachelor volunteers. The 
National Volunteer Fire 
Council is trying to correct 
this.

The e x p l o s io n  o f  
bedroom communities 
around cities compounds 
the difficulty in recruit­
ment because commuting 
workers do hot have the 
sort of civic pride and 
sense of  communi ty  
r e s p o n s i b i l i t y  that 
nour i shes  v o lu n te e r  
firefighting and has given 
volunteers their sobriquet.
"the unique breed."

"They may give money 
but not t i m e , "  said 
Monihan. "They just want 
to be taken care of."

.Kahrmann lamented the 
lad of training required of 
most volunteers who 
gen orally spend onlv a few

Recruiting, training 
needed to stay alive

evening hours each week at 
the firehouse studying and 
rehearsing firefighting and 
lifesaving techniques.
'Ilil or misn' training

Less then 20 percent of 
the nation's companies 
have physical fitness 
programs. Less then 50 per 
cent require periodical 
medical checkups. Heart 
attacks are the leading 
type of fatal injury to 
firefighters, accounting for 
about 40 percent of deaths, 
and they are occuring 
earlier in firemen's lives.

New York State recently 
established a minimum of 
229 hours of training for 
companies of five or more 
paid firemen., Dr. Gerald 
W. Lynch, chairman of the 
special task force which 
r e c o m m e n d e d  this 
minimum, said volunteers 
need the same amount of 
training.

"The state can't force 
volunteers to comply but 
we hope they will want to 
meet these standards out 
of pride for their own 
protection," said Lynch, 
who is president of New 
York's John Jay College of

Cost of protection 
is primary factor

C r i m i n a l  Jus t i ce .  
"Volunteers should know 
how to combat fires in 
these mushrooming high 
rise buildings and how to 
detect arson. Volunteers 
make up 85 percent of the 
firefighting force in this 
state and the big problem 
is that a lot of them work."

Kahrmann said: "Very 
honestly, the training of 
volunteers is limited, a hit 
or miss operation depen­
ding on the fire depart­
ment. There's a lot of 
pressure at state and coun­
ty levels all over the coun­
try to get training going, 
mainly because of the in­
crease in arson. If you 
don't get the evidence of 
arson at the site, you can't 
do very well in court."

The VFDs of Delaware 
are leaders in setting 
minimum training hours 
fo r  v o lu n t e e r s .
Departments determine 
their own minimums a o  
cording to their own needs, 
and these are now running 
between 200 and 900 hours.

Kahrmann also men­
tioned lack of adequate

cities, ladders reach to 
only the 8th or 9th floors at 
most.

"We have 35 foot ladders 
because the maximum 
average height of buildings 
here is 35 feet," said truck 
company employee Ronald 
N Huter, a volunteer and 
former chief of the 40-man 
Mountainside, N.J., fire 
department. " I f  they build 
much higher we will just 
have to let buildings bum 
down to our level."

It is difficult to provide 
practical training in high 
rise firefighting, he said. 
Departments often get per­
mission to bum condemned 
buildings in order to give 
thei r  men p ra c t i c a l  
experience. This is not 
possible in the case of new­
ly built high rises which 
are potential towering in­
fernos,

Huter said the biggest

Successful
George Hayden, a bank vice president In Bloomington, Minn., 
stands proudly In front of one of their engines. Hayden boasts It Is 
one of the best In the country with no money problems. The city 
ungrudingly provides an adequate working budget of $350,000 
and contributes $1 million annually to a pension fund for the 130- 
man corps. (UPI photo)

U'

problem of all is money for 
adequate equipment.. Tax 
money pays for most of 
Mountainside's equipment, 
but the men supply their 
own j a c k e t s ,  pants,  
helmets and boots and do a 
lo t of the equipment 
maintenance themselves.

A standard pumper with 
hose costs $100,000 or 
more. The addition of big 
aerial ladder tmeks and 
snorkel equipment ($250,- 
000 and up) would be an im­
possible financial drain on 
R i ve rs ide ' s  2,500 in­
habitants.

According to,expert es­
timates, it takes a depart­
ment  of  50 f i r e m e n  
working three shifts to 
field an initial minimum 
response of 13 men to a 
residential fire. Since paid 
firemen earn from $15,000 
to $23,000 a year, according 
to the Inte rna t i ona l  
Association of Fire (Tiiefs, 
it would cost any communi­
ty wishing to pay for a 
minimal fire force $750,000 
to over $1 million.

"You can see that an all- 
paid fire department would 
be a very expensive project

student body are women.
Volunteer f ire com­

panies still depend on 
house-to-house collection 
of donations, chicken 
dinners and dances to raise 
funds, just as they have 
since ^njamin Franklin 
founded the first volunteer 
fire company in America 
in Philadelphia in 1736.

Municipal taxes and 
state grants help meet 
some companies' budgets. 
Federal funds go mostly 
into training and research 
programs that have been 
greatly strenghthened in 
the past decade, although 
th er e  a re  f e d e r a l l y  
guaranteed loans and 
matching grants available 
to VFDs who know how to 
go about getting them. 
VFD financm

Some communities levy 
a special tax on top of the 
regular municipal property 
tax to support their VFDs. 
This runs from 4 cents for 
every $100 of property 
evaluation to 7 or 8 cents.

The money is usually spent 
on equipment.

The V F D  in 
Bloomingtton, Minn., one of 
the best in the country, is 
in an ideal situation. It has 
no money problems, accor­
ding to Chief George 
Hayden, a bank vice presi­
dent. The city ungrudging­
ly provides an adequate 
working budget of $350,000 
and contributes $1 million 
annually to a pension 
program for the 130-man 
corps. There is a waiting 
list of eager prospective 
firemen, A-1 training and 
physical fitness programs, 
and up-to-date equipment.

Property owners could 
afford to be more generous 
in thejr donations to VFDs 
in view of the fact that the 
better their fire protection 
the lower their fire in­
surance rates, the experts 
say. Firefighting adequacy 
is one of the main con­
siderations of rating com­
panies in drawing up fire 
suppression ratings for

Amer i ca ' s  towns and 
cities. From these ratings, 
insurance rates are set for 
communities by insurance 
companies.

The U.S. F i r e  Ad ­
ministration claims that 
lack of business manage­
ment by trained managers 
Is one o f the m a j or  
weaknesses of VFDs. They 
are institutions with 
budgets in the hundreds of 
thousands of dollars and 
need just as much expert 
advance planning and 
util isation of current 
business practices as 
hospitals or cultural  
centers, according to of­
ficials who have set up 
USFA educational courses 
in this area.

Apathy obstacle
Public apathy ("people 

don't think about the 
p r o b l e m s  o f  f i r e  
departments until they've 
had a f i r e " )  and 
widespread failure to en­
force construction fire

codes  which req u i r e  
architectural safeguards, 
sprinkler systems, and 
—Increasingly — smoke 
detectors is most often 
blamed for the United 
State's fire death rate, the 
highest in the world. It is 
twice that of England, 
Fra nc e ,  Sweden dnd 
Norway and five times that 
of Switzerland and the 
Netherlands. Residential 
fires are the main source 
of U.S. fire deaths.

Don Flinn, manager of 
the International Associa­
tion of Fire Chiefs, claims 
fire codes are "generally 
influenced by the construc­
tion industry" which seeks 
to cut building costs. There 
are 18,(X)0 separate state, 
county and municipal fire 
codes, often contradictory, 
and weak enforcement 
may be weakened even 
further by municipal  
budget cutbacks caused by 
inflation.

"There is a slowing — 
even abandonment — of

code enforcement in many 
places," said Flinn, assis­
tant fire chief of Silver 
Spring Md.

The nation's high civilian 
fire death rate — 7,780 in 
1979, the last available 
figure — may be due par­
tially to the fact that 
volunteers report to fires 
from their homes or jobs 
when summoned by fire 
siren, phone, pocket radio 
or beeper, whereas a paid 
c om p a n y  s t a f f s  the 
firehouse at all hours and 
can get to the site quickly 
with the necessary equip­
ment.

S low  a la rm  response
"Some parts of our dis­

trict are 11 miles from the 
station," said Monihan, of 
Lewes, Del., a hospital ad­
ministrator when he isn't 
fighting fires. " I f  there is a 
crew in the station it takes 
about two minutes to get 
there, but generally there 
is no one in the station.

for a lmost  any com ­
munity," said Kahrmann. 
"Volunteers, however, are 
doing well for their com­
munities and are generally 
keeping up their strength. 
There was a question that 
they'd survive the 1970s but 
they did, and I think they'll 
survive the '80s." 
Profeulonalitm

VFDs also got good 
marks from William F. 
Se i f r i ed ,  deputy ad­
ministrator of the National 
F i r e  A c a d e m y  at 
Emmetsburg, Md., which 
was created by the federal 
government in 1974 to up­
grade the training of 
firemen.

" Y o u  ge t  v a r i o u s  
degrees of professionalism 
in f ire  departm ents," 
Seifried observed. " I  thliik 
s om e  v o l u n t e e r  
departments are more 
professional than paid 
departments."

Seifried said volunteers 
make up about 10 percent 
of the student body at the 
academy, which had 2,100 
graduates In 1980. He said 
about four percent of the
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Sampling today
Today’s edition of The Manchester Hefald is being 

delivered to a number of non-subscribers in addition to our 
regular customers.

This is part of a continuing effort to let non-subscribers 
know what they're missing by not reading The Herald.

Watch next Wednesday's Herald for an announcement of 
an exciting new contest — with prizes galore — that will 
start next week in The Herald.

may fight garage
By MAR'HN KEARNS 

Herald Reporter

MANCHESTER -  Tovni officials 
and representatives of Temple BetR 
Sholom gathered Tuesday in the 
East Cemetery to discuss Jewish con­
cerns over the considered place­
ment of a town garage on cemetery 
property abutting the temple’s 
memtnial park.

Vfetor Motes, the former town at­
torney representing the temple, this 
morning said the temple has serious

concerns about the possible place­
ment of a new Park and Cemetery 
D e p a r t m e n t  g a r a g e  in the 
southeastern sect ion o f the 
cemetery.

The town is drafting an ordinance 
which could allow for the sale of the 
existing Harrison Street garage to 
Multi-Circuits Inc. Should a deal be 
finalized, the town would be left 
without a faci l i ty  to service 
cemetery and park equipment

At the same time, the town’s 
director of public worlu. Jay Giles, 
has written a memo to the town

manager, Robert Weiss, recommen­
ding a new garage be constructed in 
the cemetery. The proposal sup­
ports a recommendation from a 
town Blue Ribbon Committee that 
the cemetery would provide a cen­
tral location for certain town equip­
ment.

Moses today said the temple still 
must investigate its exact holdings 
in the cemetery, but held out the 
possibility it might have legal 
claims to portions of the property 
being considered for the garage.

Weiss and the director of parks

and cemeteries, Robert Harrison, 
last night met with Moses and 
members of the temple's Memorial 
Park Committee to discuss the 
situation.

In addition to the question of land 
claims, Moses said the temple was 
concerned about the future 
avai labi l i ty o f space for its 
memorial park. He said the temple 
would like to avoid splitting up its 
park and targeting future burials to 
some other site.

The town Planning and Zoning 
Commission Monday tabled a vote

on a controversial zone change 
which is considered necessary 
before any sale of the existing town 
garage could be finalized.

Multi-Circuits originally proposed 
the sale in order to allow for the 
f i r m ’ s hoped-for expansion. 
Residents, however, have for some 
six months opposed the circuit 

. board manufacturer’s efforts to 
further develop its holdings in the 
otherwise residential area of 
Harrison Street.

The temple at the same time has 
been interested in acquiring ad­

ditional cemetery space, and in Oc­
tober sought to rent the space now 
being considered for the new gar­
age. In response to the inquiry, the 
temple reportedly was told the town 
intended the land for burials.

The temple is one of two groups 
who have lined up in opposition to 
relocation of the garage in the East 
Cemetery. Already on record in op­
posing the move is the Holl Street 
Residents' Association, who with at­
torney Jon Berman have sought to 
block efforts to sell the Harrison 
Street garage.

rescue
Boston

BOSTON (U P I) -  Boston’s fiscal 
volcano simmered down today un­
der court rulings prohibiting the city 
from closing its near-penniless 
school system and allowing the 
reinstatement of 400 police and 
firemen.

Some 64,000 students attending the 
nation’s oldest school system were 
rescued from a threatened shutdown 
by a Btate Supreme Court decision 
Tuesday ordolng the city to keep 
schools open thraagb Jane 19.

Minutes later, a lower court Judge 
gave Mayor Kevin White the green 
light to use part of a 99-4 million 
stata baiioat package to-restora 400 

. police and fireiigMcta to the 
payroD. The layoffs had sparked 
angry protests in several areas of 
the dty, including several days of 
street demonstrations that backed 
up rush-hour traffic for miles.

White had been under an earlier 
court order to use the money solely 
to rescue the sinking school system.

The rulings granted a brief respite 
to d ty  leaders Who for months tave 
been wrestling with a multi-pronged 
fiscal crisis that threatens to 
bankrupt the oldest capital city in 
the United States.

Officials have blamed the crisis, 
in part, on a Califonia-style voter 
referendum passe<r last fall by 
voters which limits property taxes 
to 2W percent of the fair market 
value of a community’s real estate. 
The measure is expected to cut local 
revenue across the state by $500 
million.

The major portion of the law 
doesn't go into effect until July 1, 
when White warned the city may 
have to put the layoffs of 400 police 
and firemen back into effed , close 
many fire and police stations, and 
lay off 2,000 more city workers un­
less the state intervenes.

Boston’s school system, scraping 
the bottom of its $210 million 
budget, had faced the specter of a 
d t ^ d e  shutdown as early as May 
16 when a $9 million payroll is due.

School officials bad been warning 
since March that the system would 
come up.fSO million short before the 
yea r ’s end, and city  offic ia ls  
b ickered  fo r  weeks w ithqut 
producing a rescue package accep­
table to the mayor and City Council.

As students came out from under 
their umbrella of uncertainty, police 
officers and firefighters celebrated 
the announcement by White that he 
had reinstated the public salety 
workers and ordered the reopmlng 
of two neighborhood police station.

C itisens outraged over the 
closings had taken over the one of 
the stations, in East Boston, and 
vowed fo oiccupy it until White 
reopened It.

Citizens also had picketed daily in 
front of the Sumner Tunnel — 
linking the neighborhood to the 
downtown — fpr 2W weeks to 
highlight thelY sense of isolation. 
Suppoirters of the lald-olf police and 
f i r e f ig h t e r s  fo rm ed  human 
blockages on commuter arteries 
leading into the city to snarl rush- 
hour traffic for thTM straight days 
last week.

In the school ruling, the Supreme 
Court Justices upheld Morse’s deci- 
lion ttat school children would be 
harmed If the year was shortened.

White said 'iW d a y  night be did 
not know where the money for the 
sdiools would come from, blaming 
Boeton’s financial bind p a i^  on the 
state's failure to find new ways to 
make np the tax shortfall expected 
from Propdaltlon 2W.

Law irks 
masseur

A  stone wall and heavy barbed wire surround the Catholic 
SOCUritV cemetery In the Falls Road area of Belfast where Maze hunger

^ striker Bobby Sands will be burled Thursday. Sands died Tuesday
In the 66th day of his hunger strike. (UPl photo)

Dublin is now scene 
of IRA-backed riots

BELFAST, Northern Ireland 
(U P I) — Rioting erupted in Dublin 
today and a letter-b«>mb campaign 
was unleashed on British politicians 
and the 'royal family as a second 
IRA hunger striker slipped closer to 
death.

But Britain’s Prime Minister 
Margaret Thatcher vowed no con­
cessions "no matter how much 
hunger striking there may be,”  
telling Parliament Tuesday, “ hfr. 
Sands was a common criminal."

The death of Bobby Sands, 27, ear­
ly Tuesday, on the 66th day of a 
hunger strike, touched off a n ^ t  
and day of rioting and battles at 
barricades in Northern Ireland 
between police and Catholics.

In Dublin, the capital of the Irish 
Republic, youths went on a rampage 
today after a vigil for Sands, setting 
fire to at least lQ0<cars, smashing 
shop and hotel windows and at­
tacking police with sidewalk bricks.

There were no reports of injuries, 
but a police spokesman said, 
“ Every store along a 200-yard street 
had its windows smashed."

In London, Scotland Y ar d  
reported today the interception of a 
letter bomb addressed to Labor Par­
ty spokesman on Home Affairs Rt^ 
Hattersley, similar to one addressed 
to Prince Charles that was defused 
Tuesday.'

The bombs, spotted by the post of- 
' flee, were passed to explosives 
experts. The incidents were being 
treated by police as part of the Irislf 
Republican Army's reaction to the 
death Sands.

Two other members of Parlia­
ment recently received letter 
bombs, a favored tactic of the out­
lawed IRA in previous outbursts of 
violence.

In Belfast, three firebombs went 
off early today, burning curtains and 
s ligh tly ' damaglpg the roof of 
Queen’s University Great Hall, one 
of Belfast'^ nnost striking buildings, 
police  rSported. Three other 
firebombs attaobed to curtains two 
stories high were recovered by 
police.

At least 21 people were lajured, 
four seriously. In street fighting 
Tuesday In the Catholic sectioa

Belfast, the capital of the country 
ruled directly by London to keep 
peace between extremists of the 
majority Protestants and minority 
Catholics.

-As pillars of smoke trailed above 
Belfast from torched cars today, 
two boys and two girls dressed in the 
uniform of the Irish Republican

' I

Second striker 
close to death

;*x*xi»x««-:'X-:-x-»»x->x-x-x-w»I
Army stood in an honor guard vigil 
at Sands’ coffin draped in the 
orange, white and green flag of the 
IRA.

But at Maze Prison from where 
Sands' emaciated body was borne 
home in the rain, convicted 
murderer Francis Hughes entered 
his 53rd day of a hunger strike and 
was reported having problems with

his- vision. During the weekend, 
Hughes was reported "three days 
behind Bobby.”

Tw o other hunger str ikers 
persevered for a 48th day — Ray­
mond McCreesh, 24, serving 14 
years for arms possession and 
attempted murder, and Patrick 
O’Hara who has an eight-year 
sentence f o r  possess ion of  
explosives.

Sands, who was serving 14 years 
for possession of firearms and was 
elected to Britain’s Parliament 
during his fast, maintained he was a 
"prisoner of war" and demanded 
IRA prisoners be aIlow(^ to wear 
civilian clothes and be excused from 
prison work.

Sands will be given a fullscale 
"Republican”  funeral Thursday 
afternoon, a spokesman for the IRA 
political arm, Sinn Fein, said.

He will be buried at Milltown 
cemetery,  tradit ional resting 
ground for IRA heroes, Thursday 
afternoon after a mass at St. Luke's 
Catholic Church, a short walk from 
the Sands’ family home.

By HILARY ROSENBERG 
Herald Reporter

MANCHESTER -  At the Euro­
pean Health Spa on Middle Turn­
pike, Kevin Smith provides the un­
ique treatment of massage therapy 
to relieve chronic muscular dis­
orders.

When he applied for the job a few 
months ago, Smith discovered his 
profession was unique in another 
way. In taking the job Smith was 
required by town ordinance to 
provide a statement of his past 
criminal record and have his finger­
prints placed in a permanent file at 
the Federal Bureau of Investigation.

'M- 'addition, the approximately 
‘ two-year-old ordinance relating to 

masseurs, required that Smith sub­
mit proof of his certification as a 
massage therapist and pay an an­
nual fee of $125.

Smith provided all the necessary 
information except the fingerprints. 
"This whole thing goes a little bit 
too far for me,”  he told the Board of 
Directors at their regular meeting 
Tuesday night.

He insisted that the law was 
meant to regulate masseurs who 
w e r e  o p e r a t i n g  i l l e g i m a t e  
businesses, “ a type of massage 
that’s rather different from my 
own.”

Massage therapy, ''e said, is one 
of several  new all ied health 
professions being practiced in this 
country. His training includes a 
bachelor's degree in psychology and 
instruction in psychotherapy, 
counseling and human anatomy, he 
said.

"There’s been a stigma attached 
(to masseurs) to have to undergo 
this type of procedure in order to 
practice in your city," he said.

Smith objected that the ordinance 
is regulating the wrong party. While 
masseurs submit to the demands of 
the law, illegitimate masseurs can 
simply go outside city limits to 
avoid the requirements, he claimed.

"A  group of well-trained, con- 
scientous professionals are being 
very much over-regulated," Smith 
objected in a later interview. " I f  
they want to regulate people who 
are practicing prostitution, then 
they should do that."

But Mayor  Stephen Penny 
claimed the ordinance was designed 
to keep a close watch on ail 
masseurs. "W e drafted that or­
dinance with some care,”  he said. 
"Yours is a profession that ought to 
be held to a high standard of care."

Having his fingerprints placed on
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A U.S. immigration 
Judge says former Nazi 
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file at the FBI, however, does not 
seem necessary to Smith, he said. 
Such a file "has a tremendous poten­
tial for abuse." he said “ Should I 
participate in a protest. I would 
very much prefer that they don't 
have a record to tap into. "

In support of Smith, Bob Faucher 
suggest^ the board amend the or­
dinance to omit any involvement of 
the FBI.

" I ’m a little nervous about that 
(involvement)," he said When, un­
der the Freedom of Information 
Act, Faucher asked to see the infor­
mation the FBI had compiled on his 
activities since he returned from 
serving in Vietnam, he was sur­
prised to receive 30 pages written 
about him, Faucher said.
'Smith has been working at tiie 

health spa since February and has 
had the Manchester Health Depart­
ment hold his fingerprints tem­
porarily while he tried, through the 
Board of Directors, to prevent them 
from going to the FBI, he said.

Ferry,
freighter
collide

NEW YORK (UPI)  -  A packed 
Staten Island ferry with a history of 
mishaps collided with a Norwegian 
freighter in dense fog just south of 
the Statue of Liberty today, injuring 
scores of commuters.

The collision set off a brief panic 
aboard the ferry, as passengers 
screamed, knock^ into each other 
and scrambled for life vests, but the 
boat was towed safely back to 
Staten Island.

Police said at least 62 people were 
injured — four seriously — and were 
taken to hospitals on Staten Island. 
The extent of the injuries was not 
immediately known.

There were no immediate reports 
of injuries aboard the freighter.

A Coast Guard spokesman said 
the collision between the ferry boat, 
the American Legion, and the 515- 
foot freighter, Hoegh Orchid, oc­
curred at 7:20 a m. in Upper New 
York Bay, about one mile from the 
St. George ferry terminal on Staten 
Island and just south of the Statue of 
Liberty.

It was the third t ime the 
American Legion has been involved 
in a mishap, prompting some angry 
passengers to label the vessel a 
"jinx ship.”

The Emergency Medical Service 
said eight people were taken to St. 
Vincent’s Hospital on Staten Island 
and another eight went to the U.S. 
Public Service Hospital in that 
borough.

Twelve of the victims suffered 
minor injuries such as bumps and 
bruises but four were seriously hurt. 
One person had a heart seizure, one 
had a fractured thigh bone, another 
had a heck injury and the fourth suf­
fered chest pains.

An EMS emergency van treated 
many people at the St. George ter­
minal.

Among the passengers on the 
ferry at the time of the collision 
were David Curran, 32, a U.S. 
Customs official and Bob D'Arco, 
33, who works for Prudential 
Steamship, Lines In.Manhattan, both 
of Staten island.

" I ’m a little shaken," said 
Cqrran.
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News Briefing

Envoy dispatched
WASHINGTON (U P I) — Syria and Israel wait in an 

uneasy truce for the arrival of a veteran diplomatic 
troubleshooter President Reagan ordered to the Middle 
Elast in an effort to avert war between the two longtime 
foes.

Philip C. Habib, a veteran Foreign Service officer 
with more than 30 years experience, was to meet today 
with Secretary of State Alexander Haig before going to 
Lebanon, Israel and Syria in that order.

Haig termed the situa­
tion  in Lebanon  
"dangerous and delicate" 
upon his retu rn  to 
Washington early today 
from a NATO ministers 
conference in Rome.

S y r ia  has p la ced  
b a tte r ie s  o f le th a l 
surface-to-air missiles in 
Lebanon, as well as along 
its border with the strife- 
tom country. Israel has 
demanded the Syrians 
remove the missiles or 
risk war.

Last week, Israeli jets 
shot down two Syrian 
helicopters attacking 
Christian Phalangist 
forces in the hi|ls of the 
Bekka Valley. Prime 
M in is ter  Menachem 
Begin said the Syrians 

threatened to destroy the Christians and increased their 
military forces in Lebanon by using gunships.

Syria, whose armed forces entered Lebanon in 1975 to 
stop the civil war. responded by installing batteries of 
Soviet-built SAM-6 missiles in the valley and more ad­
vanced SAM-2 units inside its border Begin has 
demanded a return to the status quo. as it existed before 
the missiles were introduced.

Habib. 61. served as undersecretary of state for 
political affairs, the top career position at the State 
Department, from July 1976 until he retired because of 
poor health in April 1978.

In late 1979, he returned as a senior adviser to 
Secretary of State Cyrus Vance.

Habib will be accompanied on his trip by Michael E 
Draper, deputy assistant secretary for Near Eastern 
and South Asian affairs.

Reagan sent a letter to Begin this week asking for 
restraint, while the administration asked the Soviet 
Union to carry the same message to its Mideast client. 
Syria.

Begin had hinted Israel might launch a military strike 
against the missile batteries this week unless Syria dis­
mantled them. But Tuesday he accepted the Habib mis­
sion and sent a letter to Reagan, personally delivered by 
Israeli Ambassador Ephraim Evron

Philip C. Habib

L o tte ry

Lottery numbers drawn 
Tuesday in New England: 

Connecticut daily: 541. 
Maine daily: 580 
Rhode Island daily: 772. 

The 4-40 Jackpot numbers

were 22-10-28-38 
Vermont daily: 765, 
Massachusetts daily: 

1636
New Hampshire daily: 

3864.

CORE Chairman Roy Innis says he will continue 
to do "the kind of Investigating that Is not being 
done by the FBI" into the Atlanta murders. Innis, 
who is Involved in a court battle ove^ who con­
trols CORE, claims his organization has a 
witness In the case, but that the FBI has rejected 
CORE'S lead. Innis holds picture of a former 
prostitute who was originally thought to be the 
CORE witness, but Innis denied that, saying the 
real witness was someone else, and law enforce­
ment officials knew who the witness was. (UPI 
photo)

Transplant works
MINNEAPOLIS (U P I) — One of the country’s 

youngest heart transplant patients, a 9-year-old girl who 
had been suffering a terminal cardiac disease, survived 
the critical 24-hour period after surgery and was doing 
fine today.

"Her new heart is pumping away beautifully, her 
blood pressure is normal,”  Dr. John Najarian said.

The girl, who was not identified, received the heart of 
an 11-year-old girl in surgery early Tuesday at Universi­
ty of Minnesota Hospitals.

Najarian. chief of surgery, said the girl will remain in 
intensive care and on a respirator for several days.

The child should be able to go home in six to eight 
weeks, said Ralph Heussner, a hospital spokesman. She 
then can lead "a  relatively normal”  life, with regular 
checkups and medication.

It was the sixth heart transplant at the university 
since 1978 and the recipient was the youngest.

She also was one of the youngest heart transplant 
recipients in the country, but doctors said they did not 
view her "age. size, or emotional maturity, as a 
prohibitive factor.”

Two of the six university transplant patients are alive, 
the longest for 2 years following surgery. Three others 
died of complications.

Doctors were optimistic the latest transplant would 
be a success because the girl survived the “ most critical 
period," the first 24 hours, and because of newly 
developed anti-rejection drugs.

Capitol Region Highlights
Pleads guilty

VERNON — John E. Johnson. 22, of Rachel 
Road. Manchester, pleaded guilty in Tolland Coun­
ty Superior Court 'Hiesday to charges of second- 
degree larceny and third-degree accessory to 
robbery. The arrest was made in connection with 
the theft of a car in East Hartford, last February 
and a robbery the same day at the Stop & Shop 
Supermarket in Vernon.

Johnson was being held on a 82,5(X) bond in the 
Hartford Correctional Center. Sentencing is 
scheduled for June 3 in Manchester Superior Court.

New light
EAST HARTFORD -  Some 20,(XK) East Hart­

ford homeowners will have the opportunity to see 
their homes in a different light later this month. 
Thermograms, or heat pictures, were taken during 
the winter from specially equipped planes, as part 
of a major conservation program launched by 
Northeast Utilities earlier this year.

The aerial pictures indicate areas of heat loss 
from each building and will be shown to residents at 
free workshops to be held May 19, 20 and 21 at 
Penney High School and again on May 26,27 and 28. 
Officials said that^|ypdows, uninsulated roofs, 
chimneys and doors are major sources of heat loss. 
Homeowners involved will sent invitations to the 
workshops which will be held from 6 to 9 p.m.

Car use cut
HARTFORD -  City Manager Woodrow W. 

Gaitor, took steps Tuesday to curb the use of city- 
owned cars. He it putting a stop to employees who 
have been taking the cars home at n i^ t, with the 
exception of five key employees.

The five exempted from the edict are Mayor 
George Athanson, Police Chief George W. Sicaras, 
Major Frances Kelliher and Captain Donald Chafin 
of the Police Department and Theodore Brin-

damour, a flood control engineer in the Public 
Works Department.

Some additional employees will be allowed to 
Lake cars home during the winter months in case 
they have to return to work at night for snow 
removal operations.

Two charged
EAST HARTFO RD  -  An East Hartford 

woman and an Andover man were charged Monday 
with several drug-related incidents after officers, 
armed with a search warrant, allegedly found a 
half-pound of marijuana, several amphetamines 
and a "small amount of,cooain In a Burnside 
Avenue apartment.

Charged were, Lois C. Hanselman, 34, of 3941 
Burnside Ave., where the search took place, and 
Alan C. Morrill, 36, of Kingsley Drive, Andover.

Both were charged with illegal possession of 
marijuana, illegal possession of marijuana with in­
tent to sell, illegal possession of a controlled sub­
stance with intent to sell. Illegal possession of a 
narcotic substance and illegal possession fo drug 
paraphernalia.

Golf fees upped
E A S t HARTFORD -  It's official -  the Town 

Council voted unanimously Tuesday night to in­
crease the fees for non-residents playing at the 
East Hartford public golf course.

The action was taken despite pleas from elderly 
members of the local golf league. The proposed In­
creased fees schedule was submltt^ by Fred 
Balet, parks and recreation director and approved 
by the council’s Fees Committee. The fees for East 
Hartford residents will remain the same. H ie fees 
for non-residents will increase from |3 to fS.SO for 
nine boles and from |6 to 97 for 18 holes, for 
weekdays. For weekends the fees would Increase 
from $4 to 94.50 for nine and from 9> to 99 for IS 
bolea.

The fees for non-resident senior citizens will also 
increase from 91-SO to 93 for nine holes and from 93 .

to 96 for 18 boles. The increases were made to offset 
deficits in maintenance costs of the course.

Effort fails
EAST HARTFORD — Efforts of RepubUcan 

Town Councilman Joseph LaRosa, to go to referen­
dum in November on a proposed ordinance to ban 
parking on front lawns, went down to defeat during 
Tuesday night's Town Council meeting. , 

Democratic members of the council said they felt 
the public bad been given enough time to provide in­
put during tte  six months that the ordinance was 
being revised.

The new ordinance replaces a more stringent one 
adopted last April. It allows exemptions for up to 
two vehicles for persons whose driveways can't ac­
commodate their extra vehicles.

Tax rate up
TOLLAND — For the first time in four years, 

the tax rate ii( Tolland will increase one mill over 
the 90 mills held over those years.

Voters, Tuesday night, approved a 97-7 million 
budget for the coming fiscal year. A  few of the 
some 100 residents attending the meeting called for 
the reinstatement of 9u0,000 deleted from the 
School board budget.

Ihe 9150,000 was part of a total 9316,373 cut from 
the combined school and government budget. Use 
cuts were necessary due to the espected loss in 
state and federal revenues.

Funds Shared
GLASTONBURY -  The Board of Finance, 

Tuesday night, approved IS projects that w U  share 
the town’s 912 mlUioo c^dtal ImprovanMnts funds.

The recommendations will be going to the Town 
Council soon for final approval. Most« them comp­
ly with the recornmendatioos made by Rkfaard 
Borden, town manager. .

MB I
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MX goes ahead
CHICAGO (U P I) — Defense Secretary Caspar W. 

Weinberger says the MX missile system win be 
deployed despite opposition from the Mormon Church 
and Western states because it is vital to offset Soviet 
nuclear missile gains.

Weinberger, responding to questions after an address 
at the 96th annual convention of the American 
Newspaper Publishers' Association Tuesday, said the 
Reagan administration will recommend a method of 
deploying the MX miasUe ratem  in early July.

Earlier, Mormon Church President Spencer Kimball, 
spiritual leader to a million Mormons in Utah — two- 
thirds of the state’s population — asked President 
Reagan to reconsider plans to build the multiple- 
warhead MX missile systm  in the desert basins of Utah 
and Nevada.

But Weinberger said the MX was ’ ’necessary and es­
sential”  to restore the nuclear strategic balance with 
the Soviet Union.

The present Minuteman system of land-based nuclear 
missiles is "rnUch too vulnerable”  to the increasing 
strength of Soviet missiles and could suffer a 90 to 95 
percent loss in a Soviet first strike, he said.

"The missile is vital, I am convinced. It has to be 
deployed someplace,”  Weinberger said.

The Air Force is proposing deployment of 200 MX mis­
siles in a system of 4,600 "holes in the ground,”  inter­
connected ^  a special road system, s p r ^  across Utah 
and Nevada. The missiles would be moved periodically 
so they could not be targeted accurately.

At an ANPA luncheon hosted by United Press Inter­
national, the defense secretary said Reagan was setting 
an example of "courage and political leadership”  by 
cutting back domestic spending and expanding 
resources to meet the growing Soviet military threat.

Union unauthorized
WARSAW, Poland (U P I) — Poland’s parliament 

swiftly passed a law today authorixing Rural Solidarity 
to legiilly register as an Independent farmers’ union and 
delegates expressed hope that it would lead to an in­
crease in agricultural producthm.

No delegate voted against the law and Parliament 
gave its approval within 30 minutes of the session’s 
opening. T b m  were four abstentions.

"The draft bill will contribute to ease conflicts and 
social tension in the countryside and boost agricultural 
production,”  said Francisxek Sadorski, one of two 
delegates who spoke in the pre-vote debate.

Parliament also passed a bill authorizing state-run 
farmers’ organizations to register as trade unions.

Ihe nearly unanimous support lor the bill contrasted 
sharply with the bitter party oppooitloa to the fanners’ 
union last nnonth, when the independent labor move­
ment staged nationwide strikes ih support of the 
farmers.

Communist Party leader Stanlslaw Kania had said 
there was no room in the countryside for "political op­
position”  and Soviet-led Warsaw Pact forces staged 
prolonged maneuvers in Poland in an unsuccessful bid to 
get the independent union movement to back off its 
demands.

Kania did not attend the parliament session, going in­
stead to a party meeting in Plock, west of Warsaw.

In other developments, the official army newspaper 
Zolnierz Wolnosci said “ routine”  training exercises by 
Soviet communications troops were under way in 
southeastern Poland, but criticized Solidarity for repor­
ting that iet airborne troops had landed in the repon.

“ The spreading of news which might spark public 
anxiety is proof of the lack of responsibility and does not 
serve our state interests and our allies,”  newspaper 
said.

W eather

Today’s forecast
Considerable sunshine and warm this afternoon writh 

scattered showers. High temperatures in the 70s. 
Scattered showers tonight ending late tonight. Urns in 
the 40s. Considerable sunshine breezy and cooler 
Thursday with highs in the 60s. Light and variable winds 
today shifting to the northwest this afternoon and in­
creasing to 15 to 20 mph tonitht continuing Thursday.

Extended outlook
Extended outlook for New Ekigland Friday through 

Sunday:
Massachnsetu, Rhode Island and Conneeticnii 

Fair weather through the period. Highs in the 60s and 
low 70s. Ebicept cooler coast. Lows in Ihe mid 90s to mid 
40s.

Vennonii Generally fair through the period. Highs 56 
to 66 Friday and in the 90s over the weekrod. Lows in the
90s and low 40s.

Maine and New Hampshlrei Fair through the 
period. Higkn in the SOs to low 60s north and 60s to low 
70s sooth except cooler at the coast. Lows in the 90s to 
low 40s.

Long Island Sound
Long Island Sound from  Watch H ill Rhode Ision<! 

and Monunk Point, N .Y.i Winds becoming northerl] 
t t o  afternoon and increasing to 15 to 25 knots will 
higher gusts tonight. North to northwest 20 to 90 knob 
with higher gusts TTnirsday. Visibility 1 to 9 miles anc 
variable to near zero in fog and local showers today, im­
proving to 5 miles or more tonight and Thunxlay. 
Ocouioiial showers today, clearing tonight. Pair on 
Tburs^y. Average wave heights Increasing to 1 to 9 feet 
this afternoon and 2 to 4 feet tonight. ,

National forecast
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Ry United Preaa Inlernational
Today la Wednesday, May 6, the 126th day of 1961 with 

229 to follow.
The moon Is moving towanl its first quarter.
The morning star la Mars.
The evening stars are Mercury, Venus, Jupiter and 

Saturn.
Tboae horn on this date are under the sign of Taurus.
Sigmund Freud, Austrian neurologist and founder of 

psychoanalysis, was b « a  May 6, 1866. '
On this date In hlitory;
In 1816, the American Bihle Aaaociation was 

organized in New York City.
In 1925, the Worka Progress Adminiatratlon— knoim 

as the WPA — was established to provide Work for 
nnemployed in the depths of the Great Depresakn.

In 1972, an armed man who had hijacked a plana in 
Pennsylviuila the day befora parachuted over Honduras 
with im.OOO coUecM  In ransom.
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Reagan's caution continues in budget fight
WASHINGTON (U P I) -  Preti- 

dent Reagan is taking the same 
cautionary tack in p r^ctln g  the 
fate of his proposed budget cuts he 
used In fbrecarilng election results 
that clearly were m his favor.

With a House vote on the budget 
package likely today or Thursday, 
Reagan scheduled another round of 
White House pep talks with about a 
dozen members of Congreu, many 
of whom already have pledged their 
support.

During the past two weeks, 
Reagan has conferred with about SO 
Ilouae members and it now se«ns 
certain he has won over more than 
enough to nail down House passage

- of his 9689.2 billion budget plan.
Reagan is optimistic, but publicly 

remains cautious.
"You know me,”  he told reporters 

during a picturetaking session 
Tuesday. “ I run scared all the time. 

. I ’m going to wait for the count.”
Told the count may well rival his 

. own lopsided election win, Reagan
- said, “ If it turns out like the one last 
■ November, I ’ll be very happy.”

Reagan h u  concentrated on the 
budget, but also has been busy 
preparing for Thursday’s visit by 
Japanese Prime Minister Zenko 
Suzuki.

A planned meeting today of the 
president and hia foreign policy ad­
visers was to touch on such topics as

Vote now close 
to pass plan

auto imports, the sinking of a 
Japanese fre i^ ter  by an American 
submarine and U.S. calls for Japan 
to bolster its national defense.

Reagan’s budget plan — slightly 
m ^ ie d  — is sponsored in the 
House by Reps. Phil Gramm, D- 
Texas, and Delbert Latte, R-Ohio. 
Last month, it lost some momentum

to the 9714.5 billion Democratic! 
alternative offered by Budget Chair-' 
man Jim Jones of Oklahoma.

But the trend has reversed.
" I  don’t even think it’s going to be 

close,”  said Rep. Tom Bevill of 
Alabama, one of a group of conser­
vative Southern Democrats backing 
Reagan.

Although Reagan’s proposals 
seem headed (or approval, the fate 
of his proposed three-year, 90 per­
cent tax cut is uncertain.

"The tax package is something 
else,”  said Rep. Buddy Romer, D- 
La. " I t ’s going to have much more 
difficulty in the House.”

Sen. Robert Dole, chairman of the 
Senate Finance Committee, said, 
however, he sees a "shift in the 
direction supporting the president 
on tax reductions that I didn’t find 90 
days ago.”

Dole said he b e liev es  the 
Republican-controlled Senate will 
ai^rove ” a multi-year tax bill.”

But he sald.he is not sure whether 
it will be the sweeping reduction 
Reagan wants.

■i. i.
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VA still won't honor claims 
for Agent Orange damages

WASHINGTON (U P I )  -  The 
Veterans Administration has yet to 
honor an Agent Orange damage 
claim because it insists there is no 

.s c ien tific  proof the defo liant 

..sprayed over Vietnam harmed any 
' American GIs.

Tuesday, the VA announced It had 
ordered a definitive study of the her­
bicide angry veterans blame for ills 
ranging from headaches and acne to 
birth defects in their children.

A University of Callfornia-Los 
. Angeles research team has been 
’ awarded 9114,288' to design the 
epidemiological study. Dr. Matthew 
Kinnard told a quarterly meeting of 
(he VA’s Advisory Committee on 
Health. Related Effects of Her- 

.. bicides.
. "W e have gone now farther than 
we ever had before,”  said Kinnard. 
He said the Pentagon will be in­

volved in the study because it has 
” tte  definitive information on troop 
defdoyments”  and Agent Orange use 
in Vietnam.

Agent Orange, sprayed over an 
area the size of Massachusetts in a 
futile effort to deprive Vietnamese 
guerrillas of concealment in trees 
and shrubs, has been identified as a 
possible hazard because it contains 
traces of virulently toxic dioxins.

Dr. Thomas Fitzgerald of the 
American Legion, an advisory panel 
member, blamed inflammatory 
news coverage for fanning veterans’ 
fears about Agent Orange.

Some veterans complain they 
fathered stillborn or deformed 
children as a result of combat 
exposure to the defoliant. Others 
blame the diozin-tainted plant-killer 
for their own mental or physical im­
pairments.

Fitzgerald said an unfounded fear 
of stillborn and defective children is 
disrupting some veterans’ families 
and causing other veterans to seek 
unnecessary vasectomies.

"This is a real fear that exists in 
the veteran population at the 
moment,”  he said. "But the proof at 
the mqment is just to the contrary.”  

He said evidence shows pregnant 
women exposed to dioxin do risk 
having children with birth defects. 
"Animal studies to date, however, 
have not shown this to be the case 
with males transmitting to females 
the possib ility  for deform ed 
children,”  he said.

In December 1979, a concerned 
Congress ordered a study of Agent 
Orange. But the study was delayed 
until now by court challenges from 
the National Veterans Law Center.
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Ongoing debate

Smart shopping
Smart shoppers read the 

Superm arket Shopper 
column Wednesdays and 
Saturdays exclusively in 
The Herald.

House Speaker Tip O'Neill speaks \Nith House Majority Leader 
Jim Wright, D-Texas, left, and Rep. William Alexander, D-Ark., 
center, Tuesday as the House continues its debate on the 1982 
budget. (UPI photo)
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Baseball , 
fields a ! 
hazard

MANCHESTER -  The baseball 
fields at some local schools are in 
“ deplorable condition”  and present 
a hazard to young ball players, Vic­
tor Helln, commissioner of the 
International Little League, told the 
Board of Directors Tuesday night.

At the Nathan Hale'School field, 
sprinkler heads are exposed 
creating gaps that are three to four 
Inches udde, Helin said. A cement 
home plate at that field presents a 
further danger.

Other ball playing areas are also 
plagued with holes in the ground as 
well as large breaks in fences.

Deputy Mayor Stephen Cassano 
said he received a phone call recent­
ly from the parent of a youth who 
"was on crutches”  from an injury 
suffered when he tripped in a hole on 
a school playing field.

Mayor Stephen Penny remarked 
that the n< ws of the deterioration of 
the Nathan Hale field was dis­
tressing since $22,000 was ap­
propriated two years ago for the 
construction of a playground facility 
and f ie ld  th ere . "G e n e ra l 
maintenance is the problem," he 
said.

Seeking to have the fields mended 
before the Little League season 
starts. Helin asked the board to give 
the Park and Recreation Depart­
ment jurisdiction to restore the 
areas.

However, Cassano pointed out 
that the department has its hands 
full preparing the town recreation 
fields for the summer leagues that 
use them

Penny suggested Helin confront 
the Board of Education with the 
problem, since the school buildings 
and grounds crew is responsible for 
maintenance of school fields. -

E - r r  .i

Lamson says 
zoning rules 

• 'no obstacle'

Studies page

V i* ,-,. .-; '

Evandro Nobrega, left, a Brazilian journalist, studies the front 
page of the Manchester Herald as the Herald’s city editor, Alex 
GIrelli, points out a detail of design. With Mr. Nobrega Is his wife, 
Marla Bernadete, center. Nobrega, Is In Connecticut on a 
professional exchange, spent a few days at the Herald and will 
visit the Hartford Courant and other state papers. (Herald photo 
by Burbank)

Name omitted
M.ANCHESTER -  The name of 

William Masse was inadvertently 
omitted from the East Catholic High 
School honor roll published in Mon­
day's Manchester Herald 

Masse should have been listed un­
der "Honors with D istinction"

Offices to close
MANCHES TKK — The Municipal 

Building will be closed Monday. 
May 25. in observance of Memorial 
Day

There will be no refuse collection 
on that day

Emergency numbers in effect for 
that day will include: highway, 647- 
3233, refuse, 647-3248 and sanitary 
sewer and water, 647-3111.

Open house
M A X  IIESTEK -  St Bridget 

School will hold an open house from 
6 30 to 8 p rif May 13 at the school, 
located at 74 Main St All are 
welcome

Brazilian journalist studies 
state newspaper business

MANCHESTER — A Brazilian 
journalist is spending about three 
weeks in Connecticut studying 
newspaper procedures here under 
an exchange program sponsored by 
the Interamerican Press Associa­
tion and the Partners of the 
Americas.

The visitor is Evandro Nobrega, 
general editor of 0 Norte, in Joao 
Pessoa, Paraiba Joao Pessoa is the 
capital of Paraiba. the partner state 
of Connecticut in the Partners of the 
Americas.

Nobrega will spend a short time at 
the Manchester Herald before going 
to the H artford  Courant. a 
newspaper approximately com­
parable to his own paper in Brazil. 
He will also spend short periods at 
the News-Times of Danbury and 
with the New Haven newspapers.

Besides being an editor of 0 
Norte, Nobrega is press director oP- 
the F'ederal University of Paraiba.

director of public relations for the 
Higher Justice Court, and press 
director of French Cultural Associa­
tion.

"1 humbly want to learn lot with 
you." Nobrega said at the beginning 
of his professional visit.

Nobrega was the only journalist 
chosen for the exchange from 
among 15 applicants in Brazil. He 
was selected by a commitee from 
the Interamerican Press Associa­
tion after he had been proposed by 
the Partners of the Americas in 
Paraiba and accepted by the 
N a t i o n a l  P a r t n e r s  of  the 
Washington. D C. as well' as the 
Connecticut Partners organization.

Funding for the exchange is 
provided by the Tinker Foundation 
of the World Press Freedom Com­
mittee.

This is Nobrega's second visit to 
.the United States.' He previously 
v is it^  New York and Washington.

While in the area he and his wife, 
Maria Bernadete Nobrega, are the 
guests of Mr. and Mrs. Alexander 
Girelli. Girelli is city editor of The 
Manchester Hefdid.

Comment session
MANCHESTER -  The Board of 

Directors will conduct a public ses­
sion Thursday, May 21 from 6:30 
p.m. to 8:30 p.m. in the Board of 
Directors Office in the Municipal 
Building to hear comments and 
suggestions from the public.

Future sessions will be held the 
first Tuesday of each month from > 
a.m. to 11 a.m. and the third 
Thursday of each month from 6:30 
p.m. to 8:30 p.m. in the Board of 
Directors Office.

By PAU L HENDRIE 
HeraM Reporter .

HARTFORD -  Manchester this 
nwmlng resumed its defense in U.S. 
District Court on charges the town’s 
1976 decision to pull but of the Com­
munity Development Block Grant 
program was based on racial 
prejudice.

Manchester Town Planner Alan 
Lamson and bousing developer 
Harold Rothsteln both testified 
Tuesday that Manchester’s loning 
regulations are favorable to the 
dmlopment of low- and rooderate- 
income housing.

“ It is my opinion that the 330 
acres that are zoned for multi­
family dwelllhgs that have not been 
developed p r^ d e  ample oppor­
tunity,’ ’ testified Lamson.

Rothstein, who plgns to build 110- 
unlts of low- and moderate-income 
housing on Oakland Street, agreed 
th a t M a n c h e s te r ’ s zo n in g  
regulations present no obstacles to 
the development of subsidized 
housing. He said the town’ s 
withdrawl from the CDBG program 
has no effect on his current develop­
ment plans.

“ The image of the town was not 
one of the factors we considered,”  
stated Rothsteln. “ I f the zoning is 
available, it makes the decision to 
go ahead easier."

Rothsteln’s testimony countered 
previous testim ony by other 
developers, who said Manchester’s 
decision to leave the CDBG 
program gave a negative image and 
convinced them tte  town is not 
receptive to subsidized bousing.

Justice Departm ent G eorge 
Schneider tried to minimize the im­
pact of yesterday’s testhnony.

“ Your Honor, for the record, I 
wish to reiterate that neither the 
plaintiff nor the government regard 
this as a zoning case,”  he said.

But previous witnesses called by 
the plaintiffs helped give zoning its 
Importance in the case.

Previous testimony claimed 
towns often use zoning regulations 
to prevent development of low- 
income housing. Witnesses testified 
that zoning ordinances often in­
dicate bow receptive a town is 
toward minorities.

Plaintiffs lawyers also previously 
introduced a May 1978 letter from 
regional HUD o ff ic ia l Daniel 
Kolesar, which charged the town 
with establishing "zoning im ­
pediments”  to the development of 
low-income bousing.

"A fte r  the letter from  Mr. 
Kolesar, the Planning and Zoning 
Commission discussed at several 
meeting the content of the letter, 
testified Lamson yesterday. “ At 
some of the meetings, the sugges­
tion was made that the HUD of­
ficials should be apprised of our 
zoning regulations. The Planning 
and Zoning Oommisslon was very

concerned about the letter.”
Lamson said no such zoning im­

pediments exist. Since 1970,30.4 per­
cen t o f a ll housing bu ilt in 
Manchester w u  subsidised, 86.7 
percent of all family housing feallt in 
town was subsidlnd and 19 zone 
changes to allow  multi-fam ily 
houring have been approved. Lam- 
son testified.

U nder c ro ss -ex a m in a tio n , 
however, Lamson conceded that 
only four of the 15 sites approved for 
zone changes have been developed 
and he a^eed that the only local 
subsidized housing built since 1974 
was 40 units of eMerly housing.

But he testified that much low- 
income and m oderate-incom e 
housing is currently on the drawing 
b o a rd , in c lu d in g  p lan s  to 
rriiabllltate Cheney Mills property 
and provide as much as 900 housing 
units.

Lantson refused to concede under 
cross-examination that racism 
played a role in the anti-CDBG 
movement.

“ I think the conversation was 
more directed at the fact that people 
didn’t want the federal government 
directing any activity in the town,’ ’ 
testified Lamson. Lamson agreed 
that local residents expressed a fear 
that HUD would order changes in 
the town’s zoning ordinances. But 
Lamson said HUD has never made 
attempts to Influence local zoning.

Lamson stated that be personally 
favored remaining in the CDBG 
program. "1 would say that there 
were benefits to it and the benefits 
were of value to the community,’ ’ 
testified Lamson. But be said his of­
fice had very little input into the 
CDBG program.

Probe expands
COLCHESTER (U P I) -  PoUce 

have expanded their investigation of 
a series of rapes and sexual attacks 
they believe were committed by a’ 

man who ran lone women drivers off 
the road at night.

Police have attributed two rapes 
and two assaults in Lebanon, East- 
ford, Hampton and Mansfield during 
Mardi and April to ttae unidentified 
man who they said sometimes 
wears a disguise.

State police Sgt. Donald Crouch 
said ’TuMday that at least two more 
woman bad been attacked than 
originalty thought.

“ At least two, that we’re bearing 
about in our investigation, and 
maybe more haven’t reported the 
assaults,”  be said.

Police said they are searching for 
a white man, about 6 feet tall, with 
brown hair and a “ beer belly," who 
may sometimes wear a false 
moustache or a false beard, and who 
drives a dark-colored van.

Easter Seals plan annual event
MANCHESTE:R -  The 

seventh annual bike-walk 
for the Easter Seal Society 
of Connecticut is scheduled 
for May 17.

The goal of the event is 
to sign up 200 participants 
and raise $5,000 to benefit 
the campership program at 
the Ea s t e r  Se a l ' s  
Hemlocks Outdoor Elduca- 
tion Center for the Han­
dicapped in Hebron.

The 15-mile course will 
beg i n and end at 
Manchester High School. 
Vo l u n t e e r s  w i l l  be 
stationed at check points 
throughout the route to 
verify distances and assist 
the p a r t c i p a n t s  i f  
necessary.

Pledges will be based on 
the number of miles com­

pleted. Last year, more 
than 175 persons raised $3,- 
500 to support the summer 
camping programs.

Area junior and senior 
high school students are 
expected to participate in 
this year’s event.

In conjunction with the 
bike-walk, community and 
business leaders are in-

n u ii^
Probate Court is open 
for conferences with the 
judge from 6:30 P.M. to 
8 P.M. on Thursday 
nights. Appointments 
sug g e s t e d .  N i g h t  
telephone number: 647- 
3227.
William E. FitzGerald 

Judge of Probate

vited to participate in a dividual sponsorships ot president, M ancbesterl 
Partnership Program with $50. Stole Bank. Details on both I
the Easter Seal Society. Honorary chairman of events are available byl 
The goal of the program is the Partnership Program calling the Easter Seal f 
to raise $2,500 through in- is Nathan Agostinelli, Society at 226-9438.
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Landers sets run 
tor District board
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MANCHESTER -  ’Ilioinaa E. 
Landan, a aenior at the Unlverzlty 
of Connecticut and a volunteer f in  
fighter with the Eighth Dlitrict Fire 
Department, hai announced that he 
will leak election to the diatrlct’s 
Board of Directori.

Landera, 22, baa been a resident of 
the dlitrict all hlz life. ’Two of the 
■lx poaiUons on the board are up for ’ 
election. Evelyn Gregan, who toldi 
one of tboae two pozto, hai laid she 
will not leak re-election. The other 
expiring term is that of John Flynn. 
’Thie terms are for three years.

Electiooe will b t held May 27 at 
the district’s annnal meeting. A dis­
trict president will alao be elected 
and the incumbent, Gordon Laeaow, 
is a candidate for re-election.

In annonncing biz candidacy, 
Landera said, “ Ibelleve the district 
is a good place to live. I  want to aee 
the district maintain its character 
and 1 think I  can do eomethlng to help 
It aa a community and provide the 
resldenta with tte  best aervicee 
available.”

Landers has been with the fire 
department aince 1977 and is an 
Emergency Technician.

College plans, courses 
for school-age children

Thomas E. Landers

MANCHESTER -  “ CoUege tor 
Kldi,”  will be the title of a new non- 
c red it  p rogram  In itia ted  by 
Manchester Community College.

The program is designed to 
provide leisure time activities for 
school-age children. It will offer a 
series o f short-term  courses 
appealing to the interests of young 
pMple in the community. The 
courses are meant to provide a 
variety of learning experlencea In 
the arts and sciences.

The courses will start the week of 
June 29 and the following courses 
w ill be o ffe red : "E xpression

through Movement," —a claaa In 
coordination and rhythm for 9!8 year 
olds; '”ryping for Teens A Pre- 
t o ^ , ’ ’ --P ip ing 10-16-year-olds to 
get'V  bead start in maatering the 
typem ter keyboard; “ Art through 
Nature," for ages 9-11 —an explora­
tion of art forms while studying sub­
jects of nature; "Drama Workshop 
for Teens,”  —a studio course for 
ages 13-17 to be conducted by the 
MCC director of theater.

For more details on course 
descriptions and for registration in­
formation, call the Community Ser­
vices office at MCC, 646-2137.

Schbols plan 
spelling bees
MANCHESTER -  ’This week 

baa been designated as “ Spelling 
Bee Week,”  in the Manchester 
elementary schools.

Spelling bees will be conducted 
for students in Grades 4, S and 6 
in each school.

There will be three winners per 
grade in each school and 
proficiency certificates will be 
presented.

The dates for the awards will be 
determined by each individual 
principal.

STARTS TOMORROW 
AT 10 A.

6
BERNIE’S
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U.S. aid to Pakistan might lead to disaster
WASHINGTON — Several weeks 

ago, I warned that the United States 
was inviting another Iran-style dis­
aster in the Middle East by cozying 
up to Pakistan's hated dictator. 
Gen. Muhammad Dia ul-Haq. , 

Since then, according to the latest 
intelligence reports, the situation 
has deteriorated inside Pakistan. 
Yet the Reagan administration, in­
stead of backing away from this 
potential nightmare, is planning to 
commit the United States even 
more deeply to Zia's unpopular, 
repressive regime 

Secret foreign intelligence cables 
reviewed by my associate Jack 
Mitchell reveal that the "Shah Syn­
drome" is already beginning to 
materialize in Pakistan: American 
citizens have been assaulted in 
broad daylight on the streets of the 
country's largest cities — for the 
sole reason that they are identified 
with the United States, which is sup­
porting their detested dictator.

Surrounded by shameless yes- 
men. Zia has delayed three times 
the free elections he promised, has 
instituted unprecedented martial 
law and has arrested and tortured

An editorial

thousands. He is caught in a vicious 
circle of his own making: The more 
he cracks down on his countrymen, 
the more unpopular he is and the 
more vocal his opponents become. 
This then causes him to tighten the 
screws still more.

But though Zia sits precariously 
on a powder keg. White House 
policymakers seem determined to 
provide him with the latest in 
military technology. The reasons 
are the same as those advanced to 
justify support of the shah: The 
United States needs a "dependable 
ally" in the region to confront the 
Soviet Union, and Saudi Arabia must 
be protected to assure a continued 
flow of oil.

But diplomatic sources warn that 
time may be running out on Zia, just 
as it did for the shah Pakistan's 
highest judges have refused to go 
along with the general's kangaroo 
courts, in which defendants are con­
victed without benefit of witnesses, 
lawyers or appeals. Lawyers have 
also shown their distates for the dic­
tatorship by openly supporting 
prominent colleagiies who have 
been arrested  on trumped-up

Small business 
is big spender

"Small Business' makes a highly- 
significant contribution to the 
American economy — and its drive 
for reforms to increase chances for 
survival of smaller interpreneurs 
merits consideration in Washington.

Current high interest rates have 
been especially hard on members of 
the small business community.

A survey bv the National Federa- 
fbn  of Independent Businesses, 
quoted in Congress by Rep. Bill 
A lexander. D-Ark , said the 
prolonged high interest "is driving 
small businesses into bankruptcy at 
an alarming rate "

In 1980, over 11.000 entrepreneurs 
were forced to give up, an increase 
of 58 percent over the number of 
small business failures in 1979, said 
Alexander

"The tragedy of such business 
failures does not stop at the personal 
level of the entrepreneur himself," 
the congressman said. "It also has a 
profound impact on the U.S job 
m arket. During the last two 
decades, three out of every four new 
jobs have been created in the small 
business sector."

Two special events are planned to 
focus attention on Small Business:
• 1. Men and women from the small 

business community are planning a 
massive rally on the U.S. Capitol 
steps April 27 to seek support for 
major tax. spending and regulatory 
reforms the consider vital.

Pre-arranged meetings with in­
dividual members of Congress 
following the rally will focus on

Berry's World

O lM IbyN E A  Inc

"When putting a freeze on government infor­
mation pubiications. we came across this book­
let: ‘How to Sell Your Economic Package to 
Congress'."

Jack Anderson
Washington Merry-Go-Round

charges and tortured.
The recent burning of a DC-10 at 

the Karachi airport was officially 
termed an accident, but government 
insiders say it was sabotage.

Still the repression continues. 
Newspapers carry photographs of 
cruel floggings, and the possibility 
has been discussed of punishing 
adultery by publicly stoning the 
tresgressors to death.

Education is deteriorating; Zia 
and his generals have closed down 
schools as a means of curbing op­
position. The government has also 
increased censorship of the media.

Yet it is this hated dictatorship 
that the White House seems deter­
mined to identify with, trying to 
prop up Zia's shaky regime with

hundreds of millions of dollars An 
military aid. If there are dissenting 
views in the administration, they 
have been effectively silenced by 
Secretary of State Alexander Haig.

The really sad part of this is that 
the administration's policy may ac­
tually help to achieve exactly the op­
posite of its intended goal: By 
helping Zia, we could drive the op­
position — which Includes virtually 
all political parties — and the people 
of Pakistan into Soviet arms. That 
would make Zia's downfall doubly 
disastrous for the United States.

F oo tno te: The Reagan ad ­
ministration has t r i^  to distinguish 
betw een  a u th o t i ta t ia n  and 
totalitarian regimes, but Zia has 
even been denounced by former sup­

porters for flouting the nation's con­
s titu tio n . S ta te  D epartm en t 
spokesm en refused  repea ted  
requests for comment, n

R eagan-go-round  I Ronald 
Reagan has an engaging all- 
American quality that is changing 
the character of the White House. 
His good-guy approach to govern­
ment has perceptibly reduced the In­
trigues and animosities that usually 
abound in the White House. Indeed, 
he has succeeded in warming some 
of the coldest hearts in Washington.

— The president has had the same 
mellowing effect, according to the 
polls, on the public at large. Last 
June, a dismaying 77 percent of 
those polled believed the govern­
ment had Jumped the track. But a 
few days ago, the White House 
pollster, Richard Wirthlin, reported 
this unfavorable figure had dropped 
to 48 percent. Conversely, only 16 
percent of the people left the 
government was moving in the right 
direction last June. But Wirthlin's 
private polls show '46 percent now 
think the direction is right.

— Former President Jimmy 
Carter put on a show piety, but some

of his aides led riotous private lives. 
Ronald Reagan is quiet about his 
religions life and moral code. But 
the word has gone out from the 
Republican National Committee 
that aides should set a moral exam­
ple. Anyone caught revealing and 
womanizing will be fired, the staff 
has been warned.

Walrh on  w ad e: It's no secret 
that Congress is a law unto itself. In 
no field is this more obvious than 
e lec tio n eerin g . Not only do 
members of Congress get several 
free trips home to politick each 
year, but they have permitted 
themselves to send out virtually un­
limited "campaign brochures" at 
the public’s expense. Congressional 
mail to "^constituents costs the 
taxpayers more than $60 million a 
year now, and the price is going up.

The reason is the congressional 
redistricing made necessary by the 
1980 Census. Many district boun­
daries will be redrawn to comply 
with shifting popijl^ation; some dis­
tricts will be iTjCrged into others.
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legislative steps to curb inflation 
and government reguiation.

2. Sen. Lowell Weicker Jr., R- 
Conn. chairman of the Senate Com­
mittee on Small Business, has in­
troduced a resolution asking the 
president to designate the week of 
May 10-16 as "National Small 
Business Week. "

"For years, small businesses have 
made the greatest contributions to 
our national economy in terms of 
productivity, innovation and job 
creation, " Weicker said. “It is im­
portant that we as a nation' 
recognize and appreciate those con- 
tributoi;s '

Earlier this year, Weicker sub­
mitted a bill aimed at reducing the 
tax burden on the nation's small 
businesses, "not to give them a 
break over other industries, but to 
correct existing inequities in the tax 
codes tha t now have sm all 
businesses struggling to stay alive. "

The senator deciared that small 
businesses constitute 97 percent of 
ail businesses in the United States 
"and are responsible for more than 

7 million of the 9 million jobs 
created in the last 10 years."

Congress may face some delicate 
decisions in deaiing with the 
problems of small business. It's 
axiomatic, though, that a strong 
business economy is vital to a 
flourishing national economy. 
Government as well, as private in­
terests should do what appropriate 
can be done to keep both in good 
health.

"I think you'll be pleased with the realism — It’s taking more time and material 
than our original estimate. There'll be a significant cost overrun."

Surviving an IRS audit
WASHINGTON -  April 15 has 

come and gone, the 1940 is in the 
mail, and the IRS has extracted its 
annual pound of flesh. You can sit" 
back and relax for another year. Or 
can you?

What if the IRS decides to take a 
close look at you through an audit?

"The mere suggestion of an IRS 
audit." said a lobbying group called 
Citizens Choice, "triggers in many 
taxpayers, even those who are 
educated and well-informed, a knee- 
jerk reaction of intimidation and 
fear."

Your chance of being audited is 
not great — about 2 in 100 taxpayer 
returns were audited last year. The 
(xlds increase if you're in a higher 
tax  b r a c k e t ,  s a y s  an IRS 
spokesman For 1979 returns, about 
1.1 percent of those earning less 
than (10,000 were audited, and 8.7 
percent of those earning more than 
$50,000.

If you are chosen for an audit, 
however, the chances are great — 70 
to 80 percent — that you'll end up 
paying Uncle Sam additional 
money. One former IRS official says 
an auditor "feels satisfied" if he can 
find an additional $300 to $500 in 
taxes in a person's return.

On the other hand, some of the 20 
to 30 percent of those who leave an 
audit without paying more actually 
get extra money from the govern­
ment when mistakes in their favor 
are found.

Keeping com plete reco rds 
throughout the year Is the best way 
to prepare for an audit.• Such 
documentation should be kept on 
hand for at least three years — the 
IRS has that long to get around to 
auditing you.

Some tax experts also suggest a 
citizen about to be audited should 
consider taking a tax specialist with 
him to the session. This Is especially 
true If the return is a com{dlcated 
one. In this cgse, the audit seuion 
would be preceded by a strategy 
meeting between the two of you over 
defense of your return.

Paul N. Strasseis, a tax law 
specialist for five years with the IRS 
In Washington, has dhUlned a belp-

Lee
Roderick

Washington
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ful guide to taxpayers facing audits. 
Strasseis has chosen "Harry" as 
your IRS auditor, and in his best­
selling book "All You Need to Know 
About the IRS,",_tells how to put 
your best foot forward with Harry:

1. Dress the way you usually do 
for business. Don’t disguise your 
affluence by dressing down, but 
don't flaunt custom-made suits and 
fancy jewelry at Harry either.

2. Be on time. This is especially 
important if your appointment is 
first thing in the morning or just 
after lunch — times when Harry Is 
likely to be right on schedule. Keep 
Harry waiting and "You will have a 
very long and very costly audit.”

3. Don’t take more records than 
you are asked for to the audit, don’t 
volunteer Information, and don’t be 
cbatty. "You gain nothing by being 
overly cooperative," and may well 
unwittingly give Harry the rope to 
bang you with.

4. Act as natural as possible. If 
you’re nervous, calmly explain that 
to Harry ("This is my first audit” ) 
so that he won’t think those beads of 
perspiration spell guilt instead.

5. Watch your attitude — Harry 
expects you to be concerned, and If 
you aren’t, he may resent it. Don’t 
seek sympathy — Harry’s heard 
every story there Is.

6. If you have a tax specialist with 
you, let him do the talking. Harry 
prefers to talk to a fellow pro than to 
you.

7. Don’t plead that "everyone does 
It.” That just Irrltages Harry. (One 
IRS agent, told repeatadly of others 
— neighbors, in-laws, etc. — who 
"do it,” took down their names and 
addresses and Ipul their returns 
pulled and audltdd too.)

8. Don't go to the audit without 
records. If you have a <etrong fnd
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By Bob Wagman

logical case to make for a deduction, 
you may be lucky enough to get a 
break from the auditor despite lack 
of records. But it's a high-risk 
proposition.

9. Don’t allow Harry to go on a 
fishing expedition at your expense. 
Don’t voluntarily show him the 
papers oh which your strategy or 
f ig u re s  a re  s k e tc h e d . If 
you've saved the check, show him 
the stub in your checkbook instead. 
"But don't hand the checkbook to 
him. May as well toss yourself into a 
pool with a shark."

10. Don’t dump a mountain of un­
sorted paper on Harry’s desk and 
defy him to make sense of it. 
(^ n c e s  are he will no matter how 
long it takes and. Infuriated, will go 
out of his way to sock It to you.
. If these points make It sedm as 

though Harry has all the advan­
tages, you’re right. Says another 
former IRS auditor and supervisor, 
Mary L. Sprouse of Los Angeles: 
“You are at a disadvantage...The 
burden of proof is on the taxpayer.”

At any rate, armed with records, 
a heads-up attitude, and perhaps a 
couple of aspirins, reasonably 
honest citizens should be able to sur­
vive a tax audit and live to file 
another 1040 next year.

Embargo
decision
analyzed

WASHINGTON (NEA) -  The lif­
ting of the Soviet grain embargo has 
ended the longest and sharpest 
debate to have taken place thus far 
within the Reagan administration. 
In the final analysis, it was a com­
bination of personalities and 
politics, both domestic and inter­
national, that caused the White 
House to reverse its previous deci­
sion to retain the embargo.

(Candidate Ronald Reagan often 
promised farmers that as president 
he would end the embargo and 
refrain from using food as a weapon 
of international politics. But by mid- 
March the decision to retain the em­
bargo, at least for the time being, 
had been all but made.

In fact, the administration not 
only intended to continue to bar the 
Soviets from buying more grain 
than they bad already contracted for 
under a multi-year agreement, as 
President (barter had ordered last 
y e a r  a f te r  the  invasion  of 
Afghanistan, but was also talking 
about closing some loopholes In 
fa r te r’s embargo order.

The decision to continue the em­
bargo was made chiefly for reasons 
of foreign policy. Anti-Soviet 
hardliners within the administra­
tion, led by Secretary of State 
Alexander Haig, believed that en­
ding the embargo would send the 
Soviets "mixed signals” at the very 
time that Washington was trying to 
establish a firm front in its dealings 
with Moscow.

Haig and others insisted that the 
embargo had to be continued even if 
It was not very effective and even if 
American farm ers were being 
adversely affected. Reagan seenned 
ready to accept this argument 
despite his campaign promises to 
the contrary.

This position was strongly op­
posed by Agriculture Secretary John 
Block and other administration of­
ficials in the fields of domestic 
policy and politics. They argued that 
the embargo was hurting U.S. 
farmers and the U.S. economy nnore 
than it was hurting the Soviets and 
that Reagan bad to keep his cam­
paign pledge.

The debate reportedly led to some 
direct confrontations between Haig 
and Block in which the secretary of 
sUte asserted in effect that the final 
decision was his because the em­
bargo was a matter of foreign 
policy. This left some bruised 
feelings within the Cabinet and the 
White House domestic-policy staff.

Several recent events turned 
things around. I'lrst, Prance 
notifled the State Dapertmsnt that 
next year it would increase substan­
tial^ ita grain exports to the Soviet 
Union, which wnb wUUng to |hiy 
premium prices for grain.

House Majority Leader John Qroppo, left, and Finance Committee Chair­
man Irving Stolberg, D-New Haven, discuss their meeting with Gov. William 
O’Neill over a tax package. (UPl photo)

Democrats like 
revenue plans

HARTFORD (UPI) -  A $55.7 million 
revenue package which revives proposed 
state fee increases and taxes unincor­
porated business on a flat-rate basis 
received support from m ajority  
Democrats in the (Connecticut House.

House Speaker Ernest Abate, D- 
Stapiford, said Tuesday he was 
"positive" there was enough support to 
get the tax package need^ to balance 
the fiscal 1981-82 budget through the 
House today and back to the Senate.

Abate called the proposal hammered 
out in a more than 2-hour closed caucus 
of House Democrats Tuesday night "the 
best of a series of poor alternatives. Any 
tax increase is a poor alternative."

The flat fee schedule was “truly a 
business tax” compared to a tax on net 
income which many lawmakers viewed 
as a selective income tax, he said. “No 
one business gets hit terribly heavy.”

Abate said only three of the 82 House 
Democrats would vote against the 
revenue package. Seven disgruntled 
Democrats bolted to kill the spending 
side of the budget on its first try last 
month. There are 69 House Republicans.

The House plan would impose flat fees, 
which range from $100 to $3,000, based on 
the gross income of unincorporated 
businesses. It would also require each 
corporation to pay a minimum of $250. 
The two would raise $34.3 million.

The modified license and permit fee in­
crease proposal, which would raise $10 
million, places a $300 cap on the increase 
levied on any group.

The $60 million package approved by 
the Democratic-controlled Senate last 
week imposed a 5 percent tax on the net

income of unincorporated businesses 
which gross more than $150,000.

Both the Senate and the House 
Democratic caucus supported a 1 per­
cent hike in the 8 percent tax on 
telep.hone and cable television com­
panies, which would generate $11 million 
in revenue.

The Senate scrapped any proposed fee 
increases after opposition poured in 
from the bartenders, nurses, barbers, 
doctors and other professionals who 
would be affected.

Under the House plan, the more than 
71,000 unincorporat^ businesses which 
gross less than $10,000 would not be 
taxed. An unincorporated business which 
grosses from $10,000 to $25,000 would pay 
$100 and firms which hauls in more than 
$500,000 would pay the top fee — $3,000.

Abate said he hoped the Senate would 
approve the House package Thursday 
and send it to Gov. William O'Neill, who 
has threatened to veto the spending side 
of the budget if the revenue bill is not on 
his desk.

But the speaker conceded the House 
plan would not win rave reviews.

"I’m sure the.govemor will not be hap­
py with this proposal,” said Abate, who 
predicted, however, that O'Neill would 
sign into law the revenue package 
needed to balance the budget.

O'Neill told legislative leaders during 
an hour-long meeting in the morning that 
he wanted the Senate approved version 
of the unincorporated business tax.

O'Neill originally called for a 10 per­
cent tax on unincorporated businesses to 
generate the revenue needed to balance 
the 1981-82 budget.

GOP seeking budget 
without tax increase

HARTFORD (UPI) -  The Legislature 
should recall Connecticut's $2.98 billion 
budget before the governor signs it and 
rework it to exclude any tax increases, 
say Republican legislative leaders.

House Minority Leader R. E. Van 
Norstrand, R-Darlen, said Tuesday the 
budget was forced through by Gov. 
William O’Neill and the Legislature's 
Democratic majority and fails to reflect 
what the people wanted.

Republicans, who are in the minority 
in both the House and Senate, drafted 
two alternative budgets, which are os­
tensibly tax-free.

"I think It’s time to bring it (budget) 
back from Buffalo Bill’s office,” said 
Van Norstrand, who has been mentioned 
as a possible candidate in the 1982 
Republican gubernatorial runoff.

The budget Tor the 1961-1962 fiscal 
year, according to the governor’s office, 
is being check^ by the Legislative Com­
m issioner's  Office. Once O’Neill 
receives the budget he has five days to 
sign it.

In o rder to reca ll the budget. 
Republicans would need majority ap­
proval of a joint resolution in the House 
and Senate:

The governor has said he will not sim 
the budget unless the House approves the 
Senatepassed version of the unincor­
porated business tax, which Is 5 percent 
on net inctune over $150,000.

Senate Minority Leader George 
Gunther of Stratford said O’Neill should _

have "the guts” to go ahead and veto the 
budget if he does not like it. He said 
O’Neill should not sign any bill and then 
say he does not approve of it.

The governor Monday signed a bill that 
increases the effective corporation tax 
from 9.1 percent to 10 percent. O'Neill 
said he felt “compelled” to sign the bill 
because the revenue would be needed to 
balance the budget.

"If he didn't like the tax, he should 
have vetoed it and then sent it back,” 
Gunther said.

Republican State Chairman Ralph 
Capecelatro said the call to bring the 
budget back to the Legislature was a 
"bold and necessary” move which had 
the support of the GOP statewide.

Freeze eased
HARTFORD (UPI) -  The hiring 

freeze imposed by Gov. William O’Neill 
at the beginning of the year has been 
lifted for five state agencies, says 
Anthony Milano, secretary of the Office 
of Policy and Management.

Milano said Tuesday the following 
agencies will be allowed to fill vacancies 
— the Departments of Mental Health; 
Mental Retardation; Children and Youth 
Services; Corrections and the Veterans 

.Home and Hospital.
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Senate bill adds judges
HARTFORD (UPI) -  The ConnecUcut 

Senate has voted to create eight new 
judgeships for the state’s Superior Court 
system in an effort to help reduce a backlog 
of cases awaiting action on court dockets.

The Senate also voted Tuesday to impose 
penalties for violating the state’s beverage 
deposit law and rejected a proposal to cut 
state funds for programs which treat victims 
of cystic fibrosis and juvenile diabetes.

The bill to increase Uie number of Superior 
Court judgeships from 119 to 127 received un­
animous approval, with even Senate Minority 
d^dbsv George Gunther, R-Stratford, the 
chamber’s leading critic of the judicial 
system, agreeing.

Gunther said he hoped the judges wobld 
consider holding night court and "working an 
eight-hour day” to relieve the backlog of 
cases and increasing business the courts have

faced. The measure was sent to the House.
Also sent to the House was a measure im­

posing a fine of $50 to $100 on first offenders 
of the state’s beverage container deposit law, 
which requires a minimum 5-cent deposit and 
refund on all carbonated beverage con­
tainers.

A second offense could result in a fine of 
$100 to $200 and a third offense from $250 to 
$500.

The Senate also decided to recommit, and, 
in effect kill, a bill that would have cut in half 
state-funded programs to provide treatment 
for cystic fibrosis and juvenile diabetes.

Also recommitted was a bill that would 
have required the Rocky Hill Veterans Home 
and Hospital to turn over money bequeathed 
to the home by veterans into the general fund.

The 33-3 vote ended a controversy in which 
veterans argued to keep the $500,000 in their

own fund, which is used to pay for additional 
supplies for the veterans home.

In other action, the Senate approved and 
sent to the House a bill to create a criminal 
court for the-judicial district of Stamford- 
Norwalk. Cases from the seven communities 
that would make up the new district are now 
handled by the judicial district of Fairfield.

Approv^ by the Senate and sent to the 
governor were bills to:

—Impose tougher regulations to protect 
apartment hunters from excessive fees 
charged by apartment listing services.

—Protect housing authority employees 
from liability, including legal fees, arising 
out of alleged negligence or infringement on a 
person's rights during the performance of 
their duties.

— Allow municipalities to issue permits to 
open up local drinking places at 11 a m.

Teacher rights boosted
HARTFORD (UPI) -  The Connecticut 

House has approved bills which would bolster 
teachers’ rights to participate in local 
government, speed the return of stolen 
property and strengthen car anti-theft laws.

The chamber, which recessed for majority 
Democrats to consider looming revenue 
package troubles, Tuesday held off action on 
a bill imposing a 5-year minimum mandatory 
prison term for use of a firearm during com­
mission of a crime.

Most of the debate centered on the bill to 
permit professional public school teachers 
and public school employees to serve on any 
governmental body of the town in which they 
reside, except the board of education.

Communities are currently allowed to 
regulate the political activity of resident 
municipal employees, including teachers, 
and prohibit them from holding office.

The lawmakers defeated a Republican- 
sponsored amendment which would have 
gutted the bill by prohibiting teachers from 
serving on any local board which has finan­
cial control.

Rep. William Cibes, D-New London, said 
the amendment "restricts unduly participa­
tion in politics by one class of people.”

The bill went to the Senate on an 82-67 vote.
The House also sent the Senate a bill which 

would set up procudures for the speedy return 
of stolen property to robbery victims after 
they request the return within 30 days. The 
court could extend the maximum to W days.

The bill would also require law enforce­
ment agencies or the court, which now can 
hold on to property until disposition of the 
case, to notify the owner of their right to 
request return within 48 hours.

Another bill sent to the Senate would

strengthen motor vehicle laws to discourage 
and punish auto theft and so-called “chop 
shops" for stolen car parts.

One facet of the bill would allow state and 
local police, to examine and inspect the 
records kept by motor vehicle dealers and 
repairers.

The House also approved and sent the 
Senate a bill which would provide $10 million 
in bonding to pay a judgement against the 
sUte for delays in construction of the Univer­
sity of Connecticut Health Center in Far­
mington.

Rep. Irving Stolberg, D-New Haven, co- 
chairman of the Finance, Revenue and Bon­
ding Committee, said interest on the $7 
million judgement was costing the state more 
than $1,000 a day and immediate action was 
needed.
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Fedorenko's lie imperils him
NEW HAVEN (UPI) — A former Nazi 

death camp guard has moved a step 
closer to being deported for lying on his 
application for a visa to enter the United 
States more than 30 years ago.

^  U S. Immigration Judge Gordon Sacks 
issued a preliminary finding Tuesday 
that Ukrainian-born Feodor Fedorenko 
was ineligible for a visa because of his 
statement on a 1949 visa application that 
he was farmer in Poland during World 
War II.

Fedorenko has admitted he was a 
guard at the Treblinka death camp in 
Poland at the time and says he lied about 
it to avoid shipment back to the Soviet 
Union at the end of the war.

Sacks continued the proceedings for 
two weeks when he was expected to 
decide whether Federenko, 74, also was 
deportable for helping Nazis at the 
Treblinka camp persecute civilians and- 
or persecute people on the basis of race 
or religion

The judge's preliminary finding was 
not a ruling that Federenko be deported* 
and could be offset by information 
scheduled to presented when the hearing 
resumes, he said

The deportation proceedings were 
launched by the' Justice Department, 
which won a 1' S. Supreme Court deci­
sion in January stripping Fedorenko of 
his U S citizenship

The department also contends that

F ed orenko

Fedorenko personally participated in 
atrocities against prisoners at Treblinka. 
but says it needs only to prove he lied on 
the 1949 visa application to obtain a 
deportation order.

Fedorenko, a former Waterbury,

Conn., factory worker, denied he hurt or 
abused Jewish prisoners at the camp and 
said he was unaware at the time 
thousands of Jewish prisoners were 
murdered there.

“First of all, I don't believe the Ger­
mans would allow us to (hurt the 
prisoners). And what for, that was not 
our duty," Fedorenko said through an in­
terpreter. “Never in my life have I hurt 
or hit a person."

He told Sacks he performed his guard 
duties at the Nazi death camp in fear of 
his life. Had he disobeyed, he said, “I 
don't think they would have even 
bothered to put me in the camp. I think 
they would have shot me right away."

However, the Justice Department in­
troduced transcripts of 1976 interviews 
where Fedorenko indicated to a federal 
immigration official that he was aware 
Jews were murdered at Treblinka and 
worked in the area of the death barracks.

“Only from one tower you could see 
whaUwas going on in that part of the 
camp," Fedorenko said in the interview. 
"There was not much action in that part 
of the camp, but I did see corpses. 
Jewish workers in the camp were 
moving the corpses."

Sacks granted the two-week recess in 
the hearing to give Fedorenko and his at­
torney time to locate two witnesses, in­
cluding a former State Department of­
ficial. who apparently  approved

Fedoroiko's visa application.
Attorney Brian M. Gildea indicated he 

did not know where the official, iden­
tified as Ralph O. Clark, was living. The 
second witness was identified as a 
linguistics expert at Yale University.

Gildea lost an attempt Monday to have 
the proceedings postponed while 
Fedorenko pursued plans to leave volun­
tarily for the Soviet Union, where his 
wife and two children live. Gildea said 
Soviet pride might prevent the Soviet 
government from accepting Fedorenko 
if he were ordered deported.

Fedorenko told Sacks he was captured 
by the Germans two weeks after he 
joined the Russian Army in 1941, and was 
among a group of 200 prisoners removed 
from a larger group of and taken 
elsewhere to perform work for the (Ger­
mans.

Of the 200, he said 15 to 20 were shot by 
the Germans for minor offenses, three 
committed suicide and another 15 to 20 
escaped.

When he and other prisoners arrived at 
Treblinka. he said, “We were told to go 
to work as watchmen, kitchen-workers. 
The others were washing clothes. 
Nobody was given a choice."

Federenko said he was selected as a 
guard apparently  because of his 
mechanical abilities and adequate 
health.

Men work to fix nuke plant
WATEKFORD lU P Ii -  Crew.s 

worked today to replace an instrument 
-which malfunctioned in the steam 

generator at the Millstone 11 nuclear 
power plant and sent the plant into an un-' 
scheduled shutdown 

The problem Tue.sday and earlier shut-' 
down of the neighboring Millstone I 
nuclear plant required Northeast 
Utilities to turn to other generating 
sources to meet power needs at an es­
timated added cost of $I million a day. 

Northeast said the earliest the

Millstone II plant was expected back on 
line was late today, while a June 7 target 
date had been set for the return of 
Millstone 1, which was shut down on 
March 21

The two shutdowns — neither of which 
involved the plants' nuclear reactors — 
left the smaller Connecticut Yankee 
plant in Haddam as Connecticut's only 
operating nuclear plant.
. Northeast spokesman Clifford Hill said 
estimates put the cost of replacing the 
power generated by the two Millstone

u n its  from  o th e r  so u rc e s  was 
"something like over a million dollars a

day"
However, he said the latest shutdowns 

had not occurred during a peak demand 
period for power and Northeast was 
having no problem supplying electricity 
to its customers.

“There's no great demand on the 
system and there's none that we're not 
meeting," he said, adding that the costs 
of providing replacement power could be 
lower than the estimates because of the

relatively low demand.
Hill said Millstone II was shut down at 

2:50 a.m. Tuesday after an instrument 
malfunctioned and gave a reading there 
was no water in the plant's generator.

Hill said the plant's reactor wasn't in 
cold shutdown, but rather a standby 
state so it could be brought back into ser­
vice relatively quickly once the instru­
ment was replaced and its systems 
checked out.

Meanwhile, renair work on the 660- 
megawatt Millstone I plant continued.

A workman installs a Presidential seal over the 
West Wing entrance to the White House, where 
for the first time It will hang. The seal along with 
Marine guard are recent Reagan Administration 
additions that have returned to the White House 
some of the trappings and formality that was dis­
continued by President Carter. (UPI photo)

Workers
opposing
workfare

SOUTHINGTON (UPIl 
-  A union representing 
municipal workers has 
moun t e d  t he  f i r s t  
challenge to the state's 
new workfare program 
which requires able-bodied 
welfare recipients to work 
for benefits

The union filed an unfair- 
labor-practice complaint 
with the state Board of 
Labor Relations Tuesday, 
charging Southington is let­
ting welfare recipients do 
union work

Robert Pezze, staff 
representative for Council 
4 of the American h'edera- 
tion of State. County and 
Municipal Employees, said 
the complaint would be a 

"test case for the workfare 
program

S t a t e  Labor  C o m ­
mi s s i one r  P. Joseph 
Peraro said it was the first 
official complaint his of­
fice has received since the 
law was implemented Jan 
1.

"There has been a lot of 
grumbling about it. but no 
one has taken an official 
stand against it. " he said

Because the action was 
brought against the town 
and not the state's Depart- 
men t  of I ncome 
Ma i n t e n a n c e ,  which 

'oversees the workfare 
program,  it must  be 
defended by the town. 
Peraro .said

Pezze said the union is 
opposed to the hiring of 
workfare participants for 
jobs at the Town Hall, 
highway, park and sewer ' 
departments that should be 
filled by union workers.

Wel fare  r ec i p i en t s  
should be placed in jobs 
that aren't covered under 
the union corttract, such as 
those in the library or the 
local hospital, he said.

Town Manager John 
Weichsel said no union 
member would be or has 
been denied a position 
because of the program.

He said most of the 
program participants have 
been placed in the parks 
and highway departments 
because those departments 
"show the greatest ability 
to handle these workers."

Southington's proposal 
on how to use the workers 
had been approved by the 
Department of Income 
Maintenance, Weichsel 
said.

Now you know
Harry Truman met his 

childhood sweetheart, Bess 
Wallace, when he was 6 i 
and ^ e  was 5, but theyA 
were not married Ibr iJ'* 
more years. '

her wish... 
a gift from

Gallord’s silky Qiana’s<̂
As luxurious as any top can 
be! Soft, silky Qiana® nylon 
blouses to top her spring! 
Feminine, shirred front yoke. 
White, oyster, coral, jade, 
periwinkle, rosewood. Sizes 8- 
18. sportswear.

spring blazer classics
If you think you have to pay big 
bucks for spring blazers, you 
haven’t seen these fully lined 
blazers . . . classically 
tailored, but never ever dulll 
Solid linen looks in white, red 
or navy! Madras plaids! Sizes 
8-16. sportswear.

14.50
Wondermalil silky satins
Soft, sensous satiniqtie coor­
dinating underliners in Antrol* 
III satin tricot, so fine it 
resembles silki Beige, white, 
black or peach. Sizes S-M-L. 
lingerie
Basic Camisole, *7 
Petti Slip; 7.50

flowers Moom for Mom
Our romantic special occasion 
dresses in flowing feminine 
sheer polyester that’s a breeze 
to take care of too. Lilac, green 
or navy flowers abloom on 
white. Bodice pleated to 
perfection. Boatneck. Satin 
piping trim and tie sash. Sizes 
8-16. dresses.

Your Worth‘9 Chorgo Card makaa ahopping ao aaafl 
Downtown Hours - Mon-8st 9:30*5 Thurs til 9
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.egal gambling would bring bucks, not woes
NEWINGTON (UPI) -  
Hnbllng in Coanecticut h u  the 
iteatUI of railing milUoM in itate 
nm ne wMhoat Increuing perional

£, bankruptciM and welfare 
, a  itiidy laya.

The itnity, rdeaaed Toeaday, alio 
■nd that lUte^egulated gambling 
veara to have reduced the in- 
dence of illegal gambling in 
mnectlcat.
At leMt-'dO percent of Connec- 
eot’i  houaeholda have tried their 
ick a t leoit once at legal gafhbling 
I the tune of |M  million in the 1980 
acal year, the itudy aaid.
Of that figure, the itate received 
•  million; municipalitiei 111

mllUon in proceed! and local taxei; 
RVpIiera of goodi and aervlcea $147 
million; and the 5,663 peraoni

Latest study 
shows benefits

employed by the Induatry, $62' 
million.

The remaining $306 million went 
back to the bettora, the atudy in­

dicated.
The anrvey waa decigned to Itudy 

the locial, economic and flacal Im­
pact! of Connecticut’i  three Jai alai 
frontona, one dog track, 16 Off Track 
Betting parlora, Teletrak and the 
weekly, dally and inatant lotteriea.

It waa conducted by the Loi 
Angelea-baaed Economic Reaearch 
Aaaociatea and included a random 
telephone aadipllng of 600 people 
with another 900 Interviewed at 
gambling facilitiea.

One-fourth of thoae aurveyed laid 
they knew aomeone who fit tte  
deacriptlon of a compulalve gambler 
and 17 percent conaidered gambling 
a common illneaa.

AUced if they knew of anyone 
whoae g am bli^  deprived their 
familiea of the neceaaitiei of life, 13 
percent reaponded yea and 4 percent 
conaidered it a very common oc- 
ctumocc.

Only 1 percent of tboae aampled 
aaid they knew of aomeone who had 
to leek welfare aaiiatance becauae 
of legalixed gambling.

Alfred Oppenhelmer, executive 
director of the atate Dlviaion on 
^>ecial Revenue, aaid the itudy waa 
"well done” and laid hla office will 
go over it thoroughly before drawing 
any concluaiona or commenting on 
iti finding!.

The Itudy aaid no evidence waa

uncovered to ahow atate-icgulated 
gambling cauaed more problem! for 
welfare recipienta than other 
aegmenU of the atate'a population.

"There ia no evidence that waging 
at Connecticut regulated gaming 
ayatema haa impacted aggregate 
social and economic indicatora, and 
apectficaily there ia no apparent 
relationahip to the number of per- 
aonal bankruptciea, peraonal debt, 
unemployment or welfare payment! 
atatewide,” the atudy indicated.

It aaid individual caaea may exiat 
of gambling-related bankruptciea or 
financial problem! cauaed by 
gambling, "but in terma of the 
overall atatewide incidence of debt.

bankruptcy ... legalize gambling baa 
had no apparent impact.”

The atudy aaid there waa no 
measure of the actual incidence of 
gambling-related financial dif- 
ficultiea.

It indicated evidence auggeata 
that "expanded gambling oppor­
tunities may also result in the ero­
sion of the level of Illegal gambling 
activity."

On the question of welfare 
recipients, the study indicated, 
"There appears to be no greater in­
cidence of gambling participation 
among lower income groups U>an in 
the population overall."

In s ta n t  lo t te r y  
a  p o p u la r  g a m e

NEWINGTON (UPI) — A study of Connecticut's 
legal gambling industry shows that the sUte’s ina­
tant lottery has been the most popular form of legal 
betting in the state.

The studv, released Tuesday at a special meeting 
of the five-member Gaming Policy Board, indicated 
$46.5 rnilHou was bet on the $1 insUnt lottery game 
during fiscal 1980 in Connecticut.

While Instant lottery game had 35.6 percent of the 
players, jai alai, with only 18 percent of the players, 
groased $219 million.

Off Track Betting collected $166 million from 
only 6.2 percent of the bettors, aaid the study which 
waa done by the Los Angeles-based Ecoinomlcs' 
Reaearch Associates.

Greyhound racing drew 8.6 percent of the betting 
crowd, which parlayed $90 million. The weekly 
lottery took in $11.5 million from 1.9 percent of the 
bettors and the daily lottery accumulated $73 
million from 12.1 percent of the wagerera.

The study also showed 54 percent of those who 
gambled had full-time jobs with 90 percent white 
and earning between $15,000 and $25,000 a year.

The average gambler spent $10 to $50 a day at 
parimutuel events and $1 to $5 in the lotteries. The 
majority of parimutuel players were under 30 wUle 
the majority of lottery players average SO. -

Male gamblers outnumbered women, 51 percent 
to 49 percent.

B o a t in g  f r a te r n ity ]  
is c h e a t in g  s ta t e

HARTFORD (UPI) — State Tax Commissioner Orest 
T. Dubno says boat dealers and boat buyers in Connec­
ticut are falsifying sales records to avoid paying state 
sales taxes.

Dubno said Tuesday the fraud was uncovered in con­
tinuing efforts by state officials to collect upaid taxes on

• boats sold in Connecticut or brought into the state for
• use here.

He said dealers and owners were "absolutely 
falsifying records” and the fraud would be reported to 
the state attorney general’s office.

; Dubno wouldn’t be specific about details of the cases, 
or how nuuiy people were involved.

A team of 20 state auditors armed with subpoena 
' powers spread out through the state in an effort to 

collect any unpaid taxes on boats.
They reported that boat owners avoided state taxes by 

forming Delaware corporations that technicaiiy bought 
 ̂the boats. The auditors also found that others bought 
 ̂boats in Connecticut but took delivery in another state 

: thinking they could avoid Connecticut's 7V9 percent 
sales tax.

Dubno said if a boat is brought back to Connecticut for 
prbnary keeping or use here, the owner must pay the 
state sales tax or the difference between any sales taxes 
paid in another state.

Only a few owners who bought and took delivery of 
their boats in Connecticut haven't paid state sales taxes,

; he said.
The investigation has resulted in tax liens on nearly 20

- boats because their owners ignored tax bills or repeated 
: warnings to pay bills.

The boats will be auctioned if the taxes remain un­
paid, Dubno said.

- Investigators have found 700 boats for which owners 
failed to pay sales taxes since the Investigation began in 
May 1900.

Dubno said the assessed value of the boats was about 
$2 million, and the state has collected on about 75 per- 

. cent of the taxes due.
Some people are appealing the tax bills, be said.

^ a in s  predicted
HARTFORD (UPI) — Democratic National Chalr- 

nuui T. Charles Manatt is predicting that his party will.. 
'pick up l i  to 14 seats in the U.S. House in next year’s' 
elections.

Manatt, who met with Connecticut Democratic 
legislative leaders and Gov. William O’Neill Tuesday,

. said the Reagan administration would forfeit much of 
' its popularity once now proposed budget cuts are put 
into effect.

"There has never been a time wbeTe "The Big Steal’ 
works,” he said.

' Manatt, who was accompanied by Democratic 
; National Treasurer Peter KeUy, said the party is
• attempting to broaden its base with direct mail and 
lotber todraiaing methods. He said the party was 
j healthy.
'  "The Democratic party is alive and well,” be said. 
'Manatt forecast a "net gain” of 13 to 14 aeaU in the 
' House In the 1983 elections “and we will do everything to 
^regain a  majority in the Senate.”
;  He said O’Neill discussed bis own political plans for
n ex t year, but Manatt refused to dlvnl^  what the gover-
>Dor —M o ’N«dll, who succeeded the late Gov. Ella 
tOraaso New Year’s Eve, will seek election in his own 
rrightinU M .

'Probe questloried
HARTFORD (UPI) — A member of the Legislature’s 

Public Safety Committee, which investigated why state 
(poUce WMUB’t  sent to a Ku Klux Elan rally, says the 
committee’s review was i t r i ^  a “witch hunt”

; Rap. Kaoneth Tripp, IbaiaiAlre, said ’Tuesday state 
IMlice prooedure dletataa that troopers only be sent to a 
'HcaUbr whan a situation is out of hand and when local 
police have moblliaod their entire department.

ENTIRE STOCK

SPRING S SUMMER SUITS
4 Reg. to*l45««

$ 9 0 9 0

Reg. to *175“ « 1 3 9 “

Reg. to *195“
< ^ r

Reg. to *235“  
e Free Alteretlona

M 9 9 * "

100% TEX. POLYESTER
e Navy e Brown 
e Bottle Green 
e Reg. *65̂ ® 
e Sizes 36 to 46

SPORT COATS DACRON & WOOL
e Navy e Lt. Blue 
eton
e R o g .’BSOo 
e Sizes 36 to 46

P A M T C  ENTIRE h a g g a r . l e v i  p a n a t e l a , j a y m a r .
■ M l l l v  stock H U B B A R D  SA NSA B ELT. T A IL O R 'S  BENCH

2»*30 2p.*40 2J5012J70
Reg. SIB to $22 Reg. $23 to $2B Reg. $30 to $37.50 Reg. $40 to $45
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SHSRTSLEtyE
DRESS SHIRTS
Made by the ^Arrow-*- 

SH IR T CO.

•  SOLIDS
Reg. *14

•S T R IP E S
*  Reg. *16

• Sizes 14'/2to 17

SHORT SLEEVE

GOLF KNITS
by Arrow

•  Dacron A Cotton
•  10 Fashion Colors S-M-L-XL Reg.*13*«

M ilN E  GUIDE
GRLF

JACKETS
e Dacron & Cotton Shell 
e Machine Washable 
e Ton e Yellow e Blue

$ 1

SHORT SLEEVE

TERRY KNITS
by Enro

e 2 Great Styles
•  B Great Colors
•  70% Poly-30% Cotton S-M-L-XL

$ 1 2 9 4
Reg.*17'»to*l8«»

BEGAL*S
"Where Women Love to Shop for Men" 

MANCHESTER VERNON

VISA

903 MAIN ST.
Open Doily 9:30-5:30, Thurs. til 9.00

TRI-CITY PLAZA
Open Doily 10 00 9:00 Sot. til 5:30
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DOT seeks 
fare hikes

HARTFORD (U P I) — The sUte 
Transportation Department has 
proposed an increase in fares for 
Middletown and Enfield commuters 
that would be added to a general 20 
percent fare hike requested for all 
of its routes.

The proposed increase would raise 
one-way fares from 75 cents to 11.20 
and monthly passes from »25 to $41 
on the two routes, among the most 
successful in the state.

When combined with the general 
increase request for ail routes, the 
two hikes would result in a 60 per­
cent increase for riders paying as 
they ride and 64 percent for those 
buying monthly passes.

John J. Spaulding, .director of 
operations in the DOT’S Bureau of 
Public Transportation, said the 
changes result from a decision to 
base fares on the distance each 
route travels.

But the service would still be a 
good buy. Spaulding said, adding 
that ridership on both routes is not 
expected to decline by more than 5 
percent despite the increases.

“It's still inexpensive compared 
with other alternatives, ” he said.

The IX)T last year backed down 
from a 100 percent fare increase for 
Middletown and Enfield com­
muters

Caution urged 
for colleges

HARTFORD (U PI) — A private 
college agency says the University 
of Bridgeport and University of New 
Haven should consider what effect a 
possible merger of the two schools 
would have on other area in­
stitutions

Margaret Tedone, chief executive 
o f f ic e r  for the Connecticut 
Conference of Independent Colleges, 
said Tuesday she welcomed con­
sideration of the plan, but cautioned 
the schools to consider all problems 
involved

If you're shifting programs 
around, you have to be very careful 
that you don't duplicate someone 
that's just down the road. " she said.

Administrators at both schools 
said they were considering a merger 
to help combat rising costs and a 
sharp decline in enrollm ents 
expected by the mid-1980 s.

Ms Tedone said such a merger 
would probably takeMour or five 
years to complete

"Don't forget there are a lot of 
obstacles to overcome." she said

Overlap and duplication in 
programs and staff are at the top of 
the list, she said

I ’m hoping the study will include 
recommendations on how to ac­
complish a merger — precise 
proposals on programs like this 
goes here or there '

UConn grants
•STORRS I UPI I — Administrators 

at the University of Connecticut 
School of Dental Medicine say the 
quality of its faculty is the reason 
the school leads the nation in federal 
grants for dental reserach 

Dr Harold Loe, the school's dean, 
said the 12-year-old institution 
received $3.5.')6,418 in federal grants 
during the fiscal vear that ended 
June 1980

"This shows the high respect for 
our faculty, since these grants are 
all won on a competitive basis. ” Loe 
said "Our strength is across- 
the-board We have been able to at 
tract and maintain and intellectual­
ly superior faculty "

Supporters of Bobby Sands carry placards In front of the home of 
the British Counsel Phillip McKearney In Boston's Beacon Hill 
Section Tuesday. The protesters plan a 24-hour vigil there to 
show their support for Sands’ hunger strike which led to his death 
Monday. (UPI photo)

Clara VanScott
M A N C H E S T E R  -  C la ra  

VanScott. 79. of Ridge Street, died 
Saturday at a Bloomfield convales­
cent home.

She was born in Manchester and 
had been a lifelong resident.

Private funeral services were to 
be today at the Hartford Memorial 
Funeral Home, 235 Wethersfield 
Ave . Hartford. Burial will be in 
East Cemetery, Manchester

Ella B. Burka
MANCHESTER -  Ella Bidwell 

Burke. 64. died Sunday in Longmont. 
Colo She was the wife of Joseph R 
Burke

Mrs Burke had lived for many 
years in Vernon, moving to Long­
mont. Colo , four years ago She was 
employed by the Connecticut State 
Labor Department for 25 years She 
attended Manchester schools, and 
was predeceased by her parents, 
Ravmond and Anna Burke

She is also survived b t a son. 
Joseph R Burke Jr of rtfornton, 
Colo ; a sister. Karen Kanemoto of 
Longmont, Colo , a sister. Mrs. 
Thomas iJeani Hinds of Ventura. 
Calif ; two brothers, Raymond 
Bidwell of Manchester and Warren' 
Bidwell of Los Angeles. Calif ; 
several nieces, nephews and two 
granddaughters

.A memorial service will be at 11 
a m Friday in the South United 
Methodist Church Burial will be in 
East Cemetery

The Holmes Funeral Home. 400 
Main St . has the charge of 
arrangements

Memorial donations may be made 
to Meals on Wheels. Senior Citizens 
Center. Longmont. Colo

Obituaries
Anna C. Crowall

MANCHESTER-Anna iCwikla) 
Crowell, 67, of 168 Woodbridge St., 
died Monday at M anch ester 
Memorial Hospital. She was the 
widow of Gail Crowell who died on 
March 29 '

She was born in Hartford on Feb. 
3, 1913 and had been a resident of 
Manchester most of her life. She 
was a communicant of St. Bridget's 
Church, Manchester.

She leaves two sons, Robert G. 
Crowell of Milford and Donald C. 
Crowell of Manchester: two 
daughters. Mrs. Mary Ellen Foun- 
taine of Andover and Mrs. Virginia 
Maloney of Manchester: three 
brothers, John Cwikla, Joseph 
Cwikla and Michael Cwikla, all of 
Manchester: and 11 grandchildren.

Funeral services lyill be Friday at 
9:15 a.m. from the Holmes Funeral 
Home, 400 Main St., Manchester 
with a mass of the resurrection at 10 
a m. at St. Bridget's Church. Burial 
will be in Veterans section of East 
Cemetery. Friends may call at the 
funeral home Thursday from 7 to 9 
p.m

Fire flow test
MANCHESTER -  The Water 

Department will conduct a fire flow 
test on Harrison Street to determine 
the effects of the water system for 
fire protection purposes. The test 
will take place May 12, and last 
about 2 hours

This could result in decreased 
pressure and quality of water during 
the test and for a couple of hours 
afterward.

Moth aid sought
MADISON I UPI I — Town officials say they can't af­

ford chemical in.sect sprays, so they're asking residents 
to take the initiative to rid their neighborhoods of gvpsv 
moths

First Selectman John W.G Phillips has called for a 
"street-by-street " attack on the caterpillar, which 

threatens to defoliate trees in many parts of the state 
this year

A survey conducted by the state Agricultural Experi­
ment Station in New Haven revealed a "moderate to 
heavy gyp.sy moth infestation in central and North 
Madison

Two ships collide
CAPE HENRY, Va. (U P I) — The Coast Guard said 

two large vessels collided today in the foggy Atlantic 
Ocean 25 miles southeast of Cape Henry, Va.

There were no reports of injuries, but a Coast Guard 
spokesman said crewmen from one of the vessels had 
taken to lifeboats A helicopter was at the scene. '

The 469-foot Helenic Carrier, a Greek-registered dry 
cargo vessel, and the 820-foot Atlantico, a Great Britain- 
registered freighter, collided in heavy fog at 7:20 a m., 
the Coast Guard said.

Movie schedules
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Modal son

Hartford
Atheneum — Caddie 7:30, 

9:30.
East Hartford

Showcase Cinema — 
Exalibur 1:30, 7:10, 9:50 — 
Night Hawks 1, 7:20, 9:55. 
-  On the Right Track 1:10, 
7:20, 9:45. — Caveman 
1:15, 7:15, 9:35. — The 
Howling 1:15, 7:25, 9:45.— 
Heaven's Gate 1:30, 7:10,

9:55. — Atlantic City 1:30, 
7:40, 10. — King of the 
Mountain 1:30, 7:30, 9:35. 

Storra
College — Ordinary Peo­

ple. 7, 9:30. — Amy and 
Alice in Wonderland 7:30, 
9.
Vernon

Cine 1 4 2 — Stir Crazy , 
7:30, 9:30. — Nine to Five I 
7:05, 9:10.
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Rec panel questions 
culture class costs

By MARTIN KEARNS 
Herald Reporter

MANCHESTER -  The Adviaory 
Park and Recreation Commission 
echoed the concerns of budget­
conscious town directors T u e ^ y  
when It grilled Recreation Director 
Robert Harrison over proposed 
cultural arts offerings.

Commissioner Fred Ramey led 
the inquiries, questioning whether 
the cultural courses are actually 
self-sustaining. "We were told by 
the previous director that the 
cultural programs are supporting.”

Harrison reminded he has never 
told conunissloners the programs 
would be self-sustaining, but Chair­
man Joel Janenda noted that his 
preliminary budget defended the 
programs. Holding the draft report 
before him, Janenda said, "This 
thing appears to be slanted in one 
direction  and we have some 
questions."

The Board of Directors tonight is 
scheduled to vote on the town budget 
for the upcoming fiscal year. Faced 
with cutbacks in state and federal 
aid, the directors are expected to 
make tough budget decisions which 
in all likelihood will affect the Rec 
Department, among others.

"The overall problem that we all 
recognize is that as money gets 
tighter, one of the softer spots is the 
Rec Department budget,”  reminded 
Janenda.

Town directors at an April 2 
budget hearing also questioned 
traditional claims by the Recreation 
Department that its cultural 
courses are self-supporting. The 
program — featuring courses in 
areas including crafts and dance 
—last vear cost the town about |38,-

000, while retumlng revenuea of 
about 97.000,

At the bearing Mayor Stephen 
Penny teraely commented, "We 
have been led to believe that the 
program la aelf-iustaiaing. The 
budget doesn’t show it.”  Although 
residents are charged a nominal fee 
for participating In the courses, 
Penny said, "The budget doean't 
show It.”

Deputy Mayor Stephen Castano 
similarly was concerned over the 
Cultural A rts  P rogram , and 
wondered whether coursei offered

Rec director 
on the griddle

at Manchester Community College 
and Manchester High School are 
duplicate services.

Ramey mirrored those remarks, 
ezplaining that while sim ilar 
programs are available elsewhere 
in the community, Harrison’s 
proposed budget might sacrifice 
service to the town’s youth. In par­
ticular, he opposed Harrison’s con­
sideration of closing the West Side 
Recreation Center on Sundays from 
April through November.

But Harrison defended the arts 
program, estimating that 99 percent 
of the 1,274 students enrolled last 
year were female. " I t ’s one of the 
few things in the Recreation Depart­
ment budget that really relates to 
females,”  he said.

Harrison said it wouldn’t be fair to 
deprive women of courses offered

through the cultural program. ” l4 
think it would be w ro ^  to taka itJ 
away.”

The Cultural Arts Program began j 
four yaara ago, oatenaib^ toprovkio ■ 
low-coft oouraea to the oommunlty, 
■aid Harrlaon. While commlaaioaera: 
accepted the explanation they aar- 
castically wondered if  existing 
policy reflected that intention.

As the meeting drew to a cloae, 
the adviaory board agreed to urge 
town officials to first consider 
r a is in g  e n tr y  fe e s  b e fo r e  
eliminating programs. At the same 
time, Harrison said his department 
had already submitted to town 
directors a revised fee schedule 
which would substantially Improve 
the cultural program’s finances.

’The board also voted to ask town 
directors to seek Its counsel when 
considering the elimination of any 
Rec Department programs.

The department’s proposed 1981- 
62 budget calls for a 6.7 percent 
spending increase to bring its total 
allocation to 9496,200. "The people 
are going to be up in arms at the slse 
of the budget,”  said Ramey.

The board asked Harrison to pare 
down his proposal to reflect an in­
crease of about S percent. In doing 
so, certains services were targeted 
for possible elimination.

Among them was a supervisory 
position. W hile com m issioner 
Dorothy Brindamour opposed laying 
o ff current town employees, 
Harrison said tight budget realiUet 
sometimes' necessitate difflcutl 
anagement decisions. At the same 
time, he expressed hope that no 
employee need be fired. Instead be 
offered to trim his staff through attri 
tion.

—

Specialtour
Grade 7 students at Bennpt 'Junior High School recently par­
ticipated in a program at The Herald In conjunction with a project 
on newspapers at the school. The students Interviewed 
department heads and toured The Herald’s plant. Frank Burbank, 
right, managing editor. Is Interviewed by, from left, Diana Smith, 
Sara Nicholson and Chris Mateya. (Herald photo by Kearns)
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Catholic

Close call
East Catholic sticker Steve Byrne (12) jumps away from Inside 
pitch In early Inning pl^y against Bulkeley at Eagle Field. Bulldog 
catcher is Ed Garcia with Umpire Don Beerworth. (Herald photo 
by Pinto)

By LEN AU9TER 
Herald Sporlswrilrr

Aroused when deadlocked. East 
Catholic scored four times in the 
bottom of the fifth inning to break 
the tie en route to an 14>4 victory 
over B u lkeiey  High in non­
conference baseball action yester­
day at Eagle Field.

The Bulldogs had pulled even in 
the top of the fifth at 4-all with a 
three-run surge on five solid hits.

" It  seems for the other team to do 
that to ignite us. I don't know why,” 
voiced Eagle Coach Jim Penders, 
" it  was nice to see that. It was just 
like the St. Paul game where they 
tied us and bang,-we got right back 
up.”

The winning spurt was lit by a one- 
out double up the alley in right by 
sophomore Tim Wisnieski. "That 
kind of ignited us and then (Tom) 
Furlong got the key hit," Penders 
observ^.

Furlong, who was 4-for-5 with 
three RBI with a fourth erased 
because of a base running error, 
stroked a two-run single to break the 
4-4 stalemate and Dennis McCoy 
capped the inning, also with a two-

Mitchell to enter Hall of Fame
Following World War II, sports flourished 

in Mancbeatar. Professional basketball 
produced in auceeaata championships, in the 
Connecticut, Eaatan.and American Leagues. 
Seml-pn> (ootiwU laureto were boasted by 
Manchester teams in Nqw England competi­
tion. The Twiligtit Baseball League at the 
West 9199 Oval was second to none in the 
state aBd aMlJaBt pitch softball attracted 
Isrge cra iW 'larW ghtly  offerings under the 
arc lights at Robertson Park.

Professional boxing and wrestling were 
Iso offered on a r A  •

demands of the publii

Herald
Angle
Earl Yost 

Sports Editor

also offered on a r ^ l a r  basis to mMt the 
public.

One man who had a lot to do with 
promoting the sports while a Manchester 
resident was George Mitchell.

Mitchell akmg wMi the late Ed Thayer and 
John Kerttaw wtHhe guesU of honor at the 
fifth amaud East Hartford Explorers’ Tap- 
Off Chib dhner at the Marco Polo Restaurant 
in East Hartford on May 20. The trio will be 
inducted Into the Explorers’ Hall of Fame, 
Joining I  dozen earlier honorees.

A liam promoter. Mitchell, a guidance 
teachw in the Windsor Locks school system, 
has had his hand in promoting sports for 35 
years.

Currently, he has been the Boston Celtics’ 
press llasort in Connecticut for several years 
and also handles all bookings for softball at­
tractions, the King and his Court and the 
Queen and her Court. Both the latter groups 

g  appeared in Manchester several times.

Gone full cycle
Mitchell has gone the full cycle from player 

to coach, manager and promoter.
It was after World War II ended that 

Mitchell came home after nearly five years 
in service and got into promoting basketball, 
his first venture was with Nasslff Arms in the 
Eastern League.

Mitchell's Silk City and Merchant football 
teams took a back seat to no one, particularly 
the latter. The roster was sprinkled with a 
half dozen National Football League castoffs 
who scintillated in Manchester colors.

Sunday afternoon football at Mt. Nebo at­
tracted banner crowds and the best opposi­
tion available was booked with the result the 
same - Manchester winning.

On the basketball front, Mitchell booked 
the Milwaukee Hawks of the NBA, then a 
front-runner, and the big leaguers found the 
Nassiff quintet was too much to handle. The 
Rochester Royals were also brought into

town from the NBA ranks and the result was 
the same.

In baseball, Mitchell managed to field an 
entry annually in the Twilight League and he 
also coached and managed top-flight basket­
ball teams in independent offerings.

Some of Mitchell's top promotions included 
bringing in the Harlem Globetrotters to of­
ficially open the Clarke Arena at Manchester 
High. The biggest crowd ever, which 
exceeded the seating capacity by several hun­
dred, turned out.

The New York Giants were best known for 
their football playing ability in the late 1940s 
but the team's top stars banded together to 
play basketball and drew capacity crowds 
here with Mitchell promoting.

He brought in Wilt Chamberlain, Marques 
Haynes and Goose Tatum and a number of 
NBA players.

Many a finger was pointed at Mitchell as a 
big money-maker with his promotions but it 
wasn’t'true. Sure, he made a few dollars, but 
he lost a few, too.

The big thing was that he offered 
Manchester some of the greatest sports at­
tractions possible during a span of a decade.

If only a fraction of the people whose lives 
Mitchell helped enrich turn out two weeks 
from Wedne^ay night the banquet room will 
be filled.

There is every reason to believe that 
Mitchell will "play" before a full house.

Tom Ponders, former UConn athlete and 
current varsity basketball coach at Fordham 
University, will be the key speaker.

Two school track marks set
Tw o schoo l reco rd s  w ere  

shattered as Elast Catholic girls' 
track team turned back HCC foes 
Northwest Catholic and Mercy High 
by identical 73-54 scores yesterday 
at St. Joseph’s College in Hartford.

Junior Unda Reddy bettered the 
school standard in the 3,000-meter 

' run with a winning effort of 11 ;04.37 
while senior Kathy Kittredge sur­
passed the mark in the 1,500-meter 
run with a 4:55.01 clocking.

Terri Kittredge took the 800-meter 
run for the Eaglettes, 3-0 in HCC 
competition and 7-1 overall, while 
Denise White and Anne Temple 
went 1-2 in the high jump, each 
clearing 5-feet, 2-inches.

Toni Hempel annexed the 300- 
meter hurdles for the Elaglettes with 
a time of ;S2.79.

Results.
East VI, Mercy

100 hurdles. 1. Messier (EC), 2. 
Foran (EC), 3. Gunnery (M ) .19.77.

100. 1. Ingallinera (EC), 2. Sosa 
(M ), 3. Tobin (EC ) .13.13.

1,500. 1. K. Kittredge (EC), 2. E. 
Evans (EC), 3. Charest (EC) 4.55.01 
(school record).

400.1. Jackie Paardenkooper (M ), 
2. Jane Paardenkooper (M ), 3. Tem­
ple (EC) 1.01.10.

400 relay. 1. East (M. Dakin, 
Tobin, Ingallinera, L. Dakin) .M.Ol.
: 300 hurdles. 1. Hempel (EC), 2. 
McDermott (EC), 3. Kearns (M ) 
,51.79.

800. 1. T. Kittredge (E C )^ .  
Kaminikl (EC), 2. B. Evans (EC)
IJ 6.49.

200.1. Jackie Paardenkooper (M ), 
2. Jane Paardenkooper (M ), 3. 
Ingallinera (EC) J7.06.

3.000. 1. Reddy (EC), 2. K. Kit­

tredge (E C ), 3. Charest (E C ) 
11.04.37 (school record).

1,600 relay. 1. Elast (Temple, M. 
Evans, L. Dakin. T. Kittredge (EC) 
4.20.2.

Shot put. 1. Arcand (M ), 2. Marino 
(M ), 3. Paardenkooper (M ) 9.08 
meters.

Discus. 1. Paardenkooper (M ), 2. 
Smoloski (M ), 3. Hartlow (M ) 25.33 
meters.

Javelin. 1. Giamel (M ). 2. Marino

Kaminski (EC), 3. Bazzano (N ) 
2.26.46.

200. 1. foung (N ),'2 . Ingallinera 
(EC), 3. M. Dakin (EC) .28.08.

3.000. 1. Reddy (EC), 2. K. Kit­
tredge (E C ), 3. Charest (EC ) 
11.04.37.

1,600 relay. 1. East 4.20.2.
Shot put. 1. Fitzgerald (N ). 2. 

Lisavick (N ), 3. Sullivan (EC) 8.54 
meters.

Discus. 1. Townsend (N ), 2. 
Barnes (EC), 3. Lisavick (N ) 25.06 
meters.

• Javelin. 1. Gaffney (N ), 2. Stan- 
dish (EC), 3. Nolen (EC) 29.40 
meters.

High jump. 1. White (EC), 2. Tem­
ple (EC), 3. T. Kittredge (EC) 5’2 ".

Long jump. 1. Gaffney (N ), 2. 
Walsh (N ). 3. Tobin (EC) 5.12 
meters.

3,000, 1,500 
records broken

(M ), 3. Fiducia (M ) 27.82 meters.
High jump. 1. White (EC), 2. Tem­

ple (EC). - • -  ■
(M ) 5’2” .

• mt tweooon, A V 8I 1~

3. Jane Paardenkooper

Long jump. 1. Paardenkooper 
(M ), 2. Tobin (EC), 3. Kupec (EC) 
4.94 meters.
East va. Nonhwetl 

100 hurdles, l. Hayes (N ), 2. 
M eiiler (EC), 3. Young (N ) .19.70.

100. 1. Young (N ), 2. Ingallinera 
(EC), S. Tobin (EC) ,13.15.

1,900.1. K. Kittredge (EC). 2. Baz­
zano (N ), S. E. Evans (EC) 4.55.01.

400. y Temple (EC), 2. M. Evans 
(EC), 3. Krieger (N ) 1.03.64.

400 relay. 1. Northwest .52.92.
300 hurdles. 1. Hsmpel (EC), 2. 

McDermott (EC). 3. Doyle (N ) 
:98.79.

000. 1. T. Kittredge (E C ), 2.

f'-t; i - J f

run single.
Mike Falkowski added^ some 

cushion in the Eagle seventh with a 
three-run, 360-foot homer to left 
centerfield which followed a walk to 
Brad Cabral and single by McCoy.

The offensive production, 13 hits 
overall including three extra base 
knocks, made a winner of Bob

Double Ignited 
winning spurt

Beltrandi, who survived a rocky 
fifth frame. It was his first decision 
of the season.

Beltrandi was rocked for the five 
safeties in the fifth but, after a con­
ference with Penders on the mound, 
settled down to retire the last 13 in a 
row.

" I  think psychologically us going 
up by four runs frustrated the other 
team. And they started to try to kill 
it," Penders stated.

Jose Restrepo started and took 
the loss for Bulkeley, which slips to 
6-4. He worked 4 l/3innings, yielded

seven hits, walked six and was 
charged with eight runs. Beltrandi 
walked two and struckdut five for 
the Eagles, now 7-2-1 for the season.

McCoy had three hits and three 
RBI and Barter two safeties to pace 
East.

East's next outing is Thursday 
afternoon against HCC foe St Paul 
in Bristol at Page Park in a 3.15 
start. The Eagles return home 
Saturday morning against HCC rival 
South Catholic at Eagle Field at 11 
o'clock

FIa»t Cutholir ( I I ) — Furlong 2b, 
5-2-4-3, Ayer cf. 4-1-1-1, Cabral ss. 2- 
1-0-1, McCoy lb, 4-1-3-3, Falkowski 
rf, 4-1-1-3, Barter 3b. 5-1-2-0. 
Beltrandi p, O-O-O-O. Winsnieski dh. 
4-1-1-0, O’Leary ph, l-O-O-O, Goodwin 
If, 2-1-0-0, Fournier If. 3-1-I-0, Bvrne 
c, 2-1-0-0. Totals: 36-11-13-11 

ItulkeU-y (4 ) — Caro cf, 5-1-1-0, 
Restrepo p/ss, 5-0-2-0, Snyder 2b, 4- 
1-1-0, Flaherty lb, 3-0-0-1, Velez rt, 
3-1-1-0. E. Garcia c, 4-1-1-1, Santiago 
ss, O-O-O-O, Caruso dh, 3-0-1-1, K 
Rodriguez p, O-O-O-O. J. Garcia If, 3- 
0-1-1, N egron If, l-O-O-O. R 
Rodriguez 3b, 4-0-0-0. Totals: 35-4-8- 
4.
East Catholic 120 140 30x 11
Bulkeley 010 030 000 4

Kaminski hurls 
Cheney victory

Behind the four-hit pitching of 
sophom ore righ thander Tom 
Kaminski, Cheney Tech turned back 
East Hampton High, 5-2, in COC 
baseball action yesterday at the 
Beavers’ diamond.

Kaminski, 4-0, had a no-hitter 
going into the sixth inning before 
settling for his sparkling four-hit 
gem. He walked four and struckout 
four and outdueled Bellringer ace 
Steve Poulin in the process. Poulin 
was unbeaten in four decisions com­
ing in, suffering his first setback.

"He (Kaminski) pitched another 
great game for us. He had a no­
hitter into the sixth and mixed up his 
pitches well, keeping the East 
Hampton batters off balance,”  ad­
mired Tech (^ c h  Rich Busick, who 
saw his Beavers climb back to the 
.500 level at 6-6. Cheney is 6-4 in COC 
play.

The Beavers return to the dia­
mond today for a COC tilt at Rocky 
Hill High at 3:15.

Cheney opened the scoring with 
two runs in the first inning. Dave 
Nowak swatted a leadoff double and 
moved to third on Brian Eaton’s 
bunt single. 3aton swiped second 
and Jim McKay lashed a key two- 
out two-run single up the middle for 
the lead.

East Hampton, 5-6 in the con­
ference and overall, got a run back - 
in the second. Pete Coolidge walked 
and came all the way around to 
score from first as an errant pickoff 
throw sailed down the rlghtfield 
line.

Cheney restored its two-run lead 
in the fourth on a Brian Eaton 
sacrifice fly to centerfield. That 
followed an error, walk and Nowak

single which jammed the sacks.
The Techmen increased their lead 

in the fifth with a two-run spurt 
McKay walked, Tom Eaton doubled 
him home and moved to third on the 
relay home. Eaton scored on a wild 
pitch.

The Bellringers threatened in the 
seventh and scored once, but some 
excellent defensive play abetted the 
Beavers.

Cloolidge led off with an infield hit 
and Brian Mello walked. Mark Gor­
don lashed a drive to the left center- 
field gap, which leftfielder Nowak 
made a fine running catch on and 
turned into a doubleplay, catching 
Coolidge off second.

Paul Rioux tripled home Mello but 
he was picked off third by Cheney 
catcher Dan McEIheron to end the 
contest.

"Winning the first game in this 
four-game week was a must." 
Busick cited. "The defense was 
sound today and Nowak's catch in 
left center was a game-saver."

(Jieni-y Terh (.5)— Nowak if, 2- 
1-2-0, B Eaton 3b, 3-i-l-l, Belanger 
rf, 2-0-0-0, Mikoleit cf. 4-0-0-0, 
McKay lb, 3-1-1-2, Switzer dh, 3-0-0- 
0, T. Eaton ss, 3-1-1-1, McEIheron c.
1- l-O-O. Beley 2b, 2-0-1-0, Dundon ph,
0- O-O-O. Kaminski p, 0-04)-0. Totals 
235-6-4.

Kuni lluni|iUiii (2 ) — Hvtand 2b. 
3-0-1-0. Selanka cf, 3-0-0-0, O'Neil c,
2- 0-1-0, Te i xe i ra  rf,  3-0-0-0, 
McKinney If, 2-0-0-0, Coolidge lb, 2-
1- 1-0, Mello ss, 2-I-0-0. Gordon dh. 3- 
0-0-0, Rioux 3b, 3-0-1-1, Poulin p, O-O- 
O-O. Totals: 23-2-4-1.
East Hampton 010 000 1 2
Cheney Tech 200 120 x 5

Bolton routed 
by RHAM, 23-4

Digging for first base Is Esst Catholic batter Tom  Furlong after rip* 
ping second-inning single In clash yesterday against Bulkeley at 
Eagle Field. (Herald photo by Pinto)

Twelve runs in the second inning 
were more than enough as RHAM 
High overpowered winless Bolton 
High, 23-4, in COC baseball action 
yesterday in Hebron.

The victory moves the Sachems to 
8-2 in the CpC and 9-2 overall while 
the setback was the eighth in as 
many starts for the Bulldogs.

Bolton's next outing is today in a 
clash against Coventry High at the 
Bulldogs' diamond at 3.15.

Bolton opened the scoring with a 
run in the first inning but RHAM 
came back with three runs in the 
home first and put it away with a 12- 
run explosion in the second. All the 
runs came after two out with an 
error getting matters started for the 
Sachems.

Highlighting the big RHAM frame 
were a Ray Tuohey RBI double, 
two-run homer by Rick Hayber and 
RBI double by Bob LeBreux.

John Smith doubled and homered 
to pace Bolton with Chris Morianos 
adding two hits. Morianos started 
and took the loss for the Bulldogs 
while Barry MacLachlan went the 
distance to pick up the win for 
RHAM

RHAM (2 3 )— Girourd ss, 5-3-1- 
1, Crowell 2b, 5-4-2-1, Tuohey cf, 5-4- 
3-5, LeBreux lb. 4-1-2-5, Modre lb, 1- 
0-0-0, Hayber c, 4-1-3-3, Miranda c, 1- 
0-0-0, Quaranto dh, 2-2-0-1, Cupollelli 
rf, l-0-(M), Wilkes if, 3-1-1-1, Folsom 
if, O-l-O-O, McKay 3b, 1-4-1-0. Totals' 
36-23-13-17.

Bolton (4 ) — Landrey If, 3-2-1-0, 
Teller p/3b, 4-0-2-0, Smith cf/p, 4-1- 
3-2, Morianos p/lf, 4-0-2-0, W. Brown 
c, 4-0-1-0, Stephens rf, 2-0-0-0, Fen­
ton ph, l-O-O-O, T. Brown ss, 2-0-04),. 
Drummond ph, l-O-O-O, Cusano 2b, 3- 
0-1-0, Maneggia ph, 04)4)-0, Peterson 
lb, 4-1-1-0, ToUls: 32-4-11-2

I
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Evans en joys big hitting spree THE HERALD, Wed.. May 6, 1 8 81 -1 3

By KAY McFADDEN
LPI Sport* Writer

After reaching base seven times 
in a row to fall just two short of an 
AL record, one wonders what 
Dwight Evans might have done if 
the game hadn't ended after only 12 
innings.

“ My job is to get on base," Evans 
said in an understatement. “ I don't 
think I've ever been up seven times 
in a game before, much less been on 
base seven times."

Evans' feat came during a 
marathon game between the Kansas 
City Royals and the Boston Red Sox 
that was suspended Monday night in 
a tie after the league's 1 a.m. 
curfew was imposed, then con­
cluded Tuesay night with Boston 
picking up an ^7 victory.

Along the way, Evans walked four

Islanders 
win, 5-2

NEW YORK (U P I) -  The New 
York Islanders entered their series 
against the New York Rangers with • 
revenge on their minds.

They left the series with a four- 
game sweep and a shot at their se­
cond consecutive Stanley Cup.

"We want to win the Stanley Cup 
again, " said Islanders defenseman 
Denis Potvin following a 5-2 victory 

, over the Rangers Tuesday night.
/ "We want the people to realize how 

good this team really is "

North Stars 
on top, 7-4

BLOOMINGTON, Minn. (U P I) -  
Memo to the Minnesota North 
Stars; Beware of the Calgary 
Celtics in the fifth game of the 
Stanley Cup semifinals.

The Calgary who"’
"Yes. I ’m well aware that the 

Boston Celtics came back to win 
their basketball series after being 
down 3-1." smiled Calgary Flames 
general manager Cliff Fletcher 
after his team plummeted to a 3-1 
deficit by losing to Minnesota 7-4 
Tuesday night "Of course we can 
come back. We ll be at home 
Thursday, back here Saturday for 
Game 6 and close it out back at 
home, next Tuesday "

times, singled three times, scored 
three runs and knocked in another to 
help gain the win for his team. The 
right fielder just missed John H. 
B r e t t 's  record of nine times on 
base in an extra-inning game, ac­
complished for the Cleveland In­
dians on July 10,1932 in an 18-inning 
contest.

But apparently, 18 hours between 
innings can take the shine off any 
achievement.

" I ’m not out for personal goals," 
Evans said when told of his near- 
miss in the record books. "You can 
only hit day-by-day. You have to 
forget yesterday and think about 
what's going on today."

Evans' consistency enabled the 
Red Sox to halt a seven-game losing 
streak that had them a half-game 
away from the basement of the

Elastem Division. In the 12th, be 
chopped an infield single with' two 
outs to keep Boston alive. Carl 
YastrzemsU singled to right to 
drive in the third run of the inning—

‘Not out for 
personal goals’

and the Red Sox needed it when the 
Royals scored in their half on a two- 
run homer by Amos Otis.

In their regularly scheduled 
game. Larry Gura allowed just four

Houston's Billy Paultz gets his hand on ball as Boston's Larry Bird 
drives to basket in NBA playoff game last night in Boston Garden 
won by Celtics. (UPI photo)

Celtics' narrow win 
hints tough series

BOSTON ( U P I) — To a man, they 
still exude confidence from every 
pore, but there must be at least a 
shadow of self-doubt somewhere in 
the minds of the Houston Rockets

The NBA s classic overachievers 
had the Boston Celtics on the run for 
most of the game Tuesday night 
before reeling into the breakdown 
lane in the fourth period. The result 
was another Celtics escape story — 
a 98-95 win — to give Boston a 1-0 ad­
vantage in the best-of-seven series. 
Game 2 is Thursday night at Boston.

"I don't think they have anything 
on u s ." said Houston's Mike 
Dunleavy."They got away lucky and 
it’s a credit to them. We’re not hap­
py to be here. We’re here to win.”

But the general feeling was that 
Houston couldn't have asked for a 
m ore advantageous situation, 
because Boston couldn't really play 
much worse. The Celtics committed 
19 turnovers, shot just 43 percent 
and generally were in a green fog 
for most of the game. Yet they won.

“ By playing like this and winning, 
sometimes it spurs you on," said the 
Celtics' Cedric Maxwell. “ If a team 
can’t beat you on your worst night, 
they’re not going to beat you on your 
best night.”

The Celtics, who were ripe for the 
picking in a lethargic display of 
basketball, stole this one with some 
opportunistic and aggressive board- 
crashing in the fourth period. They 
shot only 37 percent in the period, 

' but seemingly followed every miss 
with a second-or third-chance 
basket. They outrebounded Houston 
19-9 in the final period and 13-4 in 
Houston's end.

" I t ’s the only thing we did effec­
tively all night,”  said Boston Coach 
Bill Fitch. “ We started a lot of fast 
breaks, but we just couldn't finish 
them."

Houston Coach Del Harris agreed 
with his counterpart’s assessment.

" I  thought we played great 
basketball for the most part. What 
hurts is giving up 25 offensive 
rebounds, that's where we lost the 
game. You just can't give up that 
many chances on offense. They get 
too many cheap baskets that way,”  
Harris said.

Indicative of Boston’s board 
superiority down the stretch was the 
filial clinching hoop by Larry Bird 
with 19 seconds left. The Celtics 
held a 96-95 lead and twice missed

chances to stretch the advantage.
But guard Chris Ford collected his 

only two offensive rebounds of the 
game to keep the ball in Boston's 
possession. Robert Harish then mis­
sed a short jumper and Bird failed 
on the rebound but hung in to con­
vert a lefty layup off his miss. When 
Rudy Tomjanovich misfired on h 
three-pointer and the Rockets mis­
sed the rebound, the game was over.

"We weren’t ready to play," said 
Bird, who had 18 points, 21 rebounds 
and nine assists " It  wasn't because 
of what they did. It was because of 
what we didn't do. You've got to be 
ready every night. "

For the Rockets, Robert Reid was 
the offensive show with 27 points, 
but Moses Malone could get only 13 
inconclusive points against the 
Celtics' triumvirate of Parish, Rick 
Robey and Kevin McHale. Malone 
did manage 15 rebounds but was an 
unsightly 4-for-17 from the field.

"You did not see the real Moses 
Malone," Harris cautioned.

"We lost our composure in the se­
cond half," Malone said. "They 
moved better on us and they got a lot 
of second chances. That rebound by

hits to give the Royals a 2-1 victory. 
Jerry GroU hit a seventh-imiiiig 
sacrifice fly to bring home John 
Wathan and snap a 1-1 tie. Evans 
drove in a run to give the Rad Sox a 
1-0 lead, and Kansas City came back 
with doiibles in the fourth by Otis 
and Willie Aikens.

In other games, Baltimote edged 
Minnesota 3-2, Texas downed 
Chicago 6-1, California beat New 
York 2-2, Oakland defeated Detroit 
6-2, Milwaukee topped Seattle 4-1, 
and Cleveland’s game at Toronto 
was postponed beuuse of f ^ .
Oriole* 3, Twin* 2
At Baltimore, Mike Flanagan 

pitched a six-hitter over 81-2 innings 
and Rich Dnuer drove in two runs 
with a double and a sacrifice fly to 
lead the Orioles. Flanagan, S-3, 
registered his third straight victory

end led Baltimore to its to average fell to .989 last Sondagr,

singled home the tying nm ^  
California scored three Uno* to the 
f o i ^  to overcome a 2-8 dellctt. 
A’* 6, TlgBf* 2
At Oakland, Calif.. Wayne G f ^  

had four hits, tochidtng a homer and 
two doubles to drive in three nma,
backing the eighMiit pitching o f ̂  
beaten Mike Norris and canylag tte  
A 's. Norris went the d W a n c e le r^
fifth time in six starts and became 
the l e a d ’s flret six-gam  wtaner. 
Brewer* 4, Mariner* 1 .
At Seattle, Rohta Yount hit a 

three-run homer to the third m A  
Pete Vuckovlch, with relle l 
from Jerry Augustine and R o ^  
Fingers, won his first game lor 
Milwaukee. Yount’s homer was bis 
thiid to two nights at Seattle.

the last devsn games. Tippy Mar 
tinea notched his third save by get 
ting the final two onto.

Ranger* 6, W ile Sox 1 
At Arlington, ’Texas, Leon Roberts 

smacked a three-run homer to 
power the Rangers. With one out in 
the sixth, Roberts — obtained from 
Seattle during the off-smsen — 
homered off Roes Baumgahen, 2-3, 
to score Bump Wills, who had 
doubled, and A1 Oliver, who had 
walked and give Texas a 20 lead. 
Angel* 6, Yankee* 2 
At Anaheim, Calif., Don Baylor 

collected three singles to drive to 
three rpns and Jesse Jefferson 
hurled 6 2-3 Innings of six-hit relief 
to spark the Angels. ’The slump- 
ridden. Baylor, on a tear since Ms

Mats' rally falls short 
with seven-run ninth

By CATHRfNE WOLF 
IIPI Sport* Writer

Perhaps Tom G riffin  should 
forget about using his “ better 
stuff.”

Griffin, working on only one day’s 
rest, allowed four hits in seven 
scoreless innings and drove in two 
runs with a single and a homer 
Tuesday night before the New York 
Mets reached three San Francisco 
relievers for seven runs in the ninth. 
Greg Minton finally came on to get 
the last out and preserve Griffin’s 
victory, a 9-7 triumph at New York.

" I  think I had better stuff in my 
last two starts but I couldn’t use it 
because I was so tight,”  said Grif­
fin, who became the starter when. 
Vida Blue was scratched because of 
hemorrhoids.

Griffin's stuff may have been 
better in his last two starts, but it 
wasn’ t as effective. On Sunday 
against Philadelphia, he yielded 
four hits and four runs in 2 1-3 in­
nings and against Los Angeles on 
April 27, he gave op eight h ^  and 
walked six in six innings. But.

Bird was the key."
Houston led virtually the entire 

game, including a 22-8 edvantage in 
thefirst 8:18. They led by five 
entering the fourth period and the 
Celtics had brief one-point leads on 
three occasions in the third quarter.

But Boston ran off a 14-4 spurt in 
the fourth period to take a 96-91 lead 
with 2:54 left. Bird had the rafters 
shaking during the blitz when he 
rebounded his own miss and, falling 
behind the backboard, grabbed the 
ball and flipped in an incredible left­
hander in one motion.

"He's their money man,”  Reid 
said. "H e ’s a tremendous player. 
Even when he doesn’t have the ball, 
he's always thinking."

Houston's Tom Henderson scored 
two baskets before Bird added the 
clincher on his layup. And the 
Rockets were left thinking about the 
game they should have won but 
couldn't quite pull off.

"W e were defin itely in the 
driver's seat," Reid said. “ We let 
the mental mistakes get to us; we 
forgot about what we did to get here. 
But we know we can play with these 
guys '

Blast Catholic's golf team is still 
looking for its first win of the 1961 
seawn after yesterday's 7Mi to 5Vi 
setback to Tolland High at Tallwood 
Country Gub.

East's Terry O’Donnell took 
medalist honors with an 80. Team­
mate Scott Zgoda fired an 83 for the 
Eagle linksmen, 0-4 for the season.

East’s next outing is Monday 
afternoon against Bulkeley and 
South Catholic at Tallwood.

Results: O ’Donnell (E C ) def. 
Kopsick 3-0, Zgoda (EC) def. Huff 2  
1, Toombs (T ) def. Wallace 2 Vk to 
Vi, Paquette (T ) def. Ostunl 20, 
Tolland won medal point, 380384.

Bolton girls post victory
Bolton High girls' softball team 

stopped RHAM High, 22, in COC 
play yesterday in Bolton.

1710 victory was the fourth in a 
row for the Bulldogs and pushes 
their record to 7-3 (or the season.

Doreen Gagnon was the winning 
pitcher for M ton , twirling a two- 
hitter. She alloweid singles in the 
first and seventh innings only.

Pam E21berg and Mary Maineggia 
were each 2for-4 with Eklberg-rip- 
ping two doubles for the Bulldogs. 
S^ond baseman Shannon Brown

was a defensive standout for Bolton.
Bolton’s next tilt is today at East 

Hampton High.

Six wins in row
East Catholic jayvee baseball 

team won its sixth straight, 22, over 
Bulkeley yesterday at Moriarty 
Field.

Paul Tucko', Tim Klro and Rick 
Clark each had two safeties in a 12 
hit attack by the young Ehigles, now 
7-2 for the season. Paul Roy in relief 
got credit for the win.

Tuesday night he was in command, 
striking out four and walking one to 
up his record to 22.

"Sometimes when you’re a little 
tired you pitch better, especially if 
you’re the kind of pitcher who 
overthrows, which I ’ve been known 
to do,”  said Griffin, who is used to 
three days off between starts.

The starting rotation is Just one of 
Giants Manager Frank Robinson’s 
pitching problems.

E lsew h ere , Houston edged 
Chicago 4-3, Montreal nipped San 
Diego 4-3, Philadelphia overcame 
Los Angeles 8-7, and St. Louis 
topped Atlanta 4-1. Pittsburgh’s 
aame at Gncinnati was rained out. 

Astro* 4, Cub* 3 
At Chicago, pinch hitter Alan 

Ashby doubled just inside the left- 
field line with two out in the ninth in­
ning to drive in two runs and help 
Houston hand the Cuba their 17th 
loss in 20 games.
Expo* 4, Padres 3 
Pinch hitter W illie Montanez 

stroked a twoKwt RBI single in the 
-  ninth to lift the Expos at Montreal.

The Expo* tied it 23 in the eighth, 
when ’Tim Raines, who stole his 21st 
base in 21 nunes, scored from third 
on Ellis Valentine’s groundout. 
Woodie Fryman, 20, picked up the 
viciiHT while San Diego’s Steve 
Mura fell to 0-4.
Phlllic* 8, Dodger* 7 
At Philadelphia, Manny Trillo -  

w to hit a solo honier in the eighth in­
ning— hit a sacrifice fly in the ninth 
to lift the Phillies. Mike Schmidt 
connected for a mn-scoring double 
off Bob^ CasUUo, 03, to tie the 
score with one out and set up Trillo’s 
game-winner. Pedro Guerrero’s 
two-run homer capped a five-run 
e i^ th  which had given the Dodgers 
a 73 lead.
Cardinal* 4, Brave* 1 
At St. Louis, George Hendrick and 

Darrell Porter ripp^  back-to-back 
home n)ns in the fourth and Larj 
Sorensen toased a six-hitter to lead 
the Cardinals to their 13th victory ir 
14 games. Sorensen, 43, had hU 
s t r ^  of 23 23 scoreless inning! 
snapped Iqr Dale Murphy’s RB 
single with two out In the ninth.

Scholastic tennis roundup

East golfers still winless

Manchester girls
Manchester High girls ’ tennis 

team evened its record at 1-1 with a 
73 whitewashing of Fermi High in a 
(X)IL make-up clash yesterday at 
Memorial Field courts.

The Indians dropped their season- 
opener Monday, 21, to Hall High In 
West Hartford.

Laurie Ziebarth, Paige Anthony, 
A l f ^  Bayer and Sandi McCnrry 
sw ^ t the singles for Manchester 
versus Fermi.

Results. Manchester vs. Fermi 
—Ziebarth (M ) def. Dowd 21, 20; 
Anthony (M ) def. Waskiel 20, 83; 
Bayer (M ) def. Martel 63, 73; 
McCurry (M ) def. Demaro 20, 20; 
Chris Brown-Joann Anderson (M ) 
def. Maher-Cellno 63, 21; Karen 
Cosgrove-B<Hinie Potacki (M ) def. 
Cromble-Cames 22, 03; Linda 
Weiss-Oiris Szarka (M ) def. Dowd- 
Duga 22, 21.

Manchester vs. Hall -Rosen (H ) 
def. Ziebarth21,22; Slobin (H ) def. 
Anthony 22, 20; Ponce (H ) def. 
Bayer 63, 63; Felnsteln (H ) def. 
McCurry 63, 23; Anderson-Brown 
(M ) def. Nelson-Gordon 43 ,73,28; 
KaU-McLellan (H ) def. Potocki- 
C osgrove 6-2, 6-0; Budnick- 
Campanelli (H ) def. Weiss-Ssarka2  
2, 21.

Cheney Tech
Evening its record yesterday was 

the CSieney Tech tennis team with a 
21 win over RHAM High in Hebron.

’The Techmen are now 33 for the 
season while the Sachems are 
winless in seven outlnga.

Ray Brookes and Phil Silverman 
captured two of the three singies 
bouts for Cheney.

Results. Farley (R )  def. G. 
Melendy 23 ,73 ; Brooikea (CT) def. 
Keefe 20, 20; Silverman (CT) def. - 
M artin  6-2, 6-4; G overn a le - 
Fitsgerald (CT) def. Balar-McKay 
24, 63; T. MeleBdy-Onhighnm 
(CT) def. Atheriey-Rlecha 20,80.

East girls
Slipping below the .800 maifc. Bast 

Catholic girls’ tennis team fell to 
Glastonbury H l^ , 22, yestenfaHr at 
Manchester Community College 
courts.

Monica Murphy in afatglss and the 
douh les team  o f S teph an ie  
Graenwald and Unda Atkins picked 
up the points for the 23 BagMtes.

Results. Murphy (E C ) def. 
Spbdew 83, 20; LsBoinhand (O ) 
daf. Hanford 2 4 ,2 8 ,7 3 ; Bosworth 
(G ) def. Murano 24 ,20 ; Gs^pi (O ) 
def. VlaglUo 73, 73; Aldrich- 
Donovan (G ) def. PatrU 31anN tt2 ' 
2, 22; Jennhigs-fodsn (O ) dsf. 
L o n go -O s n 's vs s s  0-2, 8-0; 
GiesawaU-AUdas (EC ) daf. Dnvis- 
DeCanoUs 24, 20, 74.

East boys
East Catholic boys’ tennis team 

was whitewashed, 73, by St. Paul 
yesterday in Bristol’

Tbe Eagle netters are now 33 for 
the

Results. Simone (SP) def. Steams 
63 ,63 ; Ratcliffe (SP ) def. White 2  
4 ,27 ,84 ; Smith (SP) def. Keneally 
33, 63, 20; Conrad (SP) def. Dean 
21, 22; Simeooe-Smith (SP) def. 
Keneally-Steams 24, 24; Ckwch- 
Rubino (SP) def. Daigle-Depersia 2

2, 23; Glendon-Jensen (SP) def. 
Mara-Hovanec 73, 21.

Bonnet
Bennet tennis team took a 22 ver­

dict from DePaolo Junior High o f. 
Southington Monday.

Sarah Forstrom and Chris Silver 
took singleo matchas for Bennet. 
Bill Prignano-Bob Lammey and 
Nancy Kdler3teve Bayer notched 
wins in douhles for B en ^ . Carolya 
Goodman-AIison Knauth played 
well.

Softball results
Tonight’* Schedule 
Vlllner’e v*. EtT*, 6 • Keeney 
Neleon v*. Garden Sales, 6 - Nike 
Moriarty v*. Peppino’e, 7i30 - 
Nike
AAN V*. Farr’s, 6  • Fitsgerald 
Vernon v*. Acadia, 7 iSO - Robert­
son
Methftdist v*. BA’s, 6 - Robertson 
Personal v*. Bnckland, 6 - Pagan! 
Talaga vs. Elks, 6 - Charter Oak 
Buffa lo  V * . Clark,  7i30 - 
Fitsgerald
Personal  v*. BJ’s, 8i45 - 
FMagerald

CHARTER OAK
Pete Devanney hurled a seven- 

hitter as Highland Park Market 
blanked ’Tierney’s, 33, last night at 
Fitzgerald Field. Both teams played 
errorless ball. Bruce Thleling and 
Joe Lovell each had three hits (or 
the Markets. Russ Mannlla and Tom 
Tierney each rapped two blows for 
tbe losers.

FEUNE
Two big innings powered Personal 

Tee past Thrifty Package Store, 12 
2, at Fitzgerald Field. Marianne 
Pemberton roped three hits and Sue 
Setsky, Chickey Barrera and Gall 
Shimaitls two apiece for tbe Tees. 
Cathy Grant, Debbie Dawson and 
Lis WIezorek each had two hits for 
’Thrifty’s.

NIKE
B eh in d  a 17-h it a t ta c k ,  

Washington Social Club whipped 
Gus’s, 143, at Nike Field. Kevin 
Kelley had four hits, Ctuig Husky 
also (our and Bill Wilson and Carl 
Bnjaucius three apiece for the 
Socials. Jim Colla, U o ^  BoutiUer 
and A1 Ledger had two blows apiece 
(or Gus’ .

REC
Each Bids had nine htts as Rssd 

Construction trlpnsd HMHCU, 21, 
at Niks Field. Waft Parker slaahsd s 
three'ran homsr and double, and

Guy Chambers, Rick Murphy tw r 
hits ap iece  (o r  Reed. R id  
Krajewski and Dave Mork each hac 
three blows for MMHC.

INDY
Flo’s Cake Decorating creamoi 

Zembrowski’s AU3tars, 124, a 
Robertson Park. Dave Slyne hai' 
four hits, Tom Bombardier thret 
and Harry Roy two (or Flo’s. Jin 
LaPenta, John Rook and Pete Ber 
tulotte two ap iece (o r  Zqm 
browskl’s.

NORTHERN
Scoring in all but one frame. 

A l l ia n c e  P r in t in g  rou te t 
Manchester Jaycee Blue, 17-2, a 
Robertaon Park. Tom Vecaey, Lot 
Maheux and Paul Zora each rope* 
three hits and Rick Sieczlowakl 
Steve McGrail and Tom Thibodeai 
two apiece (or Alliance. Ifogei 
Gmley had two of tbe Blue’s (oui 
hito.

WOMEN’S REC 
Behind the two-hit pitching of (3n 

dy Greenberg and an 11-ran (ourtl 
Inning, Buckhuiders blanked Renn’i 
Tavern, 183, last night at Chartei 
Oak Park. Penny G^pion bad fon 
hits and Annette McCall and List' 
Griffin two each for Bucklanders" 
Tlw contest was called after 4Vk in­
nings.

DUSTY
CBT stopped Auto Trim A PainL 

24, at Keoiim Field. ’Tom Rund had 
three hits, Wayne Golon two aud 
Don Nicholson a grandslam hotnss’ 
for CBT. Rich MoUoy and S t ^  
LauretU' had two hits apiece foi’ 
ATAP. ”

WEST SIDE
Red-Lee captured its first ur|n

Dave Gokey had three hits for Rad-
Lee while Sandy Plcara had a Uha 
number (or PoUoe.

Xavier too strong 
tor East trackmen

‘Give up?’

Too much depth was the problem 
as East Catholic High boys’ track 
team scored 61 points against 104.5 
for host Xavier while Northwest 
(^tbolic posted 26.5 points in an 
HCC triangular meet yesterday in 
Middletown.

"To  the man we ran our finest 
times of the year. Xavier had Just 
too much depth,”  remarked Eagle 
Coach Ray Glguere.

East now stands 22 (or tbe season 
after the split.

The 4 X 102meter relay of Chris 
and Greg Eltringham, Dave Raclcot 
and Randy Davison turned in a 
season best clocking of :45.5 in 
taking the event. ’The 4 X 402meter 
relay of Jerry Brown, Dave Barry,

Ran finest 
times of year

Jim ’Tierney ana Jim McKenna also

Blond-haired Frank Savage, appears to be getting the best of 
Japan’s Great Yatso In one of last night’s pro wrestling matches at
the Clarke Arenas l̂ n Manchester. The Eighth DIstrIrt Fire D e p a ,> ^ K h 2 ; iJ r S .M T e £ ^ s ,T ^ ^ ^ ^
ment sponsored the five-bout card which featured Bob B 
(Herald photo by Pinto)

Javelin: 1. Rule (X ), 2. Raynor 
(X ), 3. Tyler (NW), 4. Brunl, (X ) 
51.44 meters.

110 hurdles; 1. Bosh (X ), 2. Ue 
Brown (EC). Mooz (X ), 4. Carr 
(EC) :15.3.

100! 1. Cerritelli (X ), 2. Davison 
(EC), 3. C. Eltringham (EC), 4. G. 
Eltringham (EC) :11.S.

1.500: 1. Klttredge (EC), 2. Q>- 
zean (X ), 3. Santos (NW), 4. Cartelll 
(X ) 4:12.7.

400; 1. McKenna (EC), 2: Demalo 
(NW), 3. Aresco (X ), 4. Tierney 
(EC) :51.S.

300 hurdles: 1. Brown (EC), 2. 
Sousa (X ), 3. Mooz (X ), 4. tie Carr 
(EC), Bosh (X ) :41.6.

3,000: 1. J. S w ift (X ) ,  2. 
Birkmeyer (X ), 3. Adams (EC), 4. 
White (EC) 9:17.5.

Shot put: 1. Stamboulis (EC), 2.

Rook (X ), 3. Lemery (EC), 4. Vess 
(X ) 14.83 meters.

800: 1. Barry (EC), 2. Schiffer 
(NW). 3. Baker (X ). 4. Hawkins (X ) 
2 :0 1 .0 .

200. 1. CerrltelU (X ), 2. Dameo 
(EEW), 3. Davison (EC), 4. McKen­
na (EC) :23.4.

Pole vault: 1. C^ambaren (X ), 2. 
McNamara (X ), 3. Cushing (X ), 4. 
Melanson (NW ) 12’ .

Triple Jump: 1. G. Pltruzzello 
(X ). 2. Carty (NW). 3. Brown (EC), 
4. Young (NW) 12.16 meters.

1,600 relay: 1. East (Brown, 
Barry, Tierney, McKenna), 2. 
Xavier 3:33.86.

High jump: 1. G. Pltruzzello (X ),
2. Paganl (EC), 3. Carty (NW), 4. Ue 
Patton (X ), Miazaga (NW) 6’ .

Discus: 1. Rook (X ), 2. Brunl (X ),
3. Glamo (X ), 4. McMann (NW) 
36.82 meters.

ing gams 
easy victory

Bringing its record to 4-2, Illing 
varsity baseball team whipped 
Kosciuszko of Enfield yesterday, 11- 
1. Glenn Chetelat went 3-for-4 with 
two doubles and a triple and Chris 
Petersen had a double and triple for 
the Rams. Greg Turner added a 
single and double and Tracy Corso a 
two-base knock. Chris Repass 
hurled a two-hitter to gain the 
mound victory.

New swing helpful

Whitworth back 
among $$ leaders
HILTON HEAD ISLAND. S.C.

I UPI I—Look who's back among the 
top 10 LPGA money winners — 
Kathy Whitworth.

The 42-year-oId Hall of Famer. 
who shrugs off the tuft of gray hair 
o v e r  h er l e f t  te m p le ,  has 
rejuvenated her game with a new 
sy^ng and improved Confidence and 
hungrily awaits each week’s tour 
stop.

" I  still want to compete,”  the tall 
Texan says. “ I ’ ll take a n t in g .”

Whitworth, whose 80 tour vic­
tories are only two short of the 
record set by Mickey Wright, sank a 
20-foot birdie putt at the Wonnen's 
International Sunday to gain a

playoH with Sally Little and defen­
ding champion Hollis Stacy. Little 
captured the $18,870 first prize on 
the first sudden death hole.

By dividing $21,040 in second and 
third place prize money with Stacy, 
who won the tournament in a playoff 
a year ago, Whitworth moved to 
ninth on the .1981 money list with 
$48,972 and equalled her 1980 ear­
nings.

Since joining the LPGA 22 years 
ago, Whitworth, whose first tour 
victory was worto $900 in 1962, has 
amassed $^,825 in career earning 
and is in position to become the first 
women golfer in history to crack the 
$1 million mark.

Shrider medalist 
in Tribe triumph
Continuing Its winning ways, 

Manchester High golf team whipped 
CCIL rivals Wethersfield High, 10 
Vi-̂ Vk, and Penney High, 12 Vk to W, 
yesterday at Manchester Country 
Club.

The Silk Town linksmen are 5-1 In 
the CCIL and 8-2 overall.

Manchester’s Greg Shrider took 
medalist honors with a 76 with 
teammate Jeff Fields firing a 79 to 
lead the locals. Doug Martin carded 
an 83 for Manchester.

Results. Manchester vs. Penney 
—Martin (M ) def. Hansen 33, 
Shrider (M ) def. Turley 33, Fields 
(M ) def. Johnson 33, Hohenthal (M ) 
def. Luko 2 Vk to Vk, Manchester won 
medal point, 329-389; Manchester 
vs. Wethersfield —Martin (M ) def. 
Acker 3-0, Shrider (M ) def. 
Stankevich S3, Fields (M ) def. An- 
dreoli 33, Avery (W ) def. Hohenthal 
2 Vk to W, Manchester won medal 
point. 329-341.

Guiding the Manchester Com­
munity College women’s soft- 
ball squad this spring has been 
Dave Schwartz. The collegians 
wound up with an 11-8 won-lost 
regular season record.

IMing raises 
perfect marl^

Illing golf team ran its perfect 
mark to 73 with three victories 
yesterday at Blast Hartford Golf 
Course. The Ram linksmen turned 
back East Hartford and Bennet by 4- 
2 scores and topped Penney, 5-1. 
Bennet topped Penney, 4-2, but 
bowed to Blast Hartford, also by a 4- 
2 count.

Illing’s Phil Fedorchak and Chris 
Gareau each carded 4Ss for nine 
holes with teammate Glen Boggini 
in at 46. Bennet's Eric Trudon fired 
a 44 and Tom Finnegan 47.

8-Inches. Barry secured the 800- 
meter run with a time of 2:01.0. 
Brown won the 300-meter in­
termediate hurdles with a time of 
:41.6. Steve Kittredge took honors in 
the 1,500 while McKenna took the 
400 with a time of :51.3.

Next outing for Blast is Saturday’s 
Hartford Public Invitational. Elagles 
entered are Ron Adams (3,000), lut- 
tredge (1,500), Vln White, Bob Blake 
(3,000 steeplechase), Stamboulis 
(shot put). Brown (300 hurdles) and 
the 4 X 40O-meter relay.

Results:
5,000: 1. Swift (X ), 2. Birkmeyer 

(X ), 3. Garcia (NW), 4. Bonavito 
(X ) 16:12.2.

400 relay: 1. Blast (C. Eltringham, 
Racicot, G. Eltringham, Davison), 
2. Xavier :45.5.

Long jump. 1. Pltruzzello (X ), 2. 
Young (NW), 3. Blackwell (EC), 4. 
S. Pltruzzello (X ) 5.94 meters.

Bolton sports 
program busy

The Bolton men's softball league 
will open its season May 17 and any 
Bolton resident. 18 years or older 
who wishes to participate can con­
tact Ron Avery at 646390 or Larry 
Pesce at 649-1338 for registration 
and placement.

An instructional baseball league 
for 6 to 8-year olds will begin May 9 
from 10 a.m. to noon at Herrick 
Park. Any youngster wishing to join 
can call Ron Avery.

The first husband and wife, "Jack 
and .Jill." softball league is being 
organized for Sunday afternoons and 
is scheduled to begin June 7. Couples 
wishing to participate should con­
tact Avery, or Andy Pinto at 646- 
6388.

Reeistration for midget and pony 
football, the s^cer league and 
cheerleading is June 4-5 from 6-8 
p.m. at the Herrick Park building.

The men's softball league is 
seeking ASA registered umpires; 
anyone interested should contact 
Pesce at 649-1338.

indian thinclads 
bow with Conard

Soundly thumped yesterday was 
the Manchester High girls' track 
team, 97-30, by visiting Conard High 
in CCIL competition at Pete Wigren 
Track.

The setback drops the Silk 
Towners to 3-4 overall and 2-2 in the 
CCIL,

Sue Donnelly captured the 400- 
meter dash for Manchester while 
Sandy Prior came away the victor in 
the discus for the Indians. The 4 X 
400-meter relay of Cathy Decker, 
Janie Glidden, Karen Scott and 
Donnelly also won with the latter 
coming from 30 yards behind to win.

Kim Scott took second placements 
in the 1,500 and 3.000-meter runs for 
the locals while (Jieryl Wilson took 
second in the long jump with a 15- 
foot effort. Karen ^ o tt was second 
in the 800 while Gloria Scata, Bar­
bara Elliott and Nancy Wynn also 
did well.

Results.
100 hurdles; 1. Windish (C), 2, 

Karen Scott (M ) 3. Teasdale (C) 
:18.0.

100: 1. Ha ughey ( C ), 2. 
Youngstrom (C), 3. Scata (M ) :13.1.

1,500: 1. Carlson (C), 2. Kim Scott 
(M ), 3. Poole (C) 5:05.

400: 1. Donnelly (M ), 2. Scamner 
(C), 3. Youngstrom (C) 1:04.8

400 relay: 1. Conard :54.1.
300 hurdles: 1. Davenport (C), 2 

Scanlon (C ), 3. Hunter (C) :52.1.
800: 1. Carlson (C ), 2. Karen Scott 

(M ), 3. Hart (C) 2:29.3.
200: 1, SchroII (C ), 2, Kelley (C), 

3. Richardson (C ) :28.3.
3,000: 1. Poole (C ), 2. Kim Scott 

(M ), 3, Pastittizzo (C ) 11:08.3
1,600 re la y ; 1. Manchester 

(Decker, Glidden, Karen Scott. 
Donnelly) 4:23.

Shot put. 1. Mu'IIin (C , 2 
McCluskey iCi. 3. Elliott (M ) 10 52 
meters.

High jump 1 Brosmith C), 2. 
Davenport (Cl, 3. Haughey lO  !5’ .

D iscu s: 1. P r io r  (.\I', 2. 
McCluskey (Cl. 3. Mullin iCi 30.25 
meters.

Long jump: 1. Haughey (Ci, 2. 
Wilson (M l, 3 Brosmith (C) 4.83 
meters.

Javelin: 1 Mullin (Cl, 2. Allum 
iC), 3. Wynn (Ml 32.35 meters.

East softballers drop 
9-1 duke to Windsor
Welow the .5(X) mark is the East 

Catholic girls’ softba'i team after 
yesterday's 9-1 reversal at the hands 
of Windsor High in Windsor.

The Eaglettes, 4-5, return to the 
diamond today for a tilt with Mercy 
High in Middletown at 3.15.

Windsor, 8-5 for the season, scored 
once in the second inning, three 
more in the fifth on a three-run 
homer and five final tallies in the

sixth.
East's lone marker came in the 

fourth inning. Cindy Granato 
reached on a fielder's choice and 
seSred on Michele Leavitt's RBI tri­
ple.

Luci Hurst went the distance for 
East and absorbed the loss. She 
yielded six hits, walked six and 
fanned five.

Bowling highlights from local leagues NOW
CUNLIFFE AUTO- Dave 
VanTatsell 147-163-442, 
Don McAllister 156-142-428, 
Jim Moore 153-160-424, 
Mike Uppen 147-150-417, 
John Fox 168404, Wayne 
N ye  147-403, C a r l 
Bujauclus 144-400, John 
Kensel 161-140-399, Tim 
Caztagna 395, Ed Doucette 
144-393, Bill Bronson 144- 
392, Hank Frey 161, Don 
Logan 147, Bill MacMullen 
143, Emil Roux 140.

PARKADE DUSTY -  
Ed Bacbl 233-207-680, Rich 
Hyland 209, Butch Savlno 
216, Bob Oliver 209-581, 
Denny Carlin 210464, Art 
Thompaon 208, Joe Lauzon 
218, Bruce Moquin 668, 
Gary Cockerham 209, Jim 
Nfogowan 216-582, Rich 
Higgins 203, A1 Senna 212- 
2t86U, Dkk Murphy 210, 
Jotm Meyers 224-691, Skip 
Kelly 203-215-888, Ernie 
Whipple 218-809, Fred 
Koticki 208, Pete Beaudry _

200464, John Kozicki 209- 
559, Roland Smith 229-206- 
213448.
Bowling

A N T IQ U E S  -  F lo  
Niles 145-134-399, Vi Bayer 
345, Reggie Gburski 344, 
Arlene St. Pierre 126-342, 
Bev Anderson 139-359, 
Chris (}owperthwaite 151- 
136-389, Joan Colby 138, 
Alice Richards 142-364, 
Alice Sartwell 126-126-361, 
Louise Webb 126-140-156- 
422, Emma Johnson 131- 
348, Debbie Hanson 127.

EASTERN BUSINESS 
— Dave Dynes 168490, Stan 
Gnyh 188-162-464, Ben Gr- 
zyb  Sr. 157-393, Ed 
Sebworm 167-394, Les 
Christensen 156, Bub 
Holmes 163412, Cliff Jones 
162, BUI Zwick 161, Tom 
M orrison 161, M ickey 
Holmes 396, Bruce Laverv.

403, Paul Giliberto 399, Ron 
Joiner 394.

ELKS -  Jack Talley 143- 
355, Bernle Welch 137-366, 
Bob Mike 165-391, B ill 
Adam y 136-363, Tony 
DeSim one 361, Chuck:

B a rre ra  138-361, Joe 
DeSimone 162-398, Travis 
Cook Sr. 138-361, Hank 
H eb ert 149-389, Ron 
Deveauz 367, Dorn Farr 
154410, Tom O’Connor 139- 
399, Jim Venezia 141, (Jene 
Richardson 142-378, Ralph

D oyer 136-355, T e rry  Waldron 140-368, Ray Parr 
Devaux 359, Bruce Fishl35- 356, Bill Winnie 135, Mike 
378, Ernie Pepin 139-385, Vengruskas 154, Bill Han- 
Dave Richards 382, Hal son 149-137-07.

OV f f l  HO ^ F A R S  <)f D E P F N D A B t  I  S E R V I C E '

buntlg
• 24 Hour Em er gen cy  Serv ice
• Burner Sal es  & Serv i ce
• Clean Heat ing Oils

6 4 9 - 4 5 9 5
C. all >iq F (.( Your H o m o  Healifnj 

/.nr1 ‘ 1’ i .o n d i t io n in g  Neodu

Tommy Mulroy’s

B MO MTS
r - i s

WOM MO PUT 
WITNTHI

YOUTH SOCCER ACADEMY
TW O FUN SESSIONS  

WESTMINSTER SCHOOL WESLEYAN UNIVERSITY 
SIMSBURY, CONN. MIDDLETOWN, CONN.
JULY 19-24 JULY 26-31

SCHOOL PROVIDES
•  TOP QUALITY SOCCER BALL •  DAILY SWIM
•  CAMP SHIRT ' •  CERTIFICATES AND AWARDS

TRANSPORTATION AVAILABLE

NAME.

ADDRESS.

MH

.Z IP .
-AGE.PHONF

□  $110.00 COMMUTER □  $190.00 RESIDENT 
WESTMINSTERS WESLEYAN □  

$50.00 DEPOSIT REQUIRED 
FM MORI m nnUTIM CAU: SM-MM 

MbN T«: T9a«y Hrinffe RMfs Nr KMa
PA Ira MS, MMaHlMry, CT OBOSS

AUTO REPAIRS
0 WE SERVICE ALL

’ Hom« of Mr. Goodwroncfi GENERAL MOTOR 
CARS AND TRUCKS

» A U  MECHANICAL REPAIRS
• COMPLETE COUISION REPAIRS
> RESUILT AUTOM ATIC TRANSMISSIONS
• AUTOPAINTINa .
• CHARSE W ITH MASTER CHARBE
• 24 HOUR WRECKER SERVICE

AUTO REPAIR

CARTER
1220 MAIN ST. 
MANCHESTER 
TEL. 646-0464

OM
SERVee

O U A im
c t  R jin s

(aWPtALMOTOMiMrriPIVlIIOM

'Now at your Toyota dealer your 
Toyota is Cheaper to keep than 
before. We’ve lowered the prices of 
the most basic services and parts: 
tune ups, oil changes, air and oii 
filters, spark plugs, even batteries. 
We sell Toyota triple filtering ele­
ment air filters to help protect the 
engine of your Toyota. For Toyota 
service specialists and genuine 
Toyota parts, plus new everyday 
low prices, bring your Toyota to the 
people who know Toyota best.

®  TOYOTA jpegwgfo

1 ^ 1  TOYOTA

LYNCH
rv i A f M C H E  S T E P I ,  C O M I N J

500 WEST CENTER 8T. MANCH. 040-4B21



14 -  THE HERALD. Wed., May 6. 1861

Scoreboard

w
SAN DIECO

ab r h bi
MONTREAL

ab r h bl

Baseball

NATIONAL LEAGl'E 
By Lnited Press International 

East
W L Pet GB

St Louis 13 4 765
Montreal 15 6 714 -
l^iladelphia 16 7 696
Pittsburgh 
New Yorlt

8 B 5(0 4̂ >
6 13 316 8

Oiicago 3 17 150 11><
West

Los Angeles 16 8 667
Cincinnati 11 10 .524 3>'i
Atlanta 12 12 500 4
Houston 11 13 458 5
San P'ranciscD II 15 423 6
San Diego 8 17 320 8«i

Smith ss 4 0 11 Raines If 4 110
Jones cl S l00S cott2b  20 10
RIchrdsir 40 11 Dawson cl 4 0 00 
Salazar 3b 4 0 0 0 Valentin rf 4111 
Edwrds rf 4 0 0 0 Carter c 3 10 0
Swisher c 0 0 0 0 Cromrt lb 4 12 2
Kennedy c 4 0 10 Parrish 3b 3 0 0 0 
Lefebvr rf 0 0 0 0 Speier ss 4 0 0 0
Perkins lb 4 2 10 Lm  p 2 0 2 0
Lucas p 0 0 0 0 Hutton ph 10 0 0
Bonilla 2b 20 11 Frvmanp 0 0 0 0
Mura p 3 0 0 0 Montnz ph 10 11
Bass lb 00 0 0
Totals 32 3 5 3 Totals 32 4 8 4 
Two out when winning run scored 
San Diego 001 001 VX -̂ 3
Montreal 000 000 211--4

E--Smith. Kennedy DP—San Dieso 1 
.OB'-San Diego 4. Montreal 8 2r

NEW YOftK
ab r h bi

Rndl^2b 
Mmpnry cf 
Winnold If 
Jacksn dh 
Watson lb 
Piniclla rf 
Gamble rf 
Nettles 3b 
Foote c 
Dent ss 
Totals 
New York 
('alifornia

CALIFORNIA
ab r h bi

Perkins. Bonilla. Cromartie. Kennedy SB Bird

3 100 Carewlb 4 00 0
4 0 10 Burlesn ss 4 12 1
4 0 3 1 Ford rf 4 2 2 0 
4 0 0 0 Lynn cf 2 10 0 
4 0 00 Baylor dh 4 0 3 3
2 0 10 Downing c 4 111 
1 0 0 0 Clark If 4 0 0 0 
40 10 Grich2b 3 12 1
3 111 Hobson Sb 4 0 10 
3 000

32 2 7 2 ToUls 33 8 II 6 
110 000 00(1-2 
000 311 lOx-6 

DP-New York 2 LOB New York 5. 
('alifornia? 2B--Winfield. Burleson HR 

Foote (5i. IViwning (2) SB-Randol^ 
IP H R ER B B ^

New York
I'nderwood (LO-41 3 5 3 3 1 2

SP o m sT fM H :
JOHNNY BENCH

Tuesday s Results 
Houston 4. Chicago 3’ 
Pittsburgh at Cincinnati, ppd . 
Montreai4. San Diego3 

kneel
San FraiiciscoO. New York?

Richards SB—Smith. Jones. Scott 2. 
Raines S—Bonilla, Scott. Parrish

IP H R ER BBSO
San Diego

Mura(L0-4) 82-3 7 4 3 2 3
Lucas 0 1 0 0 0 0

Montreal
Lee 7 4 3 3 1 6
Fryman (W2-01 2 1 0 0 0 2

Lucas pitched to 1 batter in 9th 
W P-Lee T-2 24 A-15.9C0

Castro 
ijRoche 

('alifornia 
Travers 
Jefirsn (W M ) 
Aase iS 11

2 2
0 1 
1 I

0 1

Philadelphia8. Los Angeles?

St Louis 4. Atlanta 1
Wednesday s (tames 
I All Times EDT *

Houston (Ryan 1-1 > at Chicago iC^udill 
0-21.2 .35 p m

Pittsburgh i('andclaria l-2i at Cincin­
nati I Pastore 0-1», 7 35 p m 

San Diego (Eichelberger 111 at 
Montreal i§urris2-li.7 35 pm  

Los Angeles (Hooton 3-Oi at Phila­
delphia (Espinosa 1-1 >.7 35p m 

San Francisco (Whitson 0-31 at New 
York I Zachrv 3-21.8 05 p m 

Atlanta i Perry 2-2) at St Louis 
(Forsch2-li,fl 35 p m

Thursday s Games 
.Atlanta at St Louis 
Houston at Oiicago 
Pittsburgh at Cincinnati. 2. twilight 
San Diego at Montreal, night 
San Francisco at New York, night 
lx)s Angeles at Philadelphia, night

SAN FRANCISCO 
ab r h bi

Cabell lb 
Bergmn lb 
May c 
('lark rf 
CDavis rf 
Herndon If 
Evans 3b 
Martin cf 
Stennett2b 
Smith ss

NEW YORK
ab r h bi

Griffin 
Wohifrd ph

in p 
fro I 

Moffitt p 
Breinmg p 
Minton p 
Totals

4 0 0 0 Yongbld rf 
1 0 0 0 Taveras ss
5 110 f^zzilh  d
4 110 Kingmn If 
1 0 0 0 Staub lb
5 2 4 2 Miller p 
5 111 Bckmn 
5 0 2 1 Reardon
4 2 11 Cubbag ph 
4 112 Brooks 3b 
3 12 2 Trevino c 
1 0 0 0 Flynn 2b 
0 0 0 0 Jones p 
0 0 0 0 Roberts p 
0 0 0 0 Jorgnsn lb 

42 9 13 9 Totals

5 0 3 0
4 100
5 12 0 
40 11 
2 0 0 0

5 . ^ 0 0 0  
ph T  0 0 0 
>n p 0 0 0 0 

110 0 
4 12 1 
4 12 1 
4 122 
10  0 0 
0 0 0 0 
3 112 

38 7 13 7

AMERICAN LEAGl’E 
By Cnited l*ress International 

East

Cleveland
Milwaukee*
New York
Baltimore
Detroit
Boston
Toronto

We
Oakland
CTiicago
Texas
(Alifornia
MinnesoUj
Kansas ('itv
Seattle

Tuesda\

W L Pci GB

10 13 
8 13. 
R 14

571 6»i
571 S>>

I 462 9 
301

\ 333 II 
250 14

San Francisco 00I2B0 0QD-9
New York 000 000(07-7

E—Staub. Brooks DP—iSan Francisco 
LOB- San Francisco6, New York? 2B- 
YoungbI(MKl2. Hemdon2, ('lark. Evans. 
Trevino 3B-Herndon, Flynn HR 
(friffin (1). Smith d i. Jorgensen i2i

IP H R ER RB SO
•San F'rancis< o

Griffin I W 2-21 7 4 0 0 1 4
Moffitt M-3 7 6 'fi I I
Breining 1-3 0 I I 1 0
Minton 'S5(

New York
Jones 11.0-4' 4 8 6 5 '
Roberts 0 2 2 2 1
Miller 3 2 1 1 1
Reardon 2 I 0 0 (

Jones pitched to 3 batters in 5 
Roberts pitched to2 batters in 5th 

Balk Griffin PB Trevino T 2 
8(Q1

2 0 0 0 0

0
6 2-3 6 1 

2 1-3 1 0 0 1 2 
Underwood pitched to4 batters in4th, 

Travers pitched to I batter in 1st 
Balk Jefferson W P-Aase T -1  39 A 

-35.629

BOSTON KANSASCITY
ab r h bi ab r h bi

Remy2b 7 13 2 Wilson If 6 13 0
Evans rf 3 3 3 1 Wshngt ss 4 2 3 1
Yslrzm dh 7 0 2 1 McRae dh 6 111 
Rice If 7 0 2 0 Oliscf 6 112
Pere? lb 6 0 3 2 Aikens lb 4 12 1
Un.sfrd3b 6 0 10 ('.Brett 3b 10 10 
Miller cf 6 120 White 2b 5 00 0 
Aiten.son c 4 110 May lb 0 0 0 0 
Hoffmn ss 6 2 2 1 Wathan c* 6 0 4 1 

(Tialk 3b 2 0 0 0 
Phelphs ph 10 10 
Garcia pr 0 10 0 
Mullnks2b 100 0 
Geronim rf 4 0 0 1 

Totals 52 8 19 7 Totals 47 7 16 7 
(('ompletion of suspended game i 

Boston 001(00 110 0(0-8
Kansas (ity  013 000 001 0(0-7

B- (.erohimo DP—Boston 1. Kansas 
('it> 2 LOB- Boston 14, KansasCitv9 
2B-̂  Aikens. Wilson. McRae Allenson, 
Hoffman. GBretl 3B Washington. 
F*helps HR-Otis i l '  SB—(..ansford, 
FCvans SF Aikens. (leronimo

IP H R ER BB SO
Boston 

Tudor 
Stanley 
Brgmr iW lOi 
Clear 'S I '

Kansas ('ity 
Gale 
Wright
(^isonbrry i LO-2

6 1-3 8 4 4 2 2 
3 2-3 4 1 1 1 0
M-3 4 2 2 0 0 
2-3 0 0 0 0 1

4 2-3 8 3 2 2 
21-3 2 2 2 3 

5 9 3 3 1
Wright pitched to2 batters in8th 

-TudorBalk- Udor Tim«^-4 04 A 25,688

Interviewed by Michael Tollln

Johnny Bench, S3, a IS-Ume AllSUr, has been the regular catcher 
for the Cincinnati Reds since 1969 — when he was Rookie of the 
Year. He was the National League's MVP in 1970 and 1972.

Johnny, you have received am extraordinary amonat o f media 
attention for yoar request to catch oaiy twice a week. How did 
you reach this deeisioa?

It's always difficult to cut down your involvement after 16 
to 17 years of professional baseball. But there comes a time 
when you have to make a decision for your future, and I just 
felt it was necessary if I ’m going to prolong my career.

This has not been just an overnight decision, of course. I cut 
down last year so that I stopped catching day games after 
night games. It ’s just to the point where the arm hurts and the 
legs ache if I catch two days in a row. And I had to make a 
request and let the Reds help me make a decision.
You are within reach o f several milestones, iacladiag the 
record for most games played by a catcher, held by A l Lopes. 
Is il hard for you to give up the pursuit o f these numbers?

If you're goal-oriented in that fashion, then it becomes a 
matter of tunnel vision and you don’t see the forest for the 
trees. Obviously, it would be a simple matter if I would go 
ahead and catch two more years 1 would break Al Lopez’ 
record, and I could make the all-out effort and reach 400 
home runs as a catcher. But if I did that, I would not be that 
concerned about health and my future. Again, it just goes 
back, to me anyway, to life after baseball.

Baseball is a very important part of me. and I ate, slept and 
drank baseball ever since I was a Little League player. I think 
attaining records — let’s say breaking Bill Dickey’s record 
with 13 100-game seasons or breaking Yogi Berra’s home-run 
record for catchers — puts tilings in perspective. I ’m very 
proud of the things I ’ve accomplished, and they are sort of a 
measifring stick, a way of looking at where you’ve been, what 
you've done and where you’re going.

But I haven’t lived half my life yet, and there have been w  
many times that I played when I shouldn’t have, 
sometimes cries out to me and says, "Hey look, 
like I can still play and contribute, but I have to realize that 
there will be other things I have to prepare for. and I have to 
think that my future is more important than, say, whether I 
break Al Lopez’ record.
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NYUUadnn
N Y R a n tm

P in t p trlod -l. NY Itlandm. Tomlli S 
(Njntnm . Merrick), ! :■ .  >. NY 
blaaden, B o m ll(a iiu M s te d ). ll:« .  1. 
NY Maoden, Bony U (TrotUerl. 17:11 
PwltIUei-Kallur, N Y I . iA :  Une. NYI. 

Antoon, NYR,4:17; C rro il, NYI 
H iiihe..NYR ,U :ll;H «| lie f, NYR, 

H :ll; rKnUom, rlYI, I7 :»; Welllii, 
N YR .W :*.  ̂ .

Second pcriod-«. NY IiUnden. Gorin. 
9 (Lorimer), l : » .  S, NY Renfen. 
Grceebner 4 (Koleqpooioe, Hedber.) 
II :S. 4. NY Renfen, Beck 9 ( Diuuay. 
Vkken), 17;a. Penellle»-D. Potvin. 
NYI, 0:8 : GIliiee, NYI. 19:09. Bony. 
NYI. 19:S: Glllief. NYI. 10:8; Kot- 
Mooaloi. NYlr10:8.

n ird  period-7, NY Iilenden. Sutlers 
(Cerroll), 10:«. Peneltle»-None.

Shota on |oel-NY Itlenden SO-7-8. 
NY Rengen7-U a-».

G oalle»-NY Iilenden, SmlUi. NY 
Renfen, Beker. A—1780.

Celgery '.'. ’ t ’ tMinnesota S 31—7
P in t period-1, Minnesota. CIccarelllB 

(Peyne. B Smith). 3 01 9. Celeery 
ReutakalMo: (Lever. Lavellee) J:90 3, 
Minnesota. Chrlstoll 0 ( Broten, Robertal. 
13:10. 4. Minnesota, B. Smith 6 
iuneulsted), 16:2 Penellies- La- 
Braeten. Cal. 1:51. K Maiwell. Min, 
3:44; Roberts. M in,7:». Uvallee.Cal, 
11:31; Murdoch, Cal. 15 59. Hartsburg. 
Min, 16:51; Barren. Min, 16:36 

Seomd period—5. Calgary. Hislop 3 
I Lavalleel. I 31 6. Minnesota. CIccarelli 
9 (McCarUiy. B Smithl. 2:44 7, 
Minnesota. CIccarelli 10 (McCarthy, B 
SmlUil,S;50.6, Minnesota, Palmers iK 
Maxwell), 10:51. Penaltles-K Maxwell 
M ln .6:»: Pletl.Cal.irO ). Ruisell.Cal. 
U :S : Russell, (b l, 19:00.

t, and my body 
, I hurt!’'  I feel

MINNESOTA
ab r h bi

ATLANTA
ab r h bi

ST LOITS
ab r b bi

Baltiniurc3 Minnesota? 
ClevelamI at Toronto ppd

. T 70 Ion -
Boston R Kansas ('ity. I 12 inninKit. 

completion of suspended game 
Kansas City 2 iMston 1 
T*’xas6 ('hicaKol 
Culifornidfi New York 2 
Oakland 6 Detroit 2 
Milwauk(.‘e4, Seattle 1

Wednesday s (James 
•All Times EDT

Minnesota 'Arroyo 1-2' at Baltimore 
Palmer 1-0' 7 30 p m 
Cleveland 'Blvleven 2-1' at Toronto 

Todd 1 -2' 7 30 p m
Boston Eckersley2-2' at Kansas ('ity 

I Leonard 2-3' R 3fi p m 
I'hicajto I Burns 2-1' at Texas ' Honey­

cutt 2-0) . R 3f) p m
New York 'Guidrv 2-2' at California 

Witt 2-1' 10 30 p m
Detroit I Wilcox 3-2' al Oakland 

' laangford 4-11.10 30 p rn 
Milwaukee • l^erch 2-1 < at S<>attle 

' P arro tt 0-2'. 10 35 p m
Thursday s Games 

Detroit al Oakland 
Cleveland al^Toronto nifjht 
Chicago at Texas night 
New York al ('alifornia. night 
Milwaukee at Seattle, night

EASTERN I.KAGI E 
First Hall Standings 

By I'niUnJ Press International 
North

W L Pci (JB 
11 3 7BB

9 8 529 3>: 
6 11 353

Miller If 4 0 0 0 Herr 2b 4 0 0 0
Wshngtn rf 4 0 10 Scott cf 4 0 10
Chmbls lb 4 110 Hrnndz lb 3 0 10
Horner 3b 4 0 10 Hendrck rf 3 111
Murphvcf 40 11 Porter c 32 11 
Hubbr82b 4 0 0 0 OberkflMb 3 100 
Benedict c 3 0 3 0 l^zcano If 3 0 2 1
Ramirz ss 2 0 0 0 Ramsey ss 3 0 11
PcK'orb ph 10 0 0 Sorensen p 3 0 0 0 
(Jomezss 0 0 0 0
Boggs p 2 0 0 0
Assistn ph 10 0 0
Mahler p 0 0 0 0
Totals 33 1 7 1 Totals 29 4 7 4 
Atlanta 000 (Ul 001 1 •
St I^iuis OOOafiOOx 4

DP- Atlanta 1. St I>ouis I LUB 
AllanU5,Sl UiuisS HH Hendrick'5>. 
Porter >2' SB-Scott, Hernandez

IP H R ER BB SO
Atlanta 

Boggs a. 1-4.
Matiler 

St Umis 
Sorensen ' W' 4-0'

Balk-Sorensen

Second (tame
BOSTON KANSAS CITY

ab r h hi * ab rh b i
Evans rf 
Stapleln 2b 
Rudi lb 
Rice If 
Perez dh 
l^nsfrd .3b 
Schmidt c 
Nichols cf 
lloffmn ss

4 0 0 1 Wilson If 
4 0 0 0 Wshngt »s 
4 0 0 0 GBrettSb 
4 0 0 0 McRae 
3 0 0 0 Otis cl 
3 0 10 Aikens lb 
3 110 Xtarcia lb 
3 0 2 0 Wathan rf 
2 U 0 0 Phelps ph 

Geronim rl 
{'halk2b 
(irole c 

30 I 4 1 Totals

4 0 0 0 
3 0 0 0 
40 10 
3 0 10 
3 12 0 
3 0 11 
0 0 0 0 
2 110 
10 0 0 

0 0 0 0 
2 0 0 0 
2 0 0 1 
27 2 6 2

Ward If 
('astino3b 
Hatcher cf 
Smalley as 
Macknn 2b 
Jackson lb 
Engle rf 
Powell ph 
Baker ph 
Adams dh 
Butera c 
Totals 
Minnesota 
Baltimore

BALTIMORE
ab r h bi

4 13 1 Bumbry cf 
4 0 0 0 Daiier ib 
4 110 SakaU2b
3 0 0 0 Singletn dh
4 011 Murray lb 
4 0 10 Graham c 
3 0 0 0 Dempsey c

0 0 Dwyer If 
1 000 DeCincsSb
OOC

I 0

9 7 1 1
-2 07 A-7 ,531

0 1

Holyoke 
(tlens Falls 
Lvnn 
Buffalo II 294

South
West Haven 10 8
Heading lU 8 5
Bristol 9 9 5
Walerburv 8 1(1

Tsesday s Results 
I.ynn3 (JlensFallsO 
Buffalo3 Bristol 1 
Waterbury4 Beading 3 
Holvoke? West Haven 6 _

Wednesd.iv s Games 
Lynn al Buffalo 
Bristol at (j)ens Falls 
Holyoke at W'aterburv 
R ead m it West Haven

Thursday s (James 
Lynn at Huffalo 

- Bristol at Glens Falls 
Holyoke at Waterbury 
Heading at West Haven

LOS AN(JELES
ab r h bi

lx)pes2b 
Landrex cf 
Baker If 
(JaYveV lb 
Cev 3b 
(•Juerrer rf 
Srioscia c 
Russell ss 
Welch p 
Goltz p 
Johnstn pb 
Forster p 
Stewart p 
Castillo p 
Howe p 
Totals

3 112
4 0 13 

4 12 2
4 0 10 
4 0 0 0 
4 0 10 
2 10  0 
0 0 0 0 
0 0 0 0 
U 0 0 0 
0 0 0 0

33 8 9 R

HOUSTON

Puhl cf 
Reynlds ss 
Hem lb 
JCniz If 
Howe 3b 
Thon2b 
Woods rf 
Garcia 2b 
Puiols c 
Ashby c 
Niekro p 
DSmith p

ab r h bi
CHlCA(iO

4 0 10 Thmpsn cf 
4 0 0 0 Fletchr2b 
4 110 Bui knr lb 
4 2 3 0 Hendrsn If
3 0 2 0 Durham rf
0 10 0 HCniz 3b
4 0 0 0 Heitz3b
4 0 0 0 Blackwilc 
3 0 0 0 Dejesus ss 
10 12 Tracy ph 
3 0 0 0 LSmithp
1 0 0 0 Tyson ph

Reuschel p 
Krug ph 
Dillard 2b 

35 4 8 2 Totals * 
000 300 
000

ab r h bi

PltlLADKLPHlA 
ab r h hi

4 110 Gross rl 5 3 2 0
5 3 3 1 Rose lb 3 2 11 
4 12 2 Schmidt 3b 
4 0 10 Matthwslf 
3 111 TnlloZb
4 112 Maddox cf 
4 0 0 0 Howa ss 
4 0 10 Moreind c 
2 0 0 0 Chrstnsn p 
0 0 0 0 Reed p 
10 0 0 Lvlep 
0 0 0 0 I'nser ph 
0 0 0 0 Smith pr 
10 10 

0 0 0 0
36 7 11 6 Totals

Two out when winning run scored 
D)s Angeles 101(10 050 -7
Philadelphia 000(04 112 8

I)P--L«s Angeles 1 LOB—I-os Angeles 
5 ITiiladelphia 7 2B- Baker Trillo, 
Matthews. Hose. ('ey. ('astillo Schmidt 
3H—l^ndreaux HR—(Juerrero ' 31. TnlU 
'2i SB- Russell. Dipes S Dipes SF 
Baker. Tnllo

IP H HER BBSO
Los Angeles

Welch 5 4 4 4 2 2
CJottz 1 1  0 0 0 0
Forster 2 - 3 2 1 1 0 0
Stewart 1-3 0 0 0 I U
Castillo I L(K11 1 1-3 2 3 3 2 1
Howe 1-3 0 0 0 1 0

[Philadelphia
Christenson 7 7 4 4 1 7
Reed 1 3 3 3 0 1
Lyle<W2-l) 1 1  0 0 0 1

Welch pitched to 4 batters m 6th 
Christenson pitched to 2 batters in Bth 

HBP by Welch 'Rose< WP- Christen 
son PB-Moreland T -2 58 A-27241

Totals
Boston 001 000 000- 1
Kansas ('ily OOOlOOlOx- 2

DP Boston 1 LOB Boston 3. Kansas 
('ilyR 2B Olis2 Aikens. Wathan 3B- 
Lanslord S Hoffman ('halk SF—Grote 

IP H R ER BBSO
lioslon

TananaiLtM- 7 1-3 6 2 2 3 0
('ampbell 2-3 0 0 0 1 1

K.'insas Citv
(Jura'W 3-2 (■ 9 4 1 1 0  4

HBP hv Tanana I Wathan i T-2(T7 A 
21.708

3 110 
2 112 
1 0 0 0  
30 10
4 0 0 0 
3000  
0 0 00  
300 1 
3 0 0 0

4 0 0 0 Roenick rf 3 12 0 
3 0 10 Kmchek ss 2 0 0 0 

34 2 7 2 Totals 27 3 5 3 
100 000 001-2 
210 000 001-3 

LOB-Minnesota 6. Baltimore 6 2B— 
Ward. Dauer. Roenicke. Hatcher. HR- 
Ward <21 SF—Dwyer. Dauer.

IP  H R E R B B SO
Minnesota

Erickson ( L 1-31 6 5 3 3 4 2
Baltimore

Flangn(W3-2) 8 1-3 6 2 2 1 4
Stoddard 0 1 0 0 0 0
T Martinez(S3t 2-3 0 0 0 0 1

Stoddard pitched to 1 batter in 9th 
WP-Hanagan T -2  09 A-ll.fl96

Basketball

DETROIT
ab r h bi

OAKLAND
ab r h bi

NBA Playoffs
By United Press International 

Qiampionship 
Best-of-Seven 

(All Times EDT)
Boston vs. Houston 

(Boston leads series. 1-0) 
May5— Boston9§. Houston^
May 7— Houston at Boston. 7 .35 p m 
May9— Boston at Houston, 3 :3^ .m 
May 10— Boston at Houston. 1 lObp.n 
x-May 12— Houston at Boston.9;l£ 

p.m.
x-May 14— Boston at Houston. 10:06 

pm.
x-May 17 — Houston at Boston. 1:06 

p.m.
x-if necessary

CH1CA(,() TEXAS
ab r h bi

leF lorelf 5 0 0 0 Will92h 
Squires lb 5 0 2 0 Riversef 
Fisk c 4 0 )0  Duran If 
Luzinskdh 4 0 0 0 Oliver dh 
Kuntz pr 0 0 0 0 Hob<>rts If
Baines rl 4 0 0 0 Stem 3b
Ix'moncf 3 120 (Jrubb rl 
Bernzrd2h 4 0 0 0 Ihitnam lb 
MornsnSh 4 0 2 0 Sundbrge 
Almon s.s 4 0 2 1 Menduz ss
Totals 37 1 9 1 Totals
('hicago (00 000 1(0-1
Texas OOOQ(B21x-6

E Stem LOB ('hicagol0.Texas4 2B 
Wills Almon, (Jrubb, Sfjuires 3B-- 

lx*mon HR Roberts i|i Sundberg. 
Mendoza SF -Wills

IP H R ER BBSO
('hicago

Baumgartn ' 1.2-31 
Hoyt 
Hickey 
Farmer 

Texas
Darwin IW 3-21 81-3 9 1 1 0 9
('onier 2-3 0 0 U 0 0

liaumgarten pitchiHl tu2 batters in7th 
HBP-by Darwin I I,emoni T--2 46 A

ab r h bi 
3 111 
3 0 00 
1 0  0 0
3 t f 0 
3 2 )3
4 0 2 0 
4 111 
3 100 
2 0 0 0 
2 0 0  1

28 6 6 6

6 5 5 5 2 5 
2-3 0 0 0 0 0
1-3 0 0 0 0 0

I I 1 1 t 1

Peters dh 4 0 10 HeiKtrsn If 4 0 0 0 
Trmmll ss 5 110 Murphy cf 3 111 
Kemp If 4 0 10 Revmg lb 3 2 0 0 
Hebner lb 4 0 0 0 Armas rf 4 12 0 
Gibson rf 3 0 11 Gross 3b 4 2 4 3 
Cowens cf 4 12 0 Heath c 3 0 0 1 
Parrish c 4 0 0 0 Pattrsn dh 3 0 0 0 
BrooknsSb 4 0 2 0 Doyle2b 3 00 0 
Whitakr2b 3 0 0 1 SUnley ss 3 0 10 
ToUls 35 2 8 2 ToUls 30 8 8 5 
Detroit 1(0000001-2
Oakland OOOmoSx-6

EJ—Gibson LOB—Detroit 9, Oakland 4 
2B—Kemp. Gross 2. HR—Murphy (5). 
Gross <2i SB—Brookens. S—Heath

IP H RER BBSO
Detroit

RozemaiL2-3i 52-3 6 3 3 2 4 
Bailey 2 1-3 2 3 2 1 1

Oakland
Norris <W60i 9 8 2 2 2 5

HBP—by Norris iGibson) T—2:36. A— 
18.925

Hockey

NATIONAL HOCKEY LEAGUE 
Playoffs

By United Press Internationa) 
Semifinals 
Best-of-Seven 

(AU Times EDT)
NY Rangers vs. New York Islanders 

(NY IfUnders lead series. 44)) 
Apr.B — NY Islanders5. NYRangert

2
Apr. SO- NY Islanders?. New York 

RangeisS
May 2— NY Islanders 5. NY Rangers

MAJOR
LEAGUE.

l e a d e r s '

1
Mays— NY IslandersS, NY Rangers

MinnesoU vs. Calgary 
(MinnesoU leads series. 3-1)

Apr 28 — MinnesoU 4. Calgary 1 
Abr. SO— Calgary 3. Minnesota 2 
May 3 — MinnesoU 6. Calgary 4 
May 5— M innesoU?.Ca^ry4 
“  “ - MinnesoU at Calga

ToUls 
Houston 
Chicago 

E—flCruz,
(Thicagol LOB—HoustonS.Chic^o? 
2B—H ^erson . Howe. Buckner

5 0 13 
4 0 0 0 
4 0 10 
4 0 3 0 
3 0 0 0
3 110 
0 0 0 0
4 0 0 0 
2 0 0 0 
0 ) 0 0  
0 0 0 0  
1 0 0 0

2 0 0 0 
0 0 0 0  
1100 
33 3 6 3 
0(0-4 
300-3

MILWAUKEE
ab r h bi

SEATTLE
ab r h bi

ATLANTA
ab r h bi

ST U 'UIS
ab r h bi

DeJesus. Fletcher DP—

'JTtp-
son. Ashby SB—Henderson. Thon

IP H R ER BBSO
Houston

Niekro 6 1-3 5 3 3 3 4
DSimthlWl-S) 22-3 1 0 0 1 1 

Chicago
Reuschel 7 5 2 1 1 6
LSmith(L(F2) 2 3 2 2 0 2

T-2  41 A-2,0e

Miller If 4 0 0 0 Herr 2h 4 0 0 0
Wshngtn rf 4 0 10 S<'ott cf 4 0 )0
('hmbis tb 4 110 Hrnndz lb 3 0 10
Homer 3b 4 0 10 Hendrck rf 3 111
Murphy cf 4 0 11 Porter c 3 2 11
Hubbrd 2b 4 0 0 0 Oberkfll 3b 3 10 0 
Benedict c 3 0 3 0 Lescano If 3 0 2 1 
Ramirz ss 2 0 0 0 Ramsey ss 3 0 11 
Pocorb ph 1 0 0 0 Sorensen p 3 0 0 0 
CJomez ss 0 0 0 0 
Boggs p 2 0 0 0
Assistn ph 10 0 0
Mahler p 0 0 0 0
ToUls 33 1 7 1 ToUls 29 4 7 4
AtlanU (OO 000 001-1
St Louis Q(0fllOOx-4

DP-AtlanU 1. St Louis 1 LOB- 
Atlanu 5. St Louis 5 HR—Hendrick. 
Smith. Porter (2) SB—Scott. Hernandez 

IP H R E R B B SO
AtlanU

Boggs i L M i  7 7 4 4 3 3
Mahler 1 0 0 0 1 0

St Louis
Sorensen i W 4-0) 9 7 1 1 0  1

Balk-Sorensen T -2  07 A-75S1.

Yount ss 4 2 3 3 Cruz 2b 4 0 0 0 
Money 3b 2 0 O p Simpson cf 4 0 11
Oglivie If 4 0 11 Paciork rf 4 0 2 0
Hisle dh 4 0 10 Zisk dh 4 0 0 0
Simmons c 4 0 10 Meyer If 2 0 0 0
Thomas cf 3 0 0 0 Hendrsn If 2 0 0 0
Brouhrd rf 3 0 10 Narron c 2 0 0 0
Edwrds rf 1 0 0 0 Bulling c 10 0 0
Bandolb 2 110 Bochtelb 30 10
C^perlb  00 0 0 Randle In 3 120 
Romero 2b 2 10 0 Auerbeh ss 2 0 0 0 
(ianther2b 1 0 00 Gray ph 1000 

Andersn ss 0 0 0 0 
ToUls 30 4 8 4 ToUls S  1 6 1
Milwaukee 008000010-4
Seattle 001 (00000-1

DP-Seatt)e 1 LOB-Milwaukee 5. 
SeaUle4 2B-Paciorek,Bando, Sinmton. 
Yount HR—Yount (3) ^Bando. Money.

IP H R ER BBSO
Milwaukee

Vuckovich(Wl-2) 6 3 1 1

Batting
<basedon35at-bats) 

National [.eague
g ab r

Perkins. SD 1? 39 4
Collins, Cin 21 82 2(
Rose. Phil 23 S6 15
Flynn. NY 20 68 9
Henderson. On 
Herndon. SF 
Raines, Mtl 
Youngblood. NY 
Morales. Chi 
Madlock. Pitt

lgary.9:35 

(^)gary at MinnesoU.8:35

May 7< 
p.m.

x-May9-
pm.

x-May 12— Minnesota al Calgary. 9 35
p.m.
x-if necessary

21 77 7 28 264
24 S  13 33 .369

21 82 16 29 254
14 44 4 15 241

15 47 2 16 240
15 53 5 18 240

Augustine 
Fingers (S4) 

Seattle
Gleaton (L2-4) 
Andersen

I 1 
2 2

0 5 
0 0 2 

0 0 2

ugust;
-2:06

712 8 4 4 3
122 0 0 0 I 

itine pitched to 1 batter in 8th
'  A-6044

American League
g ab r h pet. 

Singleton, Bal 20 88 9 412
Butera. Min 15 35 4 13 271
Zisk. Sea 25 »  13 35 285
Almon. Chi 21 75 11 27 2B
Diaz.Cle 14 52 5 15 267.
Veryzer.Oe 15 45 3 16 .356
Coweni. Del 29 57 7 20 251
Armas. (3ak 36106 16 37 B9
Bemazard.Oii 21 81 11 38 246 
Gray. Sea 18 35 5 12 20

Home Runs
National League — Schmidt, Phil 8; 

Cmi. Hou. Kingman. NY, Dawson, MU, 
ind Hefidricfc,%L5.

American League — Armas, Oak •; 
Singleton. Bal and Zisk. Sea 7; Ford, 

Small^. Min.andHiomas. MU 6. 
Runs ̂ tted  In

Nstional League— Concepcion, Cln2S 
Schmidt. Phil S ; Garvey, LA, and 
Landreaux. LA 17; Murphy, AU IS.

— Armas, Ciek 31.
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Jai Alai Entries
WEDNESDAY (EVENING)

t;B; Kussell, ca i.iv  uD.
Third perioo-g. MinnesoU. K Maxwell 

„ (unassisted).8:44 10.Calgary. Gould3 
((Thrainard. Murdoch). 10:22 n. Calgary,
D ^ e r  I (Murdoch). 10:S7 Penallies- 
Barrett. Min. 8:01. B. Maxwell. Min. 
19:08; Plett.Cal. 19:52; Minnesota bench 
(serv^  by McCarthy). 19:52.

Shots on goaF-Olgary 8-10-1&-33 
MinnesoU 19-16-g-44.

Goalies — Calgary. Lemelin. Riggin. 
MinnesoU. Beaupre. A—15.7M.

Jai Alai Results
TUESDAY (EVENING)
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Don’t Buy
a n y p 0 € i o o ,

. ^ 1

American League
Lynn, Cal B; Sm. “  
Cnk. and Oglivie,
Lynn.Cal B; Sm al^.M intS; Murphy,

HOME ENGINEERS ~  
Pat Cuimingham 179, Lynn 
Da via 178, Diane Cote 451. 
Patty Westine 454.

A.AR.P. -  Arvid Peter­
son 209-528, Lou Sulota 520, 
Bruno Giordano 504, Dot 
Roberts 485.

P IN N E T T E S  -  
Rosemary Thibodeau 181, 
Lois Brown 109-183-520, 
C!arol Bushnell 504, Anita 
Shorts 183-175-4SS, Cindy 
MlRItt 492. Janet Lusby 
17M80, Ellen Bauer 178- 
484, Linda Burton 191-480, 
Ginger Yourkas 477, Pam 
Bretton 482, Lois Begin 184- 
480, Tina Ahrens 179-480, 
Karen Bottone 461.

DELIVERY
Can

• 4 7 -9 W 4 T .

without first cficcfciiig 
M/dU thleknossi

•  Other pools are only 14 gauge.
Or 12 mxige steel penes are 
alTTxiGt eOjstNcfcar! Praiect your 
long-term nvestment with vslus!

•  (^  today whie Bank rates are low|
•  Vtte feature cpalty pool 

and rataianonB.
•  Aluminum and Fiberglass

- . also available.

RM4 4 A a »lw on — »taia)
.00IIBJTR7 >12-7301

MANCHESTER SOUTHNQTON ENFELO AVON 
64MS33 742-7308 7410300 742-7308-

Area Towns
Bolton / Coventry

School budget cuts 
worry PTO members

By RICHARD CODY 
Herald Reporter 

BOL'TON -  School offlciaU last 
night toM member of the PTO that 
the 125,000 cut to their |1.8 miUion. 
budget would damage programs in 
the school system. PTO members 
expressed concern over the poten­
tial damage, and some will be 
raising support for restoration of the 
cut at the annual town budget 
meeting Monday night.

The Board of Ekiucation’s budget, 
as proposed by the school board, 
showed a 9 percent increase over 1st 
year’s expenses, and the cut by the 
finance btiard lowered the total in­
crease one percent.

School board member James 
Marshall, board Chairman Joseph 
Haloburdo and Superintendent Ray­
mond Allen outlined last night the 
severity of the Impact that the 
proposed cut. If approved by voters 

,  Monday night, would have on 
specific programs and facilities.

Items that would bear the closest 
scrutiny if the cut is approved were 
presented in a list to PTO members, 
and include new spelling texts for 
Grades 5 through 8, supplementary

reading materials for Grades 9 
through 12, new additions to 
programs and facilities for extra­
curricular activities.

The list was drawn up by the 
budget committee, which Is a sub­
committee of the Board of EXluca- 
tion.

The officials' differed in 
assessing the severity of the cut In 
programming, with Haloburdo con-

Allen concedes 
economy need

cerned with the loss of texts as being 
detrimental to programs. He said 
the cut, if approved, would "affect 
new things this year, and some of 
the things that we’re currently doing 
now will have also to be con­
sidered.”

He said that on a scale of one to 10, 
with a to beln^ the most severe, he 
would rate the severity at one.

Allen expressed concern over the

cut also, but was more reserved in 
his Criticism as he displayed sym­
pathy for the Board of Finance.

He said finance board members 
do not regard the school budget as 
padded, but rather found themselves 
faced with a large increase for the 
next fiscal year which followed a 
large increase in taxes last year. 
Ninety percent of the people who 
attended the public hearing on the 
school board's budget, he said, were 
for a cut, and he added that the input 
is what the finance board members 
take into account when cutting the 
budget.

Allen also viewed the situtation in 
perspective of the entire town 
budget. The town proper budget had 
90 percent of the i^uested Increase 
cut back, and Allen felt that in view 
of this, the rational of the finance 
board is more understandable.

Allen said the cut will "hurt a bit, 
and if the rest of the town can hurt a 
bit, so can we.”

'the items that will have to be cut 
from the budget if the cut is ap­
proved are needed for the schools, 
but the town has had to also cut 
things that it needs, he said.

The Baltimore Zoo’s newly hatched wattled 
crane — the real bird is on the right — admires 
his reflection In a mirror. (UPl photo)

Citizens group 
probes school

H ARTFORD (U P I) — The Connecticut Association . 
for Retarded Citizens says it will investigate the! 
Durham Hill School where state officials claimed 102 
retarded youngsters were living in squalid conditions.

Thomas Nemey, executive director of the 10,000 
member advocacy group, said Tuesday a committee 
would meet with officials at the Durham school within a 
week to discuss procedures for examining care, educa­
tion and living conditions.

He said one of the owners of the school, Frank 
Pagliaro, asked the association to assess the school

The state Department of Mental ReUrdation has 
given the school until June 1 to clean up its “ dirty, 
filthy, brokendown environment’ ’ or lose its license.

Inspectors paid a surprise visit to the school April 14 
and said they found children milling around "hair not 
combed, teeth not brushed this a.m .”

The inspectors also found old mattresses, broken light 
bulbs and other trash on the grounds around the school's 
residential cottages and a general mess inside

Nerney said parents of children at the school would be 
involved in the probe and nationally recognized experts 
in special education would be invited to tour the facility.

He said the group would issue a written report and 
“ share it with every interested party, and 1 mean 
every ."

Mayor says Providence 
will go broke this month

Selectmen agree to probe 
organization of schools

BOLTON — The Board of Selectmen, the at the 
urging of member of Carl Preuss at a meeting last 
night, will be reviewing the organization of the school 
system and analyzing past studies one on the school 
system.

Preuss presented the five-member board with a letter 
in which he urges the establishment of a committee 
study group to look into possible options for the future of 
the school system, since the question of whether or not 
the present organizaiton of the school system is prac­
tical for Bolton has once again arisen.”

The school board had two studies done on the K-12 
school system two years ago, one by a sub-committee of 
the board and another by a study group from the Univer­
sity of Connecticut.

One study recommended a re-organization of the 
school system, and Preuss says "this reorganization has 
not occurred for various reasons."

The issue of whether to reorganize the school system 
was raised by Board of Finance member Morris Sllvers- 
tein who, in a letter to the education board, urged that 
the high school operation be discontinued in order to 
restrain present, and future, rising tax levies. The less 
costly option and still educationally sufficient option, he 
said, is to send the high school students to schools in sur­
rounding towns.

Preuss is in favor of organizing a seven-member com­
mittee, “to investigate all the options open to the com­
munity and to chart a course of action for at least the 
next five years.”

The selectmen have decided to review the studies, and 
to discuss the possibility of establishing the committee 
and other options at their next regylar meeting.

Other town officials have expressed favor in in­
vestigating the issue and laying out different options for 
the townspeople to view and perhaps act upon.

Silverstein had asked for a referendum to decide the 
issue, and though a referendum has no power over how

State energy head 
will be nominated

the school system is run directly, it can pressure the 
finance Ixaard into cutting the bottom line on the school 
board’s budget, forcing them to discontinue the opera­
tion.

PROVIDENCE, R.I. (UPI) -  
Mayor Vincent A. :Cianci says 
Providence could be broke by the 
end of the month unless banks agree 
to loan the city more money.

But Cianci told a caucus of state 
legislative leaders Tuesday Uiat the 
banks won’t agree to the loans un­
less the Legislature ratifies an 
111.43 per |1,000 property tax in­
crease to insure repayment of the 
money.

An angry crowd of more than 100 
city taxpayers attended the session.

Without the loans, Cianci warned 
the lawmakers the city will not even 
be able to meet its May 21 payroll or 
pay other pressing bills and said the 
city could be Insolvent by the end of 
May.

Several legislators were not im­
pressed with Cianci’s appeal, par­
ticularly Rep. Keven A. McKenna, 
D-Providence.

McKenna suggested the city look 
to other alternatives of bailing itself 
out of its money mess, Including 
taxing exempt property, long-term 
bonding and loans from banks out­
side of Rhode Island.

“If the banks of the city of 
Providence don’t want to lend the 
money, they should go outside the 
state. There are plenty of banks out­
side the state who are willing to 
borrow,” McKenna said.

He also indicated Providence 
might not need the tax hike with 
legislative approval of bill that 

~ would tax New England Telephone

Co. assets. The city would reap an 
estimated $2.5 million in revenues 
from the bill, McKenna said.

Other lawmakers wanted to know 
what the city was doing to avoid 
more financial problems in the 
future.

“ W e’re trying our best and we're 
r e d u c i n g  t he  s i z e  o f  c i t y  
government," Cianci said.

Rep. Frank J. Fiorenzano, D- 
Providence, was skeptical of the 
mayor’s Intentions.

" I  t h i nk  thi s  is r e a l l y  a 
smokescreen to take the pressure 
o ff the city and put it on the General 
Assembly," he charged.

“ W e’re not here to place the 
burden on you," Cianci countered

HARTFORD (UPI) -  
Gov. William O’Neill says 
he will nominate Thomas 
Fitzpatrick, the state’s top 
energy official, to be the 
next chairman of the state 
Public Utilities Control 
Authority.

Fitzpatrick, 47, of West 
Hartford, has served as 
energy undersecretary in 
the state Office of Policy 
and Management since 
January 1V79. He joined 
state government in 1977 as 
a con su ltan t on fuel  
auistance.

F i t z p a t r i c k  would  
succeed John Downey of 
New Hav«i, who will step 
down as chairman of the 
utility regulatory body on

May 8 to explore a possible 
run for  th e  1982 
Democratic U.S. Senate 
nomination.

“Tom will bring to the 
Public Utilities Control 
Authority a long and dis­
tinguished career in public 
serv ice  and extensive  
expertise in the energy 
f i e ld ,  ” O’N e i l l  said  
Tuesday.

“Not only is be skilled in 
the affairs of government 
but he is also sensitive to 
the needs and concerns of 
the people of Connecticut,” 
the govenior sad.

Downey’s term would 
have expired on June 20, 
1985.

Best Selection-Best Prices
Big HugBouquet—*15.95  
Azaleas — *4.98
Mum Plants »5.95

wsaeiaaMMNnTCHua

(MEBIPUINMWOIIKSMK
for displaced homemakers 

and women In transition

FREE
TUES, MAY 12 from 1-2:80 pm 
WED, MAY 18 from 7:80-9 pm 

THUR8. MAY 14 from 10-11:80 pm
for registration Information:

QInnIe Qoodwin, Admissions Office

Lh c c 646-4900 
extension 282

Hanging Plants — *5.95
Above prices all C A S H  & C A R R Y

85 E. Center St. inurs., Fri. & sat. tii 9 pm

wiion
Sun. til Noon

649-5268
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Exhumations ordered 
in death investigation

RIV ERSID E, Calif. (U PI) -  
Authorities puzzled by the sudden 
deaths of 28 elderly patients at two 
rural hospitals will exhume 11 more 
corpses and seek to unearth two 
others, reportedly to check for 
traces of a local anesthetic.

Coroner William J .  Dykes said 
Tuesday he would move immediate­
ly to perform autopsies on the 11 
bodies, exhuming 10 buried in 
California and reclaiming another 
donated to the nearby Loma Linda 
University Medical School.

In addition, the county will seek a 
, court order to exhume a body buried 
in New Mexico and another in 
Minnesota.

The names of the 26 patients have 
not been divulged

Several conflicting reports con­
tinued to surface in the widening in­
vestigation, particularly over an un­
named drug already linked to the 
deaths and reports of a single 
suspect in the deaths.

Authorities absolutely refuse to 
discuss the drug involved or a possi­
ble suspect reportedly linked to 24 
deaths at Community Hospital of 
the Valleys in Perris and two sub­
sequent deaths about 20 miles away 
at San Gorgonio Pass Memorial 
Hospital in Banning.

"We have no one under sur­
veillance." Deputy District At­
torney Thomas HoIIenhorst said 
Tuesday. "We have not been able to 
firmly shore up what the cause of 
death is, and already people are

starting to talk about suspects.
" It  is premature.”
The Los Angeles Times reported 

today a nurse who worked at the 
Perris hospital in March and April, 
when the deaths occurred, moved 
briefly to.the Banning facility. Sup­
posedly the victims died in in n in g  
after April 20. when the Perris 
deaths had stopped.

The same nurse, the Times said, 
recently called the licensing division 
of the state Department of Health 
Services to offer help in the agen­
cy 's  investigation of the two 
hospitals.

HoIIenhorst also refused to com­
ment on news reports autopsies of 
six bodies turned up traces of 
Lidocaine — a local anesthetic dif­
ficult to trace because it is rapidly 
and erratically metabolized.

Identifying the drug, he said, 
"would hinder the ii^ s tig a tio n  
because it could be stockpiled 
somewhere,” indicating authorities 
do not want potential suspects to 
know investigators are looking for 
supplies of a particular substance.

Assistant Coroner Carl Smith said 
autopsies cannot be performed on 
five of the 28 bodies because they 
were crem ated. Autopsies had 
already been completed on eight 
others when the investigation began.

The eight did not die of "natural 
causes” as listed on their death cer­
tificates. Although the actual cause 
of death has not been determined. 
Smith said traces of the unidentified 
drug have turned up in six bodies, 
with "abnorm ally high doses" 
showing up in three.

All of the victims were elderly 
patients confined to intensive-care 
units at the two hospitals.

Reagan
threat

/

Patricia Hearst Shaw lovingly looks at her new-born baby girl, 
Gillian, Monday The birth took place at the Stanford University 
Medical Center In Stanford. Calif. (UPI photo)

SPRINGFIELD, Mass. (UPI) -  
An assistant U.S. attorney says 
F’eter G Dalis, 27, of Springfield 
threatened to shoot President 
Reagan after getting into a brief 
argument with an FBI agent.

Dalis was ordered Tuesday to un­
dergo a round of psychiatric tests. 
He was held on $10,000 bail following 
his U.S District Court appearance 
before Magistrate Charles Bergin 
on a charge of threatening tq kill the 
president.

Assistant U.S. Attorney George 
Kelly said Dalis walked into the 
Springfield office of the FBI Mon­
day and began complaining to an 
agent After a brief argument with 
the agent. Kelly said Dalis threw 
some papers on the floor and 
threatened the FBI agent — then 
threatened to shoot Reagan.

Quirks in the news
God bless

TROY, Mich (UPII -  
Gucci tradition calls for 
God to bless all soles — all 
soles made by the famed 
shoemaker, that is

C a r d in a l  Jo h n  F 
Dearden of the Catholic 
Archdiocese of Detroit 
accepted an invitation to 
bless a Gucci shop at its 
grand opening at the 
fashionable Somerset .Mall 
in Troy

"We wanted the pope 
himself but unfortunately 
he was not able to make 
it,” quipped Maurizio Guc­
ci, vice-president of the 
company and grandson of 
the founder. Guccio Gucci.

Cardinal Deardon said he 
accepted the Gucci invita­
tion because in Italy the 
b lessin gs are part of 
church tradition

Desk crash
OAKLAND, Calif. lUPI) 

— A lady in an automobile 
almost collided with an 
auto salesman — while he 
was sitting at his desk.

Salesman Charlie Parker 
said " I  heard the tires 
squealing and I took one 
look and leaped"

T h e o n ru sh in g  c a r

LE8AL NOTICE

shattered some 40 feet of 
show windows at the 
Connell Oldsmobile agency 
Monday Georgia Julian s 
car slammed into Parker's 
desk

The 72-year-old woman 
told police she was backing 
into a parking space, hit a 
p ark in g  m e te r ,  then 
stepped on the accelerator 
when she was aiming at the 
brake She was not cited

Kiss cashier

busy while his partner 
stole a 17-pound frozen 
turkey from Hammer's 
Market.

Two men entered the 
market Sunday and one 
began kissing the cashier 
while the other spirited the 
turkey away.

Witnesses described the 
middle-aged "kisser" as 5- 
feet, 5 inches, with a “big 
belly" and in his mid-40s. 
The turkey th ief was 
described as 6-feet and 
wearing a green plaid coat.

CAVE JUNCTION, Ore .  , • u a ,
I UPI I — Police searched N O  r i Q h t S  
today for a "kissing ban­
dit" who kept a cashier TRENTON, N.J. (UPI)

(Ihf

DELIVERY
Call

6 4 7 - 9 E 4 7

I'lNihuIr >4»lire
NO TiCK r o  < H^.IMTOKS

ESTATK OF 
BEATR K'K S KELLKR 

The Hon David C Rappe Judge of 
Ihe Court of Probate. D is tric t of 
Coventry, at a hearing held on May 
4. IM l ordered that all cla ims must 
be presented to the fiduciary on or 
before August 4, 1961 or be barred 
as by law provided

Bertha K Riappe. Clerk 
The fidu i'ia ry  is 

Walter S Keller. Jr 
135 Ciaridge Drive 
Willow Grove Pa 19090 

Robert M Keller 
1804 Boston Tpke 
Coventry, Ct 06238

W e have special gifts 
to please any Mother

W o lL r ’s 2 b .
SUNDAY, MAY 10

on

HOUM: IHon-W«d 10-S;I 
Thun Fri 10-* 
•al

I f  you want loinething "very tpecial’ 
for Mother— come in now and tee the 
wide selection of gift poatibilitiet we’ve 
hand-picked for gift giving.

D r . . .  Shop

RLMTALCOTTVILLf 
(lorin  » . . !  O.iMii Imt)
M 3 - 9 0 ie  _________ ,

Bermuda strike
Thousands of members of the Bermuda Industrial Union gather 
outside their Hamilton union headquarters Tuesday as they con­
tinue their general strike to force the government to grant whop­
ping pay Increases to civil servants and other workers. They were 
joined in the strike by teachers and electrical workers. (UPI photo)

Bermuda strike escalates; 
tourists evacuating island

HAMILTON, Bermuda (UPI) -  
White-collar civil servants were told 
by their union to join a general 
strike today that has paralyzed Ber­
muda and forced all tourists to leave 
the normally sedate British island 
colony.

The Bermuda Public Service 
Association decided Tuesday after­
noon its approximately 1,400 white- 
collar workers should not report for 
work in sympathy with the strike, 
which already has drawn in most 
other workers.

The Bermuda Industrial Union, 
representing government, blue- 
collar workers, called the strike to 
press demands for a 38 percent pay

raise over two years. Employees of 
hotels and supermarkets, electrical 
workers, teachers, dock workers 
and taxi drivers joined the walkout.

An estimated 7.000 workers were 
on strike today, hitting hardest at 
the tourism industry that accounts 
for two-thirds of all revenue for the 
north Atlantic island.

The last tourists left Tuesday, 
expelled from hotels that had lost 
their staffs. Airlines cut flights from 
10 to five per day and the island was 
reported losing $1 million a day.

The government of Prem ier 
David Gibbons, whose majority in 
Parliament was cut earlier this'year 
to 22 of 40 members, offered a 29

percent raise. Gibbons is supported 
by business but the opposition, 
which is calling for the resignation 
of the government, is supported by 
labor

Strikers held marches around the 
principal city of Hamilton all day 
Tuesday, but there was no violence 
reported in the 20 square-m ile 
island, located about 600 miles east 
of Cape Hatteras, N.C.

"Bermudians seem to be taking it 
all in a typical calm way. and going 
about their business as normal,” 
said a local newspaper editor. The 
British crown colony of 60,000 peo­
ple has estimated food supplies for 
another six to eight weeks.

— A woman has been told 
she has no right to receive 
money for her dental and 
doctor bills from her ex­
lover while a "palimony” 
suit against him is pending.

The Appellate Division of 
S u p erio r Court acted  
Tuesday to throw out a 
lower court judge's order 
that Sergio De Gioia pay 
Rose Crowe $125 a week 
while she seeks permanent 
support payments from 
him.

De Gioia also had been 
ordered to pay Ms. Crowe's 
future medical, dental, 
drug and other bills and to 
give her exclusive use of 
his house.

General Oil presents straight answers to your 
tough questions aix)ut home heating.

§ t  IIin a te r te t

find an oomiKU  ̂
with a heart?”

Mere wc arc. 'You don't have to look any (archer.
We think, with today's high price of fuel, ah oil company realiv owes its customers 

some help on how they can spend less. Here at C.eneral Oil. we think we re different from 
other oil suppliers, because we try to show we care.

We do want to send you a smaller heating hill.
One of the most important ways we can help you save fuel and money is hy helping 

you become better informed on the latest economy measures you can take yourself. This 
year General is giving everyone who asks our frtv "consumer guide" to energy saving It's 
filled with ideas to help you save literally hundreds of dollars.

Another thing General Oil is doing is conducting free hom e heating efficiencu 
checks, to help make sure your heating system isn't burning any more fuel than necessary 
Once we've checked it over, we'll advise you exactly how much it will cost to correct any
problems, and how much you can expect to save in fuel costs. ^

Our training, our experience, makes as energy experts. Which means we can give 
you better service, too. Call and ask about some of our very special programs designed to 
save you money.

General does more than other oil companies, because we care about kc*ening our 
customers satisfied. '

'7 want to be your 
heating oil man,"

Pleas^e help me Mve money on my oil bill. I'd like a FREE efficienev 
check and my FREE "consumer guide" to energy saving. ^

Name.

Address. 

Zip____
. Town.

- Telephone.

General ON
General Oil Company, P.O. Box 209 

East Hartford. CT06108 (203)SU-3500

BUSINESS /  Classified

Paaral A, Prlgnano

Joins practice
MANCHESTER — Attorney Allan D. Thomas 

announces that attorney Pascal A. Prignano has 
become associated with him In the practice of law 
with offices at 257 E . Center St.

P r ig n a n o  m o st 
recently served as 
assistant vice presi­
dent and counsel to 
the real estate divi­
sion of Society for 
Savings in Hartford. 
Prior to that time he 
was vice president 
and general counsel 
to CBT Realty Corp. 
and for three years 
was legal counsel to 
First Hartford Real­
ty Corp. He spent one 
year as associate 
trial counsel of the 
New York City Legal 
Aid Society.

Prignano holds a 
B.A. degree from St. 
Johns University and 
an L .L .B . degree 

from St. John’s University Law School. He attended 
Manchester schools and Marianapolis Preparatory 
^hool.

For six years Prignano was a member of the 
Manchester Board of Directors and served as depu­
ty mayor for five of those years.

Prignano is married to the former Louise 
Pouliot. They and their five children reside at 60 
Nutmeg Drive.

Conference set
W ETHERSFIELD -  More than 600 delegates 

from New England. New York and New Jersey are 
expected to attend the 37th annual Eastern 
Seaboard Apprenticeship Conference June 22 to 26 
at the Park Plaza in New Haven, according to State 
Labor Commissioner P. Joseph Peraro, honorary 
chairman.

The theme for this year’s conference is "Appren­
ticeship Skills: Foundation for Economic Growth.” 
Panels representing labor and management ad­
ministrators of apprenticeship programs will have 
speakers from national and state organizations, 
l iie  conference will focus on the administration of 
apprenticeship programs and explore new 
techniques for on-the-job training and in-school 
struction.

Panels will be devoted to varied apprentice skills, 
including automotive, manufacturing and metal 
trades, graphic arts, plumbers/pipefitters, building 
and construction as well as a cooperative education 
session. Apprentices from the different trades also 
will be included in the panel discussions.

A special forum on June 23 will address the 
"Utilization of Human Resources" and will include 
a sub-panel of male, female and minority appren­
tices from the construction, manufacturing and ser­
vice trades.

Among those invited to the conference are U.S. 
Labor Secretary Raymond J .  Donovan, Connecticut 
Governor William A. O'Neill, New Haven Mayor 
Biagio DiLieto and Connecticut AFL-CIO President 
John Driscoll.

Export awards
HARTFORD — Gunther Hubman, international 

group manager of Seal Inc., Naugatuck, has been 
selected Connecticut’s Exporter of the Year. The 
1981 winner of the Service to Exporters Award is 
Thomas J .  Rosenwald, Connecticut area manager 
for International Customs Service Inc., Windsor 
Locks.

The names of the award winners were revealed 
by Harvey J .  Wason of Thomas A, Farrelly Co., 
Inc., Fairfield, chairman of the World Trade Week 
awards committee.

Hubman and Rosenwald will be honored at the 
eighth annual Connecticut World Trade Week 
dinner May 21 at the Bridgeport Holiday Inn. 
Featured speaker for the evening will be James 
"Scotty" Reston, Washington columnist for the 
New York Times.

On bank board
MANCHESTER — Sebert R. Armstrong, presi 

dent, chief executive officer and director of Carlyle 
Johnson Machine Co. in Manchester, has been ap­
pointed to the Manchester Associate Board of the 
Connecticut Bank 
and Trust Co.

T h e a s s o c ia t e  
board counsels in the 
su p e rv is io n  and 
management of the 
bank’s activities In 
M a n ch e ste r . The 
board also aids the 
bank in developing 
new b u sin ess  by 
k e e p in g  C B T  
m a n a g e m e n t in ­
fo rm ed  of lo c a l  
problems and possi­
ble solutions.

A rm strong has 
been president of 
C a r ly le  Jo h n so n  
Machine since 1978.
Prior to that time, he 
was president for 
s e v e n  y e a r s  of 
Amutrong Engineering Co. of Old Lyme. He 
received his master's degree in engineering from 
the University of Cincinnati and M.B.A. degree 
from George Washington University.

ArmstroM, an Avon resident, also serves as 
preaident, m e f  executive officer and director of 
two tubiidiary companies of Carlyle Johnson 
Machine — Metronlcs Inc. of Bolton and Rollins 
Transmission Inc. of Manchester.

Sebert R. Armelrong

After Sunday, May 10, 
you can keep your pay

As of this coming Sunday, May tO, you will have paid 
every penny of every dollar you have earned since Jan. 1 
In taxes to government — M era l, state and local. Only 
on that day, also Mother's Day, will you finally BEGIN 
to keep one single cent of your paycheck to finance your 
own needs and desires.

This is six days later than what the Washington-based 
Tax Foundation calls “Tax Freedom Day” in 1980. In 
comparison, the average worker finished paying all 
taxes on earnings on Apr. 28 in 1970; on Apr. 18 in 1960 
and way back on Valentine's Day, Feb. 14, in 1930.

Where do all your tax dollars go?
Let’s say you are a worker earning $22,000 a year, 

supporting a wife and two dependent children (the 
familiar, even if no longer typical, stereotype). The 
federal budget is utterly incomprehensible when you 
read the totals in dollars on the way to a trillion a year. 
But Elsie M. Watters, director of research of the Tax 
Foundation, makes it entirely understandable (if no less 
infuriating) by breaking down the totals into percen­
tages of each of your tax dollars going to each of the 
major categories of federal spending alone.

Following is a breakdown of the major functions and 
the percentage of your tax dollars that goes to each 
item:

Income security, 33.55 percent; national defense, 
23.68; interest on the public debt, 11,29; health, 9.75; 
education, training and job services, 4.47; transporta-

Your 
Money's 
Worth
Sylvia Porter

tion, 3.51; veterans’ benefits, 3.27; natural resources, 
2.00; international affairs. 1.65; community develop­
ment, 1.50; energy, 1.35; general fiscal assistance, 1.00; 
general science, space, .91; general government, ,74; 
enforcement of justice, .69; commerce, housing credit, 
.47, and agriculture, .17.

In dollar totals: The $22,000-a-year worker with three 
dependents pays $6,339 of his/her total earnings to the 
federal government to finance the above activities or 
expenses. In these terms, a budget that is incomprehen­
sible in multibillion figures can make sense — even 
though you detest the sense it makes.

‘ It still startles me (and I assume that it startles you as 
well) that a full one-third total of the earnings of a 
$22,000-a-year worker will go to so-called "income 
security." This is the category that primarily includes 
the tens of billions of dollars that go to Social Security 
benefits (such as retirement, disability and other Social 
Security payments) and to welfare. In that relatively 
low earnings worker’s terms, that amounted to a 
towering $2,127. ' '

National defense spending in this budget (1981's) is 
well down in second place at only slightly above 23 per­
cent. If President Reagan's budget is accepted in 
anything similar to its present form, that proportion 
will be in for a sharp rise soon.

Since 1 follow the trend of interest rates unusually 
closely, I am not surprised to note that interest on the 
national debt is in third place as a tax grabber.

And unless the rates the U.S, Treasury must pay to 
borrow money and/or the amounts it must borrow fall 
drastically soon, that 11 percent bite of $716 of the 
worker's pay will climb even higher — a dreary com­
ment on an even drearier aspect of U.S. government in 
this era.

As for all the fuss and fury about waste iri govern­
ment, unbearable padding of payrolls, etc., the whole 
category takes far less than one penny of a worker's pay 
dollar. And look at agriculture!

Copyrighi 1981 Field EnlerprineH Inr.

Court to degide 
worth of jobs

m b .

Air pressure Is applied to a valve actuator by Rose Guargul In an 
operational test at Honeywell's Commercial Division plant In Arlington 
Heights, III., where the units are manufactured. These actuators are used 
with valves to regulate heating and cooling systems In large commercial 
buildings. (UPI photo)

NEW YORK (UPI) -  Sometime in 
June or July the Supreme Court is 
expected to hand down its decision on the 
issue of comparable worth in job com­
pensation. At stake is a potential in­
crease of $150 billion to the annual 
payroll burden of American business.

Also hanging on the decision is the 
hope of millions of women to win what 
they consider fairer wages.

Complicating the m atter is the 
possibility a decision favoring job 
evaluation for comparable worth might 
create more problems than it solved.

The doctrine, of comparable worth 
attempts to go beyond the 1963 equal pay 
for equal work law. It seeks to create a 
legal requirement that dissimilar jobs be 
evaluated for comparable worth in fixing 
wage scales and eliminating discrimina­
tion on the basis of sex, race or other fac­
tors.

In this way, a type of job that is filled 
almost entirely by women — office 
clerical for instance, might be evaluated 
as comparable in worth to the employer 
to a higher paid job of, say, machinist, 
held almost exclusively by men. and the 
employer ordered to increase the rate on 
the lower rated job.

The case recently argued before the 
Supreme Court came from the state of 
Oregon. Four ja i l  m atrons sued 
Washington County for compensation 
equal to that of male jail guards. The 
jobs are not the same. The male guards 
wear guns and are responsible for more 
prisoners than the female matrons. 
There have been other law suits on the 
comparable worth issue, but the Oregon 
case is regarded as the crucial one.

The comparable worth issue is being

pushed by the U.S. Equal Employment 
Opportunity Commission. E leanor 
Holmes North, chairwoman, recently 
referred to it as “the w om en's.-i^e of 
the 1980s."

Ruth E. Blumrosen, a consultant to the 
EEOC, contends job segregation in 
American society has ruled in job and 
wage discrimination and maintains the 
comparable worth doctrine can correct 
this by shifting to the employer the 
burden of demonstrating that the rate of 
pay is not influenced by discriminatory 
factors.

Proponents of comparable worth con­
tend Title VII of the 1964 Civil Rights Act 
gives the government the right to require 
job evaluation for comparable worth on 
the basis of something like Hay Points, a 
widely advocated system developed by 
Hay Associates, a Philadelphia manage­
ment consulting firm.

But last October, Federal Judge 
Patrick Higgenbottom of the district of 
northern Texas ruled "the use of Hay 
points to control objectively for the 
relative worth of was not intended 
to foreclose an empioyw.from justifying 
salary differences even among jobs with 
the same number of points. " He said 
education, experience and values in the 
open market for em ployes also could be 
considered.

The American Society for Personnel 
Development, based in Berea, Ohio, 
which is taking a leading role in opposing 
the comparable worth doctrine, says it 
flies in the face of the law of supply and 
demand and attempts to remove from 
the marketplace the pricing of jobs in a 
free economy.

Sears catalog goes electronic
WASHINGTON (UPI) -  Press a but­

ton and the blond model on page 18 of 
Sears’ summer catalog comes to life on 
your television screen, strolling along a 
surf-splashed beach in her blue blazer 
and white pleated skirt.

Punch another button and the > gas 
barbecue grill on page 200 puffs smoke 
and sizzles steaks.

Sears catalog — the wish book for 
generations of Americans — has gone 
electronic.

Last Friday, the country’s largest 
retailer began a limited experiment at 
nine of Its stores in the Washington, 
D.C., and Cincinnati areas. The summer

catalog is being replaced by a video disc 
and a TV screen.

The same disc, which reduces the 236- 
page catalog to the size of a long-playing 
record, also is being sent to between 1,- 
000 and 1,500 consumers across the coun­
try who have video equipment in their 
homes.

Those consumers, whose names will be 
drawn from sales records for the equip­
ment, will be contacted by Sears and 
asked if they would like a space age 
catalog.

The experiment will end July 25. After 
that, the company said It will review 
their results and decide the future of the

paperless catalog. Sears said the test is 
the first of its kind.

"We think some kind of electronic at- 
home shopping is going to be part of the 
retailing mix down the road,” Robert 
Wood If, a Sears vice president and 
grandson of the firm's founder, told 
United Press International.

He also said the discs, if produced in 
sufficient quantity, probably could be 
turned out for less money than the 
printed catalog, considering the current 
cost of paper.

The disc contains all 17,872 items in the 
catalog, in full color, plus several three- 
to four-minute "com m ercials" with

sound and music, such as those for 
fashions, swimsuits and the barbecue 
grill. The same models and merchandise 
used in the still photos are used in the 
movie versions.

If the customer decides to place an 
order, it is telephoned in. or taken to the 
order desk at the store, along with the 
catalog number displayed on the screen.

The viijeo equipment used for the in- 
home tests will h« the Pioneer VP-KXIO. 
The disc was made for Sears by Discovi- 
sion Associates, a company owned by 
International Business Machines Corp. 
and MCA Inc.

UConn to host symposium on computers
STORRS — Current developments and 

future trends In computer technology 
will be explored during a two-day 
University of Connecticut Centennial 
Symposium this month.

The symposium, part of UConn's year- 
, will belong fOOth birthday observance 

held May 18 and 19 in the UConn Bishop 
Center. It will be sponsored by the 
University’s School of Engineering and 
Research Foundation, the General Elec­
tric Foundation and Hamilton Standards, 
Division of United Technologies.

The symposium will open on May 18, at 
2 p.m. with a theme-setting panel discus­
sion focusing on “Computer Technology 
and Connecticut Industi^,” moderated 
by Dr. Taylor L. Booth, UConn professor

of electrical engineering and computed 
science, and Rotert J .  Herlihy, research 
and development coordinator of the 
Rogers Corp. and Connecticut Business 
Industry Association.

At 7 p.m. there will be a symposium 
banquet, featuring a talk by Dr. Anthony 
DlBenedetto, UConn's vice president for 
Graduate Education and Research.

On May 19, seven panel discussions are 
slated for the day featuring inter­
n a tio n a lly  reco g n ized  com p u ter 
specialists. They Include:

• A discussion on "Technology Trends 
in Computing the Future," by Robert 
G lorloso , m anager of corp o rate  
research. Digital ^u lp m ent Coro.

• "Impact of Computers on Telecom­

munications,” discussed by Robert W. 
Lucky, director of electronics and com­
puter systems research laboratory, Bell 
Laboratories.

• “ Applications of Pattern Recogni­
tion and Image Processing, " discussed 
by King-sun Fu, Goss professor of 
engineering, Purdue University.

• A discussion of "Com puter in 
Medicine and Health Services” by Judith 

' M.S. Prewitt of the division of computer 
research  and technology. National 
Institutes of Health.

• A d ls c i / s s io n  f o c u s i n g  on 
“Developments in Office Automation 
Technology and Applications," by Paul 
A. Strassmann, vice president for infor­
mation systems. Xerox Corp.

• "Com puter-A ided Design and 
Manufacturing in the '80s,” discussed by 
Stuart G. Miller, manager, automation 
laboratory. General Electric Research 
and Development.

• "The Long-Term Future of Com­
puter Systems," by Maurice V. Wilkes, 
Cambridge U niversity and Digital 
Equipment Corp.

Registration and fee information may 
be obtained by con tactin g  Cindy 
Waskiewlcz at the University of Connec­
ticut, Conferences and Institutes, Box U- 
56E, Bishop Center, Storrs, CT 06268, 
telephone 486-3231, or Jeannine Spink, 
School of Engineering, Box U-37, Univer­
sity of Connecticut, Storrs, CT 06268, 
telephone 486-3954.

f
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12:00 noon the day 
before publication.

Deadline for Saturday Is 
12 noon Friday; Mon­
day's deadline Is 2:30 
Friday.

Phone 643-2711

Classified 643-2711
N O T IC E S

1—  Lost snd Pound
2— Pofsonais
3—  A n nou ncomen t *
4—  Enl»rtsinm*n| 
Ŝ Auclion*

F IN A N C IA L

8—  Bondt-StocMs-MortosgM
9—  Pof»on«i Loan*

IQ— Iniuranca

EMPLOYMENT
13~H«tp Wsntod
14- >Buam«M OpportunHiM
15—  Situation Wantad

E D U C A T IO N  >
IS— Prhrata Inatructlona
19—  Schooia-Claaaaa
20—  Inatructlona Wantad

R E A L  E S T A T E

23—  Homaa tor Sata
24—  Lota<Land for 8ala
25—  invaatmant Proparty 

. 26— Buairtaaa Proparty
27— Waaort Proparty 
2B-Raal Eatata Wantad

MI8C. SERVICES
31—  Sarvioaa Offarad
32—  Palnllrtg.Paparlfto
33—  BuHding-Contractlrtg
34—  Rooflng^Sldlno

35— HaeOng-Ptvmblno 
3S— Ftoorino
37— Movlnp*Truoliln9-6toraoa 
3S— Sarvtopa Wantad

46—  Sporting Ooods
47—  oivdan Produols 
46— AntiQuaa
49— Wantad to Buy

59— Miac. tor Bant

AUTOMOTIVE.

MISC. FOR SALE RENTALS
40—  Houaafioid Goods
41—  Artiolaa for Bala
42—  Building Suppllaa
43—  PatS'Blrda-O^
44—  Musical Inatrumama
45—  Boats A Aooaaaortaa

52—  Booms for Bant
53—  Apartmants for Bant
54—  Homaa for Bant
5 6 -  Omoaa^toraa for Bant 
56 Baaort Proparty for Bant
57—  Wantad to Bant

61—  Autos for Sals
62—  Trueha for 8Ma
63—  Haavy Eqmpmant for Sala
64—  Motorcyclaa Bieydas
65—  Campara-Trallara-Moblla 

Homaa
66—  Automotiva Sarvtoa
67—  Autos for Bant-Laaaa

mantSKit
MIES

Minimum Charge
$ 2.10

P E R  W O R D
1 D A Y .................14ip
3 D A Y S  ..............13 «
6 D A Y S  .............. 12e
26 D A Y S ...... . l i e

HAPPY ADS U.60 PtP INCH

iManrhfBtfr Iferalb
)

'Your Community Newspaper'

P LEA S E READ 
YOUR AD

CIsssHM sds srs Mkwi

Help Wented 13 Help Wanted 13

ovsr Ow ptane ss s con- 
vsntencs. The Hsrsld Is PERMANENT FULL TIME
rusimisIHs tor only ono ki- 
cofToct kisomon ond Oion 
only to Iho olio ol tl|p Exporlnncnd Qroevry, Frozon Food or Dairy
orlglntl IntoiMon. Erroro 
wfdcti do not loooon Iho

Peraon wanted. Apply  In paraon to:

valuo ol Iho odvortlsoniont 
win not bo corroctod by an H IG H LA N D  PARK M A R K E T
■dditlonai bwartion. 317 H ighland Straat, Manchaatar

iHaurliralrr
(No phono calls plaaaa)

Hrrali'i
E M P L O Y M E N T  1?.'?..*!;^.'!?................

aaaaaapaaanaaaaaaaaaaaoa
Help Wanted IS

HIRING NOW to work one 
of our outdoor flow er 
locations, Friday, Satur­
day or Sunday, work one, 
two or three days. Car 
needed. SDR Enterprises. 
Andover, CT. 742-9965.

FULL TIME (40 hours) - 
Experienced, mature sales 
clerk. Apply in person: 
Marlow’s Inc., 887 Main 
Street, Manchester.

N O T I C E S .

Lost and Found

LOST - SINCE 4 15 Gray 
m ale cat, short ears 
Extremely affectionate 
H a rva rd  Road a rea , 
M anchester W earing 
white flea nollar & blue 
studded collar Any infor­
m ation  a p p rec ia ted  
REWARD 649-4410 or 34J- 
.1945

FOUND ■ Ferret near 
Woodlawn Circle. Ea.,t 
Hartford on .April 29th Call 
646-6134

LOST - Ladies Hamilton 
Watch. Broad Street vicini­
ty White gold, name 
enscribed Reward 649- 
6039

LOST-ELECTRO.MC 
FISH DETECTOR Lost at 
Crystal Lake, Sunday. May 
3 If found, kindlv call 646- 
2319

Help Wanted 13

PART TIME - Earn extra 
money while the kids are in 
school. Telephone Solicita­
tion. E Hartford company. 
A good telephone voice and 
diction a must. Hours 9 
a m. to I p.m. and 5 to 9 
p.m. Call Mon through 
Fri.. 9 a m to 1 p m , Mrs 
Williams. 569-4993

.NAVY VETS Career Op­
portunities available Call 
collect. i518i 462-4321 9 00 
a m to 1 00 p m

Part time parson to worh 
in Nursery SciMiol in East 
Hartford 11:00 am to 
2:30 pm. Call: S69-1610.

Personals

S IN G L E '’ A L O N E '’ 
UNATTACHED’’ Call or 
write Acquaintance. 435 
Buckland Road, South 
Windsor, 06074 644-0877

Announcem ents 3

C H I N A . C R Y S T A L .  
TABLEW ARE. Cutlery 
Hal f  p rice, c l oseout  
Patterns will be available 
for vears 649-4300

SERVICE STATHW 
ATTENDENT

Apply In parson. 
2S2 Sponcor Stroat 

Manciwstsr

HOUSEKEEPER 
^'A.N'TED (or apartment in 

East Hartford Call after 
5 00 p m , 528-1332

CLERK - Checking in­
voices and receiving slips 
Use of calculator helpful 

.Apply; Gaer Brothers, 140 
Rye Street. South Windsor

2t1 RN'S PART TIME. All 
shifts at Student Health 
Service Physical assess­
ment skills necessary. Call 
or write to Peg Maloney. 
Director of Nursing, Box 

.U-11, University of Conn 
Storrs, Ct 06268 at 468- 
4700 E O E

FULL TIME LICE.NSED 
P E N T A L  A G E N T  for 
.Manchester Real Estate 
O f f i c e .  Monday thru 
Friday. 9 to 5, Saturday 9 
to 3 Contact: Mr Carlson 
at 646-1980

TYPIST ■ PART TIME 
afternoons. Transcription 
experience preferred Send 
resume to JOBS. P O Box 
H, Vernon, Conn 06066

IMMEDIATE OPENINGS 
FO R  E x p e r i e n c e d  
I’ainters Call 643-9097

TMPLE AAA
AUTO CLUB

Manchester
Branch

.1*>/ ffroarf Si .. MnnrhrAtpr

Is  s e e k i n g  an 

experienced PA R T - 

T IM E SUPERVISOR 
to direct a telephone 

.sales staff 9 a m. - 1 

p m or 5 p.m. - 9 p m. 

Must be mature, well 

o r g a n i z e d ,  and a 

motivator.

Please call Ms. Robin 

for an interview at 236- 

3261 ext. 282

Help Wanted 13 Help Wanted 13

Door To Door 
SALESPEOPLE

Needed to work with 
newspaper carriers. 

Eariy evening hours — 
exceiient opportunity 

to earn extra money! ! !

Call Jeanne 
647-9946

Commissions. Must 
ly experienced in 
breeds. 228-9089.

all

CONTROLLER • 
OFFICE MANAGER

C o n n e c t ic u t 's  fs s te s t  
growing soft drink company 
i i  leeklng s ControllerOffice 
Manager. Candidate mult 
have at lea it  5 y e a n ' 
experience In general ac­
counting and financial con­
trols. cost accounting, cash 
flow management, general 
office management, and the 
ability to prepare financial 
s ta te m e n ts  P o s it io n  
requires working very close­
ly with F^resident of com­
pany Please send resume 
and salary requirements to 
Box Y  C/o The Herald

ARBOR ACRES FARM, 
INC. Equal Opportunity 
Employer seeks full time 
and part time general 
poultry farm workers. 
Agricultural background 
desirable but not essential 
We offer a Company Paid 
Health and Retirement 
Plan Apply in person: 
Ma r l bo r o ug h  Road,  
Glastonbury, CT

O F F I C E  D U T I E S  
EXPERIENCED 
Preferred. Fringe benefits. 
E 0  E Call 289-8291 after 4 
pm

EXPERIENCED 
ESTIMATOR neede by 
General Contractor. Must 
be knowledgeable in all 
phases of construction. 
Forward Resume to P.O. 
Box 8, Coventry, CT 06238.

SUPERINTENDANT 
.NEEDED for apartment 
c o m p l e x  l o c a t ed  in 
Manchester. Must have 
knowledge of mechanical, 
electrical, and plumbing. 
Submi t  r e s ume  to 
Manager. 175A Downy 
Drive, Manchester.

BE THE FIRST TO OWN 
YOUR Sarah Coventry Kit 
of Jewelry. Two average 
shows & 1500 kit is yours to 
keep! Excel lent Com­
missions. Call Judy after 5 
p.m. 646-5642.

PA RT T IME - We are 
looking for a promotion 
minded individual who is 
ab l e  to m o t i v a t e  

Approximate 
4:00 p.m. to 8:00 

p .m. ,  Monday  thru 
Thursday, and Saturday' 
mornings. Salary in excess 
of $100. Apply m person - 
The Manchester Herald, 16 
B ra in a rd  P l a c e ,  
Manchester, between 9:00 
a m. and 10:30 a.m., Mon­
day thru Friday, or call 
Mark Abraitis at 643-2711.

DOG GBOOMER - PART 
TIME, Saturday’s plus one 
or possible more days.

"  be ful-

WANTED - PART TIME 
INSPECTOR to do first 
piece and final inspection. 
20-30 hours weekly. Apply 
in p e rs on :  T r iu m p h  
Manufacturing, 55 Elm 
Street. Manchester. Equal 
Opportunity Employer.

LEGAL SECRETARY - 
One man office. Shorthand 
essential. Please call 646- 
2426 for an interview. 
OFFICE MANAGER FOR 
LARGE busy medical 
practice. Duties include 
supervising off ice per­
sonnel .  p a y r o l l ,  
purchasing, liason with ac­
countant, coordinating all 
aspects of office routine. 
Clerical and bookkeeping 
ski l l s  useful .  Sa la ry  
$13.000-115,000. Send 
resume to Ear, Nose and 
Throat: Group. 320 Main 
Street, Manchester.

OPTOMETRIC 
ASSISTANT - Area Doctor 
seeks personable, con- 
sciencious individual. 4’>k 
day week, 8:30-4:30. No 
Saturdays. Send resume 
to: Buckland Station, Box 
20. Manchester.

EXPERDNXD

To provide Nursing  
C a i» In private homes 
and Medical FacllHles. 
Part lima, full time. 
Consideration given to 
prafaranca oh Loca­
tion and Hours.
NO FEE - WEEKLY  

PAY
For Information call 

M 3-N15

AID 5 ASSISTANCE
of North Eaotom C o m .

357 East Canter 8t. 
Manchaatar

NURSE - Opening for 
School Nurse,  Bolton 
Public Schools: 10 months 
full time position. Effec­
tive date: September 2nd, 
1981. Contact Superinten­
dent Raymond A. Allen, 
Jr , 643-1569. EOE.

SC HOO L B U S I N E S  
OFFICE ACCOUNTANT - 
Lead position in two person 
school business office.
dealing with bookkee^ 

purcl
„  — lagem ... ___

related activities. Business

eping,
y ro l l ,  purchas ing ,  

dget management and

school graduate with 
minimum of three years 
office experience or com­
p a r a b le  bus iness  
experience. Twelve month 
work year, 35 hour work 
week, good salary, with 
liberal fringe benefits. For 
additional information and 
application; call Bolton 
Superintendent's Office. 
643-1569.

B I N D E R Y  W O M A N  
WANTED, call 647-9822, 
ask for Mr. Nasuta.

NURSES AIDE - Part 
time. Laurel Manor. 91 
Chestnut Street, 
Manchester._______ ■

A T H L E T I C  T R I P
DRIVERS - Transport 
school children to and from 
sport events. Afternoons 
only, starting about 2 p.m. 
We w i l l  T ra in .  Ca l l  
Manchester 643-2373; Ver­
non 875-2828.

•••••••••••••••••••&•••• •••••••••••••■•••••••*•* .♦•#••••••••••••••••••••• ^ * * * * * V * * ^ * ^ * * * * * * «  •
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•••••••••••••••••••••••• •••••*******************_____ ________
DRIVERS FOR SCHOOL 
BUSES - We will train. 
Apply today: Manchester 
643-2373; Vernon 875-2828.

CR EDIT  M A N A G E R  • 
Experienced preferred. 
Benefits. Includes general 
office work. Call 6^2871.

CLERK TYPIST - 45 words 
per minute required. 4Vk 
day work week. F ree 
p a r k in g ,  Conuiany  
benefits. (^11 Joan Turner 
547-5892 between 10 a.m. 
and 12 noon. Equal Oppor­
tunity Employer.

PA R T  TIM E  DRIVER.  
Must know streets in 
Manchester. Apply in per­
son: Krause IGorlst, 
H a r t f o r d  Road ,
Manchester.

GENERAL
MAINTENANCE person. 
Duties can include dish & 
pot washing,  general  
cleaning of mning rooms 
and/or operation of in- 
house laundry. Persons or 
person hired must be hard 
working, clean, reliable & 
capable of working very 
early or very late. Call in 
Manchester 643-2751. Ask 
for George.

BARTENDER: SERVICE 
B A R T E N D E R  nights 
Tues. - Sat. 5:30 until close 
of dining room. Good posi­
tion for neat college stu­
dent with day schedule or 
as someone's second job. 
Call 643-2751. Ask for Paul 
C.

SMiSPOSmON
now avgltoM* M

comity 21 LMSEY 
lEiH ESTATE

in Manchester at 353 Center 
St Now you can enjoy career 
development, professional 
tra in ing . V IP  national 
referrals, stale, local and 
national advertising vrhile 
pammg top commissions. 

C M  C h w «*  tor dMUto, 
■I MS-4000.

P A R T  T I M E
S E C R E T A R Y  - T w o  
secretar ies needed in 
professional sales office. 
$4.50 per hour, 35 hrs. per 
week. Typing, filing, steno 
work require. West Hart­
ford area. Tel: 269-5263 for 
interview.

S N A C K  B A R
ATTENDENT - Full time, 
Tuesday thru Saturday, 8 
to 4 p .m.  F E M A L E  
LADIES LOCKER ROOM 
A T T E N D E N T  - Tues., 
Thurs., Sat., 8 to 4 p.m., 
Wed, & Fri. 8 to 12. 2 FULL 
T IME EXPER IE NCE D 
WAITRESSES - Flexible 
hours. Salary commen­
surate with experience. 
Must have own transporta­
tion. Call Mr. Wilson, 8TC- 
9133. Ellington Ridge Coun­
try Club.

WE LC OME WAGON - 
America's leading meeting 
service is looking fo r civic 
minded personne l  in 
Manch es t e r ,  Bol ton,  
Coventry, East Hartford. 
Flexible hours. Good ear­
nings. Car necessary. For 
more information call: 247- 
1166 or 828-6634. EOE.

M E D IC A L  DOCTOR - 
Manchester area, with 
busy medical practice, 
looking for  ful l  t ime  
Medical  Receptionist. 
Bookkeeping and light 
typing involved. 4 to 44k 
days per week. Ehccellent 
fringe benefits. Pleasant 
environment. Call 633-8861, 
9 to 5 p.m.

S E R V I C E  S T A T I O N  
ATTENDENT NEEDED - 
Momings-Evenings- 
Weekends. Apply in per­
son, between 9 and 5: 
Manchester Exxon, 24 
W in dso r  S t r e e t ,  
Manchester.

HELP WANTED - Person 
to work in pizza shop. App­
ly in person to Center 
Giant Grinder St Pizza 
Shop, 660 Center Street, 
Manchester.

D E N T A L  O R A L  
SURGERY OFFICE in 
Manchester seeking part- 
time person for recep­
t ionist  and assistant 
responsibilities. Typing 
necessary. Experienced 
preferred. 649-2272.

EXPER IEN C ED  
A U T O  BODY 

PERSON
Paid Holidays. 

Uniforms, benefits 
Please apply In person 
to:

SUPERIOR AUTO 
Rt 6, CohimMa 

228-9431

J

S E W I N G  M A C H I N E  
OPERATOR WANTED. 
Call Economy Canvas, 390 
Prosoect Street, East 
Hartford. 289-5281.

CLERICAL HELP - in­
dividual with good figure 
aptitude needed to write up 
cash receipts & various 
o t he r  o f f i c e  dut ies .  
Excellent fringes. Willing 
to train. Apply at 414 
Tolland Street, East Hart­
ford,

SINGLE WOMEN - Supple­
ment your income for you 
and your family from your 
own home. For appoint­
ment call 875-0816, 4:30- 
7:30 p.m. Monday thru 
Friday.

DIVERSIFY INCOME in 
spare time. Ambitious 
couples, singles needed to 
deve lo p  independent '  
business in rapidly growing 
field. Send qualincations 
to: P.O. Box 585, Vernon, 
Conn. 06066.

ONE OF THE WORLD’S 
S W E E T E S T  B A B IE S  
needs care while parents 
work. Monday thru Friday, 
days. Manchester ,  in 
L y d a l l  S t r e e t  a rea .  
References required. Call 
643-9960.

OFFICE MANAGER to 
report to chief executive. 
Bookkeeping to t r i al  
balance. Knowledge of 
business machines and of­
fice procedure needed. Call 
646-2920 between 10 and 4.

W A N T E D
E X P E R IE N C E D  R E A L  
ESTATE
REPRESENTATIVES in 
the Andover, Colchester, 
Coventry, Manchester & 
Willimantic offices. If you 
are tired of reduced com­
missions, or mismanage­
ment, ca ll F IR E S ID E  
REALTY. No Company 
can offer you more. 64'f- 
9144 or 742-9144 for

COME BACK TO 
THE COUNTRY,—

hut stay cioae to the c ity . . .

Mark Anthony Estates
at South Road and Hop River Roads in Bolton, 
has Four N ew  Homes under construction on 
beautiful wooded lots.
CAPE COD

1228 square feet, 2 fu ll^ th s , carpeting, 
cabinets, heavy Insulation, fcderson windows.

ri,360.

RAISED RANCH
1158 square feet, garage, complete carpeting, 
cabinets, insulation, Anderson windows.

$69,500.

CAPECOD
1479 square feet, full dormer, on 1.2 acres, 
large deck, 3 bedrooms, open living/dining 
area.

$69,900.
RAISED RANCH

1156 square feet, garage on 1.3 acre lot, country 
kitchen, complete carpeting and cabinets.

$67,500.

B M R Y  i  ROBERTA HOWARD 
B U U E R S .IIC .
525 Qurtoyvllto Road

429-7117

Manchaatar
llV k %  Anmtal 
Mortgage Rate

Guaranteed the first 2 years 
^  builder NEW-g room 
dmtemporary, 3 bedrooms, 
2 baUis, fireplaced living 
room • dinlna room • family 
room off Kitchen-beamed 
cathedral celling, private 
loft den > 2 car garage, solar 
hot water • 9124.900

MERRITT, Agency
iMltwi -  646-1180

Sarvfcat Otfarad 31

BOLTON QU A LI T Y  & 
PRICE!  And a beauty 
throughout! Uk baths. This 
6 Room Ranch features: A 
first floor family room 
with sliders to large deck. 
Beautiful view ol the coun­
tryside. Just a few minutes 
to downtown Manchester 
and acouple of minutes to 
1-84. Asking $66,500. Cen­
tury 21, Tedford Real 
EsUte, 647-9914.

BRICK, BLOCK, STONE ■" 
Fireplaces.  Concrete. 
Chimney Repairs. "No Job 
Too Smal l .Ca l l  644-8356 
for estimates.

M&M P4(H, Manchester 
649-2871. Small repairs, 
r emode l ing,  heating,- 
baths, kitchens and water; 
heaters. Free estimates!

CUSTOM D RAPERIES.' 
Made very reasonable.! 
Free measurements and 
decor. Cali any time. 649-! 
4266

Manchaatar
GORGEOUS

Uk Room Ranch, or 
large treed lot - J 
bedrooms, 2 baths 
sunken l iving room 
w/fireplace,  fami ly 
r oom  o f f  k i t chen  
w / d in e t t e ,  Den 
w/sundeck .  P o o l  
w/deck, 2 car garage- 
'79.900.

MERRITT, Agency

T A P I N G ,  C E I L I N G  
REPAIRS, flowers, swirls. 
Sheet rock  add it i ons . !  
Garages. Rec Rooms &, 
Homes. Experienced. 649- 
8627: 649-3219.

C & M Tree Service, Free 
estimates. Discount senior 
c i t i z e n s .  Compa ny  
Manchester owned and 
operated. Call 646-1327.

GARDENS
ROTOTILLED. Small Cub 
Cadet tractor with rear 
ti l ler. SAT ISFACTION 
GUARNTEED. Call 647- 
0530 or 528-0268.

CO NFID ENTIAL Inter-
_________________  Invaatmant Proparty 25 C O M P L E T E  L A W N

EXCErLENT*................... Uli^i^ni, “ se^din^g a "d
INVESTMENT! Good cash thatching.  A l l  needs 
flow! First Hoor leased to t r ea ted .  Tak ing new 

^ °  package store. Second customers. 649-2728
___________________ floor, very nice apartment, ------------------- -------------

K ITC HFN ® & a rio “ 7 u fth lr ’ d f f i :
KI'TCHEN IS accepting strano Real Estate. 646- ^
applications for part-time 2000. WE DO WINDOWS, lawn
emplojment. Hours are 4-8 work and general cleaning
Mon.-Fri. Eiaht hours on Good rates Cali.Bill 643-
Saturday and/or Sunday. □ BUSINESS 1246.
20-24 hours per week. Call O F D U i f 'E e  — ------------- ----------------
for appointment. 649-4332. O C n V I U t o  ^

COLLECTOR Lady to Sarvfcas Offered s i -..n r... 
work in small office in YARDWORK-ODD JOBS..
East Hartford. Must be R E W E A V I N G  B U R N  mowed, leaves-
good on telephone and be HOLES. Zippers urn- landscaping. Will,
ab l e  to f y p e  when brellas repaired. Window cL®n ’
m^ssary. HouraJ-3 p.m. shades, Venetian blinds. ^ 6 ^
Please call 528-4197 for ap- Keys. TV FOR RENT -------------~ ---------------
polntment. Marlow’s, 867 Main Street] —
---------------------------------  649-5221. w T
EXECUTIVE ASSISTANT ------------------------ ----- i ICFNSRTi n x v  r-Ao,^
to P re s id e ^  of Plastic C E R A M I C  F I R I N G .  Pr S e r  wlt/ca?e fou 
ConiMny. BooU^ping to Discount rates. Quick ser- your  ch i ld  in m i

between 10 and 4. .

□ REAL ESTATE

Homes For Sato 23

M A N C H E S T E R  A-1  
CONDITION, three family 
home on busline. 5-5-S. 
Separate furnaces, good In­
come, good investment. 
Owner-agent. 643-6883 or 
644-8593 a f t e r  6:00  
weekdays.

N E W  O N  M A R K E T  - 
MANCHESTER - Duplex. 
6-6. Living room, dining 
room, kitenen, 3 b lo o m s  
each unit. One unit has IVk 
baths. La rge  spacious 
rooms, lovely porches with 
one s id e  co m p le te ly  
enclosed. One of the attrac­
tive "Cheney ’Types" on 
the west side. 181,900. 
Odeaard Realty 643-4365 or 
U i Emerson 646-1716.

B -B  U P H O L S T E R Y .  
C u stom  W o rk . F re e  
Estimates. Will pick up 
and deliver. Please caU 
646-2161.

6DDJ0U
No Job In  amiN

M  d O N  gonlOt iMai 
manta. ■Mtoa, do. 

C O I I M 7 - 0 0 8 2

B&M  TR E E  SERVICE, 
Inc. Complete tree care in­
cluding spraying for gypsy 
moths, other insects and 
d is e a s e s . “ S P E C IA L  
RATES" on stump grin- 
diiu with tree removal. 
Fully Inured and licensed. 
F r e e  e s t im a t e s  and  
D IS C O U N T S  F O R  
SENIOR a i lZ E N S . 043- 
701.

a p p l i a n c e  r e p a i r ;
S E R V IC E  - W ashers,; 
driers, refrigerators. Calk 
643-4965 between 7-9 a.m, 
or after 4 p.m.

LAWNMOWERS 
R E P A IR E D  - 15% Sr.,' 
Citizen Discount! Fresi 
pick-up and de live ry !. 
E x p e r t  t e r v lc f i i
ECONOMY ■
LAWNMOWER, 647-3860. >

M O T H E R  W IT H -  
LICENSED HOME w ill' 
care for your child, 3 years!

weekdays. Calk.

^elndng-Paparlng 32;
<****•*•••••••••••••••••»
INTERIOR PAINTINCr 
p v s r ^  years experience, 
I w  winter rates and senior 
citizen discounts. 648 Weo.

N E W  P R I V A T E  P A R T Y  W A N T  A D  R A T E S  — F A M I L Y  T H R I F T  S P E C I A L ! ! !

3 Lilies - 3 Days ^6.00
inmomi Lii.  ̂iMH j  .. • —  W  11,00 DlaciHNit H PaM In AilvanMUnes WW n# Chuged At Low PthaSa

G U AR AN TEED  RESULTSI
H Your Hem Isnl SoM Within 3 Days— 

NCONO 8 DAY* A N  n w n

Prton o f w U c Im  m uat b o  Includotl In ad .
FOR SALE ITEMS ONLY. MAHMUM $1.000410

PH O N E 
W A N T 

 ̂ AD S

643-2711
C A LL... t h e  HCaALO

FMedng-Paparlng 32 HouaahoU Oooda 40 Oardan Produeta 4T Apartmanla For Sant S3 OMoaa-Storaa tor Sant Autoa For Sala SI Autoa For Bala SI Autos For Sala
PROFESSIONAL .......................................................................................................................................................................... ................................................................................................................................
PAINTING - Interior and 
exterior. Commercial and 
res iden tia l. F re e  e s ­
timates. Fully insured. 646- 
4679.

L ^  PAINTING. Interior 
A  EMerior. "Check my 
rate before you decorate.'
Dnendahle. Fully insured.
646-1653.

67

TV CONSOLE (PHILOO) ^
Used. m .  CaU 6466714. y f
A d  for Ed. TOP SOIL FOR SALE.*i*̂ *V'*?**7*r*******M Rich, clean, stone free 
u m u sa  mr s a w  lo a m , any  am ou n t
•••••••••••••••■ ••••••••  j e i j y j r e d .  875-7506

anytime.

INTERIOR . PAINTING  
AND W ALLPAPER ING  
Qtfality professional 
work at reasonable  
prices. FuUy Inured. 
Free estimates. G.L. 
McHugh. 643-9321.

• IN T E R IO R  A N D  
^ I ^ E R I O R  PAINTING , 
■Paper hanging, carpentiy 
’work. Fully insured. J.P. 
Lewis A  Son. 64»4658.

DAN SHEA PAINTING St 
DEICORAUNG - interior 
land E x te r io r .  A lso :  
^ U p apering . ^QuaUt^

TEACHERS 
EXPERIENCED  
E X T E R IO R  Painters. 
N o w  b o o k in g  fo r  
sum m er/spring Jobs. 
F R E E  E S T IM A T E S ,  
reasonable rates. 6466873.

★
EXTERIOR PAINTING . 
Reasonable orices, FREE  
ESTIM ATE^. Call 643-

ALUMINUM Sheets used 
as printing plates, .007 
thick 83x38%'’, 50 cents 
each or 5 for |3. Phone 043- 
3711. Must be picked up 
before 11 a.m. ONLY.

W A T E R  P U M P S  - 3”  
Carter Gas Powered. % "  
Carter. Gas powered. 3" 
Electric. 1%’’ . 3” and 6” 
hoses. CaU 649-7407.

FOR SALE, ALBINAR F  
3.8/56 telephoto lens for 
screwtype mount with haze 
and skyU^t filters, $50. 
CaU 6365M e v e n i^ .

F O R  S A L E  SO inch  
Franklin wood burning 
stove. Excellent condlUon! 
$90. CaU 646-7KB.

SWIM POOLS - OUTLET  
offers brand new , above 
ground 31 foot long pools 
c o m p le te  w ith  h u ge  
sundeck, fencing, hi-rate 
filter, etc. A u in g  $978 
delivered. Includes in­
sta lla tio n . F inancing  
available. Call Dennis 
collect (303) 3354804.

D E L IV E R IN G  D A R K  
LOAM - 5 Yards 385.00 plus 
tax. Sand. Gravel St Stone. 
CaU 6 4 3 -^ .  CaU 0434004.

N E W  S IG M A
TELEPHOTO Lens 135mm 
F/2.8 with carrying case.

CHOICE EVERBEARINO  
R E D  R A S P B E R R Y  
BUSHES - 1 to 4 feet taU. 
78 cents each. Last week to 
plant. Please caU 649-3430. 
••••••••••••••••••••••••

49AnUquaa

WANTED - AnUque Fur­
niture, Glass, Pewter, OU 
P a in tin gs  o r Antique  
Item s . R . H a rr is o n .  
Telephone 6434709. 
••••••••••••••••••••••••
Wantad to Buy 49

WANTED PIANO - Old up­
right. 643-4962.

B U Y
Older

W A N T E D  TO  
IM M E D IA T E LY .
house in need of r ^ i r .
Cash. Please caU m n k  *701,64 p.m

MANCHESTER - Heat in­
cluded. One bedroom, new­
ly  d e c o ra te d . $225. 
Locators, 2366645. FEE.

M A N C H E S T E R  - 2 
bedrooms, a ll modern 
kitchen. $190. Locators. 
2365546. FEE.

MANCHESTER - Female 
Roommate to share large 
two bedroom apartment. 
$175 per month includes 
heat and hot water. Bus 
line. Available June 1st. 
CaU 643-7825.

T H R E E  R O O M
APAR’TMENT with heat, 
hot water, stove, refrig., 
carpet. $275. Adults only. 
No pete. 3rd floor. Central­
ly  lo ca te d . S ecu rity  
deposit. CaU 646-7690.

FOUR ROOMS, SECOND 
F L O O R . H eat, stove, 
refrigerator. Adults. No 

Security. CaU 646

EAST CENTER STREET- 
400 square feet. Ground 
floor. Private entrance. 
Heat, Ught and parking in­
cluded. Desireable for: 
Professional, Secretarial 
Service, M anufactures  
Rep., etc. Keith Real 
Estate, 6464126.

Roaort Fropariy For

C A P E  C O D  
W E L L F L E E T .  T w o  
bedroom cottage, newly 
remodeled. Reasonable 
rates. 7424389 before 2 
p.m.

Wontod to Ront 57

J.T. Strano, Strano 
Estate 6462000.

Real

b U Y I N G  B A S E B A L L  
CARDS. WUl pay cold cash 
for your cards coUecting 
dust. If interested call 5 i^  
5291.

BUYING
Cirfy American, Victorian an­
tiques. rugs. jwinUngs. One 
item or entire cootents.

T O P S P A ID
Selling anything old? CaU ns. 
your Mlghton.

B O B ER T M A N LEYI
9 4 9 - 3 9 9 3

F O U R  RO OM S W IT H  
Refrigerator St Stove. 
Newly remodeled. $295 per 
montii. Security deposit 
required. UtiUties not in­
cluded. No pets. 871-0090 
between 9 - 5  p.m. or 646 
76M after 5 p.m.

M A N C H E S T E R  - 2
bedroom, 5 room rent in 
tw o  f a m i l y  house .  
Appliances, carpeted, no 
utilities. Adults, no pets. 
Available June 1st. $350 
plus security. CaU 6468518 
after 4:00 p.m.

HOUSE ’TO SHARE. $50 
weekly, includes large

RESPONSIBLE COUPLE 
with three children looking 
for a three bedroom duplex 
in the country. Have most 
tools for repairs. Will do 
yard work. Will help out 
older couple. CaU Marie 
2894517.

WANTED - 2 bedroom 
apartment or town-house. 
For June 1st. Rent up to 
$400 with heat and hot 
water. Manchester area. 
2865338 before 3 p.m.

APARTMENT WANTED: 
Single teacher without pets 
wants quiet well-kept 1-2 
bedroom in Manchester' 
area beginning between 
June ana September. CaU 
4269381 67 weeknighte on­
ly-

Fits Cannon cameras. Cost bedroom, your own stower
Buddksg Contracting 33 

FARRAND
REM O D EUN G  - Cabinets, 
Roofing, Gutters, Room 
AddlUons, Decks, AU tjqiaa 
o f R e m o d e l i n g  and  
Repairs. Free estimates. 
Fully insured. Phone 846 
8017.

I a a CAR aam oas. < 
1 ROOM ADIMTtOMt

Rseswwato Sitoe
CAU.

M S - I B I t

$85. WUl seU for $80. 646 
1801.

M O V I E  C A M E R A ,  
PROJECTOR St SCREEN. 
A l s o ,  B a b y  c r i b ,  
transforms to youth bed. 
Both Uke new condition. 
5665291.

S C R E E N E D  L O A M  - 
Gravel, Processed Gravel, 
Sand, Stone, and FiU. For 
deliveries call: George 
Griffing, Andover 742-7866.

Mfac. tor Ront 58
* RENTALS

Rooma lor Ront 52 
••••••••••••••••••••••••
Central location. Free  
p a r k i n g ,  k i tchen  
priveleges. Security and 
w r i t t e n  r e f e r e n c e s  
required. 6462893 after 4 
p.m. ^

EX’TEMELY NICE ROOM 
w o r k i n g  g e n t l e m a n  
p r e f e r r e d .  K i t c h e n

MANCHESTER - 2 Bay 
'Truck Garage, 700 square 
feet. $ ^  monthly. (^11 
647-9137.

□ AUTOMOTIVE

FR EE  WOOD! Cot your
ow n in r e s i d e n l l a l  R*al EsUte, 646

L E O N  C I E Z S Y N S K I  
BUILD ER . New homes, 
additions, remodeliiw, rec 
rooms, pragea, kitdiens 
remodelM, cmlings, bath 
tile, dormers, roofing. 
Residential or commer­
cial. 5464291.

D E S I G N  K I T C H E N S ,  
cabinets, vanities, counter 
tops, kitchen csbinet fronts 
custom  woodworking,  
colonial reproductions. 
J.P. Lewis 6 4 ) ^ .

ELECTRICAL SERVICES 
- We do aU types of Elec­
t r i c  Work! U cens^ . CaU 
after 5:00 p.m., 6461516.

R O B E R T  J A R V I S  - 
- B u i ld i n g  cont rac to r .  
Custom building, addiUons, 
ga ra ge s ,  roo f ing  and 
s id in g ,  k i te ne ns ,  
bathrooms and rw air work 
of aU kinds. 6434fll2.

A A A   ̂ Q U A L I T Y  
G u a re n t e e d  F o r  Thei  
Com plete Job!  E ar l y  
American Restoration, 
Room AddiUons, Wood or 
Concrete Decks, Roofing, 
R e c r e a t i o n  R o o m s ,  
Custom Woodworking, 
Plumbing, Heating, and 
Electric. "One CaU Mrves 
AU Your Needs.” Joe, 646 
2378; or Dick 6463746 
anytime.

ftooMng 34

ROOFER WILL INSTALL 
Roofing, Siding, or G u ^  
for Low Discount Price! 
CaU Ken at 647-1566.

neighborhood.
Elsperieneed only. CaU 646 

after 5:00 p.m.

1878.

and bathroom facilities, 
garage space, and a ll 
utilities. Available May 
9Ui. CaU 6560611 65 p.m.

TW O  B E D R O O M ,
Carpeted, appliances, cen­
trally locatra. June 1st.
$300 monthly. No uUlities.
Security, references. 646 .........................................
1318 after 5 p.m. 6468782. Auto Parts For Bale 60

4 A L M O S T  N E W  
GOODYEAR O ff St On 
Road ’Tires. 16”  x 10 white 
rim. Original cost $830. 
Make an offer. CaU 646 
2094 after 5:30 p.m.

SAVINGS

C L E A N  F U R N I S H E D  
S L E E P I N G  room  fo r  
mature gentlemen. CaU 
0464701 69 p.m.

MANCHESTER - New 2 
bedroom duplex available 
June 1st. Appl lanced  
kitchen, fully cam ted, 1% 
baths, basement. Lease, 
security. No pets. $450 plus 
utilUes. 6466)03.

PICNIC TABLES. New, 
stained and preserved. |40 
up. DeUvered Manchester. 
34 Foley Street. 6498178.

V A R I E T I E S  O F  
FLOW ER ING  BUSHES. 
Perenials, ground cover, 
englisb ivy, aediums,  
bousep lan ts ,  cac tus ,  
swedisn ivy and many 
more. 649 6118.

T H R E E  B E D R O O M  
DUPLEX, Near shopping 

 ̂ & bus line, aU appliances,

Apartmanta fo r Rant S3 4 '^ '^ ^ a / e ! * M 5 f * p lu f
fecurity requir^.

T W O  R O O M
APARTM ENT - Heated. 
N o  ap p l i an ces .  $225 
monthly. Security. Tenant 
Insurance required. Phone 
6462426, 9 to 5 weekI weekdays.

OFFICE COPIERS FOR 
SALE - A 6M  107 Copier 
for $50. A 6M  Copier for 
$150. May be seen at The 
Manchester Herald during 
regular business hours. 
Phone inquiries welcomed. 
Please caU 6462711, ask 
(or Mark.

ANTIQUE M AHOGANY  
CARVED two Uer table. 
Exce l l ent  $76. Smal l  
mahogany carved three 
s h e l f  m u f f i n  s ta nd ,  
ExceUent. $26. 6468526.

6 FOOT CONVECTOR. 1% 
inches. New. In box. $20. 
Telephone 6460173.

BABY CRIB M APLE. $20. 
Detecto Scales beam tepe 

30 lbs. no. 
new for $75. Call

C U T  Y O U R  O W N  
HARDWOOD - $36 per cor- 
d. Freshly down trees. 
Limited time only. CaU

118 MAIN STREET. Three 
room apartment. Heat and 
hot water. No appliances. 
$3M) m o n t^ . Security. Te­
nant Insurance required. 
CaU 6462426.66 weekdays.

F O U R  R O O M
A P A R T M E N T .  M ature  
adul t s .  No  pets .  No  
appliances. Security. Ref. 
Parking one car. 6^1266.

CaU 6460042 after 6 p.m.

M A N C H E S T E R  - Two  
be d ro o m .  Un heated .  
Appliances. Parking. No 
pets .  $285. 528-1369 
evenings.

FIRST FLOOR RENT - 2 
bedrooms, dining room, 
living room. Nice area. No 
pets, no cildren. $300 
monthly. Century 21, Ted­
ford Real Estate, 047-0914.

1965 VW p o p  PARTS. Will 
seU for $90. Total or In­
dividual parts. CaU 646 
0231. Ask for Bob.

1968 MUSTANG PAR’TS - 
289 Engine $50. Three 
speed transmission with 
bell bousing and clutch. 
$50. Other miscellaneous 
parts. 6469206 AFTER 5 
p.m.

W A T E R  I N J E C T I O N  
SYSTEM. $34.95 InstaUed. 
Foster-Bren 7070 Main 
Street, Manchester. 646 
4300 for appointment.

Autoa For Sato SI

Homoa lor Ron! 54

□  M l % L E

Mouaohold Oooda

p s im
REPRIGBRATOR8, 
W ASHERS, R A N G ES  • 
Clean, Guamteed. Parte 
A  Service. Low prices! 
B.D. Pearl A  Son, 649 Main 
Street 6462171.___________

f r e e z e r  18 Cu. Ft. n>-

846180.___________________

MAGNAVOX
COMBINATION black and 
white television. Record 
player, AM /FM  Radio, 

chwiT C a J ^ .  
Needs repair. $86. Phone 
84M608.___________ ___

W I T H

f o r  BMdRrg MatarMa 42
Miacellaneous Plywood, 
S t e e l  B e a m s ,  W o od  
Timbers St Lumber. Call 
6464128.

40

Ooga-BIrtfe-Pefa 40

I ’M  CHARLIE, A double 
pawed tuxedo cat, looking 
for a home. I ’m altereo, 
and aU 1 need is food and n 
chair to caU my own. 626 
M81, 3484)671.

WiMtool Inatrumanit 44

M-3 HAMMOND SPINET  
ORGAN - Blondo. Mint 
condltknl $400. Bench and 
music books included. 046 
4029.

••••••••••••••••••••••••

MANCHESTER - Unique 
three room apartment, one 
bedroom, appliances. 12 
foot closet, very private 
and secure. Parking, Pete 
to be considered. $350. 
Required security and 
references. 647-9906 p.m.

VERNON - New 5 Room 
Ranch Condo. Stove,  
refrigerator, dish washer. 
N o  l e a s e  r e q u i r e d .  
References and security. 
$450. 6464003.

T W O  R O O M
APARTM ENT - Central 
location. Appliances and 
utiUUes included. $240 per 
month plus security and 
references. 6462093 after 4 
p.m.

E A S T  H A R T F O R D .  
Luxury 2 bedroom apart­
ment. New waU to waU 
carpeting. Adjacent to fuU 
service park. Heat, hot 
water, and appUancee. No

V E R N O N  - N e w l y  
decorated, 2 bedrooms. 
Lots of extras. $300s. 
Locators, 2366646. FEE.

MANCHESTER - Nice 2 
bedroom  with fo rmal  
dining area. Only 1375. 
Locators, 2365640. FEE.

EAST HARTFORD - Large 
6 Rooms plus. Walking dl^  
tance to schools, churches 
and stores.' $400 plus  
security deposit. UtiuUes 
not inclucM. CaU 2864084 
after 5:00 p.m.

W A NT ED  JUNK AND 
LATE MODEL WRECKS - 
Cash Paid. CaU Parker 
Street Used Auto Parts, 
6463391.

JEEPS, CARS TRUCKS 
available through govern­
ment agencies, many sell 
for under $200. Call 6(0-941- 
8014 ext. 7816 for your 
d i r e c t o r y  on how to 
purchase.

FOUR BEDROOM HOME 
- large yard, parking coun­
try Uving in rural witon.

Lease. 6462871 Dave 
or Charlie.

pete. Adults pir^erred. $379 
p e r  m o n t n .  280-0000 
between 9:20 and 5:20. 286
2106 after 6:10.

WINDOWSW AilA/V/ TT O V* •  •  —

Mch. can 6466in sfter 0 646177G

••••• • • •• • • • •• • • • •• • • •• •
F R E E  LO AM , 

orddhrand. CaU
............ or 644-2789 7:00

''■q.m. to 10:00 p.m.

BOLTON - Ftew ihiptex, 5 
acres woodsd, 2bedroams, 
fully sppUsnoed kitchen, 
a l l  e le c t r ic , deposit ,  
refecences. $600 per month 
phu utUities. 648AI78 after 
6 pjn . or weekends.

EAST HARTFORD-Sunny 
1 bedroom. Utilities in­
c l u d e d .  Jus t  $100. 
Locatars, 2186848. F ^ .

VERNON 
bedroom.
$276. Locstore, 
f B!E

• SparkUni two 
Won’t U sn o n g . 
store, 216-6846.

Officee-Storee tor Rant

W O R K S P A C E  O R  
STORAGE SPACE FOR  
RENT in Manchester. No 
lease or security deposit. 
Reasonable rates. Suitable 
for small business. Retail 
and commerclaUy zoned. 
CaU 8761801, 10 to 5.

N E W L Y  R E N O V A T E D  
310 square feet office 
available. Main Street 
locat ion w ith am p le  
parking. CaU 6462881.

O F F I C E  S P A C E  FOR  
RENT. 800 square feet. 
Newly re-decorated. Very 
reasonable. CaU 6464751 
between 8 and 6.

M ANCHESTER • MAIN  
STREET - 2,000 sq. feet. 
Ideal convenient store 
location. EstabUshed area. 
Hayes Corporstton, 646 
OUl.

PRIM E OFFICE SPACE • 
Rusiness District • Free 
PSTklag -  Light, Heat and 
A/C inclnted • CaU 646 
9806.

TOLLAWO 
1766231 646461

8 0

8 0

79

7 9

7 8

7 8

7 8

7 8

7 8

7 7

^  LYNCH MOTORS
1886646
Black, 4 speed,

0 cylindar
Tn yM s 1 / 1 4 x 4
4 spd., Roll Bar, 

Stereo cassette 
■ w n m N M  Landau 
Coupe, fact, sun 
roof, velour 
Interior. 
C o ro B a S D r. 
Deluxe, auto., vinyl 
roof. 29,000 

miles.
C a H e a a .T .U flln o h
4 cyl., 5 spd., ex­

cellent cond. 
HoiidaCMe 
4 cylinder,

4 speed.
M G k  Skytarti Cpn.
6 cyl., auto., 

power steering. 
Gamsro Comp* 
Black, 6 cyl., pow. 

steering, stereo 
Chs«. Monxa Wgn. 
V-6, auto, power 

steering
Mam.GoH|ar2Dr.
302, Air cond., 
stereo, 45,000 

miles

*699$
*719 5

*6195

*4995

*5195

*3895
*4195

*4595

*3995
1

*3195

77 Fetd IT B  t gnlrs
Black, Air cond., 
stereo, 45,000 

miles.
7 7  A M C M a M a r

4 Dr., A/C, stereo, 
cruise control

7 7  Ctievy M om s 2-I-2
Blue, 4 speed,

55.000 miles.
7 6  Clw v. Motile Carle

vinyl roof, A/C. 
cruise, stereo

7 7  Ponllae’X a n A m ’’ 
Limited edition,

28.000 miles.
7 5  Fo rd G ra iiM ia 20 r. 

6 cylinder, auto., 
P.S.

DodgeOart74 Swinger. 2 Dr,, Htp. 
6 cylinder.

43.000 miles.
7 4  0 8 ts u n 6 2 10

2 Dr., 4 cyl.,
4 speed.

7 4  V .W .8 u g 4 c y l..
4 speed 

stereo.
7 3  FordF350Plchup

Campers special 
.8300 GVW

*2895
*1995

*3195

*3195
*4595

*2595

.*2895
*2395

*2895

*2595

LYNCH
500 West Center St., Manchester • 646-4321

Autos For Sale 61

WANTED PARTS CAR - 
1966 Ford F>irlane 390. 
Automatic or standard. 
Call 646-7297 8 a.m.-4 p.m.

GREMLIN X 1977 SPORT 
PACK - AM/FM 8 track. 
Air, AT. re., PB. Great 
mpg! Immaculate! $3600. 
Call 646-8091 or 871-2771.

1972 FO R D  T O R IN O  
STA’nON WAGON. At, PS, 
PB. Minor repairs. $600 or 
best offer. Call between 9-3 
p.m. 228-9170.

1970 TOYOTA CORONA - 2 
door. Fair running condi­
tion. $500. 646-8041.

1972 C H E V R O L E T  
IM P A L A  - Four door. 
Needs new engine or good 
for parts. Cml 646-6576, 
after 6:00 p.m.

1973 OLDSMOBILE - DelU 
88. AC, PS, PB. Radio. 
Original owner. $795. 649- 
3475 (home) 646-2903 (of­
fice)

HONDA CIVIC CVee 1976 
WAGON - Ehrcellent con­
dition! Automatic. Low 
mileage. $^50. CaU 643- 
9042.

Trucks for Sale 62

■150

1973 V W  S U P E R  
BEETLE. 72,000 miles, 28,- 
000 miles on a rebuilt 
e n ^ .  Muat aeU. $1500. 
8n-7025, 643-7860.

1972 TOYOTA. Good condi­
tion. Asking $200. Must sell 
im m ^atm y. Call 646-1365.

PINTO 1978 - Radials, new 
shocks, brakes. AM/FM  
stereo cassette.  Low  
mileage. Excellent coodi- 
Uon. M600. 876-1431.

1872 D O D G E
CRESTWOOD SW - 218, 
PS„ PB„ Air. 9 seater. 
Average condlUon. Asking 
$475. C M  646-1047.

1971 PONTIAC LEMANS. 
Very g ^  condlUon. $1,000 
orbertoffer.’Tel: 04341804.

F O R D  1978 F 
R A N G E R  X L T  
A u t o m a t i c ,  p o w e r  
steering, brakes, am/fm 
stereo, cap. Beautiful con­
dition! Priced right! 742- 
8161 weekdays after 4:30; 
anytime weekends.

Motorcycloa-BIcycloa 64

MOTORCYCLE 
INSURANCE - Lowest 
R a t e s  A v a i l a b l e !  
Immediate Binding Lay- 
Up Options. Call Joan, 
Clarke Insurance Agency, 
643-1126.

PR IV ATE 
PR OPERTY 
Want Ads

I E 6 A L  N O T IC E S

Probate Notice
Court of Probate, District of 

MancAester
NOTICE OF HEARING 

E S T A T E  OF U S IL IO  
AGOST1NE1XI. deceased 

Pursuant to an order of Hon 
William E. FitzGerald, Judge, 
dated 4/30/81 a hearing will be held 
an an application praying that an 
instrument purporting to be the 
last will and testament of said 
deceased be admitted to probate as 
in said application on file more ful­
ly appears, at the Court of Probate 
on May 14, 1981 at 10:00 A M

Sherrie L. Anderson. 
Ass't. Clerk

00»4)5

Probate Notice
Court of Probate. District of 

Manchester
NOTICE OF HEARING 

E S T A T  OF W IL L IA M  M 
MeSWEENEY. deceased 

Pursuant *to an order of Hon 
William E FitzGerald, Judge, 
dated April 30. 1981 a hearing will 
be held on an application praying 
that an instrument purporting to be 
the last will and testament of said 
deceased be admitted to probate as 
in said application on file more ful­
ly appears, at the Court of Probate 
on May 14, 1961 at 10:30 A M.

Sherrie L Anderson, 
Ass’t. Clerk

0KM15

U G l t L  N O T IC E S
Probate Notice

Court of Probate. District of 
Manchester

NOTfCE OF HEARfNG 
E STATE  OF DEBOHAH A 

GALLAGHER, deceased 
Pursuant to an order of Hon 
William E FitzGerald. Judge, 
dated May I. 1981 a hearing will be 
held on an application praying that 
letters of administration be 
granted on said, estate as m said 
application on file more fully 
appears, at the Court of f^robale on 
May 14. 1981 at 2 00 P M

Sherrie L. Anderson, 
Ass t Clerk

008^

ANDOVER INLAND 
WETLANDS 

COMMISSION
Notice of Public Hee-*’'"  
on a subdivision on East 
Street and Boston Hill 
Road proposed by Fri Land 
Equities, Inc:

Pursuant to the Andover 
In land  We t la nd
Regulations, the Andover 
Wetlands Commission will 
hold a public hearing on the 
above subdivision proposal 
on Monday, May 18,1981 at 
the Andover Town Office 
Bu i l d in g  at 8 p.m.  
Interested parties are in­
vited to appear and be 
heard.

Signed:
Susan B. Losee, 
Chairman 
Andover Wetlands 
Commission 

084-04

L E 8 M . N O T IC E L E G A L  N O T IC E

MOTORCYCLE 
INSURANCE, see us now 
for same day coverage and 
competitive rates. Ask for 
Judy or Janet, Crockett 
Agency, Inc., 643-1577.

Compora, Trollora and 
MoMo Homos 65

1973 V W  C A M P E R  - 
Elxcellent condition. Fac­
tory equipped. Pop top. 
AM -FM  Radio, Cassette 
player, radial tires. $2700. 
Can 742-5025 AFTER  6 
p.m.

1973 EASTERN CAMPER. 
21 feet self-contained. 
$2600. C a l l  040-4642 
anytime.

6

M
A
Y

S U P E R I O R  C O U R T  FOR  T H E  S T A T E  OF 
CONNECTICUT 

JUVENILE MATTERS 
12th DISTRICT

ORDER OF NOTICE
/ ' ' “* * \ it y  of Hartford, CT April 30, 1981 

PETITION FOR THE COMMITMENT OF THE 
MINOR CHILD OF 

ORUS SILVA 
of parts unknown

Upon the petition of Mark J. Marcus, Commissioner 
of Children and Youth Services, by June M. Wlehn, Duly 
Authorized Agent of the City of Hartford in said District, 
stating that the minor child of the above named person 
is an uncared-for, child, which petition wiU be heard on 
the 4th day of June 1901 at 3:30 o’clock in the afternoon, 
at the Superior Court-Juvenile Matters, 920 Broad Street 
in the City of Hartford. CT in said District,

It appe^ng to and being found by the subscribing 
authority that the above named Orus Silva has gone to 
parts unknown, therefore.

ORDERED, That notice of the hearing of this petition 
be given by publishing this order of notice in the 
Manchester Evening Herald a newspaper having a cir­
culation In the City of Manchester, CT, once a week 2 
weeks successively, commending immediately upon 
receipt of Notice — 7 days apart.

Elizabeth J. Flynn 
Clerk
Superior Court-Juvenile Matters 
12th District

0084)6

6
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Home mortgage picture changing rapi
WASHINGTON (UP1> -  For the 

average American home owner one of 
life's, constants has been the monthly 
mortgage payment.

Sign up for a 30-year mortgage at a 
fixed interest rate, under the system in 
common use since the Depression, and 
the monthly payment is an unvarying 
amount — month in. month out, year 
after year, as regular as the con­
stellations.

That s the way it used to be. Now this 
picture IS rapidly changing.

The fixed rate mortgage is giving way 
around the country to new kinds of 
mortgage loans in which interest rates 
and monthly payments fluctuate over the 
life of a loan as interest rates change in 
financial markets.

This has stirred controversy between 
mortgage lenders and consumer groups

It IS altering the relationship between 
lenders and borrowers — changing the 
way they share economic risk

It Is plunging home buyers into a new 
world in which changes in the Treasury 
bill rate will be as important to their 
household budgets as the price of fuel, 
and in which they must grapple with 
such difficult concepts as "negative 
amortization

Perhaps most fundamental, it is for­
cing consumers to look at their place in 
the scheme ol things in new and more 
sophisticated ways

The change started in California in 
early 1973 among state-chartered saving 
and loan associations Most states per 
mit state regulated financial institutions 
to issue some form of flexible mortgage

The Federal Home Loan Bpnk Board, 
which regulates tedcrally-chartered 
savings and loan associations, authorized 
these to begin offering a so-called 
Variable Rate Mortgage nationwide in 
1978 and anot her  ver s ion,  the

Renegotiable Rate Mortgage, last 
summer.

The Comptroller of the Currency, 
regulator of national banks, authorized 
them to begin offering still another ver­
sion. called an Adustable Rate Mortgage 
last March.

By some estimates, up to half of new 
mortgages being issued throughout the 
country now carry variable rates. They 
are more common In cities than in the 
countryside.

The Bank Board is considering still 
more far reaching variable rate rules for 
savings and loans. If these are approved 
some experts believe that within a short 
time the vast majority of new mortgages 
issued in the country will have variable 
rates.

E xisting  long-term , fix ed -ra te  
mortgages will not change, only new 
ones.

The cause of this change has been in­
flation.

Rollin D. Bernard, president of the 
P S League of Savings Associations, 
explains it this way:

A savings and loan association is an in­
termediary It accepts deposits from 
people with money to invest and lends 
these out as mortpges to home buyers. 
Without intermediaries, a person could 
not buy a home unless he were rich 
enough to pay cash or lucky enough to 
find another person willing to lend the 
money

Savings institutions grew up as places 
where small savers could put their 
money On passbook 'a c co u n ts , 
depositors can withdraw their funds on 
little or no notice. But mortgages are 
commonly issued for decades. So. by 
their nature, such insitutions "borrow 
short and lend long "

"If depositors are happy getting a 
steady 4 percent return on their savings

RCA-Quasar-Hitact

ID E O  U U C E N T E R
Now Open

Selection In Connecticut” 
i-Toshlba-Sony-8ylvanla i Philco

6 HR. VHS
VIDEO RECORDER

l•■11 la  Vh )  U R t ^

«— t e n  U 8» m aM W aat

“Ask About Our 
Exclusive Video Club"

R E N T A L
C E N T E R

New Releases

9  T o  5  A irp la n e  
X a n a d u  B lu e s  B ro ttie rs  
F la s ti G o rd o n  S ta r  T re k  
W a ll D is n e y  " 1 0 "

A ll R a tin g s  A v a ila b le

V ID E O  R E C O R D E R  
C L E A R A N C E

RCA. Portable VCR *648
6 HR VHS machine *58R
Hitachi color camera •488

many other unadvertised 
clearance specials

PRICE BREAK
T A P E  S P E C I A L S

SCOTCH L-500 TAPE •
SCOTCH T-120-6 HR M S * *

REBATE* ^ . 5 0
n iu i
COST M2.S0

At
J 445 H A R T F O R D  R D . U U M A R C H E S8 4 7 0 0 0 7  445 H A R T F O R D  R D . 1 / 1 /  M A H C H E S T I R

8 4 7 0 0 0 8
T A K E 1-84 TO  K E EN E Y  S T. EX IT

THE PEOPLE WHO BPINQ YOU LOW PRICES AND PERSONAL^

LARGE WHITE FRESH EGGS ARE LOWER AT PINEHURST .. 
Parkay M argarines featured at very low prices ... Selected large 
Chicken Legs a good value at 69c lb. and we have a sale on U.S.D.A. 
Choice Beef Oven Roasts. For Cook-outs we offer 4 to the lb. freshly 
ground beef patties .

STRICTLY FRESH

EGGS
Doz.

P A R K A Y
S T IC K S
d 5 9 <

Margarine
Sale

P A R K A Y
S O F T

d 8 9 <
U.S.No. 1 Main*

P O TA T O ES

Idaho Bahars
51*1 .6 3

HEINZ
KEG OF 

C A TS U P
*1 .0 932 oz.

C H IX N O O D LE  
S O U P

C A M P B E L L S

41*1.0 0

CHICKEN LEGS
10 Ib.lots 674 lb.

LEAN BONELESS  ̂
T O P  SIR LO IN  BEEF 
OVEN R O A S T 2.49 lb.

BO NELESS OVEN ROAST
T E N D E R  S IR LO IN  T IP . * 2 . 5 0

Fraazar apaclal ... Whols Sirloin Roast 
of Boat (9 to 10 Iba. cut and fraazar wrap 
as you Instruct.

lb. 2 . 2 5

FR ES H  B O N ED  S H A D  A N D  S H A D  
ROE

Supply l lm ifd  . . .  pxpucMIy on Iho too. 
Roto iya llont — 643-4151

S H EN A N D O A H  
W H ITE TU R K EY  ,
(frozan) 2-lb. rolla I
S P E C IA L . box

MEAT AND POTATOES PRICE BREAK.
All sales are great, but large Chicken Legs at 
69c lb, and Maine Potatoes 10 lbs. 1.89 are the 
greatest.

FROZEN FOODS
Stouffor’a Now Onion Broad and ragular 
garlic broad ar* proving as popular as 
Popparldg* Farm Corn, Bran and Bluabsrry 
Muffins.

PINEHURST GROCERY INC *3 0 2  I R A l j

there is no problem,” Bernard said in an 
interview. Institutions can Issue long­
term mortgages at slightly higher rates 
and make money.

"This was largely the case until the 
mid-1960s,” Bernard said. Then, with in­
flation rising, savers began to demand 
higher returns on their money. New 
kinds of savings certificates, based on in­
terest rates in money markets, were 
created to provide this higher return.

Starting in 1980, federal regulators 
also began a 6-year phase-out of interest 
ceilings on savings accounts, which had 
kept their cost of obtaining funds ar­
tificially low.

The result is that an increasingly large 
part of the sources of funds of savings in­
stitutions is now based on fluctuating in­
terest rates, and when these rise sharp­
ly. the institution finds its cost of funds is 
bigger than it is earning from outstan­
ding long-term mortgages.

"Inflation has caus^  money, along 
with everything else, to be more expen­
sive, " Bernard said. "As an in­
termediary, a savings and loan must 
balance the return that its getting on 
money with what money is costing. 
There isn't any other way to operate."

If mortgage money is to be available, 
so that people can buy houses, Bernard

says, the only solution Is a tnortgage 
with some form of flexible rate.

Federal regulators began allowing 
flexible mortgages cautiously, wfth con­
siderable safeguards for consumers.

The V a ria b le  R a te  M ortgage 
authorized by the bank board for federal 
savings and loans in 1978 allowed the 
mortgage rate to be adjusted up or down 
once-a-year. But it could rise no more 
than 0.5 percentage points annually and 
no more than 2.5 percentage points over 
the life of a mortgage.

Many lenders said that wasn't flexible 
enough for recent volatile interest rates, 
and the VRM, though still in effect, has 
had relatively little use.

Last summer the board added a 
Renegotiable Rate Mortgage, subject to 
revision every 3, 4 or 5 years. It has the 
same hajf percentage point annual limit 
on rate increases but allows a total in­
crease of 5 percentage points over the 
life of a mortgage.

The A djustable Rate Mortgage 
authorized by the com ptroller for 
national banks is even more flexible.

It allows the mortgage rate to be 
raised, or lowered, every six months by 
as much as one percentage point each 
period — or a maximum of two points- 
a-year.

OPEN 
To The 
PUBLIC 
7 DAYS 
A WEEKI

EAST HARTFORD
2 8 9  Ellington Road 

Next to KMCS DEPT. STORE 
R O U T E  5

P H O N E  5 2 8 -9 7 8 8

m

BLOOMFIELD
1 0 5 1  Blue H ills A v a

Cor. Park Avo.-NbrI to 
SAV-MOn In tho Formor 
TREASURE CITY Bldg
P H O N P  2 4 2 -3 3 3 1

NEW BRITAIN
10 3 5  W e st M a in  S t.

NorI  To
8CARRITT HOME CENTER 

PHONES
New Britain 2 2 3 -2144 

Hartford 825-3845

WETHERSFIELD
681 Silas Deane Hgwy.

OppoaKo Tho 
CINE WEBS THEATRE

PHONES
721-B 3 8 0  or 7 2 1-8 3 78

D A I L Y

10 to 9
SAT. 10 to 6 

SUNDAY

Routs 88
Eooy»to poMo Irom MIJdlilBww 

Crooa tho Arrtponl Srldfo To 
Roulo M  Eool-IVk MSoo 

on tho Loft
P H O N E 3 4 2 -3 8 e S

1/2M 1L L I O N
MATTRESS SETS

OUT THEY GO ••• SOME BELOW TODAY'S

WHOLESALG PRICES

i f  ■•Sr' - »  • • >  * • t  ■ *

T W IN  S IZE $ 6 R  Ea Pc
FU LL S IZE $ R 6  Ea
Q U E E N  S IZE  $ 1 0 9 E a .  Pc

Ou—n S l i t  SaM In lafi Only.

E A S Y  T E R M S '

FOCUS/  Food B etty 's  Recipes and Menus  

T V 'N o v ie s /C o m ic s

(lb  the Dessert Ikble)
Holidays — where are they '' 

happening? In the country, in 
the city, in a quiet suburban 
home and in your own life. 
That’s where they’re happening 
in the guise of family reunions 
and inform al get-togethers. 
Naturally, the warm welcome is 
extended with good food. Let 
this be your season of great des­
sert finales.

With today’s convenient food 
products on your side, it takes 
less time than you think to cre­
ate showcase desserts because 
they call for Cool Whip non­
dairy whipped topping as the 
major ingredient. It blends in 
heavenly ways with other food 
textures and flavors. These rec­
ipes also make good use of such 
timesaving products as pack­
aged cake mix and commer­
cially-made pie shells. So, count

*

on rave dessert reviews this hol­
iday season.

T rad ition  m inded? C ran­
berry-Cream Cheese A e ex­
ten d s enjoym ent of ho liday  
cranberries in a smooth-textured - 
pie which stores in the freezer. 
Two layers of a thawed frozen 
whipped topping-cream cheese 
mixture rest in a pie shell; one in­
cludes cranberry-orange relish.

Bew are of the chocolate 
lovers. Easy Elegant Chocolate 
Squares will be whisked away 
within moments of reaching the 
serving table. Squares of choc- 
obte cake are sandwiched to­
gether with a truly rich filling 
which includes a blend of sweet 
cooking chocolate and thawed ■ 
"frozen whipped topping. There’s 
a touch of rum flavor, too, all 
accented with a sugar glaze and 
candied cherry garnish.

Eggnog anyone? In a new 
version, that is. Similar to the 
traditional bevdTago, Frozen 
Eggnog Loaf has an enticing 
nun-nutmeg flavor throughout 
each slice of frozen filling. Lady- 
fingers lined side by side inside 
a loaf pan embrace the frozen 
filling, a combination of smooth- 
textured thawed frozen whip­
ped topping and ice cream.%

Take inventory of the holiday 
happenings in  your life. If  
there’* only one happening toA
make ready , now you have 
’'three to go” with the help of 
these dessert finales.

Top; Cranbsrry-Cream Cheese Pie. Center; Easy Elegant Chocolate Squares. Bottom; Frozen Eggnog Loaf.

Cranbet^ry-Cream 
Cheese Pie

1 package (8 o z.) cream cheese, softened
2 tablespoons^slQa^

1 / 4  cup milk j
1 teaspoon vanilla
1 container (8 o z.) frozen whipped toppings 

thawed
1 baked 9-inch pie shell, cooled
1 cup cranberrj^range relish

Beat cheese until smooth; gradually beat in 
sugar. Blend in niilk and vanilla; then fold in 
whipped topping.'Measurja -2-1/2 cups and 
spread evenly 08 Irnttom and sides of pie 
shell, mounding liigh around edge to form a 
1-inch b order. Fo ld  relish in to  rem aining 
whipped topping mixture. Spoon into lined 
shell without covering border. Freeze until 
firm, about 3 h o ilfi. Garnish with fresh orange 
slices; if desired,^ - .

N e ta : F q t  smoother Texture, place cranberry 
relish in blender oontaiiier; add 1 tablespoon 
orange juice and blend until smooth.

Easy Elegant 
Chocolate Squares

1 package (2-layer size) chocolate cake mix or
pudding-included cake mix 

Chocolate Filling 
Sugar Glaze

Prepare, cake mix as directed on package, baking in i  
greased and floured 9-inch square pans at 350° fO T 20 
to 30 minutes. Cool. Split one cake horizontally, making
2 layers. (Freeze second cake for another dessert.) Pile 
Chocolate Filling onto one layer and spread evenly to 
edges; top with second layer. Spread Sugar Glaze over 
top. Chill. Garnish with candied cherries, ifv desired.

C b ico la ti FHIlHg. Heat 1 package (4 oz.) sweet cooking 
chocolate with 1 tablespoon milk in saucepan over low 
heat, stirring until chocolate is melted. Beat 2 table­
spoons sugar into 1 package (3 oz.) cream cheese, soft­
ened. Add 3 tablespoons light rum and chocolate mixture 
and beat until junooth. Fold into 1 container (8 oz.) frozen 
whipped t ( ^ h g ,  thawed, blending well. Makes 3 cups.

Sigwr G ia n . Combine 3/4 cup confectioners sugar and 
M / 2  to  2 tablespoons water; stir until smooth. Spread 
immediately over cake.

Frozen 
Eggnog Loaf

12 ladyfingers, split
1 egg, well beaten
3 tablespoons sugar
2 tablespoons lemon juice
3 tablespoons light rum 

1/2 teaspoon nutmeg
1 pint vanilla ice cream, softened .
1 container (8 oz.) frozen whipped topping, 

thawed

Line sides of 8x4-inch loaf pan with 9 of the 
split ladyfingers. Combine egg, sugar, lemon 
juice, rum and nutmeg in bowl. Spoon in ice 
cream and blend. Fold in whipped topping, 
blending well. Spoon into pan. Press remain­
ing split ladyfingers on filling. Freeze until 
firm, at least 4 hours. Unmold onto serving 
platter. Garnish with additional whipped top- 
piog and chocolate curls, if desired. Makes 
10 to 12 servings. ,

■
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Status symbol of the '80s

The price, not the
By J K A » E  LESEM

It’s not the wine, but the 
prices, that have become a 
major status symbol for 
the 1980s

"I'm  from an area with a 
lot of instant millionaires 
— oil engineers — and they 
think they have to order 
the best bottle of wine in 
the house and they don't 
even like it ,"  says Joe 
Vuskovich, a restaurateur 
in Gretna. La., a New 
Orleans suburb.

Vuskovich thinks a lot of 
p e o p le  o rd e r  w ine 
"because of the price. 
They pay $25 for a bottle 
and really don't enjoy it 
that much "

Wine also has become 
the first choice of many 
who d rin k  a lc o h o lic  
beverages.

James "Slug" Claiborne, 
who has fiv e  "w h ite  
tablecloth " restaurants in 
North Carolina, says his 
wine sales have increased 
dramatically, to 12-14 per­
cent of the total tab.'

"We sell more wine than 
mixed beverages." he said. 
His wine list has more than 
60 selections.

Ten years ago only about 
30 percent of the guests at 
Brennan's restaurant in 
New Orleans regularly 
ordered wine, says owner 
Ted Brennan. "Now it's SO­
BS percent "

B re n n a n  sa y s  h e 's  
amazed because the big 
meal at his restaurant is 
breakfast.

Vuskovich. CW borne 
and Brennan w 4^am ong 
more than 60 restaurateurs 
fro m  th ro u g h o u t the  
United States who attended 
a recent wine tasting in 
New York City conducted 
by Food & Wine magazine

The invitation to the 
tasting said its purpose 
w as to a d v is e  
restaurateurs on how to 
select wines to meet a 
restaurant s demands "

The magazine’s editor- 
in-< hief William Rice said 
he and wine editors John 
and F lin  W aIker had 

sought out wines in a 
relatively modest price 
range — $4.SO-$14. All but 
two were under $10 a bot­
tle The.se are retail store 
p r ic e s  R e s t a u r a n t  
operators traditionally 
mark up wine at least 100 
percent — a p ra ctice  
restaurant c r itic s  con­
demn

So do restaurant patrons. 
Walker said

They don't object to even 
higher markups on food, he 
said, because they figure 
the price reflects labor, 
fuel energy, rent and other 
fixed restaurant costs.

"But when someone sells 
a bottle of beaujolais for 
$15 that they can buy for $5 
retail, since nothing's been 
done to it except open the 
bottle, they tend to resent 
the high price and resist it.

"Wine sells better when 
It's not priced at three 
times re ta il"

Rice said the tasting was 
planned to "to compare 
wines by grape type, not to 
select a best wine, but to 
note stylistic differences "

T he r e s t a u r a t e u r s  
represented everything 
from tem ples of haute 
c u is in e  su ch  as  
W ash in g to n 's  M aison 
Blanche to steakhouses. 
family style eateries and 
Chinese restaurants. Their 
locales range in size from 
New York City. Houston 
and Los Angeles to Gretna, 
population 30.200

Vuskovich operates both 
a low-priced, high-volume 
.New Orleans-style seafood 
establishment and Visko's. 
a piuch more expensive 
restaurant.

" I n  th e  s e a fo o d  
restaurant I have three 
house wines, " he said. 
When you only have house 
wines, he said, men don't 
feel pressured to buy the 
best bottle on the list. He 
has cut his extensive wine 
list in the other restaurant 
to eight labels.

Wine is also a highly visi­
ble status symbol in es­
tablishments such as Tony 
Greco’s Maison Blanche.

"Our restaurant sells a 
lot of expensive wine,” 
G reco said , to people 
trying to impress someone.

Happens all the time on the 
political scene, he said^

What's expensive?
"Anything over $50 a bot­

tle.
"T here may be some 

ju s t i f i c a t io n  fo r  ISO 
wines," he said. " I t ’s a 
matter of quality and taste. 
At higher prices it’s like an 
antique value — one-of- 
akind."

" P e o p le  who never 
thought of drinking wine 
before are ordering it. 
They're now going to sweet 
wines after dinner (instead 
of brandy, liqueurs and 
cordials) and wine before 
dinner instead of spirits.

Show buoinriMi

" Y o u 'v e  g o t to 
remember." Greco said, 
"the restaurant business is 
show business in the dining
room."

C la ib o rn e  sa id  the 
growth of wine sales in his 
Slug’s steak houses is 
"part of the move to the 
Sunbelt." He said his 
typical guests are "well- 
heeled people with dis­
criminating appetites."

Ivar Christensen, presi­
dent of the Media. Pa., 
company that operates the 
Golden Eagle in Phoenix 
and La T o u r in I n ­
dianapolis. said 80 percent 
of the tables order wine at 
dinner to drink with their 
mainly French and con­
tinental food.

"It could be a glass of 
house wine or a bottle. At 
lunch more than half have 
wine — more house wine 
than by the bottle."

"1 think younger people 
have developed more taste 
for wine where they would 
have ordered beer before," 
he said.

Luis G. de Castilla is vice 
president of La Hacienda 
de Los Morales, a Houston 
restaurant with an inter­
national menu and banquet 
facilities for 1,500.

Castilla said he was plan­
ning to introduce a new 
wine list with about 40-45 
labels in a few weeks. 
"We re adding Califomias. 

from small vineyards with 
limited editions and prices 
from about $10 and up."

While his cellar does con­
tain some $250-$300 bottles. 
Castilla said, "We sell very 
few of the more expensive 
wines."

He attributed much of 
the sales growth to the 
area’s increasingly inter­
national population — 
d iplom ats, oil people, 
bankers and businessmen.

George A. Watson III, of 
Marietta. Ga., said he iS" 
trying to educate both his 
employees and restaurant 
patrons. Watson is a co­
owner of WD Crowley’s 
e ig h t  n e ig h b o rh o o d  
restaurants and taverns in 
Atlanta, Columbus and 
Savannah. Ga.

Until 1963, alcoholic 
beverages by the drink 
were illegal there except in 
private clubs.

"People are (still) a lit­
tle uncom fortable with 
w in e ."  W atson sa id , 
"(and) reasonably anxious 
to learn something about 
it.

"1 feel it's important to 
go into more explanation 
on our w ine l i s t s  — 
although we haven't gone 
to printing the names 
phonetically." Instead, 
each wine is numbered, he 
said.

"The business communi­
ty and other people who 
entertain a lot are more 
comfortable with wine," 
he said, "and we sell a 
tremendous amount of bulk 
wine."

Bruce Anderson's Little 
Rock. Ark. restaurant. 
Cajun’s Wharf, opened in 
1975, only two years after 
the area got alcohol by the 
drink. It and his Nashville 
restaurant of the same 
name specialize in seafood 
and steak.

"About 40 percent of the 
tables order wine by the 
glass or bottle,” Anderson 
said.

Price probably dictates 
choices, he said, with 
American varietals the 
most popular.

Prime rib, steaks and 
fresh Blast Coast seafood 
are specialties at The Wine

Cellar In Columbus, Ohio, 
said general manager Tom 
Fitzglbbons, and tte  moat 
popular wines are fruitier, 
sem i-dry G erm an and 
California types. «

Connoisseurs usually 
recommend dry reds and 
whites with those foods.

" I  think people have to 
find what they l ik e ,” 
Fitzgibbons said. He es­
timated his sales of bouae 
wine at 150,0(X) gallons a 
year, and lx>ttled wines, 
three to four cases per 
night.

"People are very price 
conscious," he added, and 
they know value.

J .P . Morgan, Jr .  (no 
relation to the fanious 
banker but “my middle 
name is P lerp ont,” he 
said) is president and 
founder of The Peddler, a 
31-restaurant chain in the

ine, restaurateurs say
TexasSoutheast, 

speciallzi^ In 
salad bars.

Morgan said an average 
of SO percent of total sales 
a r e  b e e r ,  w in e and  
cock tails , a figure he 
called "very low for the in­
dustry.” ■

He said bis restaurants 
serve largely traveling 
men during the week and 
families on weekends.

One of the largest In­
creases in wine drinking 
w as rep orted  by Ted  
Balestreri, of the Sardine 
F a c to ry  In M onterey, 
Calif.

Last year for the first 
time in history, Balestreri 
said, his wine sales passed 
those of spirits — 60 per­
cent compiuad with 40 per­
cent.

Balestreri said credit 
should be shared by the

media "for making the 
very familiar with 

jllfferent types of ertne" 
restaurant owners 

who hire wine captains to 
help custom ers match  
wines with food.

B a l e s t r e r i  sa id  he 
planned to expand his 400- 
bottle wine list to 1,000 by 
the epd of the year.

Tw o F lo r id a
resta u ra te u rs , Leonce 
Picot and A1 Kocab, seU so 
much wine at their three 
restaurants that they have 
converted an old ice ­
making plant Into a storage 
warehouse whose contents 
Picot values at about $1 
million wholesale for wine 
alone.

In a telephone Interview, 
P ic o t  e s tim a te d  the  
restaurants' annual retail 
wine sales at about |1.7 
million for bottled wines.

He said they also sell about 
900 cases of champagne 
and about 1,760 cases of red 
and white wines by the 
glass annually.

He said they recently 
opened the warehouse to 
retail sales for regular 
p a tro n s  of th e ir  
restaurants: the Down 
Under and Casa Vocchia In 
Ft. Lauderdale and La 
Vleille Maison in Boca 
Raton.

The warehouse -offers 
wine by the case, cheese, 
caviar, fresh p a ^ ,  and 
c h in a , c r y s t a l  and  
glassware like that used at 
their restaurants — all at 
nofrllls prices.

The initial warehouse 
sales brochure offers 89 
wines, including cham­
pagne and other sparkling 
wines, at 12-bottle case 
prices that range from 942

for a  1979 white Chevalier 
de Vedrioe Bordeaux to 
$140 for a case of Momm’s 
Cordon Rouge 1975.

Statistics from industry 
sources document the ex­
tent of the trend.

White wine sales alone 
grew 513 (s ic ) percent 
between 197080, says Mar­
vin R. Sbanken, editor and 
publisher of Im ^ ct, a wine, 
and spirits newsletter. 
Shanken says white wine 
shipments in crease from 
SI m lllte  gallons to 190 
million u  Uut time.

He expects the trend to 
continue indefinitely — as 
a reflection of Americans’ 
preference for cold, light 
and refreshing drinks.

Red wine’s market share 
dropped from 50 percent in 
1970 to only 26 percent last 
year, Shanken added.

Liquor Store Magazine

reported recently that 
sales of imported white 
ta b le  w in es “ a r e  
explodiag.” Pour brands 
will sell m ore than 1 
million cases this year, 
says Abby Hannan, whose 
e s tim a te s  and tren d s  
appeared in the April issue 
of the trade publication. 
They are Riunlte Bianco 
and Bolla Soave, both 
Italian, and Blue Nun and 
Kreusch Llebfraumllchs, 
both German.

Even so, Harman says, 
"American whites account 
for 56 percent of U.S. table 
wine while white imports 
are responsible for about 
npercentof total table im­
ports.”

By 1965, he thinks, the 
list of imported white table 
wines selling more than 
100,(X)0 cases a year will 
grow to .about 60 brands.

How to read The Herald for free
Bargain-wise consumers know The Herald more than 

pays for itself. Using the many money-savings coupons 
in The |lerald every week, shoppers pay back their sub­
scription price and save even more. The Herald is a 
good investment.
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MaatSpaclals
BEEF C H U C K -B O N E L E S S  BEEF

Shoulder
Roasts

7 9

Look for our colorful 
1 6 i>aga circular. 
Watch for H in the 
mail or pick one 
up at your local 
A&P Store.
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Maat Specials
PORK P IC N IC S

Pork
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Shoulders
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.3^ London Broil *&£:
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Blade Steaks
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' Ground Beef
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Cube Steaks
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Colonial Bacon 
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Fleischmann’s Oleo ;^99*
ICALTtST-lIQHTN L lV tlV  a

Cottage Cheese ’i:89*
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Ched-O-Bit Cheese S99*
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Sealtest Yogurt 3ssM

Delicious Apples r .
npoBTta-twttT.ABCv-aiuMa
Red Emperor Grapes
CA IPO IM A -AACV  UEOICSS

Navel Oranges
CMa-rnuM-pLOMCiA
Pascal Celery

■M* FoncooMraunBAiAos-vitASM a
.59^ Fresh Spinach
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Romaine Lettuce
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Banquet Chicken
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Fire Starter
MAOf«TMiU.BA
Hibachi'.:;;-::
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Chock Full O'Nuts
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mom
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Rich’s Coffee Rich

Niblets Com
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S k ip a r C o u p o n  ^

BAK lO P tA

BSM Baked Beans
BiOtAAflOBBWT

CSC Cola’

1^  A A Q  BMMTII08W.L<flTA.0SMACAII0NIB(KAN
Progresso Soups
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Cooked Ham
019

nacK->Boi~TOMAro w
Heinz Keg-O-Ketchup
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EightOXi^k Coffee
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Viva Paper Towels
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Economize

Be your own butcher

W hether you use outdoor grills or Inside broilers, lamb kabobs m ake tasty  
party or everyday fare.Party fun

Do-it-yourself lamb kabobs 
party fun or everyday meal

Buying meats or poultry 
In Urge quanUUea can save 
you money, if you do the 
"b u tch e ii^ " yourself.

Belect a cut labeled "full 
round steak bone-in,” at 
le a s t  2 -in ch es th ick , 
weighing 4V6 to 5 pounds. 
At home, divide this cut 
into three well-known cuts 
you have probably bought 
separately: top round, bot­
tom round and eye round. 
T o  a s s u r e  ad ded  
tenderness for each of your 
round steaks, use a natural 
m e a t  te n d e r lz e r  in 
marinades.

An Oriental grilled steak 
serves 6 to 8; a BavarUn 
beef steak serves 3 to 4, 
and tangy sauteed steaks 
serve 2. The leftovers 
make excellent sandwiches 
or go well in a chef or meat 
salad, further stretching 
the dollars you paid for the 
initial large cut of meat.

Oriental Grilled 
Steak

4!i cup water
4 tablespoons margarine
V4 cup Worcestershire 

sauce
V4 cup soy sauce
V4 cup wine vinegar
3 tablespoons brown 

sugar
1 Ml tablespoons prepared 

mustard
Vk te a sp o o n  ground 

ginger
1 top round steak (about 

2Mi pounds), cut 2-inches 
thick, trinuned

1 Vk te a s p o o n s  u n­
seasoned natural meat 
tenderizer

In saucepan, combine 
first 8 ingredients; simmer 
10-15 minutes. Moisten 
meat with water. Sprinkle 
ev en ly  w ith h a lf  the 
amount of tenderizer and 
piece deeply with a fork; 
repeat on other side. (Use 
no salt.) Broil steak 4 to 5- 
inches from heat, 16-18 
m inu tes per sid e for 
medium, basting frequent­
ly  w ith  s a u c e . S lic e  
diagonally and serve with 
remaining sauce. This 
k itc h e n -te ste d  re c ip e  
makes 6-8 servings. 

Bavarian Beef Sleak 
2 slices bacon, chopped
1 large onion, chopped
2 tablespoons oil 
l^bottom round steak

(about 1 pound), cut 2- 
inches thick

1 teaspoon seasoned 
natural meat tenderizer 

Y4 cup water 
Vt cup beef stock 

cup wine vinegar 
1 tablespoon sugar 
Y4 teaspoon fennel seed 
Black pepper, to taste 
1 small apple, peeled and 

chopped
V4 medium cabbage, 

sliced
In large skillet, saute 

bacon and onion in oil until 
onion is tra n s lu c e n t; 
remove, drain and set 
aside. Moisten meat with 
water. Sprinkle evenly 
with half the amount of 
tenderizer and piece deep­
ly with fork; repeat on 
other side. Slice meat into 
V4-inch strips. (Use no

salt.) Brown thoroughly on 
both sides; drain fat. Com­
bine meat, bacon, onions 
and remaining ingredients. 
Cover and simmer, stirring 
occasionally. 20-25 minutes 
or until ten d er. T h is 
k itc h e n -te ste d  re c ip e  
makes 4 servings.

Tangy S au tee d  S le a k
2 large onions, sliced into’ 

Miinch rings
2 tablespoons oil
1 eye round steak (about 

Y4 pound), cut 2-inches 
thick

'/2  teaspoon seasoned 
natural meat tenderizer 

cup beef stock
2 tablespoons water
2 tablespoons butter or 

margarine
1 'h tablespoons lemon 

juice
Y4 teaspoon sugar
Vi teaspoon grated lemon 

peel
1 bay leaf, crushed
Black pepper, to taste
In large skillet, brown 

onions in oil; remove and 
set aside. S lice  m eat 
lengthwise into 4 ( ‘/2 inchi 
steaks. Moisten meat with 
water. Sprinkle evenly 
with half the amount of 
tenderrizer and piece deep­
ly with a fork; repeat on 
other side. (Use no salt.) 
Brown meat thoroughly on 
both sides. Combine meat, 
onions and remaining in­
g r e d ie n ts  ; s im m e r . 
stirring occasionally. 12-15 
minutes or until tender. 
This kitchen-tested recipe 
makes 2 servings.

Lamb ihiih kabobt have 
been around a long time. 
Skewer Cooking! Call it 
w hat you w ill. This  
e x c i t i n g  m eth od  of 
preparing lamb began in 
ancient Persia. Wealthy 
sheiks and their soldiers 
roasted meaty chunki of 
lam b with fru its  and 
vegetables on swords.

Today, we have outdoor 
grills a ^  indoor broilers 
on which to prepare this 
delightful meal on a stick. 
Easy? Yon bet. Fun? It 
sure can be.

s u b tle  f la v o r s ,  then  
refrigerate. Take a few 
m in u te s  to  th in k  of 
vegetables, fruits, other 
meats such as sausage or 
bacon, and exotics like 
olives, kumquats or spiced 
apples that are suited to 
the kabob concept. At your' 
convenience, parboil the 
vegetables that need it; 
prepare the other food 
items. Place them in an at­
tractive arrangement on a 
large platter or sectioned 
lazy susan and cover with 
plaHic wrap. Tuck away in 

le

things they like best from 
your nice assortment. The 
cooking- takes minutes and 
in no time at all, with no 
fuss or muss, an excitingly 
different dinner is enjoyed 
by all.

Zesly Barbecued 
Lamb Shiah Kabob 

4 servings
1 tablespoon cooking oil 
Ml cup finely chopped 

onion
I-V4 cups catsup 
Y4 cup water

1 teaspoon chili powder 
Vk teaspoon celery salt 
Vk teaspoon dry mustard
2 pounds boneless lamb, 

cut into 1-Mi inch cubes
8 slices zucchini, 'about 

V4-inch thick 
16 pitted jumbo ripe 

olives
12 cherry tomatoes 
Heat oil in saucepan. Add 

onion and cook until limp. 
And catsup, water, brown 
s u g a r , v in e g a r ,  
Worcestershire sauce, chili 
ppwder, celery salt and 
mustard. Simmer about 30

want to cooK the kabolM, 
put the lean danks of lamb 
in the marinkte to o th e r

Let everyone assemble 
th e ir  own kabobs on 
skew ers, choosing the

3 tablespoons firmly 
packed light brown sugar

* ® *"*'"caaionally. If necMsary,
add a little additional 
water during cooking.

vinegar 
1 ta b le sp o o n

Worcestershire sauce

Thred Iamb onto four 
skewers. Parboil zucchini 
about 3 minutes. Drain 
well. Alternately thread 2 
zucchini slices, 4 olives and' 
3 cherry tomatoes on each 
of 4 additional skewers. 
Grill lamb kabobs 7 to 8 
minutes on each side, or 
until desired degree of 
doneness, brushing lamb 
occasionally with barbecue 
sauce. G rill vegetable 
kabobs about 4 minutes on 
each side, or to desired 
d e g re e  of d o n e n e ss , 
bnuhing occasionally with

HnsdSnjbiirbwxMl
and serve with kabobs.

n p m
I Open 7 Days  

For Your 
® Convenience!

Menus
Manchester

Cafeteria menus which 
will be served May U-15 at 
Manchester Public Schools 
are as follows:

Monday: Hot dog on roll, 
potato puffs, whole kernel 
com, milk, chilled pears.

T u e s d a y : C h ick en  
vegetable aoup, cheese piz­
za, milk, apple crisp.

Wednesday: Breaded 
pork patty with gravy, 
whipp^ potato, buttered 
green hMM, bread, batter, 
milk, nmy applesauce.

Thuraday:. Shells with 
meat satice, fotsed salad 
(c h o ice  of d re ssin g ), 
bread, butter, milk, jello 
with topping.

Friday: Tomato soup, 
toastiMi cheese sandwich, 
vegetable nibblers, milk, 
peanut butter cookies.

Elderly
Menus whlcb will be 

s e rv e d  M ay 11-15 a t  
M ayfair and WestbiU  
Gardens to Manchester 
residents 60 or older, are 
as follows:

M onday: C antonese  
p ork , s te a m e d  r i c e ,  
Chinese nooue garnish, 
tossed salad with drssshig. 
M andarin oranga and 
pinsapplt chunks; brand, 
m argarine, skim milk, 
CofNe er tea.

Tninday: Roast beef au 
Jns, m ashed potatoes, 
sncchtai squash, spice 
c a k e ,  r y e  b re a d ,  
m argarine, skim milk,, 
coffee or tea.

W ednesday: Turkey  
tetrasslni, green , beans, 
tossed salad witti dressing, 
fru ite d  g e la tin  w ith  
w h ip ^  topping, wheat 
bread, margarine, sUm  
milk, qslfBe or ten.

T koffdny: Chili coa  
Cnrnn, s team ed  r ic e ,  
tpisidJUlirt with dresKhig, 
f r e W  i r n i t ,  b re a d ,  
g a i w i ^ ^ a k l m  mUk,

m d a y : Biiked breaded 
flak, mixed vcgeUblas, 
stewed tom atoes, fruit 
eoektaU, oatmeal cookie, 
wfesat hrsnd. margartae,.

skim milk, coffee or tea.
The menu is subject to 

chuige.

Coventry ^
All schools

Monday: Cheeseburger, 
whole potato, buttered 
vegetable, chilled pineap­
ple.

Tuesday: Ravioli with 
meatsauce, green beans, 
Italian bread, peaches. 

W ed n esd ay : J u i c e ,

turkey and gravy, stuiting, 
cranberry sauce, carrot 
coins, icy juicy.

Thursday: M eat and 
cheese grinder, french 
fries, tossed salad, cup 
c a k e . Sa lad  b ar a lso  
a v a ila b le  a t C ap tain  

j)Iatban Hale School.
Frid ay: Ju ice , pizza, 

tossed salad, fruit cup.

Robertson breakfast 
Monday: Juice, English 

muffin, milk.

Tuesday: Fruit, Danish, 
milk.

Wednesday: Juice, eggs, 
toast, milk.

Thursday: Juice, cereal, 
raisins, milk.

Frid ay; Fru it, raisin 
toast, milk.

Bolton
Elementary-Center 
Monday: Gub sandwiches, 
pickle chips, celery sticks.

potato chips, white cake.
Tuesday: Chili dog, 

baked beans, com chips, 
gelatin cubes.

Wednesday: Lasagna 
with meatsauce, buttered 
bread, green beans, chilled 
peaches.

Thursday: Pizza, fruit 
juice, tossed salad, gelatin 
with topping.

F r id a y ; Tuna boat, 
potato puffs, celery and 
carrot sticks, fruit upside 
down coke.

Fresh'Grade^A

LARGE
EGGS

D O ZE N  C A R TO N

Top 0 ’ The Morning
sliced Bacon

0 n «
Pound  

Package

Farm er's P ride
ENGLISH 
MUFFINS m

J2 O2. 6 Count Paclioge

cu m beH an d  fa rm s
100% Pure Florida
Orange Juice

from concentrate

cumberUmd 
farm s

Old Fashioned
SWISS 

CHOCOLATE 
FUDGE

Ice Cream
W ^ ll  make It with all natural 
flarars. purs cans sugar and 
farm f r ^  milk and cream
dirsot from our own dalryll H a lf Gal.

You can taato the dUhroneol ^ 9  Reg. f  1.99
Wo losorvo Hi# Right to Limil QuanHtioi .

Homs A Pricoi ifloctlvo Wod., May B thru Sun., May 10 M
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Tips for using selfrrising flour I  +X^i>-:r^
Can you ragfMt m lpM  Cut ihortmibig Into nour S c u m  PtlUbury’s Uilbleached Sulf-Riilno ■ T ^ | |  TCl K. I f l

for tolf^rlaliiii flourF with fork until conilftcncy Sclf*Mflnf or Unblonchcd Flour I  "iS.. .VTzr. . .  ^  kM milk s.if.RuuS sinur itk CUM f rmlv Dackod ■  I
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^ vegetable side dish will add Important nutrients and
O O i T l D i n a l l O r i o  menu variety with interesting colors, flavors and textures.

Budget-wise meals
If dinnertime seems like table in a lightly lemon- 

an instant replay' of the flavored rice and tomato 
same budget-wise meats, mixture that complements 
splugering on an expensive any entry and adds lively
cut need not be the answer 

U ncle  B e n 's  ' 
Converted' Brand Rice, 
which receives this very 
special treatment, cooks 
up into firm, separate 
pram s that won't get 
broken apart or sticky 
when v e g e ta b le s  or 
seasonings are stirred in

color to the menu An op­
tional topping of crumbled 
feta cheese adds an authen­
tic greek flavor bonus'”t 

Ureriun Spiniwh Hire 
1 medium onion, chopped 
1 tablespoon olive oil or 

vegetable oil 
2-1 2 cups water 
1 cup Uncle Ben's*

The foolproof directions Converter' Brand Rice 
and no-watch cooking time 1 tablespoon lemon juice 
are important plusses for 2 teaspoons garlic sale 
busy cooks, and because 1 2  teaspoon grated 
converted' Brand Rice lemon peel 
produces more cooked rice 2 cups firmly packed 
per cup of uncooked rice fresh spinach, leaves 
than other brands, it's a coarsely chopped 
budget pleaser, too 1 me d i u m t o ma t o .

Fresh green beans take chopped 
an extraordinary pizzaz 1/3 cup crumbled feta 
when combined with rice, cheese (optionall 
diced ham.  Parm esan Cook onion in oil in large 
cheese and seasonings in saucepan until tender but 
the Italian Manner. The en- not brown. Add water and 
tree can be as simple as bring to a boil. Stir in rice, 
meatloaf, cubed steaks or lemon juice, garlic salt and 
roast chicken, yet the meal lemon peel. Cover and 
will seem special with this simmer 20 minutes. Stir in 
flavorful accompaniment spinach, remove from 
Green  Bean Ri sot t o  heat Let stand covered un- 
Primavera is a colorful, til all liquid is absorbed, 
satisfying side dish with about 5 minutes. Stir in 
enough protein and hearty tomato and sprinkle with 
flavor to allow meat por- cheese, if desired. Makes 6 
tions to be smaller, and servings 
t h e r e f o r e  mor e  f fpren I t run Rinoi to
economical Primavpru

Grecian Spinish Rice 1 cup Uncle Ben s* 
brings frest spinish to the Converted* Brand Rice

1 garlic clove, minced
1 tablespoon vegetable 

oil or olive oil
.1-3/4 cups water
3 4 cup d ry  whi t e  

wine 1-1'4 t easpoon 
sale 1 /2 pound frest green 
beans, cut diagonally into 
1-inch slices

1/2 cup finely diced 
cooked ham

2 to 3 tablespoons grated 
Parmesan cheese

Cook rice and garlic in 
oil in large saucepan over 
low heat, stirring constant­
ly. about 5 minutes or until 
rice is golden. Add water, 
wine and salt: bring to a 
boil. Cover and simmer 10 
minutes. Stir in beans. 
Cover and s immer  10 
minutes. Remove from 
heat; llet stand covered un­
til all liquid is absorbed. 
Stir in ham Sprinkle with

cheese to serve. Makes 6 
servings.

•t recipe*
for •elf>rUliig flowrr
The moat popular uae for 

the flour is biaculU, and 
this recipe is a classic. If 
you have never made 
baking powder biscuits 
"from scratch" before, 
you will be delighted with 
how easy it is to bake soft, 
tender biscuits with self­
rising flour. "The tips show 
quick ways to vary the 
flavor.

For pie crust, use yqur 
favorite pastry recipe but 
omit the salt.

In many recipes from Its 
test kitchens, Pillsbury in­
cludes a tip on substituting 
self-rising flour, whenever 
it can replace all purpose 
flour.
Whai kind* of recipe* 
work with *elf>ri*ing 

flour?
T he f lo u r  b e s t  

dem onstrates its con­
venience in simple recipes 
with only a few extra in­
gredients, such as biscuits 
and shortcakes. But it can 
be substituted for all pur­
pose flour in most recipes 
calling for baking powder, 
including cakes, cookies, 
quick breads, muffins and 
coffee cakes.

As a general rule, use the 
same amount of flour but 
omit the baking powder 
and salt called for in the 
recipe. You may need to 
m ak e  a d d i t io n a l  
adjustments if a second 
leavening agent, such as 
baking soda is also needed 
for the recipe.
How do I *lore self-rising 

flour?
Keep it as you would any 

all purpose flour, in a tight­
ly covered container stored 
in a cool, dry place. The 
leavening agent will retain 
its strength  for many 
months.

H lB ru itR
2 cups Pillsbury's Best* 

Self-Rising or Unbleached 
SelfRising Flour 

cup shortening
4̂ cup milk

Heat oven to 450° F, 
Lightly spoon flour into 
measuring cup: level off.

S cups P l l l s b ^ ’s Best* 
incy SeM-Rlsii _

of coarse meal. Add milk Self-Rising Flour 
all at once; stir with fork 2 tablespoons sugar 
Just until a soft dough Vk cup shortening 
forms. Turn dough onto V* cup half-andrhalf or 
lightly floured surface; whipping cream 
sprinkle dough lightly with 2 tablespoons margarine 
flour. Knead gently 10 or butter, melted 
times or until no longer 1 tablespoon sugar 
sticky. Roll out dough to Vk- 1 cup whipping cream, 
inch thickness; cut with 2- whipped 
inch floured biscuit cutter. 6 cu p s  s lic e d  
P lace b iscu its on un- straw berries or other 
greased cookie sheet. Bake favorite fruit 
a t 450°F. for 8, to 12 Heat oven to 425° F. 
minutes or until golden Lightly spoon flour into 
brown. 12 biscuits.
Variations:

1. Crispy Buscuits. Roll 
out dough to Vk to Vk-inch

or

or

to 425 
spoon flour 

measuring cup; level off. 
In large bowl, combine 
flour and sugar, cu t 
sho rten ing  into flour

thickness. Cut with floured mixture with fork until 
2 Ys-inch biscuit cutter, consistency of coarse 
Bake at 425°F. for 8 to 10 meal. Add half-and-half to

Udbleached 
Flour

m  cups firmly packed 
brown sugar.

1 teaspoon cinnainoa 
Vk teaspoon nu tm ^
1 Clip peach Jam 

preserves 
1 cup buttermilk 
4k cup m argarine 

butter, softened
* egg*
1 cup chopped pecans 
Vk cup sugar

Carmel Sauce 
Vk cup firmly packed 

boown sugar 
\vk cup sugar 
Vk cup m argarine or 

butter
Vk cup half-and-half 
1 teaspoon vanilla 
Heat oven to 350°F. 

Grease and flour 13x9-inch

victim  says

minutes.
2. Buttermilk Biscuits. 

Substitute buttermilk for 
milk. Add Vk teaspoon 
soda.

3. Sausage or Bacon 
Biscuits. Fry Vk lb. sausage 
or bacon. Drain well; 
crumble. Add to flour­
sh o r te n in g  m ix tu re , 
Refrigerate leftovers.

4. Cheese Biscuits. Add 8 
oz. (2 cups) shredded Ched­
d ar cheese to flo u r­
shortening mixture.

5. Cornmeal Biscuits. 
Substitute Vk cup cornmeal 
for Vk cup flour.

6. Increase milk to 1 cup. 
Drop dough by tablespoons 
onto greased cookie ^ee t.

Deluxe Shortcake
Shortcakes are a snap 

with self-rising flour. This 
large 8-inch shortcake 
makes an elegant deswrt.

Hour mixture; stir Just un- pan. Ughtly spoon flour 
til m oistened. Spread into measuring cup; level 
batter in 2 ungreased 8- off. In large bowl, combine 
inch round pans. Brush all cake ingredients expect 
melted margarine over pecans and V* cup sugar, 
h a tte r ; sprinkle with Beat 1 minute at low speed 
sugar. to combine ingredients;

Bake at 425° F. for 12 to beat 3 minutes at highest 
18 minutes or until light speed. Pour batter into 
golden brown. Immediate- prepared pan. Sprinkle 
ly remove from pans; cool pecans and Vk cup sugar 
completely. Fill and top over top. Bake at 350°F. 
layers with whipped cream for 45 to 55 minutes or until 
and s t r a w b e r r i e s ,  toothpick inserted near
Refrigerate leftovers. 12 center comes out clean, 
servings. To prepare caram el

This moist, flavorful sauce, combine all in-
cake is topped with a warm gred ien ts in m edium  
caramel sauce. Since the saucepan. Bring to boil, 
recipe uses self-rising stirring constantly. Cook
flour, you do not need to over low heat, stirring oc- 
add salt or leavening. c a s io n a lly , ab o u t 10 

Easy Jam Cake minutes or until thickened.
Cake Serve warm caramel sauce

3Vk cups P illsbury 's  over cake. 12 servings. 
B est*  S e lf-R ising  or
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VALUABLE COUPON

FORMAL GENT
730 SILAS DEANE HWY. 

WETHERSFIELD • 563-4810
DUKE STYLE 

TUXEDOS
■•10 DUKES ■■

Sit*** Csndls 
Ic* Blu* Navy 
Brown Sky gius 
Burgundy Tsn 
Qr**n Dusty Ross

Vz Price
REG. 563.00 NOW

$31.50
TUXEDO RENTALS Tw

Proms WfJjj] M »7iV411 Clubs

MOTHER’S  DAY SPECIAL

* B .O O

M5.00

COOKED BONELESS STUFFED 
ROASTER CHICKEN 
Dwttpnwd for OBsy sHoIng.
Stuffod with hoiiM-ma<io drotaing and 
complata with Gray Ladga gravy.

COOKED 10-12 lb. TURKEY 
Stulfad with a hom a-m ada  
draaaing and complata with 1 
q t  of gravy.

PICK UP AT 11:30 A.M. ALL READY TO TREAT MOM. 
Ordara m utt ba In by FrI., May B

MARLBOROUGH RD., GLASTONBURY 633-6906

MT. VERNON
DAIRY STORES

244 Broad St. 
M anchester

653 Center St. 
Manchester

to save.on to/o special 
Lawn-Boy mowers.

IFLETCHER GLASS CO.
n1«f WWiCMf iTfll0*#r JS Y««ri f»s>rsawc« 

t
COMPLETE AUTO OLAEE SERVICE

W INDOW G L A SS  • M IRRO RS • G LA SS  
FURNITURE TO PS • PICTURE FRAMING 

• F IREPLACE a DOOR M IRRO RS 
• TUB EN C LO SU R ES • SPEC IAL  WORK

|^ « N C H tS T tN  649-452^
EstHMte Cbdy Ghren

54 McKEE ST, MANCMESTI* 
(Off Center Sl )

icauiCTOBtm
MBM run

PUSTKS R  STOCK
.100-Vi"-3/U"'/."

Model 7071

Buy th« push ntoilsl aiMl savs $50*. Buy ths ssH • 
propsllsd for what you’d pay for a push modal!**

Both models. 7071 2rpushabie. 
and 8071,21 seitpropelied, have 
these big Lawn-Boy leatures

• Fingertip starts with electronic 
ignition *

• Fingertip wheel ad|ustment

S p e c ia l O ffe r:

• Extra-capacily, side-mounted grass 
catcher ^

• Optional extras: rear bag. 
Mow-N-Mulch"*. leaf shredder, leal 
bag

Push Mods) 
7071

Sstfpropsllsd 
Model 8071

•249*»
•299*»

CAPITOL EQUIPMENT
38 M A IN  ST.

6 4 3 - 7 9 B 8

WE’VE MOVED
MT. VERNON DAIRY STORE

WE’VE MOVED OUR HARTFORD RD. 
STORE TO A GREAT NEW LOCATION 

ONLY ONE MILE AWAY
NEW LOCATION
653 Center St.

LOOK FOR BIG RED BARN AT THE AM ACO  GAS 
STATION AT THE C O R N E R  OF C E N T E R  & ADAMS S T S .

LAND 0 LAKES BUTTER

1.69 LAND CO LAKES
'UAwVt

limit 2

M O S E R  F A R M S  I C R I S P - a i r e  
GRADE A WHITE LARGE I NATIVE APPLES MAGS &

CORTLANDS

S A L E  E N D S  S A T  . M A Y  9. 198T

By MAR'niM SLOANE 
DEARSUPERMARiaBT 

SHOPPCR -  Savaral 
week! ago I read your 
suggextloea to help oom- 
panlet eliminate MfM of 
the problems with their re­
fund o ffe rs . H ere is 
another suggesUon that 1 
hope you timl add to your 
list:

When a company lenda 
us coupoM in the mail, it 
shouldn't print on the 
e n v e lo p e  " v a lu a b le  
coupoM Inside."

I shnt in my proofs for an 
offer that (Htomiaed me |2  
worth of coupoM. Gueaa 
what I found inside the 
envelope with this notice 
on the front In big bold 
letters? Nothing!

Obviously, my coupoM 
were too much of a tem- 
pration for someone. How 
can we get the companies 
to send us our coupons in 
p la in  e n v e lo p e s?  — 
Dorothy S. from Orlando, 
Fla.

DEAR DOROTHY -  I 
hope th a t  a ll of the  
customer-relatloM people 
who tell me tbat they r ^  
this column will carefully 
consider your good advice.

DEAR SUPERMARKET 
SHOPPER — Why would 
several supermarkets, all 
within a 8-mlle radius, 
offer double coupoM for 
almost 100 consecutive 
weeks and then eliminate 
double coupons within a 
tw o-w eek p erio d ?  — 
Puzzled from Middletown, 
NY.

; DEAR PUZZLED -  
•Double coupons are a form 
!of price war.
'. One store in an area 
‘offers to double the value 
of m an u f a c t u r e r t ’i

Shoppdt

the others are usually 
more than willing to go 
back to businesa as usual. 
So, the beat philoabpliy for 
shoppers is to stmplv enjoy 
double-couiKms vmiM they 
can.
Refand of the day

Write to the following ad­
dress to obtain the form 
required by this offer: 
Signal Mouthwash f l  
Savings Offer, P.O. Box 
6612, Maple Plain, Mlrni. 
55348. S m  a stamped, 
self-addreaied envelope 
with your request. This 
offer expires S ^ .  SO, 1981. 
Clip *n* file refunds 
(Week of May S)
Dairy, oils, margarine, 
diet foods (File 2)

Clip out Ihli file and keep 
it with similar cash-off 
coupons — beverage 
refound of fa ra  with 
beverage coupons, for 
example. Start collecting 
the needed proofs of 
purchase while looking for 
the required refund forms 
at the supermarket. In 
ne wsp ape rs  ' and 
m agasinei, and when 
trading with friends. 
Offers  may not be 
available in all areas of the 
country .-Allow 10 weeks to 
receive anch refund.

Soft, Soft Whipped, Diet 
Margarine, Light Tasty 
Spread Expires Sept. 90, 
1901.

BORDEN Norman 
Rockwell Prints. Receive 
four lull-color Norman 
Rockwell  "S a tur da y  
Evening P oit” covers. 
Send the required refund 
form, the k m  from any 
Borden product and M 
cents for postage and 
handling. Expires Dec. 91,' 
1001. '

FLEISCHMANN’s Egg 
Beate rs  Free  Offer.  
Receive a coupon for a free 
17-ounce package of Egg 
Beaters. Send the required 
certificate to which you 
have affixed four proofof- 
purchase seals from the in­
sides of any Egg Beaters 
packages. Expbes Dec. 91, 
UOl.

the back panel with milk 
pitcher symbols from any 
two packages of Velvaeta 
Slices proceii cheese 
spread. Ehqtirea June 90, 
1901.

PILLSBURY-KRAFT- 
OSCAR MYER Cheese ‘n’

, Wiener Crescent Refund. 
Receive a |1 refund. Send 
the required refund form, 
tbe label(s) from one 
ei^t-roU or two four-roll 
packages of Pillsbury 
Crescent Dinner Rolls, the

and net-weight sUtement 
from one package of Kraft 
Natural Sharp or New 
York Extra Sharp Cheddar 
Cbeeae and the label from 
one package O^car Meyer 
Wieners or Bmf Franks. 
Expires Dec. 31, 1981.

STO U FFE R S L ean 
Cuisine. Receive a |1 re­

fund. Send the required re- required refund form and 
fund form and the Unlver- jg  fro n t panels from  
sal Product Code symbols weight Watchers Mixes for 
from the backs of any three sajgd Dressings, Sauces or 
Lean Cuisine Entrees. Gravies. The camera is 
Expires Dec. 31, 1901. also avaiUble for 10 proofs 

WEIGHT WATCHERS and 88.95. Expires Dec. 31, 
Mixes New Profile Offer, iggj.
Receive a Kodak Winner Copyright 1981, United 
Pocket Camera. Send the Feature* Syndicate Ine,

KRAFT VelveeU Slices 
|1 Refund. Receive four 95- 
cent coupon!. Send the 
Required refund form and _horae and wagon symbol

Poultry gains 
in popularity

TRETORN

American cooks 'are 
choosing poultry more and 
m o re  o f te n .  T h e ir  
purchases of chickens have 
Increased every year since 
1976.

On a per-capltal basis, 
poultry consumption is 36 
percent higher than in 1967, 
while consumption of red 
meats is up only 1 percent. 
Eggs lost 11 percent of 
their market during these

years, and dairy products 
gained only 1 percent.

Beef, however, is still 
the preferred meat, con­
sumers with full purses 
and wallets tend to buy 
beef.

“Large beef supplies in 
the first quarter will give 
way to greatly reduced se- 
condquarter supplies," 
warns the U.S. Agriculture 
Department.

The foUowing often are

Icustomen away from the l lw ^ h m d
competition. The other "

i a l K ^ W ^ p S T w  BLUE BONNET • and the double-coupon war Savlnga Book.”
We shopper, benefit R e « ‘ve the “W n l ^  

.fromthiscompeUtion.But, HomeSaviy 
; like other types of price
< wars, double coupons must and four UrivemIProdurt 
Uventually come to an end.
1 When one atore gives up, ̂  following: Blue Bonnet

D e a r
A b b y

# if - r  9
Abigail Van Buren

pleasant pact
DEAR ABBY: In your recent column concerning pre­

marital contracts. I’m glad you agreed that they made

TEN N IS C LA SSIC  
' women

41 Koniiiuri '*’ 
i*s l)v In  io m "  

R'dltilr siivin^s' 
({ititliiv { rail s  

uinsti ip  tA'ilh a 
(Ird ad v an tau r  

liL'htwriL't)! 
m m lor t  lo|)

I H T t o r m a r u  I- 

Iraltirt 's. 
Sinashmu* 

Wninrn s 5 10 
It whiu* ll hliic 

in»'n s  7 10 
tmi i iaw  ir im 
i l in i S a m rd a v

suallv s2T> .11 
i r o m ’nt s io rcs

V IM .  DAamK*f4
M l  ->4iN I1l F A C f V O f  F H O M  O IR IC  f O R k  9 0 R  f l A f l  A O O R IA M VMorvtlwn l7g«oA«efi*vnllo>alK>m SKoe lowmogvnA«»t4 a»*

BUUTIFULLY
oirroouD

MTRODUCING!

THE ROSELINE 
COLLECTION

from J.Q. Ditraiid • Franco

4-r’OtHMR PUTES 4-7V'DEIURT flATEIA-ivomt. curt 4-UUCIRt

O P E N  
6 A.M.  to 

11 P.M.

18-ptece
hostess
•at

O Y m

7 D A Y S  
A W E E K

c k H f y m o R

irnm I r. n i j f l f sn  ' ' ' /  '•//■ t • /

ROSELINE STEMWARE ./J',

4-Dack

1 . R e aH 39

• I offer my own experience as a testimonial. 1 have
Ibeen widowed twice, run a very luccesaful buslneaa and 
'a t 39 am now married to a wonderful man of 56. We have
'a  pre-marital contract, and It’a no problem at all. I gave 
my husband the beautiful 9,000-acre ranch we Uve on 
and an allowance for life. So far It’a been a p ^ e c t
marriage. I work at my bualneaa all day and come h ^
to a chilled martini and a gounnet dinner prepare by 

Imv »««s»«nd, wbo’a a marveloui cook. While he jokea 
i S ^ t b S n g  a "kept m«i,” 1 know he U delighted with, 
‘this arrangement. o - i - J
! He putters around tbe ranch and plays goU. ^  Is a
wonderful father to the children of my second m a r r i ^
On our flrat annivavary I gave him a paid-up county
club memberahlp loc Ule and I find myieU c o n tlm ^ y
buying him preaento to Miow my devotkn. lU a is the

Ibest business deal I ever made!.near uuau—  HAPPY IN SANTA YNB2
DEAR HAPPYi And your huslMuid made a pretty

good deaL tool ------------- _

DEAR ABBY: I know I muat have many aym-
Mrthiiera 00 thto ot». I naed aoma npdtMlate advlm on
howto took (amlnlne and gtomorouf at the oftlee

i without letting men think la m  on the i n ^ .
! If I wear hlgh-faihlon clothes that flatter myiigure 
‘ and briiw out tbe beet In me, all the old creepe (never 
the nice eligible men) make paieea at me. If I to
repel the old creeps, I’m further into oW-maidhood. I a m ' '
90. Any suggMtiona?~ v ~ e e -  co nfu sed

DEAR CONFUSEOi “Nlee, eUglMe men" never 
pesMU at anyone. A guide to appropriate office 

; attire ineludm a tong list of don’u i w, ,
Don't strive tor “glamour” in the office. Femlnl- 

'• IV.yes.Glamonr.not Don’tweerahorta,ortoo-ehort
• slilrts. Don't wear plunging neekUnea or anything

light. See-through Mouses ars a no-no. 
the J— h Jewelry at heme. Don’t wear eoeht^  

•dolhM  to work. Fanta are fine If they ere well-
• tailored and worn with a matching hwhet. Lounging
; |ifj— - Jnmpanits or Jenna with 'r.ehlria are inap-

• ‘̂ rUmTioltow the ehove suggeatlo^ and tke old
; stlH asake pmsm at yon, yen d hotter cheek
the M  to your eye.

•  • •
' DBA"  ABBY: While agraeliii with your oommant,|'

A i IwriT lo MVf thukSs A 
iZSSSnifilim m tay, 'Him ktodrfyon tonottee.’” TMa 
I politod out to roe by a Soatbam gaallaman who la

' DEAR D.I He may he a writer e l  dbttoetton, hnt 
j^V ao ig M lh m an .

gM Pm  BV song UMEH. by COTV
SOFIA SPRAY 
COLOGNE

jiSSfrUE SPRAY 
toy REVLON
CmKHTUnO MTimU IfMV
SCOUNDREL

S1ATC l IN C

.  MIRROR-aO-LIOHTLY

? MAKE-UP 
,  MIRROR
( $ 0 9 9
f  ggdi

FOOT RELIEF

POLLENEX
FOOTBATH

$ 4 C 9 9
■  each

1 ^ ^ ^ ^ R E G . 8 5 ^

M S i S f

rfteSH  FROM OUR DCLI ,

" ncMssintTsttnuaaTnrm V anusewu.csaumnaa.immm

 ̂ CONAIR 
iM B O P A C K
feOBT B1I.M. U U  MN. REBATE II J l

COBAmCURlDAZZlERTM ' I
mmuermt

INSTANT
HAIRSETTER

COST 819.98, U U  Mn. BE8ATE 82.88

* 1 7 - ® ®■  RUATI

l a s o s a m H
i H O T V e d S

V^MACABONI^.
fOimCOOLESLAW

, 5 9 iS..
BINIQUEr 
OF ROSES

*k  IHI HOMSNIIC «l wavs PIlPUl lONG SIlMMin
y m  Q r i c o c  aMiHicaNHiauiYHOSi iNSPiMfoiHiscniKcnoN

l l U O C O  1 1 • HT aHCMOH MOCMNC.

#
18 P IE C E  R O S E S

B E V E R A G E W A R E  S E T ^

___ _____  _ ^  1 /VFOR MOM, -
Wf NUV^ U M I R  ^  
YOU THI  l O V M  Y M  
11 P l l C t  H O S I S  
HiVERAGI  WAHl  St T 
S n  A Gl A M O R O U S  
MOUU ANY T IMi  
DAY OR NIGHT

SET CONTA INS
. -I-, 0/ M.»n 'I*

<7 0/  B i l l  A K I. I K«0  
'■ ■ o n /  D U U d il  JU K  I

riOTCOflFEE 1A«~'
TOBO-----------------------------EM ---- -

214 SPENCER ST. NUNCH.
** **^*r***nMS£SSm*S*Sflisinn t*7MNl. OmmSSS

* ,m * ,.w » .» .n .^ ..« W 2 ^
_______________mb: jfallSBitf <556 rsyiBSBR* Writ BP —f .  H H
5 58<g. Cemrtm  WARtWHIi 6 0 0 0 CORPOMTIOW 1991
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Handicapped staff 
produce radio show

c~ CAMBRIDGE, Mass (UPI) -  
The strains of Stevie Wonder open 
the radio program

A newsman delivers the latest 
national and local roundup, followed 
by a quick summary of upcoming 
cultural and community events.

The pleasant voice of Andrea West 
introduces the show's guest 

Sound like just another talk show’’ 
Not quite

Miss West, a paraplegic, is 
thought to be the only handicapped 
person in the country producing a 
radio program aimed at the disabled 
with a totally handicapped staff.

"Disability Directions." born 
from Miss West's concern about the 
lack of visibility of the handicapped 
in the media and discrimination 
they fa ce , has a ired  e v e r y  
Wednesday night for more than a 
year on WMBR

The show is produced in a building 
basement on the Massachusetts 
Institute of Technology campus 

The program's popularity has 
spread so rapidly among both dis­
abled and able-bodied listeners that 
Miss West IS optimistically planning 
a similar show on cable television in 
Boston when the c ity  gets a 
franchise

This IS a success story, but one 
based on perseverence. " the 32- 
year-old brunette said as she deftly 
maneuvered the wheelchair around 
her combination office-apartment 

"Even during the International 
Year of Disabled Persons, youth and 
beauty are still very much a part of 
the .American culture. " Miss West 
said

The aWareness that "the han­
dicapped are not only often cut off 
from the population at large but also 
isolated from other people with dis- 
ablilities made me want to do 
something to bring us all together. " 
she said

What better way than through 
the media with a radio program 
directed at the interests of the dis­
abled but broad enough to intrigue 
the general listening audience as 
well'""

Miss West is the first one to admit 
the handicapped have special 
problems

"It doesn't occur to normal people 
to think much about the obstacles 
that face the handicapped." she 
said I certainly didn't "

But three years ago. Miss West 
accidentally fell several stories 
from the balcony of an apartment 
She was hospitalized for six months, 
which gave her more than enough 
time to think about shattered 
dreams and a future without the use 
of her legs

While hospitalized Miss West 
vividly remembered her student 
days at Skidmore College, the years 
she spent living in p^urope running 
her own candle-making business in

Copenhagen, moving to a farm in 
Norway, and the homesickness that 
brought her to Boston to study com­
munications.

"When the doctors told me they 
were very sorry but there was no 
cure for my injury. 1 thought about 
all the things I loved, like playing 
tennis with my mother, dancing and 
roller skating. " Miss West said

"There was also plenty of time to 
wonder about what I was going to 
do. and would I be able to do it "

"Sound’ grim"’ It is grim You 
think about suicide and talk it over 
with your buddy in the next bed who 
is also spinal cord injured and knows 
exactly what you're talking about. " 
she said.

After deciding upon life, the next 
step is "making a peace treaty with 
the wheelchair and learning to ask 
for help "

Ms West underwent four months 
of rehabilitation, but requesting 
help is still a very real part of her 
life.

"Every time 1 come to a curb or a 
revolving door, 1 need assistance, " 
she said.

Finding an apartment accessible 
to wheelchairs took months The one 
Miss West has is in a .State Elderly 
and Handicapped Housing unit A 
■̂amp outside leads to an elevator, 

the door is wide enough for a 
wheelchair to pass through, a low 
stove and sink plus high electrical 
outlets make an ideal arrangement 
for someone who cannot walk.

"Who's going to think about 
something as basic as a ramp unless 
they're interested in attracting han­
dicapped tenants’’ " she asked 

The news stories in her program 
are an outgrowth of the problems 
the handicap share 

Programs have dealt with in­
adequate facilities in housing and 
buildings, the inaccessability of the 
entire Massachusetts Bay Transpor­
tation Authority fleet of buses and 
trains, the problems of finding a job 
that a wheelchair-bound person can 
get to and from.

But news editor David Moran, 
paralyzed from the waist down, also 
focuses on the impact of the Reagan 
administration's proposed budget 
cuts on individual programs for the 
handicapped, and the stands taken 
by representatives and senators on 
events of particular interest to the 
physically or mentally disabled 

In a commentary on the shooting 
of White House Press Secretary 
James S. Brady through the brain 
during the assassination attempt on 
President Reagan, Moran said. " We 
know what lies in store for James 
Brady even if the rest of the world 
does not

" After the physical therapy, after 
the medical treatments., how well 
he recovers will depend upon how 
well he and significant others view

ipat _____
Ending employment discrimina­

tion against people with disabilities 
is one of Miss West’s primary objec­
tives.

" I 'm  not talking about absurdities 
like a blind person driving a school 
bus or a person who uses a 
wheelchair playing for the Boston 
Celtics basketball team ." Miss West 
said. "I'm talking about qualified 
people in everyday situations.”

The only stipulation Miss West 
places on those she interviews is 
physical or mental disability.

"These people have been there. 
They know from experience just 
how long and hard the road back is, 
the anguish of no longer being able 
to enjoy activities once taken for 
granted and the frustrations of dis­
c r im in a t io n , but m any h ave 
succeeded in spite of the obstacles." 
Miss West said.

" N o  a b le - b o d ie d  p e r s o n ,  
regardless of how sensitive, actually 
lives through these ordeals," she 
added

The calendar, presented during 
each program by Karen Schneider- 
man in her wheelchair, is of par­
ticular interest. It concentrates on 
events the handicapped can attend 
or participate in, such as special 
a th letic  program s, camps and 
cultural events in accessable set­
tings.

Among those who have been on 
the program are a psychologist with 
an amputated leg, a police officer 
with dyslexia, two Harvard Univer­
sity medical students who are spinal 
co rd  in ju re d  p a ra p le g ic s ,  a 
onelegged ski instructor, a blind 
concert p ian ist, and a senior 
program analyst at a large com­
puter corporation.

Others have not been so lucky.
Jim Hoell, hoping to go into film  

production, told Miss West that 
television and movie industry jobs 
"a re  especially difficult for the dis­
abled " to obtain.

"H ave you ever seen a television 
commercial where someone in a 
wheelchair tried to sell breakfast 
cereals or an ad with a disabled 
woman smiling over detergent?”  he 
asked.

"No. I haven ’t, ” M iss W est 
answered, inquiring for the benefit 
of her audience what Hoell’s dis­
ability IS. "Post polio,”  he replied.

Although Hoell has been dis­
couraged since high school when 
counselors refused to take his goals 
seriously, he hasn't given up.

Andrea West, 32, a paraplegic, Is thought to be 
the only handicapped person In the country 
producing a radio program with a totally han­
dicapped staff. (UPI photo)
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Bright, Cheerful and 
AFFORDABLE!

FOR Mothers Day
CAMOItt

CANDIES

•OFTWME
•COSIETICS
•COLOOES
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Gamllos A 
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k l i n d
T U S P L O M S T

Remember Mother \ 
on her special day 

with a lovely plant 
or arrangement from  

Pentland*8

'*Pl9a$lng you U our pleasure**

24 Birch 8t.
Manchastar, Qonnacticiit 

643-6247 643-4444

Multi-color BRAIDED RUGS
(50%  wool, 50% assorted fabrics for lasting beauty.)

at an unbelievably low price.

9 X 12, normally 
priced at $350. *7 7 9

IN  S T O C K  S U P P L Y  O N L Y .

What a terrific gift fo r  M oth er!
Naturally at

Htrlboroogb CoDotry Bin
0 B  North Main Slrcel

Exit 12 or 13 from Route 2 
Marlborough, CT

Open 10-5:30 Tuci. - Sal. 
Open 10-9 I riday 

Sunday I - 5, Closed Mondav

14 Mala Street ' 
Old Saybrook, CT

Open 10-5:30 Mon, - Sal, 
Open 10-9 Friday 

Sunday I - 5.

KITH LOVE 
TO MOTHB)

IT’S

IF SHE LOVES ROSES, she'll adore 
this finely sculpted sterling scarfpin.

_— ~  In white color or in a rich 
vermeil finish. Stylish, useful, lastingl
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In 1929
Recognized this piece? It's changed a lot since 1920. It’s the cor­
ner of Main and Maple streets In Manchester and In those days 
was the site of a Furniture Exchange. The Identities of the people 
playing street football have been lost over the years.

u

Cheney mills subject 
of photography show

M AN C H E STE R  -  "Cheney 
Brother! Waa the World,”  will be 
the theme of a photography exhibit 
scheduled to be held in the Clock 
Tower Building at the Cheney Mills 
complex.

Dr. John F. Sutherland, director 
o f the Institute of Local History and 
asaociate profesaor of history at 
Manchester Community College and 
Syivian Ofiara, director of the 
college’s photography program, 
have announced that the institute 
received a 11,000 grant from the 
Connecticut Humanities Council to 
underwrite a portion of the cost of 
the eihibit scheduM id open Oct. 10.

The Ooefc Tower Building fonqpr- 
Ijr boueed the spinning mlUs now in 
the Cneney Brothers National 
H istoric Landmark D istrict in 
Manchester. The exhibit will be co- 
sp on so red  by th e  T ow n  o f 
Manchester, through the Cheney 
National Historic CHstrict Commis­
sion.

The photographs will tell the story 
of life in the early 20th century 
among the workers of the Cheney 
Brothers Silk Mill.

During the first two and one-half 
decades of this century, Cheney 
Brothers was an internationally 
famed firm which engaged in all of

the processes of silk manufacture, 
and claimed to be the largest such 
company in the country. The firm 
employ^ 25 percent of the town’s 
population, drawing immigrants 
from many nations.

Photography displays will include 
mounted photographs and posters 
with accompanying interpretive 
narrative, some of which will con­
sist of excerpts from the oral 
history project at the Institute of 
Local History at Manchester Com­
munity College.

The exhibits will be original 
photographs, posters or reproduc- 
Udos exectited in thd MCC facilities 
by Ofiara.

The narrative will largely be 
prepared by Sutherland, who has 
researched the material using cen­
sus data, assessor's records, city 
directories, municipal records and 
oral history.

In addition, artifacts such as 
tools, goods, products and a model 
loom will be on display. Observers 
w ill be able to v iew  a b rie f 
slide/tape program and to don 
headsets and listen to oral history 
excerpts.

The presentations will include: 
"T h e  W orkp lace ," "L a b o r  & 
M an a gem en t," "T h e  M il l ’ s

Influence on the Town’s Physical 
and Economic Expansion,”  and 
’ ’Family and Neighborhood Life and 
Recreation.”

Along with MCC and the town, 
several other area groups and 
organ iza tion s  w ill  ass ist in 
preparing the exhibit. Cheney 
Brothers, the Lutz Junior Museum, 
and the Manchester Historical 
Society will donate photographs, 
posters, and artifacts which will 
supplement the institutes collec­
tions, and Cheney Brothers is 
making available the Clock Tower 
Mill.

There will be a public request for 
personal treasures from  old 
photograph albums and artifacts 
and some have already been 
promised.

Dr. Sutherland said the Cheneys 
enjoyed a reputation as a bene'volent 
employer. “ The company main­
tained decent, substantially built 
homes, schools, public utilities and 
recreation centers. Thousands of 
residents would have echoed the 
sientiments of one who exclaimed in 
an oral history interview, ‘Cheney 
Brothers was the world.’ ’ ’ The 
exhibit will be open free of charge, 
to the public.

Hemlocks fair Saturday
H E B R O N  — The  annual  

Hemlocks Country Fair is scheduled 
for Saturday at the Hemlocks Out­
door Education Center on Jones 
Street.

The fair will open at 10 a.m. and 
will include craft booths, a bake 
sale, plants and shrub sales, games, 
a country store and auction

refreshments.
The day’s events will also include 

a swimming period in the Hemlocks 
heated pool at 4 p.m. followed by a 
barbecued chicken supper from S to 
6:30 p.m.

At 7:30 p.m. there will be a square 
dance for beginners.

Tickets for the chicken supper _

should be reserved by calling 228- 
M96. Square dance tickets will be 
available a t the door.

Proceeds from the (air will be 
used to support recreation and cam­
ping programs provided by the 
center to handicapped childrm and 
adults throughout the state.

Israeli concert Thursday
MANCHESTER — Greater Hart­

ford will celebrate Israel’s 33 years 
of independence Thursday, with a 
concert by two of Israel’s most 
poeular musical performers, the 
“ Duo Bp’lm ”

Benny Roeenbaum and Ylsrael 
Gottesdiener and their multi­
language repertoire will perform at 
7;4S p .m.  at  the  E m a n u e l  
Synagogue, 160 Mobegan Drive, 
West Hartford.

Tickets for the “ Duo R e ’im”  
(Hebrew for “ friends’ ’ ) concert are 
on sale at the Hartford Jewlah Q m - 
munity Center, 335 Bloomfield Ave., 
co-sponaors of the program with the 
Greater Hartford Jewish Federa­
tion.

Several hundred area girls and 
boys will enjoy an afternoon perfor­
mance by the entertainment team 
during a special childrens celebra­
tion of Israel's birthday to be held _

from 4 to 6 at the Jewish Community 
Center. An'“ Israel Quiz”  in college- 
bowl style will precede their perfor­
mance in the theater. A short 
memorial prayer for Israeli soldiers 
killed in service to their country will 
be offered at both programs.

For m ore information call  
Abrasha Tene, director of Israel 
programs at the Jewish center, 236- 
4571.

College schedules exhibit
.".JP":

‘ W E S T  H A R T F O R D  -  
iUthographar and etchings by Im­
pressionist Printmaker Chllde 
H am m  from the Saint Joseph 
College Art Collection w ill be 
exhibited for the public at Saint 
Jiiseiib College on Asylum Avenue 
.loiiay through Sunday, May 24.
- The exhibition, “ Chllde Hasaam, 
' impreesioalst Printmaker.”  will In­

clude M Hassam printi, featuri^ 
two rare lithographs, one of which is 
a unique impression. The art will be 
displayed weekdays from 10 a.m. to 
5 p.m. and waehenda frasn 1 to 4 
g.m. in the Crystal Room of Mercy

M ^  of the printi are from the 
late Rev. John J. Kelley CoUection

CG to sponsor show
H A R TFO R D  — Connecticut 

General Insurance Corporation will 
the US,000 Connecticut 

OniM  Slam of Show Jumping at the 
Slst Annual ChildrM ’s Services 
Hoarse Show, May 7 to 10, at the 
Farmington V a ll^  Polo Qub in 
FUmiqgton.

The Connecticut General Grand

Slam is a seriei of Jumping event! 
demanding speed, strength, en­
durance and ability of bourM and 
rider. Winners in the competition 
will receive over $21,000 in cash 
prixes and a $4,000 caah award will 
be presented to the one horse and 
rider team who accumulate the 
most Grand Slam points

( 8  M a in  WotM DaSy nawa htgt)- 
H0hl6^ iMlIOfMl Mid IMemsllonal.
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T le T e e M in h
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O V M IM V  Q v e t :  CouMry- 
w 6 «l«fn  6>nBM M «rl«  Hagatrd. 
H o ilt: Hugh Do«fM and Frank Blatr. 
(Cloaad>CapltoAad; U.8.A.)
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tiawa 
BaHaava
•poftaCafitar 
FaaHvalOfFaWi 
WM KlfifdOfii ‘A Day With tha 

San^Crana*
(B  MoaayBaa Financial. buainaM 
and conaumar nawa with haavy am-

f ait on tha Wall Siraat day 
Mawa

In Farformanca 
FacaTlialluale 

Fan And Maa Of Raglnald 
Farrln

7:2B
M  OaByNumbar

7:30
O) MIMagailna 
X  MHiiTliaFaiiiBy 
ClJWBdWBdWortdOfAnlniala'Saa

MitiHMIOIFama'CaeeyBtangal* 
Chartaa Darning portraya Caaay 
Btangal In tMa ona-man charactar- 
liatkHi of tha faiaty ax-nanagar of 
Itia Maw York Yankaaa and tha Naw 
York Mata. WrHara SIdnay and Da vM 
CarroB ravaal Caaay'a IrraprMalbla 
paraonality and colortal caraar 
throagh a aarlaa of mooologaaa. (00 
mjna.)
S  Tfiat’aNoBywood

CD Marv Ortffbi Ouaata: Kal Rud- 
man, Captski end TanWa. Ro- 
aann# Caah, Kanny Rankin, Boom- 
town Rata, Tha Whlapara, Lauran

S f t t  ■■l»»!S BoMok R«d 8o> V*
KanuiCHyRoytl*

(D CaaWMNiMdayMtMllevto
TtwOwHIWMnBandH’ tMI SUn: 
Rciph Wall*. Julia Bouaaao. Tha 
dramalRbaaadonthairualHaaxpar- 
ianca of Fathar Barnard Pagano. a 
aoclakyoonoamMandoccaaiooaily 
controvaralat pHapl, who nuddanly 
f indt himaalf undar arraat for a aarlaR 
of atickupR of amall itoroR in 
Qala2wara.(2 hra.) .
GDM Aiaancan Ofbam Danny and 
Donna Novak axparlanca tha an- 
girfah of a mlacamag# of thak fourth 
child, and RtlM anothdr diaappoint- 
mant whan thak handtoma 17 yaar 
old ton. Catay. falla daaphr in lova 
wHhawoman lOyaarahiaaaniorRnd 
annoancaa hit plana to mova In with 
^  and har young ton. (00 mint.) ' 
W  AĤ RiMBkio *01 
M O M  DIffranIBtrokaaWhan 
ona of hit achool chums it facad with 
balng aani to on orphanaga, Arnold 
hidaa hkn In tha Drummond’s psnth- 
ousauntilhacansskhisstspfstharto
lot hit frland stsy

alosad-Csptlonad)
lMovla-(Drama)** “ OtonaCoM 

Oaad" PaulWMIiams.RIchardCran- 
na. Somaona ia killing young woman 
who work for vllllana. (Ratad R) (2

prova ha't not a loaar. (Ratad PO) (2

^ K o te k  C avan Bhaw Ouast: Oora 
Vidal, Part 6.
_  11:t0

!̂So

) PaniBvFa 
) FacaTha

Fawd

I $00.000PyramM
1 CNN Sparta A rapon on what’s 

happanad and what's shasd in 
iftprts.
Q  BfaM onsyO ama
M  Movla -(C om a dy) 
**WHara*aWWaT”  IBTOHanryDar- 
row,Mark(3llpln.An0yaaroldwlthan. 
1.0. of lOOoutsmartathatownspao- 
pla and hla fathar who hsppans to ba 
tha shartff. (Ratad Q ) (00 mins.) 
M M  MacNsBUhrarRaaoct 
M  B awiyMMShow 
H  BamayMMar 
M  Tic  Tae Dough 

7:00
(B ) Talavfsion Tonight Pravlaw on
Ih# baaf bala for talavlawing that 
night.

§.*00
CD EnoaEnoa Strata bacomat a ona 
manpoNcaforcawhananapIdamlcof 
‘BluaFlu* atrlkas his dapartmant and 
ha’a iaft alona to protaot a pratty 
woman Judga from a killar'a wrath. 
(M m lna.)
CD PM Hapailna 
CD Qraatiat Bporta tagaad 
(DW ThaOraeteetAm artcanM ero 
Ralph'a aupar powara. BUI’a govam- 
mant know how and Pam'a lagal tac- 
tlca blaza Into action to ward off tha 
CIA. tha IR8, traaaury agants snd tha 
local poMca altar ona of Rsiph's 
atudania bacomaa tha prima au- 
apaMlaaaaitaaofdramatlcfkaK(eo

3!i*BaaaBaB Naw York Mata vs 8sn 
Frandaco Giants 
M  EBPN'a Sparta TMk 
O  M o vla ‘(C o ia ad y)**  "Y o u n g  
Frankanalain" 1B74 PatarBoyla. 
Marty Faldman. Parody of old Fran- 
kanstaki plcturas. with appropriata 
mualc, aats, laboratory agulpmant 
and Black and Whita camara-work. 
(ELAiMiePX̂ hrs.)
9 0 9  Baal Paopla A profile Ola 
handicappad ranger in YoaamHa Na- 
tional Park, a man who lovaa to play 
his violin in a Bavarly Hills msn's 
room, snd Sarah Purcell axpar- 
iencasthafunandparilofautoracing. 
(Rapaat;80mlns.)
9  P rlm a na w a -iao  Oatailiia 
raporta from around tha nation and 
tha world. Major avants of tha day 
covarad

_ l  Bronx Datactivaa Camaras ac­
company twohomiclda dot actfvasto 
tha acanas of six crimaa snd through 
subssqusnt invssligatlon of ths 
crimas. in this raaHatic and hsrd- 
l^ in g  documantary. (00 mins.)
Iff) World ‘Ths Rsd Army' Prssidant 
Rssgan is inersssing dsfsnss 
spsnding. but lust what srs ws 
dsfsndingourssivss against? This 
invsstigativs rsport sxaminss ths 
strangths snd w ssknsssss of ths 
Russian military, with soma surpris­
ing rssults.(60 mins.)

0:30
9 9 9  Tha Facts Of Ufa  Tootis
falls in lovs for ths first lima snd 
bagina to sxpsrisncs doubts about 
hsrsslf snd har school friends 
(Rspssi)

10:(X)

) Bj nnyMMBItow 
) 9  ABC Nawa NlfhtBna

>rad by Tad Koppal. 
auOa 

P JpoftaCanlar 
19  9 r i i a  T o M fM  Bhow
P NawaBaak A ninaty-mkHila nawa 

ftoal.
9  ABC Captlonad Nawa

(£  Mwd*
„  11:4S
■  M o«l*-(OraM M )—  " t M T I w
B lam arck" 10$0 KannathMora. 
Dana Wyntar. OurfngW.W 6 . tha Bri­
tish Navy ataOta tha f amad Qarman 
waraMpBlamarck. (2hrs.)

13:00
(C M o u ta -lO rw ia )— • "Ta rg a lO t 
An A M ln I l l "  197S Anttiony Quinn. 
John PhNip Law. (Paid Subscription 
Tsfavlsion) An Africsn sdvsnturs of 
kidnspping, politicsl tsrror snd 
myrdsr. (2 hrs.)
CD MlkaDouglas 
CD M ovla-(W aatam )**^ "Run of 
tha Arrow " 1 M 7  RodOlalgar.Brisn 
Kaith. FUlad with bHtamass. an ax- 
confadarsta pirata joins ths Sioux 
nstion still fightingths Unit sdStstss. 
(2hrs.)
W  ESPN's Sporto Talk 
9  Dr. Giana Scott On Hebrews 
9  Love Boat A middle sgad hus-
bsndand wife gat tha surprisaof thair 
lives whsn thsy discovsr Ihsrs's s 
bsby on ths wsy (Repast, 70 
mins.)

12K>6
(D Movla HNo Information avall- 
abla) "Operation Daybreak" No 
Other Information Availsbia (Rstad 
PQ) (2 hrs . 30 mins )

12:30
£  t ^ a r T s  Heroes 
9  M  9  Tomorrow Cosst-
To-Coast Quest; Tins Turnsr (90 
mins.)

12:50
9  M o vla -(C o m ed y) * S  "U se d  
Cara" 1000 Jack Albertson Two 
brothsrs fight ovsr s ussd csr lot 
(RstsdPQ) (2 h rs)

1K)0
GD Rat Patrol

PKA Fun Contact Karate 
Uohtwaight Conlandart Bout 
(SI People Tonight An hour of 
parsonslity news, interviews snd 
rjiyiaws.
9Movla-<Com ady)**** "Putney
Bwopa" 1060 Arnold Johnson. Ruth 
Hsrmins. A largs Madison svsnue 
sdvarlising sgsncy is taken over by 
miiitani blacks, (gomins.)

1:10
9  UOAFRaNglousFHm 

1:30CD 9  VagaO Dsn Tsnns takas 
chargs of a bizsrrs sxtortion snd ( D  Adam 12 
murder case for his dashing Frsnch 2.*00
dstactivs frisnd, Nicholas Rimbaud, CE)Movta-(8uapansa)*** H  "N igh 
whanaplottobisckmsilsringofmsis of tha Hunter" 1B5S Robert Miti 
prostitutes explodes into violence chum. Shelley Wlnlars 4|

3mins.)
(B)8uparaplaaUsingspacialsnima-
tion, film footage and still photo­
graphs. this spscisi sxplorss ths 
csraars ot history's grsatsst spiss; 
Mats Hari. Francis Gary Powers, 
t ^ u  F ^ h s . snd othsrs.
9 9 9 O uk w yTo slopnsighbor- 
hood crims, tuvo brothsrs organizs a 
vigllsnts committss, but it is only 
after ona of them is slain that the sur­
vivor will head Quincy's sdvics. (60 
mins.)
(S) Freem an Reports A ons hour 
national call-in, in-dsplh talk show 
wHhslivssudiancs. ^
^  CofMtacttcut Prime Tima

psychopathic killsr posing as 
prsachar tarrorizss a widow and hsf 
two childfsn, trying to find s cache o< 
stolen money (2 hrs.. I7mins.)
( D  Nsws

Somers bounceJ
HOLLYWOOD (U P I) - I  

Suzanne S om ers , e m ­
b r o i l e d  in c o n t r a c t  
sq u a b b l e s  w i t h  A B C

TOEd»«OI8«rrt»»IFilmudinBtt,il. thmuBhout the lORO-Rl EnglundundlBdlu.lhiudocumuniury mrougnoui m e l»au-ni
•xuminut thu probiamu ot dully .ui' television Season over her 

‘•o'e in " T h r e e ’s Com- 
iO;M pany, bounced back from

S  her difficulties with a show
Vidal, Part II e l.

10:40 0* OWD.
CD Kinar’sKom ar Next  mid-season the
® ® ( I )® i ' i ? N u w u  hlonde glamour girl will 
®M.A.8.H. s tar  in " T h e  Suzanne

Somers Show”  for C B ^ T ^  
From  A lca tra z" 1070 Clint a Situation comedy based 
Eastwood, Patrick McQoohan. An g WOrkinE ffirl.
■ KraakAiit from thA D o

Miss Somers says. “ I t ’s

S Joa  FrankBn Btiow
Sports Updata Tha istsst sports

rssutts for tha Watt Cosat aports

O a tim a n
2:30

S C ommunity C alawdar
Ovam lfM Doak Bast oftha day's 

reports: NEW 8DE8K, Frssmsn 
Raporta. sports updsts and 
mgnaylina.
9  U u ra lA iid H a rd f 
9  Movla HiDrama) *** "S tra w  
D ofS " 1071 OuatmHoffman.Sufian 
Qaorga. An American mathariis- 
tlclan. disturbed by tha pradomtA- 
anca of vlolanca In American society, 
moves his family to an isolatad Cor- 
nishvHlaga.HssvantusItyisforcsdio 
tskssnsggrsssivs stance to dsf snd 
what hs fsafs is rightfuify his. (Rated 
PQ) (2 h rs)

2:36
(D Naws-Wasthar

2:40
CD Moment Of Meditation 

2:45
(D Thoughta To  U va  By 

2:00
CD AN Mght Weather Oarvica 

3:00
CD Movla -(A dventure ) 
"Stopover T o k y o " 1057 Robert 
Wagner, Joen Collins. An Amsricen 
intsitigencs agsnt. deiivsnng sscrei 
dais to s Jspsnsss agent in Koras . >• 
forced tolay ovsr in Japan under con­
stant watch. ( 1 19 mins )
^  SportsCantsr 
9  BawHchad

3:30
(H) W C T  Tennis Championships
From Dallas Singles Ouarlerlinals 
4.
9  Happy Days Again 

4:00
9  News

4:30

S 22 AHvs
Movla-(Drams)** "Stone Cold 

Dead" PaulWillisma.RichardCren- 
na Someone IS killing young women 
who work for villisns (Rsted R) (2 
hrs )

Sport Parade
Milt Richman. sports 

editor of United Press 
International gives the ins 
and„outs on the national 
sports scene on The Herald 
sports pages Another 
reason not to miss The 
Herald1

/ N O U K f u c a n c f f lA /
IN T lfttT A T I S4 iX IT  SS SH.VEH LANI 

lA S T  HARTVOAO SSS-SaC 
•AM um  s u r m a  daily 
PmST SHOW OULV tz .s o

w hen you 're  the fastest, 
som eone always wants 
you to prove if. pjgj

dkyS

unprscsdsntsd breakout from ths 
rock. (1 to mins.)
9  Hava Gun WHI Travel really something different 

for me. PH be playing a 
dumb, blonde, single girl 
who wears short shorts a 
lot — or does that sound 
fam iliar?”

from all tha action with Nick Charles 
§Qd Bob Kurtz.
9 M o v la ’KOrama)** "Running" 
Susan Anspsch, MichssIDougIss. A 
marathon man has sights sal on 
Otvmoic victorv and ths chancs to ■ M C K

Something Different............ Wish Someone A

Happy Birthday
with A Herald Happy Heart

Only
$6.00

H a p p y Birthday ^

Jo h n  K s

L IT T U  THEATRE 
OF MANCHESTER
presents 
hu|eneO'Neill’4

EXCALIBUR

L o v e
M ary

C a l l . . . .
643-2711

Ask for.... 

Pam

' I '
EUTCtnalcM

non. UTOMT
wf ijA iusn i
(MNnI MAslti

SiM
hOiSSMki 

CWm  TU rti 
MTlKSMrM.M
•ridlin-lil

which was bequeathed to Saint- 
Joqteh College in 1986, while several 
have been borrowed from the Yale 
University Art Gallery and the 
Catholic Library of Hartford.

Hassam, working in an Im ­
pressionist style, cau^t the varying 
qualities of light in different hours 
of the day, in every aeason and in 
changing atmospheres, both in pain-. 
Unp and prints.

According to Vincenza A. Uccello, 
M.F.A., chalrperaon of the College’!  
Fine Arts Dspnrtment, the early 
etching Haaeam produced are con­
sidered sunong the masterpieces of 
Impreeiionlst printmaking.

'The public is invited to attend the 
exhibit at no charge. Further Infor­
mation may be obtained by calling 
the co llege ’s O ffice  o f Public 
RelaUom at 2II-4I71, ext. W .

SYLVESTER STALLONE

INIQHT

Lobster Special
AT

Malm Coast Ssafood
Lobsters - Steamers • Stuffed Shrimp

Lobiturt —  $3.60/lb. 
8tuam«rt —  89*/lb. 

Stufted Shrimp ^  $1.00 a ch
(Lobo la rs  boHod at no antra ehorga ) 
T u aa .,W ad .,T lw ra .10 -<  Fri.10-7

S B O s k I s i M i S t  6 4 3 - 2 6 6 7

• ISSHIBMnCTUK 
a m  lum m  pm mc

îinKrD(!k!OQ
! lIKIs’K M IUR W .M K lN  k H i S m  K1

I I
B a c k  w h e n  y o u ' 
h a d  t o  b e a t  I t  
b e ffo iw  y o u  
c o u ld  e a t  I t . . .

fPGl UmtadAitiata

PLEASE CALLTHEATRE
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Andover housing project 
will be dedicated May 17
ANDOVER -  Hop River Carlberg. The Rev. Davitt 

Homes, a 24-unlt homing pastor of St. John
community for seiiTbr Roman Catholic Church in

Policy talk
Andover Grade 6 students Julie Soucy and R.J. Clark were 
looking over policy papers with the assistance of Principal David 
Kravit Monday. The students were Invited to partake In a prin­
cipal's daily activities by Kravit. and they found the job tougher 
than they had originally reckoned. (Herald photo by Cody)

citizens and the han­
dicapped, will be dedicated 
at a special program May 
17,2:30 p.m., at the project 
on Riverside Drive, off 
Long Hill Road.

Featured speaker for the 
event will be the Rev. Dr. 
Kenneth Taylor, Minister 
of Lay Life and Work of the 
Connecticut Congerence of 
the United Church of 
Christ.

Twelve years in plan­
ning, Hop River Homes 
grew out of the desire to 
see elderly housing in the 
c o m m u n ity , f i r s t  
npressed by the Human 
^ncem s Committee of the 
F irs t  C ongregationa l 
Church of Andover.

Since then an interfaith 
committee was formed and 
sponsorship was gained 
th rou gh  the N ew  
Samaritan Housing Cor­
poration of Connecticut.

Other activities at the 
dedication program will in­
clude special music by the 
Elementary School Band, 
the Junior Choir of the 
First Congregational hurch 
and a chamber group under 
the direction of Mrs. Jane

C rom w ell, w il l  bring 
greetings from Connec­
ticut Interfaith Housing.

Hop River Homes was 
bu ilt w ith a 50 yea r 
mortgage of 1870,000 from 
the Farmer’s Home Ad­
m in is t r a t io n .

Hop River Homes was 
d e s ig n ed  by H en ry  
S ch ad ler A s so c ia te s  
Architects of West Hart­
ford, and built by Keenan 
and Navarro Builders of 
Dayville. Interim finan­
cing was provided by the 
C on n ecticu t Housing 
Finance Authority and ren- 
ta l a ss is ta n ce  sam e

through the Department of 
H ou sin g  and U rban  
Development. Ground was 
broken on March 17, 1980, 
and the Homes opened on 
February 1,1981. They are 
now completely renUd.

Management of Hop 
R iv e r  Homes w ill be 
through Elderly Housing 
Management Inc. Planning 
assistance was provided 
from New England Non- 
Profit Housing.

Master of ceremonies at 
the dedication will be the 
Rev. Richard H. Taylor, 
p a s to r  o f  the F ir s t  
Ccmgregatlonal Church and 
President of the Hop River 
Homes board. Former 
President Mrs. Bette J.

MacDonald now serves as 
administrator o f the com­
plex. Other members of 
the board during Its plan­
ning and construction In­
clude Mrs. Imodale S. 
Richards, Mrs. Janet Me 
C a ll,  M rs. M a rga re t 
Jurovaty, Mrs. Eleanor 
Borrup, Mrs. Christine 
Reese, Mr. J. Russell 
Thompson, Mr. Wayne 
Besaw Sr., Mr. David 
Yeomans, Mr. William  
Austin and Mrs. Geraldine 
Jeauibtte.

The committee hopes to 
wind up the initial funds 
drive for the construction 
o f the Homes by the 
dedication date.

Students discover 
school policy hard

B ET M O R E 
FO R LES S

R IC H  \ R n  < :o i »  
lliTu ld  Reporl<T 

\MH)\ ER -  Grade 6 
students Julie Soucy and 
R J Clark found that ad­
ministering policy is a bit 
more difficult than they 
had previously thought, 
after spending Monday 
observing and aidino Prin­
cipal David Kravit

It looked pretty easy,"
R J said in reflecting upon 
how he vie.wed the job 
before experiencing a day 
at It The few times we 
saw him i Kravit’ . he was 
]ust walking around or sit­
ting at hts desk But it's 
alot different

The tw o stu den ts  
engaged in daily routine, 
which was Kravit s plan ‘ 
A n yth in g  sp ec ia l or 
extraordinary. Kravit said, 
might color their percep­
tion of the job

The students helped put 
the finishing touches on the 
organization of the day's 
lunch program, and ac­
companied the pricipal on 
several trips through the 
school to check on various 
things.

But the most interesting 
thing the students said they 
noticed was watching the 
principal “ get frustrated" 
while trying to phone 
someone

He must make a million 
calls. ' Julie said, adding 
that the schedule page on 
Kravit's desk was “ full of 
appointments and things to 
do."

The students took the op­
portunity to request a 
longer recess period, and 
Kravit said he would con­
sider increasing the recess 
period if the lunch period 
was shortened, and if he 
cou ld  o r g a n iz e  the 
teaching, kitchen and 
custodial staff for the 
change.

The change was more 
complex than they thought.

The students w ere  . 
looking forward to a fire 
drill, scheduled for later in 
the day, which would pre­
sent another opportunity to 
see the principal in action, 
and to gain a wider breadth 
of understanding the posi­
tion.

Kravit said he offered 
the opportunity'' to the 
students when he was sit-

Exciusively yours
How well informed we 

are of the activities in 
Washington that have 
meaning to Manchester 
depends on our Washington 
news sources Every week 
The Herald gives you 
exclusive reports from our 
Wa.shington bureau The 
He r a l d ,  the onl y  
newspaper with its own 
bureau c o v e r i n g  
Washington for news for 
Manchester.

ting in on a Grade 6 class 
meeting, after discovering 
that they did not fully un­
derstand the nature of 
policy decision 

From that meeting, he

said, he concluded that 
“ the kids have no idea 
what this job is like and 
what goes into a decision. 
So I offered the opportunity 
right there "

V. Bargain Vision Care —
The M ORE  may evaporate into LESS —  

quicker than the blink of an eve!
Trust your vision to someone who cares —  

your independent family optom etrist!^^^
A w in iii, froM / Y  A A  VS

lh> CotvmlKiA OiKinmrk Soonv
W<»w»nl h HnroUK In

y '-

COS
A R E  Y O U  T H IN K IN G  

A B O U T  R E T U R N IN G  T O  C O LLE G E ?

rhe Bachelor o f  General Studies Program  
at the S to IT S  Campus o f  the Un iversity o f  C onnecticu t is 

an individualized, interdisciplinary degree program  o f  
part-time study designed fo r  the adult student w ith  an 

associate’s degree or sixty earned credits. F o r  additional

in form ation  contact 
A n ita  Bacon at 486-4873. 

Applications for Fall,. 1981 w ill be accepted until 

June 1, 1981.....so act now !

Extended and Continuing Education 
The University o f  Connecticu t

4̂

MGC SUM M ER SESSIONS
DONT WAIT. NOW IS THE 

TIME TO REGISTER
M C C  offers 62 courses In Business, Humanities, 
Physical Sclance, Mathematics, Social Sciences, 
and Secretarial Sciences.

IN HUMANITIES, SELECT FROM:
(eight week courses starting June 1, meeting two 
evenings a week)
C O U R SE S  D A YS TIM ES
Reading Rate & Comprehension T .Th  7:00 p.m. • 9:40 p.m. 
Introductory CompoalUon ' M.W 7:00 p.m. • 0:40 p.m. 
Hispanic Cultura & Converaation T .Th  7:00 p.m. • 9:40 p.m. 
Effectiva Speaking , M.W  7:00 p.m. > 9:40 p.m.

(six week courses starting June 22, meeting dally 
Monday through Thursday mornings.)
Basic Photography 10:00 a.m. • 12:30 p.m.
Introductory Compoaltlon 8:00 a.m. -  9:50 a.m.
Introduction to Literature 10:10 a m. • 12:00 noon
Creative Crafta 10:10 a.m. <• 12:00 noon
Effective Speaking 8:00 a.m. • 9:50 a.m.

A three credit course costa $90. For a class 
schedule or information about ragistaring by 
phone or In person call 646-2137. M C C  adheres to 
the principles of equal opportunity and affirmative 
action.

REGISTER 
BY PHONE

... until Friday, May 
15 for 8-waak saa-
slon.

... until Friday, June 
5, for 6-weak ses­
sion.

C A L L  6 4 6 - 2 1 3 7

MANCHESTER 
COMMUNITY 

COLLEGE 
60 Bidwell St. 

Manchester, Ct.

BGSO
rDlAMOND DIVIDEND DAYS

DIAMOND SOLITAIRES

■ \

P en d a n ts

SAI.K KK(;
U.IIA riir.ll ' !l!i $1 lit
D.KI f.ir.tl I lit ifiit
(i.l.T c.irai 17!l
n.'ju I’.jrat litil
II.-.”) c.irai 2!»!l *29

carat ;i9!t .")79

E a r r in g s

TOTAL
WKlGHT S.\LK «K (;.

O.O.A ' .'>9 $ H9
0.10 119 |t)9
0.20 199 299
o:i3 299 429
0.50 619 9f>0

RINGS

' 4 carat "299
Reg. 3429

‘/j carat *489
Keg. $699

G enuine D iam onds in P rec ious Gold!
lUunIrationii enlarged to nhou> detail

M A N C H IS TIR  FA R K A M  • 8<S aaH  site 
Vim tOM , MM6TOL PLAZA, W M TPAIIM S, S M M «N IV

IT’S SPRINQI
HOME IMPROVEMENT TIME

UeiMOH

BEAUTIFY YOUR HOME
Whypantorreparduttas

• Maintenance 
weather proof plastic

• No rot, peel, crack or warp
• Easy installation
• All sizes available

Hitjti Oiiality Factory Finish

B L A C K
W H I T E

AVAILABLE IN BLACK 
OR WHITE 15” WIDTH

Heavy

Holght Reg. SALt
ii** . 15.35 1LSB
47” 17.80 14.40
51” 18.90
55" 19.95
59” 21.10 1 1 U

Whot a bright Ideol
Install Q Wasco Thermallzad 

Sky window* and save.

» 1 9 8 ~

THE I

BB VMtSCiO*
SKgaindsw^

ti

(

6’x8’ 19~
STOCKADE FENCE

No. 1 Cloaad PIckat Fanea, 3 
Baekralla. Poat Extra.

•  N o .1  B ’x B ’ M B M
•  N o .  1 4 ’x 8 ’ M B J B

3 ’ x 8 ’  » 9 . * »
SPACEO PICKET

AaaamMad. Heavy Baekrall and Piekala. 
Poat Extra.

PRESSURE T R EA 1D

Won't Notl 
Praasuro treated 
to prevent daai

paint. Ideal far 
daeka; .pareliaa.

...M * t ia s ie ........................I

...4 01 taS sflH t,:)....................

...SAT tllr tr .....................f -

...SAS M s IV .... ...........

...sas siM idr................ ia.i4|

tiM a ir...
SatalV...

W H ENGLAND r

bo

CASH «i CARRY

ROUTE 44RR0LT0N NOTCH

649-5201
)M(

Noen $««i
V itT H
a isM
♦AIJIT4

w m  BAIT
OAKOfM a j i l
Vs VQIS4
ORIS ai7$S
♦ S S I  a i i

aoure
♦  197SS 
V A j i e t  
OAQJ
♦  Q IS

Valnerabla: Ek»t-West 
Dsalar North
Wert Narib

lA
East
Pass

Saolh
IP

IB IB Pass 89
Pms
PaM

4P
Pass

Pam
Pa«

ftp

OpsaiiMtea4:#K

Make the slam

ByOswaHJaesky
sadAIH satag

i
Sontk has ao proMem at 

trick oae. Wo ntfis the apade. 
T l^  If lie is worth his salt he 
stO|» to consider the way to 
proMod. Ho doesn’t think 
shoot maUngseven. Hisprob-. 
lem Is to find how to make his 
slam contract 

A 5-d tnunp break wUl 
almost sorely cook his goose 
so be most concentrate on 3-2 
and 4-1 breaks. He sees that 
be can lose a finesse to the 
queen of hearts and sUU get 
his 12 tricks U be can ruff one 
more spade in dummy or if 
the diamond finsase la on. 
Hien be decides that be should 
assume Uut West holds Uie 
diamond king.

If he plays oot his ace and
king of hearts he can keep 
control of the hand if trumps 
break 3-2 and come to 12 
tricks so his first thought is to 
do that Than he sees that if 
trumps are 4-1 this play will 
lose. On the other band, if he 
cashes dummy’s king of 
tnknpo pad thin finessoo for 
tho queen, he will only be able 
to ooooto 11 tricks if West 
was dealt tbs qqstn and two 
small atae Wari will take his 
queen and leod a third trump.

Finally, he aees tho cinch 
play. He leodo a low heart 
from dummy and linaMes. 
Win or looo tne flnsoee he has 
retained control and is sore of 
his
(NZWSPAPI* B r m n u B  a s w .)

Measurements of the 
moon's atmosphere indicate 
that air preasnre there is len 
than one one-hundred-bil- 
lionth of that on earth.

you. Ion 
Inn sod

PEANUTS —  CIm Am  M. Scbult

MH.UTTLE FRENCH

‘ > 0 ^ 6 R (N iM F O N P
OP Ml' BROTHER.,

______________- . . _ W H 0
MI6HTCARETDM^
A B R A V E F lV IN B j^ .

Jii.
PRISCILLA’S POP — Id  S4IMVMI

O R  P b N 't

A COUSIN? AN 
AUNT? A GRANP/MAMA? 

■25=*----------S

19 IM IS 
SCUR 

OOMPLETE 
LIST OP 
TOUHSP

c a S H m s w i
FOR OUR 

SELECTIONS^

NOW. 
X PO N T  

W AW T

SOJTHE
WRONG

6MMapHM.kW.W8Hi»l9«9«g1ltOI
CAPTAIN EASY — Crooks S
WHATW

M A M K  
X CAN 

•W IPBN
*tOU UP 
W ITH A  

P E A L '"

AIR 
X CAN

IN T H E  
A B O U T  THIS, 
------- T E L L .'

vrmytiM
HE RUN9 A LITTU PKIUIMO 
OUTFIT CAUeP RAMSO R iM I 
X WOULDN'T TPUOr HIM ANY 

FAKTHSR THAN I  CAN 
9Kb HIMt

THS INTBReOTINd THIN0T WHAT 
10 WHAT Hk OAlD ABOUT J ABOUT 

AW NBW WOLF B A V ^ A  T V  
PROJBCri

A  \  I

ALLEY OOP — Davo OVauo
TNHI FILUtV I WH40O4A MSAN 
PtMXtBBOtHfB ■FILTMV-fTHIS " 
TO BB QUA . r ON* OF TH* 
HBkDCUARlSRsI NKXSTCMfES 

IN MOO/
DESKS, 04AJRS

WE*U.NEED

1 1IS^SS

5 ^

PRANK AND ERN EST »  Sob TlMVOO

(y)o@ . @ © w .
DEPT. OF REGULATORY CONTROLS

TH*we$ v-fe

^Birthday
M ey7,l9Sl

A substantial amount of travel Is 
Wtsiy Ibis coming year. Your trips 
may not be of tong duration, but 
they tbouid be fun and oNar you 
tome kiterastlng adventures.

TAW tUB (April 10-May » )
Cowortisrs may bo a bit more 
diffleult than usual to gat along 
with today, aspeetsSy If they feat 
you are foisting thittgs on them 
which you should altsnd to your­
self. Find out more of what Has 
ahead lor you m the year foSow- 
Ing your birthday by sending lor 
your copy ol Astro-Oraph. Box 
489. City Station, N.Y.
10019. Be sure to specify birth 
dote.
O IM M  (May 21-Jime 99) Think 
twioo today before putting any 
more money Into things which 
have ihua far proven to bo 
toeers. Leok around Inclead for 
belter poaaibliltlae. 
C A N C O M iim e tIN u ly  12) Be 
earohil today regarding the lypae 
ol Irlonds you bring home, mpe- 
cially H ihsVro at odds with soma 
member ol your fom lly. 
UnpieosaiNriae eouM raauH.
L IO  (JWy 29-A u i I t )  Your 
imagoJs a trifle fragile today, so 
don’t Bo s n y t l^  out ofllne to 
give one who dootn'l think of 
you m glowing lerme something 
lotalk about.
VMOO (Aug. 19 Bept. t »  Nor- 
maly you have pretty good Judg­
ment In itnanoM matters, but 
today you may let one who 
knows lass than you do riiako 
dictstons loryou. i
U M U  (B O ^  t8-OeL 21) Bo 
careful today In businoas manors 
which could affsci others as wsH 
as yourasN. Don’t strike out on 
your own In aroqa triteio you laefc

•COm SS^UBoL  24 Nov. 2 Q  M
you oae that your IMonors ann’t
In accord wttn Idoas Wiportam to 

lorsgo tho hard aoN today, 
ad of swaying Itism. you 

mighi owakan more oppoaWaa
SA&NTTAMUB (Nov. 22«oo..21) 
Whan dooHng with your poor

the molerlty. You may find your- 
•aVoutonollmh. 
eAPMOONN (Doe. IM a n . 1R 
Blosr dssr of attuattarw at work 
today which smack of oompany 
polMcs. Yim  mIgM gal drown 
M o aomeihina from triileh you’9sfsrjrsarsi
gomoUmae yollr bmoveilona are 
fOol Umo and otspsovoro. but 
today you'd bo wNe to oUok to 
proven methods. Spso untsotod 
MoMtoranolhardagr.
PIBCHB (Fa*. 2B4Hanll 29) 
Tlwra *  a posalbIWy to d a ylM
you msv toko too o a rte u s ly j^  
Boo whU Should he tak X iTa 9 
sport, den i msho wMihig loo

.S S S u L ieh  tM p ril iw p ie  
*  not a good dsy to dNcuoo 
hudgoN Of siiMMteoo tor ts i^  
ntomhom. hiNood ol roaeiMig
irouee. mere eoiddbeow led.

s*noiMWii*sn*siis>ii
• 1

THE BORN LOSER — Art SanBom
IF 'R X l 6X7T A »K 1 M M 7

aSRSOUiCOWT'fiil^

WINTHROP — OIck CavaHI
W K A TteiN  
T H E  LUNCH 

B O X ?

L E T T U C E ,  
T C M M T O . 

tSNkSN S L IC E S

a :
AHoatoufCne.

ANDWHATfe 
IN THE 

THEKAAOS?

-n-IOUSANP
IS L A N P

P R E S f iH N ^ .

LEW ’S LAW — Jamaa Setiumalatar
r

r
M YA A O lH a ^'S  C O M lN lT L A TE R  

W ITH  T H E  C A N P E L vA B R A  
/ANP T H E  R N C 5 E R  e O M -.

t w
OtHJLA

SHORT RIBS —  Frank
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ACROSS

1 Offlclsl doerso 
S What parson 
8 Jark .

12 Fssd ths khty
13 TwoUmss.
14 Fsnnsyivsnis 

port
16 Cut short 
16 Dstsmiining 

worth 
18 LscUng 

boldntsi
20 Crims
21 Urgsnt 

wirsisss 
signal

22 City prosscu- 
tor (sbbr.)

23Nswts 
25 Hocksy 

Issgus (sbbr.) 
28 Lord's wifs 
30 Aardvark'i 

dial
34 Postic foot 

I Igi 
' Wi 

38 Rsfrigsrstor 
'40 Oiminutivs suf- 

fix
41 Psnalizs 
43PSSP 
44 Maks thrsad
46 Clargymsn's 

dsgrsa 
48 For what 

reason
61 Collection 
52 Oblitsrats 
66 Otic msksup 

(2 wds.)
59 Again
60 Normandy 

invasion day
61 Genetic 

mstarial 
(abbr.)

62 Approach
63 Ory
64 Poicina home
65 Small bills

36 Ignite
37 Wsar at edge

DOWN

1 Truth
2 Cross 

inscription
3 Mighty mita
4 Warm
5 Baakatball 

laagua (abbr.)
6 Fined
7 Change into 

bona
8 Odd
9 Spring 

bloomer
10 Boy (Sp.|
11 Barrrit
17 Induitrious 

ersaturs
IB Modern 

painter
24 Money vault
25 Spouse
26 Stag
27 Loves (Lit.)
29 Electric

currant (abbr.)
31 Pan tips

Answer to Previous Punia 

N 6 U | t | RTn
U ifijjy -

ID n U L U t

□ n n  □ □ □
KiOUftHD DElfD C^Cltl 

■  G ia iD E ia n E ic in  □I31DI anno ■ izjaaD n n a ■ n a n n ■□□□□
32 Too much (Fr.)
33 Enticing
35 Unplaysd goH 

holsf
38 Offics holdar
39 Grant
41 Evil ones
42 Purpose
45 Greek latter 
47 Oregon 

constelletion

48 Mcrriae
49 Jekyirt 

opposite
50 Period of time
53 Presently
54 Sown (Fr.)
55 Rem's mstes
57 Sosp 

ingredient
58 Skete

1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 n

12 13 14

16 16 17

It 19 20 21

22 23 24

28 26 27 26 29 30 31 32 33

34 35 36

37 36 39

40 41 42 43

44 46 46 47

46 49 60 61 62 S3 54 55

68 67 58 69

60 61 62

63 64 65 4

OUR BOARDING HOUSE
I'M HOCKIN' /AY V  HARRV KALUEY. )  (  P lP N T  TkiE L
y y a t c h t o  buy /t h e  l)6E p  c a r  V c o u r t  HANO

BTOCKIN <$ALE6MAN,I6 B A C K ) A  C U O ^E P 
5MELLIN’ M L T 0 .')A 6  TRAINER ! j  ON Hl$ 
NltSKT NEVY« J AN P  HE’£r ^ T IL L  ./ C M E ?  MAYBE 
BURKE \$ ON '^-nT(2Y1N' TO FA5S \  V E  O U O H TA 
THE HEAVYWE16HT)h iM6ELF OFF A ’6 \ RATTLE  THE 
C O M E B A C K  .^HARRANOHI HALLI. H  B A R S  

T R A IL . ' THE tSREAT 4URU!

fT iH E V R E

m
IN 7R A  5U R FR 15E * S-i>

KIT ‘N’ CARLYLE -  Larry Wright

rioW WA5

YooR tifty,

BUGS b u n n y  —  Hoimdahl & Stotfol

A9AtXENiOFMV 
AFFECTION,

I  SeOUSHT YOU A DOZEN 
FEESM CAeROTB - j - n

N O W
SWEET.

TNEBES NCflHlN© IN THIS 
BOX BJT CAP0OT TOPS.

ODULDNT
HESIST

I  SUESS HUNiSEK IS 
A STBDN(5Ee EMCmoN 
1HAN IDVE.

BARBS

Phil Pastoret
Always count to 10 when 

yoti’re angry. It gives you 
time to work up more steam 
over the situation.

U politics is aa art, there 
are aa atarfol lot of practitioa- 
ers who have yet leaned to 
dnw a straight liac. So says 
oor raiidsat poadit.

vou ever feel that you 
left to bold your d«»ti-

Do
were left to hold your ____
ny’s kite just before the torna­
do hit?

6

M
A
Y

6

Never pul oft till tomoiTow 
that w h M  you caa coo aome-
oae else into doiag lor yoo
today.

•
' ^


